THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948

THE FACTORIES ACT, 1948
(LABOUR BRANCH)

- Notification
The 27th Augus(, 2009

Ne. G.S.R. 34/C.A. 63/1948/S.112/Amd (29))2009..—With refercnce
te Government of Punjab, Department of Labour, Notification Mo.
G.S.R. 5674/C.A.63/1948/S. 112/Amd./2008, dated 1the 24th October,
2008 and in exercise of the powers conferred by section 112 of the
Pactories Act, 1948 (Central Act No. 63 of 194R), and all other
powers enabling him in this behalf, the Governor of Punjab is
pleased to make the following rules further to amend the Punjab
Pactery Rules, 1952, namely :—

RULERS
1. (1) These rules may be called the Punjab Factory (First
Amendment) Rules, 2009 .
(2) They shall come into force on and with effect from the
date ot their publication in the Official Gazette,
2. In thé Punjab Pactory Rules, 1952, for rule 42, the foliowing
rule shall be substituted, namely :—
«“§2 Bxcessive Weights :—-

() No Person, unaided by another persoz, or mechanical
aid, be required or allowed to lift, put down, cagry or
move any load of material, article, tool or applance
exceeding the maximum limit in  weight as set out in
the following schedule -

SCHEDULE

Pergons Maximum weight of materinl.
Atﬂi('!’(‘. tool or 1F,pli;“3‘\'_é_-
1 P
(&) Adult Male 50 Kilograms
(b) Aduh Pcmalc 30 '
(¢) Young Person 20

(Male 15—18 years)




THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948

1 2
e —— ST -
(d) Young Person (Female 20 Kilogeams
15-—18 ycars)
(¢) Young Person (Male 6 o
14— 15 vcars)

(f) Young Person (Fomale 14 o
{4—15 Ycars)
e — -
(2) No, womin Qv voung percon shall engegr, in conjunction

with others, in lifting, caring or mo . inz anv material,

article, tool or &r plianes, if  the weight tiere of excesds the
lowest weighat fixed D7 the Sehedule to sub-rule (1) for any

-

r the number of the

of the perséns . cngaged, mul

persons cngagaed.
(3) Taking into accoui the conditions in  which the work is te

be performed, no workes shall be reguircd o permiited te

engage in the manual tyanaport of lod by reaser ef
its weight, is likely to jcopardice his health of safety.

(4) Wherever rcasonably practiceble, sujtablo techmical devices

shall be used for the manual traninort of 10zds.

. B o S.rille 3 a g
Explanation.—For tae purposes of sup-rulz (3 and (4)

«Manuzl Transport of
tre weight of the load i5

covers the liftng and putting down of loads,
it workers are engaged in the regalar

Joads” teant apy framnsport in which

L I | o (PR o T, [
wholly borne by ong werilr, it

(5) Notwithstand ng the fast the
«manual transport of joads”
as set out in sub-rule(!). they shonld he subjected to moedieal
examination prior 0 TCE dlar assigamens and perlodical
ciaminetion at an interval
assignment of su b jobs cxeecds
on of sub-rule(8) “Regular Manual

within the pormissible imits

"~

of every twebve months i tae
syore thall fwelve montis,

Explenation.—For 15¢ PUTRO
Transport of Loads’’ mecis &y aclivity waich is continueu-

sly or principelly dovoud le tle menuel  {ranipodt of

Locds, or which DOHL 1. pelrde., cven th evgh imfermait-
ently, the manual transport of loads.™.
P. RAM,
al Secrerary to Guvernment of Punjab,
Department of Lubdur.

Princip

THE FACTORIES ACT, 1948



THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948

(LABOUR BRANCH)

v et B A -

I\‘Ori “i"!( ATION
The 15h (.)-".‘(0|M:l', 2014
No. G.S.R. 37/C.A63/1048/5. 112/ Amd. (30)/2014.- With reference

v

o the Goverrmvent of Punjab, Depariment of Labour |, Notification Mo,
3S.R.23/C.A.63/1948/Ss. 112 and 115/Amd /2014, dated the 17th /\;n‘il. 2014,
ad'in exercise of the powers conlerred by section 112 ol the Factories
94\ ((__\J.Ll'.“l\k'l\“l) 6_) OrlJA‘Q},1Il“ (1”‘)”’.(,' O\ C ‘S ‘l)ln(vl 11, "ln] -:-1
ehai, e Governor of & unjab is picascd to maxe the following 1 Hes iutiii
s amend the Punjab Factory Rules, 1952, namely:-
’ : RULLES ®

(1) These rules may be called the Punjab Factory (Amendmeni) Rules,

2014,

- -~

(7y They shall come into force on and wilh clleet from t.hc Jate ot
their publication in the Official Gazette.
L Tn the Puniab Factory Rules, 7952 ( hereinafter referred 10 s i
aid raies), inrme 2-A inthe Scheduie, incolumn 4, for item (1), the folnnwing
teuy shail o2 substituted, nemely:-
“i) A Member or Associate Member . of an —
(a) Institte of civil engineering tor
(b) Institzie of structural engineering | or
/¢y Institute of enginecring € india) incivil enginsering or sLucud
- - engineering br anch, shall have an experience of working s
such in design or congtiruction or repair ol structure, tm‘ i
minimum period of five ycars;”
b,

3 Tn the suid rules for ruies 3A and 4, the following rule shall be substituice

-
-

namely;-

3A: Approval of Plans .- (1) No building shall be construcied or

usedas a fuctory unless its building plan is certificd by the competent person
ottt o~

———————

Y

“ -
and is submitted to the Chiefl Inspector.




THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948

(2) No additions, alterations or extensions in the existing factory premises,
shall be made unless plans of such additions, alterations or extensions, have
duly . been ceruﬁed by the competent person and submitted to the Chlef

Inspector : .

-

3) * Apphcatlon for submlssmn the plans shall be made by the compctent
person_in Form No.1-C alpng with the following plans and documents in’
‘ dupHcaté (in duplicate duly countersigned by the Occupier or Manager as the
case may be) to the Chief Inspector. - .
“(a) a certificate of approval in respect of a site or a factory from the
local authority, if such site is located in an arga where notified or
= draft'master plan does not exist and a certificate fro}xx an officer,
o who is not below the rank of District Town Planner, Department of
| Town Country Planning , concerning the classification of land use
to the effect that such site falls in an mdus‘unl arca Or zone;”

7]

(b) Form No. 1-E and replies to quest101ma1re annexed thereto;
2 Y )

(¢) Flow chart'of the manu Facturing process giving a bricf description
of the process in its varioys stages; )
(d) - Sitc plan drawn to & minimum scale of 1 cm. = 12 m. showing the

exact Jocation of the factory with respectio's 1rrounding buildings,

roads, drains, etc: ¥ .

(c) Plans, elevations, cross—sections drawn to .a minimum scale of
1 er. = 1.2 m. showing means of lighting, «enn!auon fire escapces,
position of plant and machinery, direction of opening of doors,
+ - drinking water points, roof m"xfenals details of urinals, latrines,
washing places, facilities for storjng and drying of workers clothing,

rest-room and lunch-room, canteen and ambulance room; and

() (i) ' The Occupier or Manager of the factqry shail appoint an
- . 7“Competent Person”, for submission of buil dino Plan; and

(i) “Competent Person, sha]] make an apphmtlon of self-
certification ( in writing ) , to the Chief Inspector, to the effect

~

= that the bulldmg plan being submitted is"as.per the Act and

" these rules.

% @

"(g) Such other particulars as the Chief Inspector may require in relation.

r o



4,

THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948

ST/

The Chief Inspector, if satisfied with the plan and documents attached '1lonowuh

the apphcatlon given under sub-rule(3), shal] retain one copy thereof in his

office and send another copy to the inspector for® necessary action . w
.th]r be

4: Certificate of Stability.- (1) No manufacturing process sha

carued on’in any building or part thererof ( whether newly constructed

or re-constructed or extended) as a factoxy or increase the madnnery in

any exisiing factory until a certificale of swability in Form 1-[F in respect

sthereof, duly signed by’a competent, person, has been gent b5 this Chief
Inspector.

=3

-~

“r- <@

(2) No manufacturing process shall be carried out in any factory,
unless a fresh certificate bf stability ( in Form 1-F) , ts obtained
from a Competent Person after completion of a five years period ,
and sent to the Chief Inspector . |

In the said rules, for thu existing Form No.I-C. the following fm m

shail bb sub,hmtcd mnamely:-

ae ~



THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948

, “FORM NO.1-C -
. . , (seerale 3-A)

®

- Application fqr submission ofBuilding'Flans to construct, extend alterati
. 24 ; , alteration
or take into use any building as a factory

W g

o . -
|.  Name and address of the : ... .. N - : ‘
Competent PEISOIL ~ ~ |, ° sisevsssemends ’ Rt
2. .Full name and postal address: ...................... § '
= of factory. s I 4 £ 3 P BT s o i ¢ 0 i
Lpcation ‘of the factory:-
State* ™ | ieeeses % ot i 2 T
District : g T i memegssmsmen yeenienn ORI Y. -
) ,
 Townor Village: | s R 0 s o ol 3 e o o s
a Lo ~ ) I i . :
4, " Particulars of plant to be installed :
< ‘
D‘été,:_., ;e - Signature of Competent Person .

5. Inthesaid rules, inrule 8, in sub rulg,(3), for the, words “one year or five

s” the words “five years or ten ears” shall be substituted.
J |

-

year
VISWAJEET KHANNA,
Principal Secretary to Government of Punjab,
| Department of Labour.”

o



THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948

THE FACTORIES ACT, 1948

4

NOTIFICATION
The 10th November, 2014

No. G.S.R. 61/C.A.63/1948/Ss.49 and 112/Amd.(1)/2014.-With reference
to the Government of Punjab, Department of Labour, Notification No.
G.S.R.32/C.A.63/1948/Ss. 49 and 112/Amd./ 2014, dated the 4th June, 2014
and in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (2) of section 49 read
with section 112 of the Factories Act, 1948 (Central Act No. 63 of 1948), and
all other powers enabling him in this behalf, the Governor of Punjab is pleased
to make the following rules further-to amend the Punjab Welfare Officers
(Recruitmer;tﬁand Conditions of Service ) Rules, 1952, namely:-

RULES -

1. (1) TheseRules may be called the Punjab Welfare Officers (Recruitment
and Conditions of Service) (Amendment) Rules, 2014,

(2) They shall come into force on and with effect from the date of their
publication in the Official Gazette.

2. Inthe Punjai) Welfare Oﬁicérs ( Recruitment and Conditions of Service)
Rules, 1952 , for rule 3-A, except the proviso given there under, the
following shall be substituted, namely:-

“3-A. Pay scales and emoluments of Welfare Officers.-The Chief
Welfare Officer and Welfare Officer, shall be entitled to the scales of pay
as specified in the Table given below, namely:-

TABLE
Sr. No. Name of the Post Pay Band GradePay  Initial Pay
1 Chief Welfare Officer.  15600-39100 5400 21000
2 Welfare Officer = - 10300-34800 5000 -~ 18450 .7

VISWAJEET KHANNA,
Principal Secretary to Government of Punjab,
Department of Labour.

THE FACTORIES ACT, 1948



THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948

NOTIFICATIUN
The 29th October, 2014~

§.112/Amd.(31)/2014.-With reference to the
. Notification No. G.S.R.38/C.A.63/1948/

No. G.S.R.-58/C.A.63/1948/
conferred by|

g

Govemment,bf-Punjab, Départment of Labour

S.112/Amd./ 2014, dated the 25th June, 2014, and in exercise of the powers
al Act No. 63 of 1948), and all other powers;

on 112 of the Factories Act, 1948 (Centr.
Governor of Punjab is pleased to make the following rules,

tory Rules, 1952, namely:-

secti
~enabling him in this behalf, the
further to amend the Punjab Fac
' | RULES

1. (D -,Thesé-mles may be called the Punjab Factory (Second Amendment) Rules,

2014. _ : i
(2) ' They shall come into force on and with effect from the date oftheir publication in

the Official Gazette.

ferred to as the said rules), inrule 8,—i|
|
!

2. Inthe Pﬁnjab Factory Rules, 1952 (hereinafterre

v for sub-rule (1), the foilowing sub-rule shall be subs

“(1)No licence shall be gra11ted or renewed by the Chieﬂnsp
tate Government, under sub-section (2-A) of section 8 of the]
red in this behalf by the State_quémment . unless the notice
A licence for a factory shall be granted

Zon payment of the fees as specified in

sting Schedule, the_ following Schedule shall be substituted,|

tituted , namely:-: |
’ l

ector orany other

_ officer appointed by the S

Act gnd specially .empowé
§pccfﬁed in section 7 of the Act has been given.

by the Chief* Inspector or the said officer in Form
- sub-rule (2)” ; and '
Ny, - (i) in sub-rule (2), for the exi

namel_;-



Maleum number of workers to be employcd on any d

THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948

- ay

ay durmg the year Fees f
grant of licence for a factory for one year i

' QuantityKilo  Upto - From From ~ Trom ~From - Trom Above

. Watt.installed 20 21to Slto 101to 251t - 501to 1000 |
(axKilo - . 1000 250 500 00 |
wat) ' " ,

Upo20 450 750 1500 . 3000 4500 7500 10,500
Zluplos0 - 655 1500 2250 4500 7500 10500 15,000
STupro100 1500 2250 3000 7500 10,500 15000 18,000

T0Tupto250 250 3000 6000 - 10500 15000 18000 22,500

© 25luptoS00 3000 4500 7500 12,000 18000 22500 30,000

~ S0luptol000 4500 6000 10,500 15000 22500 30000  37.500

Above 1000... 6000 - 10,500 115,000 22,500 30,000 37,500 45,0007

3

In the said rules, in rule 9, in sub-rule (4), for the words “twenfy-ﬁve rupees”, the

~ words “one hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

=

In the said rules, in rule 11, in sub-rule (3), for the words “twenty-ﬁve rupees”, the
words “one hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

In the' said rules, in rule 13; for the words “twenty-five rupees,” the words “one
hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

In the said rules, in rule 14, for the words “ paid into the authorized branch of State
Bank of India” the words deposxted in the authorized branch of any bank” shall be

'substltuted

VISWAJEET KHANNA,
~ Principal Secretary to Government of Punjab,
Department of Labour.

THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948



THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948

| -——N-OTIP:ICAT[ON
e v The.l2th.!une, 2015

No. G.S.R.40/C.A,63/1948/S.l12/Amd.(33)/2015.-wnh' reTEraneE
othe Government of Punjab, Department of Labour;, Notification No. G.S.R.8/
- A.63/1948/5.112/Amd /2015 , dated 17th March, 2015 and in exercise of
he power conferred by section 12 of the Factories Aét, 1948 (Central Act
No.63 of 1948), and all other powers ex}abiing.him in'thié behalf, the Governor
of Punjab is pleased to make t.he', following rules further to amend the Punjab

Factory Rules, 1952, namely:-
RULES
l. Theée rules méy- be éalled tl\e-Plluljab Factory (Second Amendment) !
Rules, 2015. ' :
2 They‘_shall come into force on and with effect from the 'date of their
publicatic;n in the Official Gazelte. | '
3.  In the Punjab Factory Rules, 1952 (hereinafter veferred to as the 'said
rules), in rule 8,-

(). in sub-rule (1), for the words * one year or five years” the words

“one year or any further period upto ten years » shall be substituted; -

~and
(i) insub-rule (2),-

(a) forthe words “five years,” and “five times” the words “more
than one year” and “multiplied by the number of years,” shall

respectively be substituted;

. (b) for the existing Schedule, the following Schedule shall be

substituted, namely:-



THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948



THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948

// | “SCHEDULE
| /__,E‘,u’ for the grant of licence for a factory for one year
Quantity Maximum number of workers to be employed on
Kilo Watt any day during the year |
insm"ed
(Max Kilo
Watt)
Upto From From From From From Above
2 2110 Slto I0lto  251to 501to 1000
% 100 250 500 1000
Upto | 0 70 1500 3000 4500 7500 10,500
| _
ipio 655 | - 1500 20 4500 7500 10500 15,000

51 upto 150 . 250 3000 7500 10,500 15000 18,000

[0luplo 2250 3000~ 6000 10500 15000 18000 22,500
251 upto
50tupto 4500 6000 10500 15000 22500 30000 37,500

1000 < -
Above . 6000 10500 15000 22500 30000 37,500 45,000
1000 . | :

(ii) in  sub-rule (3), for the words “ five years , or ten years > the words

~“one year, or any number of years upto ten years,” shall be
_substituted..

3 Inthesaid rules, in rule 10, in sub-rule (2) for the words “one year orfive
years” the words “one year or any further period upto ten years” shall be

substituted ;

g
§:
%]

12000 18000 22500 - 30000

‘ VISWAJEET KHANNA,
Principal Secretary to Government of Punjab,
Department of Labour.



THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948

THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948

No. G.S.R. 5/C.A.63/1948/S-112/Amd.(32)/2015/-With reference to
Government of Punjab, Department of Labour, Notification No. G.S.R.31/
C.A.63/1948/S.112/Amd./2014,dated the 29th May, 2014 and in exercise of
the powers conferred by section 112 of the Factories Act,1948 (Central Act
No. 63 of 1948), and all other powers enabling him in this behalf, the Governor
of Punjab is pleased to make the following rules further to amend the Punjab
Factory Rules, 1 952 namely:-
T RULES

1 1) These rules may be called the Punjab Factory (First Amendment)

Rules, 2015. )
) They'shall come into force on and with effect from the date of their

publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Punjab Factory Rules, 1952, in rule 85, in sub-rule (2),for

the words and sign “completion of the overtime work.”, the words and sign

“completion of the overtime work.” shall be substituted and the thereafter the

following proviso shall be inserted namely:-

«provided that if the Chief Inspector is satisfied that it is not possible
to issue daily slips to the workers due to the nature of work carried
out by a worker in the factory, he may permit to issue weekly slips
in duplicate duly signed by the Manager or by a person duly
authorized by him after completion of the work specified therein.”’.
In the said rules, in rule 1‘07, clause (2) shall be omitted. '

In the said rules, Form No. 22 shall be omitted.

VISWAJEET KHANNA,,
- Principal Secretary to Government of Punjab
Department of Labour.



THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948

VTIOM

] . ' NOTIFIC

The 20th February, 2014

\fa.gl,’]s, 010-4 Labour/30.-Whereas in the Judgment given by Honble fHigh ¢

Conr of Judicature
484 e .
0. W.P2604 t0 4606 of 1999 and otiiers has struck down section 6671 Wb)as unconstiational.

W0 AL

shifi so

ni, women can be emplov:d in factorm% in the night shifis i.e from 16.00 P 16 5

o

e
[
(o9

UE]
o
[¢]

s for employing women in nigh
of the women workers. information was obained from Chiet inspector of |

rmed by him vide letter No. B 1/29416/2009 dated 16 Feb, 2010 that no appeal by

pending before Hon'bie Supreme Court of India or any other Court ag

Tthe industries they have been permitted to employ women in the ni

Loun

iles, 1950 for in-corporating the guidelines ordered by Hon'ble

U"

e Government of 1 "mlir.adu,

ing 1 view the above facts, whereas section 66(13(b) of Factories A

A

)
131
1S
i

ionat and

. 25 UN-CCenst this way 1
" Textilz indusiry to emplo

th Qctober, 2010 0 employ women in

Facteries Acl, 1948 in the State are al

cwing condidons. This exemption shall be allowed

appiication to the Government .

Jt shali be the duty of the employer or cther respansibie persons at the work places

prevent or deter the commission of acts of sziua! harassment 1o provide the pr»‘;\;cd'\z:es or the

. statement or prosecution of acts of al harass

L by taking ali steps rec

(Z; Al er syers or persons in charge of work place or factory should take appropriate sieps 1o prevent
they should take the i
Y, bition of sexual harassment in any oo such as tnwelcome sexaatly detenuined beh wwiour
s or by implicaticn or advances ¢ Ct to gain contuit of nd sexualiyv fav
ccloured remarks or showing pornography or any otner e
non-verbal contact of cexual nature;
{1 The rules or regulations shall be framed by the factory managem: nis relating to condue
pronibiting sexual harussment and provide for appropriate penalties in such wders
and also introduce am mems wherever necessary which are
{(1ii) propriate working conditions in respect of work, | Chealih and hvatens o further cnsurs

that there is no hostile environment towards wamen at wor

€3 and no woman emniovee sn

avereasonable grounds 1o believe thut she is disadvantaged in connection with her ern

(3) in case ofany criminal case the emplo;. er s h’!“ mitiate

2

ropriate acuon in sccordance with thepenal

e not victimised or discriminated swhile
t‘assmem and wherever necessan ; atthe request of the aftected

nt The cinplover shaliale approiy




9

THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948

i

disciplinary action if such conduct amo
4Mounts 16 misconduet i
th employrment,

The emplover shall main
. ployer s maintain a complaint mechanjsm in the factory itsell and the said mechani
should ensure time-bouy alme i C o e
ound treatment of complaints. Such mechanism should be at any rate to provide

when necessary a Complaint commities : :
3 plaint committee, 4 special counsellor or other support services including the

maintenance of confidentiality.
+J niai B Ittas o

Such Complaint Committee should be headed by a womiam and not fess than hal? of its members shoutd
A

be women. besides a non- -governmental organisation’s representation in the committes. Such person

should be familiar with the issues of seviial harassment

3 - B 2 . 3
The female employees should d to raise issucs of sexual harassment to workers in the

Workers” meeting and other appropriate fora,

£ PP, WS, e e i - ) " ‘ ' 4 prEs
The Icr_nalc empioyees shouid be made aware of their rights in particular by prominentis notifying the
guidelines on the subject.
Wherever there is a harassment at the instance of a third party, either by an act or amission the
cmp!o.ver and person in charge of the {actory should take all sieps necessary and reasonable to as
the affected person in terms of support and preventive action.
but alse surrounding

ide

The employer shall pmwge proper lighting not only inside the factory,

factory and 1o all places where the female workers may move out of necessitv in the course of such

shift.
The emciover shall see that the women workers are empioyed in a batch not fess than ten a1

25rd of the totai strength.

of the women workers employed in a night shift shall not be less than

ufficient women security shall be provided during the night shifi ot the enuy as we

¥2]

¢

Sufficient number of work sheds shall be provided for the female workers to arrive inadvancear

l
ieave after the working hours.

Separate canieen facility shall be provided for the female workers

Separate transportation facility shall be provided wherever transportation is provided by the empioyer
or the oceupier of the factory.

“the Factories Act. an additional hotiday shall b

Apart from the facilities, which is nermissibie und
perminied for the women workers during thewr mensuruation p eriod, whick shall be @ paid holiday for the

night shifts,

The factory shall provide appropriate medical facilities and also make available atany time of urgency

y providing necessary telephone connections and where more than hundred female workers

ro
are

"I’ﬁ,u.:}.’ud in a shift, a separate vehicle be kept ready to meet the emergent situation such as hosoualisatior

whenever there is a case of injury or incidenial acts of harassment ete,
Wherever the factory provides boarding and lodging arrangements for the female workers, the same
shall be kept exciusively for the women under the control of women wardens O supervisors

During night shift not less than 1/3rd ol strength of the supervisors or shift-in-chiarge or foreman or

other s upElVISOt) staff shall be women




THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948

L‘

in other respects, the ¢ provisions of the Factories Act and the rules of other statutory provisions with
respect 10 the hours of work and the Payment of Equal Remuneration Act and all other Labour
Legislations s shall be followed by the employer. '

The cmployer “shall appoint not less than two female wardens per night shift who shall go s round and

work as Special Welfare Assistants.

(22) The female workers who work in night shifts and regular shifts shall have a monthly meeting through
their representativ tives with principal employer once in eig ht weeks as grievance day and the employer
shall try to comply ail just and reasona able grievances.

23y  The employer shail be at liberty to em sloy female workers as'a whole or in part during night shift,

L

provided, the above directions be complied with.

(24) The employer shall senda fortnightly report to 1th173pPCLOI of Factories about the details of ¢employees
engaged ‘during night shifts and shall also d express report whenever there is some\‘emto\.\/arc

i» the Inspector of Factories and local § ome Station as weii

VISWAJERET KHANNA

igarh princinal Secretary to Govt. of Punjab
Chandigarh Principal Secretar) ja
Department

™ ~NN0N17
The 13th November, 2015



THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948

\lrl';""r'vv

NOTIFICATIO!

—fJ 77 1D

The lstApril; 2014

No. S.O.ZSIC.A.63/1948_/S.8/2014.-1 n exercise of the powers
conferred by sub-section (2-A) of section 8 of the Factories Act, 1948 (Central
Act No. LXIII of 1948), and all other powers enabling him in this behalf, the
Governor of Punjab is pleased to appoint the person as specified in sub-items
(a), (b) and (c) of item (i) of the Schedule given under rule 2-A of the Punjab

Factory Rules,1952, to be the competent persons, to assist the Chief Inspector.. ... i

of Factories, Punjab, for the purposes of issuance of certification of plans and
certificate.of _gtability, as the case may be, under these rules.

. VISWAJEET KHANNA,
Principal Secretary to Government of Punjab,
Department of Labour. :



THE FACTORIES ACT , 1948

i .Nollllcnlion '|'o

'I'ho 29lh Scplcmbcr 5 VPR

No..21/113/08-2L/3027. —In' cxcrcnsc of the powers, coufcrjd by qubiscctnon (l) of Scclmn 85 of
he Factories Act, 1948 (Central ‘Act No. 63 of 1948), tiie Govcmor of ? Punjnb is pleased ho deslare
hat all the provisions of the u[urcsmd Act shall apply to:all lhc pl.tcc*: in the State of l'un,ar' whercin
nanufacmrmg prooesscs, mvolvmg use, Swragc, lmndlnu,, procccsmg of asbestos  or lhc products
iereol is carried on with or wnlhout lhc “aid ot' powcr or is so Ordmunly carricd on, nom;uhsmndmg

hat:— - 2 f‘l N " ! Q i : , e J : ‘

“
(i) Trc number of pcrsons employed therein is lcsq Ilmn len, il \\orkmg with dxc aid of
~power and less than lwwty, 1( working w:lhout the :ud of power j or L

~'P"."“
’

Sy

(i) The persons working therein are not unplovcd by lhc&owm.r lhm.of but - or workmg with
the permission of, ot undcr agrccmcm with s‘m.h dwmr ERIR b f

[ 5" TR . l

Provided that the mmmfaclurmg process  is ‘,not chg tnrncd on by the owucr only with
the 2id of his family. \ | 1

o

VIS o, RAM, 3

I‘nnupnl Emctcmry to Government . of Pnnjab _
Department of Labour. } 1

i
|
1
t '



20 INDUSTRIAL DISPUTE ACT , 1947

JMUVS | Wiitem Wi 0" )

The 19" March, 2008

No. 1/22/04-4Lab/1091. — In continuation of Punjab Government Labour
Department Notification No. 1/22/04-4Lab.11/4927, dated 19" November, 2004 and in
exercise of the powers conferred under Section 39 of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947
(Central Act No XIV of 1947), and all other powers enabling him in this behalf, the -
Governor of Punjab -is pleased to direct that powers exercisable by the State
Government under Section 10 and under sub-sectioh (3), (4), (5) and (6) of Section 12
of the said Act, in relation to an Industrial Dispute falling under section 2-A of the said
Act, shall also be exercisable by the Assistant Labour Commissioner/Labour-cum-

Conciliation Officers within their respective jurisdiction in the State, with immediate

effect.

P. RAM
Principal Secretary to Government, Punjab,
Department of Labour. 5




21 INDUSTRIAL DISPUTE ACT , 1947

NOTIFICATION
The 3rd July, 2015

No.S.Q. 31/C.A.4/1936/5.6/2015.~In exercise of the powers conferred
under section 6 of the Payment of Wages Act, 1936 (Centra! Act 4 of 1936),
and all other powers enabl‘ing him in this behalf, the Governor cf Punjab is
pleased to specify that in all the factories registered under the Factories Act,
1948 and all shops and commercial establishment registered under the Pun;ab
Shops =::d Commercial Establishment Act, 1958, the employers shall pay to
the persons employed therein, the wages either by cheque or by crediting the

wages in their bank account.

VISWAJEET KHANNA,
Principal Secretary to Government of Punjab,

Department of Labour.



22 INDUSTRIAL DISPUTE ACT , 1947

o NOTIFICATION
The 18th October, 2012

No. S.0. 88/C.A. 14/1947/S. 39/2012.-In exercise of the powers
conferred by section 39 of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (Central Act 14
of 1947) and all other powers enabling him in this behalf, the Governor of

et ’Uﬂ_] jabis pkased to direct that the powers exercisable by the State Govemment
under sub-clause (vi) of clause (n) of section 2 of the said Act shall also be

exercisable by the Additional Labour Commissioner, Punjab.

R.C. NAYYAR,
Principal Secretary to Government of Punjab,
-Department of Labour.



23 INDUSTRIAL DISPUTE ACT , 1947

4720 UVYVC U NOTIFICATION
The 3rd January, 2017

No. S.0. 2/C.A.14/1947/S-7-A/2017. In supersession of the Government of Punjab,
Department of Labour, Notification No. $.0. 67/C.A.14/1947/S.7/2008 dated the
j0th October, 2008, and in exercise of the power conferred by section 7-A of the Industrial
Dispute Act, 1947 (Central Act No. 14 of 1947), and all other powers enabling him in this
behalf, the Governor of Punjab is pleased to constitute the Industrial Tribunals as specified
:n the schedule given below, for adjudication the industrial disputes relating to any matter
specified in the Second Schedule and or Third Schedute of the said Act, and for performing
such other functions as may be assigned to said Tribunals under the said Act, within their
respectivejurisdiction as indicated against each Industrial ribunal, namely:-

SCHEDULE

Sr. Name of the Industrial Tribunal  Territorial Jurisdiction

No.

1. industrial Tribunal, Amritsar Districts of Amritsar, Taran Taran, Gurdaspur
and Pathankot. ‘
2. Industrial Tribunal, Jalandhar Districts of Jalandhar, Kapurthala, Hoshiarpuy
and Shaheed B‘a‘sagai Sin -wh_liligvla-‘g.__‘m o
3. Industrial Tribunal, Ludhiana District ofLudhm.n; except Sub-division Khzana
Industrial Tribunal, Patiala Districts of Patiala. Sengrur and Bamala.
5.  Industrial Tribunal, Bathinda Districts of Bathinds, Faridkot, Ferozepur,
Faziika, Mansa, iukatsar and Mioga.

B

Industrial Tribunal, Mohal Districts of Mohali, Ropar, Fatehgach Sahit ol

Sub-division Khanna.

VISWAJEET KHARNMA,
Additional Chief Secretary to Governmait of Punigh,

A PRI QU A%l (N BT LT o
RPN Departmeni of Laotal



24 INDUSTRIAL DISPUTE ACT , 1947

NOTIFICATION =~
| The 3rd January, 2017 _

Ne. S.O. 3/C.A.l4/ 1947/5.8/2017.- In supersession of the Government
of Punjab Department of Labour, Notification No. S.0.16/14/1947/S.8/2013
dated the 13th March, 2013 and in exercisg of the power conferred by section
8 of the Industrial Dispute Act, 1947§£Cemral Act No. 14 of 1947), and all
other powers enabling him in this behalf, the Governor of Punjab is pleased to
appoint Sh. Gurjant Singh, Additional District and Sessions Judge, Presiding

Officer, Industrial tribunal, Gurdaspur, as Presiding Officer, Industrial Tribunal,
Mohali, from the date he assumes charge as such.

VISWAJEET KHANNA,
Additional Chief Secretary to Government of Punjab,
Department of Labour.



