
3? W www.govtpressmp.nic.in
1% xfi w 3% film an m %.

W 36] W, W, W 19 max? 2018—11115! 29, w 1939

fisrfa afitfifiafimfiw

mm, W19 Wfizms

a9. 1124—18—36m19—31 (my—war a: mafia: 311%? 213 a; 3129?? rim is wanna STU

WWWWflWWfiWHWWW?

'W%Wfiamfiamafivmm
mama, afirfiaa W.

71



72

'

warm mm, W 19 mar"? 2018

WW

751113; 3 24112024

WWW firfix (Wm) am, :2024

[“mfiwm(m)"fim 22min Q026afiWWfifi‘me

wmfimafifiwmmfiamw.

Wmmm, zeuawmmfimafilfiafi, 2m afiafir

fisfififimarigawfim

am,wtfim—fimmmmflfi%afirnwfimfimmfiwmfiw%fifi
WWW%,WWEEW$W%E§WWH%

W, W37fififlfiéfifla®322aé€w<2>§mmmfimfim§mnm
fimafimfivmaawfiwmmfiz—

mm. 2. 311 am EFF WW WHWWWH (Wu—rt) 31m, Qou it

Maw—m mgaswwéfléxuafifalfifimfifaéafim,nmwfififimafufim,2W:
m V" “i (W R3W2fik©fimnmwwfifimafafiam m2 (W wanna) msafiw
W“ “”1

fifififigfifiafi%amfi=rfi%§quwm.
31W m

wanna am

swan? Ex“: 13‘

fivfifim fim

TSTFIT.

”FT—E55

WWWW, W43 (5511135 Q3 magmmfivfim

WW 3. 11W 37mm film: WW, 22% (W Q3 ‘FFL 2mg) ff, am 233% 13, 3mm

mm
{a In (2)11...

““Wmi'” "

(11$) w ‘fa 9W1?!" % pm a: 316:: “ah W” qua w my

(fi)W“Wfimfiwmw3fimfiwafinfiwwWafifimm
fimfifimmfiawtfiqfimfifimfimfiw

WWmawwfimfimmwmmmfifimmfl

aswm,¥lfi“wmmfifiafifiwfimmmwaafim
mwmwmmmfifimfimmgw

Wmfimqfiqfiwafiaamfimmm.wmmmmm

mmmfi%mammmmmfimmm.
WWII." WWW.



11mm W, W 19 W 2018 72 (1)

aim—Hi

WWW, 2w: (m awm22a2)wfivha=r

x. WWW 11mm afafim, 2222 (m 3x9 11122112) 1?, Hm 2&2 ff, 31mm (2) ff,- WW

Wife-7 30 111

“EQWW.

(W) 'W"€f9fif$fi"%www”fihufim”wfiafiqm;

(E‘T) W“Wmmwmfiwmmfifiafiwafinfitwm
ammfimfifimfiafiafifiawwmafifim

fiamfimmmqufiqfimawwafiafiwfimmwfi
WWWfiWW",3¥WW§W”SfiWWEfiWWEfi
memwfimfiaamfim,mmqfifimsfifigfi

mammgmmmwmmafimmmm.
wmmmmmmmmwammmm
mamammmmmflmmm

um:
'

'

3?:an

We 2? waft, 1ch “(WW

warm.

111111-61, W 19 waft 2018

at. 1124—19—gaafiH—31—(m.).—W a; 1112013111 ~21: 313%? 348 a; we (3) fit 313mm 11', NW 717mm firm

(Wu—r1) 31m, 2018 (m3m2018) arraifisfi WW$WW©QH§§MWWWW§

nwsréméswmafitwfiamanm,

Wm,31fiifiafifii%fi

MADHYA PRADESH ORDINANCE

No.3 OF 2018

THE MADHYA PRADESH NAGARPALIK VIDHI (SANSHODHAN) ADHYADESH, 2018

[First published in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette (Extra-ordinary)”, dated the 19‘“ January, 2018.]

Promulgated by the Governor in the sixty~eighth year of the Republic of India.

An Ordinance further to amed the Madhya Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1956 and the

Madhya Pradesh Municipalities Act, 1961.

WHEREAS, the State Legislature is not in session and the Governor of Madhya Pradesh is satisfied

that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immediate action;



72 (2) mania W, Trim 19 we 2018

Short title.

Madhya Pradesh

Act No. 23 of

1956 and Act

No. 37 of 1961 to

be temporarily
amended.

Amendment to

the Madhya
Pradesh Act No.

23 of 1956.

Amendment to

the Madhya
Pradesh Act No.

37 of 1961.

BHOPAL :

Now, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of article 213 of the Constitution

of India, the Governor of Madhya Pradesh is pleased to promulgate the following Ordinance :—~

1. This Ordinance may be called the Madhya Pradesh Nagarpalik Vidhi (Sanshodhan)

Adhyadesh, 2018.

2. During the period of operation of this Ordinance, the Madhya Pradesh Municipal

Corporation Act, 1956 (No. 23 of 1956) and the Madhya Pradesh Municipalities Act, 1961 (No.

37 of 1961) shall have effect subject to the amendments specified in sections 3 and 4.

PART I

AMENDMENT TO THE MADHYA PRADESH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION ACT, 1956

(No. 23 OF 1956)

3. In the Madhya Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1956 (No. 23 of 1956), in Section

133-A, in sub-section (1),—

(i) for the words "two per centum", the words "three per centum" shall be

substituted;

(ii) for the words "The amount of duty so received to the Municipal Corporation
shall be used for implementation of infrastructure developments projects or for

repayment of loans taken for implementation of such projects by or on behalf

of the concerned Municipal Corporation", the words "The amount of duty so

received may be used for urban infrastructure development, affordable housing

projects, urban transport including metro rail or such other projects in urban areas.

This amount so received may also be used for repayment of .loans taken for

implementation of aforementioned projects." shall be substituted.

PART II

AMENDNIENT TO THE MADHYA PRADESH MUNICIPALLITIES ACT, 1961 (No. 37 OF 1961)

4. In the Madhya Pradesh Municipalities Act, 1961 (No. 37 of 1961), in Section 161, in sub-

section (1),—

(i). for the words "two per centum", the words "three per centum" shall be

substituted;

(ii) for the words "The amount of duty so received to the Municipal Council or Nagar

Parishad shall be used for implementation of infrastructure developments projects
or for repayment of loans taken for implementation of such projects by or behalf

of the concerned Munisipal Council or Nagar Parishadz”, the words "The amount

of duty so received may be used for urban infrastructure development, affordable

housing projects, urban transport including metro rail or such other projects in

urban areas. This amount so received may also be used for repayment of loans

taken for implementation of aforementioned projects,
"

shall be substituted.

OM PRAKASH KOHLI

DATED THE 12th January, 2018 Governor,

Madhya Pradesh.

WWWWWW,WWWWW,Wfigfifiamwfina—zms.


