THE
JHARKHAND GAZETTE

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 179 14 Falgun, 1939 (S)

Ranchi, Monday, 5t March, 2018

COMMERCIAL TAXES DEPARTMENT

Notification

28th February, 2018

NOTIFICATION No-2/2018 State Tax (Rate)

S.0. No. 17 Dated - 5th March, 2018 -- In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of
section 11 of the Jharkhand Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 (12 of 2017), the State Government, on
being satisfied that it is necessary in the public interest so to do, on the recommendations of the Council,
hereby makes the following further amendments in the notification of the Government of Jharkhand,
Department of Commercial Taxes, No.12/2017- State Tax (Rate), dated the 29tJune, 2017, published in
the Gazette of Jharkhand, Extraordinary, vide S.0 42 dated the 29th June, 2017, namely:-

In the said notification, in the Table, -

(a) against serial number 3, in the entry in column (3), after the words “a Governmental Authority” the

words “ or a Government Entity” shall be inserted;



2 Jharkhand Gazette (Extraordinary), Monday, 5t March, 2018

(b) after serial number 3 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall
be inserted, namely: -

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5)
“3A | Chapter Composite supply of goods and services in which Nil Nil”;
99 the value of supply of goods constitutes not more

than 25 per cent. of the value of the said
composite supply provided to the Central
Government, State
territory or local authority or a Governmental
authority or a Government Entity by way of any
activity in relation to any function entrusted to a
Panchayat under article 243G of the Constitution
or in relation to any function entrusted to a
Municipality under 243W of the
Constitution.

Government or Union

article

(c) against serial number 16,in the entry in column (3), for the words “one year”, the words “three
years” shall be substituted;

(d) after serial number 19 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries
shall be inserted, namely: -

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5)
“19A | Heading | Services by way of transportation | Nil Nothing contained in this
9965 of goods by an aircraft from serial number shall apply
customs station of clearance in after the 30tday of
India to a place outside India. September, 2018.
19B | Heading | Services by way of transportation | Nil Nothing contained in this
9965 of goods by a vessel from customs serial number shall apply
station of clearance in India to a after the 30tday of
. . September, 2018.”;
place outside India.

(e) against serial number 22,in the entry in column (3), after item (b), the following item shall be
inserted, namely: -
“(c) motor vehicle for transport of students, faculty and staff, to a person providing services of
transportation of students, faculty and staff to an educational institution providing services by way
of pre-school education and education upto higher secondary school or equivalent.”;

(f) after serial number 29 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries
shall be inserted, namely: -

&) (2) (3) “ [ (5
“29A | Heading Services of life insurance provided or agreed to | Nil Nil”;
9971 or | be provided by the Naval Group Insurance Fund
Heading | ¢4 the personnel of Coast Guard under the Group
9991 Insurance Schemes of the Central Government.




Jharkhand Gazette (Extraordinary), Monday, 5t March, 2018 3

(g) against serial number 36,in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words “fifty thousand”, the
words “two lakhs” shall be substituted;

(h) after serial number 36 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries
shall be inserted, namely: -

(1) (2) (3) 4) 5)
“36A | Heading | Services by way of reinsurance of the | Nil Nil”;
9971 or | jpsyrance schemes specified in serial number
Heading 35 or 36
9991 or 36

(i) after serial number 39 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries
shall be inserted, namely: -

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5)
“39A | Heading | Services by an intermediary of financial services | Nil Nil”;
9971 located in a multi services SEZ with International

Financial Services Centre (IFSC) status to a
customer located outside India for international
financial services in currencies other than Indian
rupees (INR).

Explanation.- For the purposes of this
entry, the intermediary of financial
services in IFSC is a person,-

(i) who is permitted or recognised as
such by the Government of India or any
Regulator appointed for regulation of
IFSC; or

(ii) who is treated as a person resident
outside India under the Foreign
Exchange Management (International
Financial Services Centre) Regulations,
2015; or

(iii) who is registered under the
Insurance Regulatory and Development
Authority of India (International
Financial Service Centre) Guidelines,
2015 as IFSC Insurance Office; or

(iv) who is permitted as such by
Securities and Exchange Board of India
(SEBI)under the Securities and Exchange
Board of India (International Financial
Services Centres) Guidelines, 2015.

(j) against serial number 45,in the entry in column (3),-
(i) initem (a), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(iii) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental
Authority or Government Entity;”;

(ii) initem (b), after sub-item (iii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-



4 Jharkhand Gazette (Extraordinary), Monday, 5t March, 2018

“(iv) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental
Authority or Government Entity;”;

(iii) initem (c), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(iii) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental
Authority or Government Entity.”;

(k) after serial number 53 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries
shall be inserted, namely: -

(1) (2) (3) “4) | B
“53A | Heading Services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of | Nil Nil”
9985 agricultural produce. ’

() against serial number 54,in the entry in column (3), after item (g), the following item shall be
inserted, namely:-
“(h) services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural produce.”;

(m) against serial number 60, in the entry in column (3), the words “the Ministry of External
Affairs,” shall be omitted;

(n) after serial number 65 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries
shall be inserted, namely: -

(1) (2) (3) 4 | (5
“65A | Heading Services by way of providing information under | Nil Nil”
9991 the Right to Information Act, 2005 (22 of ’
2005).

(o) against serial number 66, in the entry in column (3),-
(i) afteritem (a), the following item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(aa) by an educational institution by way of conduct of entrance examination against
consideration in the form of entrance fee;”;

(ii) initem (b),-
(A)in sub-item (iv), the words “upto higher secondary” shall be omitted;
(B) after sub-item (iv), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(v) supply of online educational journals or periodicals:”;

(C)in the proviso, for the word, brackets and letter “entry (b)”, the words, brackets and
letters “sub-items (i), (ii) and (iii)of item (b)” shall be substituted;

(D) after the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-
“Provided further that nothing contained in sub-item (v) of item (b) shall apply to an
institution providing services by way of;-
(i) pre-school education and education up to higher secondary school or equivalent; or
(ii) education as a part of an approved vocational education course.”;



Jharkhand Gazette (Extraordinary), Monday, 5t March, 2018 5

(p) against serial number 77, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words “five thousand”, the
words “seven thousand five hundred” shall be substituted;

(q) against serial number 81, forthe entry in column (3), the following entry shall be substituted,

namely: -

“Services by way of right to admission to-
(a) circus, dance, or theatrical performance including drama or ballet;
(b) award function, concert, pageant, musical performance or any sporting event

other than a recognised sporting event;

(c) recognised sporting event;

(d) planetarium,

where the consideration for right to admission to the events or places as referred to

in items (a), (b), (c) or (d) above is not more than Rs 500 per person.”.

2. This notification shall be deemed to be effective from 25t January, 2018.

[File.No Va Kar / GST / 05/ 2018]
By the order of the Governor of Jharkhand,

K. K. Khandelwal,
Principal Secretary-cum Commissioner .

Note: -The principal notification was published in the Gazette of Jharkhand, Extraordinary,
vide notification No. 12/2017 - State Tax (Rate), dated the 29%june, 2017, vide S.O 42 dated the
29tJune, 2017 and was last amended by notification No.47/2017 - State Tax (Rate),dated the
14thtNovember, 2017 vide S.0 127 dated the 14th November, 2017.



6 Jharkhand Gazette (Extraordinary), Monday, 5t March, 2018

reagEET
28 wIadr, 2018

g Ho. 2/2018- T[T FX ()

TH. M- 17 f&eiis 5 HAE, 2018-- JRWUS HTT UG Adrehy AT,
2017 (2017 &r 12) &I 9RT 11 &I 39 9RT (1) & ded Uecd AfFadr &1 9T
A §T, T TSR $H 910 & TS gl gU fF AT AT SiAfgd H 3T
£ 3 gRug &r TAEMRRIT & 3TYR W), TdGEdRl, SREUS ISR, dIiusd-H]
faarar fr IfAFG=AT dE&AT 12/2017- AT H (), fe=treh 28 =, 2017 To&@
TH. 3. 42, AT 29 ST, 2017 & ded $IRW@US & A9, NHTYROT, H
ORI fohar Irar T, H 3R 31T off eafaf@a Tereer I §, Ior -

3oFd ATRAHPIAT H, FRO 7, -

(F) A TEAT 3 & FAGT oA (3) & YA H, “TIHPRT UMARRI Asal & Ieard “IT
TIHRT AR el I AT T fohar e, -

@) HF FEIT 3 3R 398 gefg vkaftcal & geaa Rafef@a s7 gear ik gyRatear i
Jarfa frar Sreem, Ior-

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5)
“3% | LT | HiGUTA & efeoe 243T & AT | e | W
99 I dJaraad & I gfiaueT &
3lede 2439 & 3ddd fREr R
e & d@i v R s #
gafaa dr haTteerad & ATEIH o
hog TIPR, ToT TIRR, TT T
TSI &9 AT TAET  IIThIoT AT
e gIfeRior I @y A
F & A drell AT TF JAr3dT FHr
HgFd YT TS E@HA Ater Hr 3
HIF 3MYfd T FHod WA 3T &
AT | 25 gfaera & 379k =T &7 |




Jharkhand Gazette (Extraordinary), Monday, 5t March, 2018 7

@) HA TEAT 16 & THET, Plad (3) AT gfafec &, “Th a¥” Uqsgi & TUHT W “diT v’
greel ol gfaeaiia foram e,

@) & e 19 IR 398 gefag ufafseal & geaa Reafof@a w0 g ik gfaftear
F ITTT fhar STeem, T2 -

(1) (2) (3) (4) )

“19% | oy ARG H T&ua fhar [T | 3w yfafse & fAfga
9965 |hIACFH FellALH AT &g o sta 30

¥ ART & sy Bada AdFax, 2018 &

AT T WX argaATT & d1G e SA&T grem |

GART AT T IRagdd

FIA F ATEIH O & ST

arelr dar
19@ | oW ARG A &I el wFerd | T | 39 "fafse A [Afga
9965 | Fitw VAT ¥ #RA & e $Ig 8 a1 30
Rurd el Tl W STerdTe & fasz, 2018 &

CART ATl 1 IRAGeT il & S eI et e |

AEIH @ & S arelr Jar

(3) %A TEAT 22 & THET, Pl (3) T yfafee &, A (@) F U, F=faf@a A Fr
Jaaa fear sreem, Jem -

‘@0 w8 et cafFa & faef@ar, gt AR wFEaRal & aReaga & v A aga

St fF 0 deIOie Teare @ o, srearaer 3R FEETRAT & IRagsd Fr dar geneT

AT 81 S T faeared qa i RieT 3R AreafAs TR A1 GHEET ah H RET & Areaw

d YA HATU YeTed T 8,

(@) %A TEIT 29 & FHT IR 398 F&ftd gfafte & e FAefeaf@d sa e 3k
giafseal &l HT.TAMAT fhar Jreem, J2m -

(1) (2) (3) (4) ()

“29% | MY | Sholg EIHR T AFfgw oTAT W | YW
9971 | ASTATHT o AT deI&Th &

T $HAUTRIT I FAdel PT AR Hs &
oy HTEIH A Yeld Hr JA areir AT YeTd
9991 | U I & faw ggAfa & 8 g
SAT Fara |




8

Jharkhand Gazette (Extraordinary), Monday, 5t March, 2018

(B) HH TEIT 36 F JAGT, Fiadd (3) Fr ydfSe &, A< (31) H “TIw §OR” & F TAT W

“@ AT’ ereet @ yfarnfug fear Sreem;

(37) A &I 36 3R 3TW FERg wfafear & gead Aeafaf@d w7 gear ik wfaftear

F a-Taia far Srwem, Jem: -

(1)

(2)

(3)

(4)

)

“36h

iy
9971
AT
ofry
9991

SH T&AT 35 AT 36 H [AfATEse AT
ATSAATIT o Gel: AT & ATEIH F ¥
ST dTell aara

Ao
o

AT,
o

@) HF TEar 39 iR 399 gefag gyRkdfteat & gearg, Feafef@d w7 gear 3k gfafsear

Fr gfaeaiug fRar Sreem, o -

(1)

(2)

(3)

(4)

()

“39h

oy
9971

IEZsl g Jar arad @AY 3 A=
H ua fAcdia qasit & ATegsy
ST SeEAT  BrEaARTA  iadst
HeX (ATSTHTHAT) ¥FecH g, & SarT
ART & dgX Fua &t ags &r
Farsem facd @asit & fav
HRAT AT & ffear frdl 31=7 #Har
H & IS |arw

TISERIOT - 39 9fafe & 32T &
faT, 3STwrradr § Qe Fait &
Faregey ¥ JfAuT 0 sufea 4 g,
() T IR TWHER o 39 &AfAca
FgAfa A Aemar & & oar R
AfaarAs gfasior o 583 &AfdAca
3TATT &7 § AT S HSTURTHAT &
RAfegasr & fav Tgsa =g
feaas & & § & #Aegar & g,
T

(i) TS facely Har geereT (AR
e dar &heg) AfaaATE@er, 2015

M
N

AT”;
[N




Jharkhand Gazette (Extraordinary), Monday, 5t March, 2018 9

F 3dd ARI & 8 HT Fis
frardy safea AT /=T &y, ar

(iii) S foF AR AT AfaardAs v
ahr T gIfeaior  (FAaRTsarT Ao
Jar sheg) & fear-fAader, 2015 &+
AT FMSTHTHAT AT FSRRT &
9 F doiiepd &, AT

(i) fo8 #R gfasifa va fafasa
s, (@) F aRd gfasffa
Ffaaa g Gawwrse, AT dar
Fog) Teem-fAder, 2015 & 3ided 59
fAfAca 3egaAfa ger= $r ar |

(31) A HEAT 45 & FHeT, Pl (3) 1 wfafse -

(i) #Ag (&), 39 A (i) & I2ad, AFATA@T 39 Ag A ATTA™T fRar smwem, JUr-
“(iii) Porg TWHR, T TR, 9 AT 89, TAET G0, AhRT JIfheor ar
WeRr e

(i) #AS (@), 39 #Ag (i) & UATd, AFATai@d 39 A o a0 fRar sreem, -
“(iv) og TPR, Tod WHR, 9 IoT &1, TUENT IIfaIor, TRl Jifdeor ar
WeRr e

(iii)y A (31), 39 A (ii) & 9ATd, AFATATET 39 A o AT fRar Sreem, -
“(iii) FPrg PR, ToT WHR, T AT &1, TAEET IR0, THRT TIfSeor a1
R R |7

@) HF TEar 53 IR 399 FefRg yfafScal & geara Feafaf@a sa g 3k gfafSear
FT T:Taa fhar Sreem, J2m: -

(1) (2) (3) 4 |

“53ah | MY | & 3cUlel & JAEBE H AT & AETHA § &1 | YT | Y
9985 | Fer grel Harw

(3) HH T&IAT 54 & FHE, Piad (3) A e & #Ac (¥), F RIT F=Afa@d 7 #r
3T Eafg AT STeem, Jem:-
“(T) P Icural & JAESE F YA & HALIH F &1 S drell Fard |7



10 Jharkhand Gazette (Extraordinary), Monday, 5t March, 2018

(3) HH TFEAT 60 & THET, Hrad (3) Fr yAfSe F erse “fager A & FHIe” & AT
foRgT SATUET, T2

@) & TEIr 65 IR 398 Fefaa yafeal & geaa Reafaf@a w0 g 3k gfafear
FT T:Taa far Sreem, J2m: -

(1) (2) (3) “4) | O

“65% | MY | =TT 1 R Jf&TH, 2005 L | AW
9991 | (2005 &hT 22) & AT ITHASRT Y&l | =T |7
Fel o ATEIH H &Y Silel drell ddrd

(UT) A HEAT 66 & HHET, Sierd (3) H ylafse #,-
i. #AG (F) % 9Ild, ATl A I gfaeuriad fRar sreem, J2m-
“(eheh) Topdll QAeTiUTeh HEUTT G@RT YA Yooh & &I H Fidhel & Uasl H Fder &t i
IRANTAT FF & ST arelr |qar;”
i. A (@) #,-
(@) 39-AG (iv) H, “ ATEITA® TR d&” sl &l R’fAd fRar e,
@) 39 AG (iv), & 9TATd, AFATai@d 39 A & AT a fhar Sreem, -
“(v) TS Seied I NRANfSHeT @ e dgeT Igid & Aegd & foeelr
IO TTATT H7;
() Wegeh #H, Ueg, HIsoh IR 3R “GlAfe (@) & TUH W Ueq, HIseh R 38R
“He (@) & 39 #Ag (i), (i) 3R (i) > = sfacafRa fear s,
(€) Redeh & IAd ArAff@d WRege I 3d-Ta1fad fRar Sresm, J2r-
‘gt 3N o T A (@) & 3T AQ (v) A AR Fg o a1 T HEYET W oE]

sTEr gl o &, -

(i) Tacgrerd qd e 3R 3Taa’ ArAfAT TR de A1 FAHET A d6 R&T &
HAEIH &; a1

(i) fordr JeqAlfeT caraE@e RIGT deumA & vh BEy & T A RET &
HIEIH 8 396 §aT ¢ & &7

@) A TEIT 77 & THET, oA (3) Fr ufafe A, A (1) H U/ §oR” AYsal F TAHT W
grd goiR 9 &7 Ueer & gfaeenfa fear sreem, I2um-

(@) HH FEar 81 & JAST, FHiad (3) & ydfte & FTaa W Aafaf@a gfafte =
yfaeeniug foar Sreem, J2am:-
‘AR & 93 & IAFER & & F & S arely JaTw -




Jharkhand Gazette (Extraordinary), Monday, 5t March, 2018 11

() THH, T AT AUeT-HA<T TSHA ATeeh AT S o Mida g;

(@) WEHR ARG, HINa FARIE 3R Afoge gfaaiiarar, @alta geier ar
HIS hrsr ST foF AIAT 9red HIsT FARE d R &8;

(3T) HATTAT UTCd shisT TARIE;

(&) dRTHAS;

ST 3UdaFd #AS (F), (@), (3) AT (F) F IJUT HefAT ARG AT FAT=AT A7
Uaer & SR &r gfakwd 500 9T gfa cafed & 319 1 gr.

2. gg TAFIAT 25 SieTadl, 2018 @ Fgcd gl |

[.8 .droadi/SiTeudHoEro/05/2018]
HRES TSIITT & 3T I,

Fo FHo WusHdld,
eITeT AIT-Tg-37geFd |

e : g AR &dr 12/2017- TeF X (&), f&aieh 29 S, 2017 & wH. 3. 42,
festieh 29 S, 2017 & g FIRWUS & IS9d, HHTYUROT, H YerrfAd foram arar ar 3 saa
A IR ARG &A1 47/2017- T HY(R) At 14 Fawsy, 2017 58 wa. 3. 127,
fesTir 14 saFaR, 2017 & ded HFRWUS o o9, FATURCT, H YHhIAd fohar aar o1, &
CaRT HAMYT fham arar § |

Printed & Published by the Superintendent of Jharkhand Government Press, Doranda, Ranchi.
Jharkhand Gazette (Extraordinary) 179-- 50.



