(4
A
Sy REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/98

wosdt o €k wep-33004/98

:LI\H

EXTRAORDINARY

The Gazette of J CJrzclta

YR J—B0s 3—3I9 B0 (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub section (l) ¥l

Wit | wehIiva
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

o 246 1 - fireeht, qUAR, S[end 1, 1998/3TIF 10, 1920
No. 246] NEW DELHI, WEDNESDAY, JULY 1, 1998/ASADHA 10, 1920
DLRELEE
NferyerAT
¢ figedt, 1 oems, 1998

WIELET. 374 (37 ).— 3T FonR, i, T 3t g (o) sffam, 1962 (1962 %11) %91 6 B0 TS iR
= AT R gy, Y S srqgeEt & v (1) F fafifde sfutafifial w, sw st & wiv (2) wit acarft wikfed F
fyfrfde saimel st et KT, o9 a0 8 TR ik S I et o €
i %

1 "2
ﬁmmﬁu(ﬁmm)mﬁﬁm 1992 (1992 1, U1 H—
v siffira wAi 11) (1) wwRr (2) 3 et o Prefie s ot e, srefy—

“(2) wwmﬁmmmmwmﬂmﬁqﬁm
fraa ="
(ii) S9uRT (2) ¥ vvam e soum s wafa 2w,
s+

“(3) v R et e o a e s wEhn

2. wm2H,—

(i) ‘v, g s S s g orfufEs, 1976 (1976 #114)

et AR R B v e, e R e e g e,
1976 (1976 1 14) 9 T &% &7V SR o & 7o wopa | v
ol o T i
o

1816 G198



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [ParT (1I—S8EC. 3(1))

2

T & 3w () sfufrem, 1993
{1994 =1 e Afufiem doaw 2)

(i) i emn v % v R EREE % SR 239 % avde
Tt T P W aoa dn e o < w e e @
g |
3. T 4 & T e omem
1. SR H,—
(i) =7om (2) % wrR R Fretafon s wlh s, safg;—
" (2) =75 39 i R R g Frd v e v o sfvper
o P!
(i) ¥ v TRrenfm v (2) % 9vem PrAfefee wvm
aﬁmmﬁnwﬂﬁwﬁ,mﬁ:—
“(3) wem TR e T T 8% T el de sdm
2. w2 ¥ i, oo sttt e wies g sfufRm, 1976 (1976 w114) "
vt o i ¥ v e i, e SR Qe e T arfufem,
1976 (1976 1 14) N T &% T S g § 7w vy’ e
o siw @ ity
3. URT4 W Er fe )

[\ET- 11015~ 0 FH TE.(190) ]
€%, v, wfm

auraiy 1

iren S T (FWYA SRR, 199201992 T 1) Wi WS T &5 THO ﬁT:@'ﬂﬂTwﬁWI
i, o ik S v v SPrm, 1996 w1 S W w0 & fog o afufam
res 3 Trony 3 Kool wd A v Brarr g g0 el w9 F 97 srflfaite o -

1. T wm Al wiewy . —

(1) APt it = Tivn o g (Fe) sfufam, 19921
(2) = o arier At W e R ey ToEr aeey § st g P W)
(3) vom e wepdl E9 v i T s d w

2, Y0 2 I | —

s T ary T S A S e wae e gro ol g v g siuREm, 1976 (1976 W 14) (P e
e o setrm . wer T ®) 9 e 2 & o () e, T sl weww? v & v i
¥ ST 239 % ftT Tspal o Prge ST TR @ T S e W e v S siw T i)

3, 7§ M 13 % W SR, 6 Affram w w13 & e, Pretaiea staccenfn feam g, s —

“12. %, Wik Sen —

(1) v arfufrm ¥ Reht sny % A1 gy o TesR e ari T wEle A9 & TRl g | g e
wreat ¥ Tt vt ¥ i vt wa fveds ot Geh onat S sl R ¥, < Rrfka 6w, e SR E

(2) v& AfuPr ¥ svEy, 39ur (1) 3 sty Wiitegm e g ) s i vt

4. @ frrom &)




LT l—are®s 3(i) ] AT AT 3

Farta—II
e wiven 2w ( s ) afkfm, 1993 ( 1994 T TiET Sffaw Heais 2)
e o @ gar 3 e ut qar-Reait

Tire, TIor it e wivew g0 el 1976 T AT T HA & g ww sfutEm |
T 3 TTORTS W e o 3 v e e g1 Pttt €1 9 g ot w—
1. wifirer =m 3fit wrta.—

(1) wa s A e s g (deT) FueEE, 1993 ¥

(2) meﬁmmmmmm;ﬁmﬁwmﬁmﬁl

(3) v fam weqol §9 god & T ol da W)
2. URY 4 T Woitee . —

ey ey s e e e e e when, e o € wien o swfpRm, 19776 (1976 1 14) (Rl ¥ e e
ey srfuftrae ! e T #1) a4 Y IR (1)F -

(i) de (F) & " v we ¥ e R/ W T e W@ e,
(i) v () ¥ i TR e v W o e w e v 1@ s e
(i) T (1) F g D TR e e W R TR e /@ e

3. YRT 11 %7 §.—
o sfufran = w11 3w (2) F ore S TR v ¥ )R TR T v @ g |
4. &9 g T v
MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS
NOTIFICATION

New Delhi, the 1st July, 1998
G.S.R. 374 (¥).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 6 of the Goa, Daman and Diu (Administration)Act,
1962 (1 of 1962) the Central Government hereby extends to thc Union territory of Daman and Diu, the enactments specified
in column (1) of the Schedule hereto annexed subject to the modifications specified in the corresponding entries in column (2)
of the said Schedule.
THE SCHEDULE

Enactments Modifications
1 2
Goa Public Gambling (Amendment) Act, 1. In Section 1.—
1992 (Goa Act No. 11 of 1992) (i) For Subssection (2) the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely —

"(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Central
Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette,
appoint."

(i) after sub-section (2) the following sub-section shall be in-
serted, namely :—
“(3) Itextends to the whole of the Union tertitory of Daman ‘
and Diu".

2, In Section 2.—

(i) for the words and figures "the Goa, Daman and Diu Public

Gambling Act, 1976 (Act 14 of 1976)", the words and
' figures " the Goa, Daman and Diu Public Gambling Act,




4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [ParT ITI—S&c.

Enactments

Modifications

2

;he Goa Public Gambling (Amendment) Act,
1993 (Goa Act No. 2 of 1994).

(i)

1976 (14 of 1976) as in force in the Union territory of Daman
and Diu" shall be substituted.

for the words "the Government of Goa", the words “the ad-
ministrator of the Union territory of Daman and Diu ap-
pointed by the President Under article 239 of the Constitu-
tion" shall be substrtuted.

3. Section 4 shall be omitted.
1. In Section 1.—

(D

(i)

for sub-section (2) the following sub-section shall be sub-

-gtituted, namely.—

"(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Central
Government may, by notification in the Official
Gazette, appoint”’

Afier sub-section (2) so substituted, the following sub-sec-

tion shall be inserted, namely :—

"(3) it extends to the whole of the Union territory of Daman
‘and Diu".

2. Insection 2 for the words and figures "the Goa, Daman and Diu
Public Gambling Act, 1976 (Act 14 of 1976)" the words and fig-
ures "Goa, Daman and Diu Public Gambling Act, 1976 (Act 14
of 1976) as in force in the Unijon territory of Daman and Diu"
shall be substituted.

3, Section 4 shall be omitted.

1 Short title and commencement.-—

[F. No. V-11015/2/96-UTL{190)]
PX. JALALI, Jt. Secy.

ANNEXURE I
The Goa Public Gambling (Amendment) Act, 1992 (11of 1992) as extended to the Union territory of
Daman and Din
An Act further to amend the Goa, Daman and Diu Public Gambling Act, 1976
Be it enacted by the legislative assembly of Goa in the forty-third Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

(1) This Act may be called the Goa Public Gambling (Amendment) Act, 1992.
(2) 1t shall coms into force on such date as the Central Government may by notification in the Official

Gazette, appoint.

(3) It extends to the whole of the Union territory of Daman and Diu.

2 Amendment of section 2.—

In clause (3) of section 2 of the Goa, Daman and Diu Public Gambling Act, 1976 (14 0f 1976) as in force in
the Union territory of Daman and Diu (hereinafter referred to as the "Principal Act,"), for the words and
figure "the Government of Goa, Daman and Diu,the words "the Administrator of the Union territory of
Daman and Diu, appointed by the President under article 239 of the Constitution” shall be substituted.

3, Insertion of new section 13A.—

After section 13 of the Principal Act, the following shall be inserted, namely-—

"13 A, Authorised Game.—

(1) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, the Government may authorise any game of electronic
amusement/slot machines in Five Star Hotels subject to such conditions, including payment of such recur-
ring and non-recurring fees, as may be prescribed.

(2) The provisions of this Act shall not apply to any game authorised under sub-section (1)."

4, Omitted,

A



_{wmI—wws3(i)] IR ST AT : STEER =

ANNEXURE IT
The Goa Public Gambling (Amendment) Act, 1993 (Goa Act No. 2 of 1994) as extended to the Union territory of
Daman and Diu
An Act further to amend the Goa, Daman and Diu Public Gambling Act, 1976,
Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Goa in the forty-fourth Year of the Republic of India as follows:—
Short title and commencement.—
(1) This Act may be called the Goa Public Gambling (Amendment) Act, 1993.
(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Central Government may by notification in the Official
Gazette, appoint.
(3) It extends to the whole of the Union territory of Datnan and Diu.

2. Amendment of Section 4.—In sub-section (1) of section 4 of the Goa, Daman and Diu Public Gamling Act, 1976
(14 of 1976) as in forcs in the Union territory of Daman and Diu (horginaﬁcr referred to as the ‘Principal Act’).—

(i) in clause (a) for the words "two hundred rupees” the words "two thousand rupees” shall be substituted ;
(ii) in clause (b) for the words "threc hundred rupees” the words "three thousand rupees” shall be substituted
and;
(iii) in clause (c) for the words "five hundred rupees”, the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.
3. Amendment of section 11.—

In sub-section (2) of section 11 of the Principal Act, for the words "five hundred rupees”, the words "two
thousands rupees” shall be substituted.

4. Omitted.

(2L -1 A€~
Printad by tho Manager, Govi. of India Preas, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
end Published by the Controller of Publioations, Delhi-110054— 1998







