
(\w) 

T&K$TpifcVT!P-3B004W S^SK^ / N REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/98 

(Ike (Bazette of iJtulia 
EXTRAORDINARY Vv -~pQr*: &<f\ 

WT n — ^ 3 3—3*TW3(i) !fV#l£*ir " " J 7+}< 
PART H—Section 3—Sub section (i) f ^ ^ r . -,.._,oV ,£' 

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

tfo246] ^f^ft,-5Umr,^n^1.1998/3^T?10, 1920 
No. 246] NEW DELHI, WEDNESDAY, JULY 1,1998/ASADHA 10,1920 

srffcRJ^RT 

"HT.'Stf.fa 374 ( 3T).—fr^l*! WhK, "T̂Tr, ^ ^ i f a (HYIWH) •5fftrf¥PT, 1962 (1962"TO 1) "ft VRI6 5TO H<W ¥lRKI*i¥ 

ffefffrf̂ e "^nTRR^ srwM T?^ ' 5^ , "WET 'wq' ^ r "ê nT 5RVC t ? ^ "'TT i^fwirftn ^roft 'f 1 

ift«(T^f>^JJl(WiT«Fr) S l W m , 1992 (1992 1. w H , — 

i$i-%$grfkftqn qqqi* 11) d ) Tronr (2) %"wrrin:PJI=Tl̂ iRan"3irawTi3ft'̂ 'fi, 3r*rf̂ — 

"(2) ^B^wd^^5np^1^%?^^WTTTPn^"^aTfVq^'5Rr 

(ii) ^mnr(2) %-̂ ^Fi.PiHfengfl <4>n?m3f?T: rwTf*nr̂ wcr̂ , 

"(3) ^ i ^ 1 ^ W T ^ ^ ^ x i ^ ^ ^ m ^ k ^ i q R ^ 7 i ' , i 

2. tiRi 2 %— 

(i) "-THT, WT Vk ^ ?fa> ^ 3rf*#m, 1976 (1976 ^ 14)" 

1976 (1976 W 14) ^f TW &3WT 3?h ^ "̂ 'T«TT TĴ xr" Ŵf 

1K16QI/98 (I) 



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART [I—SEC. 3(i)J 

TTtaT-tfite^ OWflttR) ajjWWt, 1993 

(1994 TR"^fWT <HfVfVtH ^nwi* ' 2 ) 

3. tiro 4 w ^fa f&pn -«m̂ ni 1 

1. ^TOKri^*,— 

(i) w r o (2) %"wn^Rf^HftiRafl '<mH55[i^it'3f^J a?*^;— 

" (2) "*TO <wt fliflo ̂  y^fl isHi fare* ̂ -iO-4 *H*R <wmi £f ^ifejvjii 

(ii) wsftflv MRi+»mfVfl ~&vm (2) % TTC^niif
5rRfaftsra ^rqnr 

' ' ( 3 ) W*R $KGR W$ ^ TT*J <^ 1?m sfa ' (N "TC fmr ! " 

2. P̂T 2 "^ " f̂reff, t m 3fa flq wV q^tl grffrPm, 1976 (1976*ET14)" 

1976 (1976 ^T 14) ̂ 7 1 ^ tjfaT^TO 3lfc i f a^ f ''TOnPJ^r" 71^ 

3. «IRT4 ^in?itTTf^r''nn3[firi 

[ w . ^ -1101s -^ . i tST. (190)] 

% n Wl<b qatl (^fttiPT)gTPiTf^W, 1992(1992^ 11) ^ ^ TTO ^ T?TO afa ̂  ""l* W ftSJlftff I 

i.'iiRym HI*I aft* yUv •.— 

(1) yi-^rMPli*H ^>r̂ TT^T"TVgnT^Ft̂ n (Tryfrre) grfffim, 1992 %i 

(3) ^ffiT (4|«1R H ^ I ^ T TT f̂ 3fa Trqui 3fa iftr I t $ I 

2. HOT 2 ̂ 5T ^WffftTT :— 

^ T I ^ ^ ^ W ^ ^ ^ ' ^ ^ ^ ' ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ a T f t r f ^ n T O , 1976 (1976 ^ 14) (ftl^TStf' TS% 

"13.<F. Ulfa^dtsM:— 

( i ) T*T srfafow F̂ %*ft lira % isft ^ *ft w « sstajiPi* OT*fc info/ ^rafe TT#T % Pfî ft "Gta ̂ \ ""Tfa TTTTT 

( 2 ) W SflftlPm % "3TO«l, "̂TOTCT (1) % 3PJfa "Hlf*!^ fe^ft ̂  V t W l l ^ f l f f t l " 

4. TjfTT Phil •Wfll 11 



L-«TFTU—W3(i)] j g j g T : WTWRQ1 

<mi4«i—n 

•<fltii H!#> <$i (TtyrtepT) atffrfircw, 1993 (1994 cpriu^T atftiffcw dmUb 2) 

(1) i s &M*m -w wTfa\*ta> W ( w r ^ ^fWPw, 1993 * i 

(2) w ^ i f a ^ y p f ^ M y ^ w H T m - ^ ' 3 ^ f B ^ ^ ' ^ 1 

(3) w f f i f o ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ 1 ^ 3 ^ 1 1 ^ 1 ^ 1 

2. «JTCT 4 ̂ T ^PThR. — 

, l T ^ 3 # r f i T ^ , , T ? ^ ^ ^ t l ) * » T O 4 ^ ^ T O R r ( l ) ^ r -

(ii)T5re(T9)3"tffttftwr ^ ^ w r ^ ' ' ^ ^ ^ ^ ' ' ^ ^ ^ ; ^ 

3. «rrtr n TRT'*TCito;T.— 

4. ^fcf f*F*TT TFu" % I 

MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS 
NOTIFICATION 

New Delhi, the 1st My, 1998 

G.S.R. 374 (E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 6 of the Goa, Daman and Diu (Admiiustration)Act, 
1962 (I of 1962) the Central Government hereby extends to the Union territory of Daman and Diu, the enactments specified 
in column (1) of the Schedule hereto annexed subject to the modifications specified in the corresponding entries in column (2) 

of the said Schedule. 
THE SCHEDULE 

Enactments Modifications 

Goa Public Gambling (Amendment) Act, 1. In Section If— 
1992 (Goa Act No. 11 of 1992) (0 For Sub-section (2) the following sub-section shall be 

substituted, namely:— 
"(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Central 
Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, 
appoint." 

(ji) after sub-section (2) the following sub-section shall be in­
serted, namely:— 

"(3) It extends to the whole of the Union territory of Daman 
and Diu". 

2, In Section 2 — 
(i) for the words and figures "the Goa, Daman and Diu Public 

Gambling Act, 1976 (Act 14 of 1976)", the words and 
' figures " the Goa, Daman and Diu Public Gambling Act, 



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—Sac. 

Enactments Modifications 

1976 (14 of 1976) as in force in the Union territory of Daman 
and Dili" shall be substituted. 

(ii) for the words "the Government of Goa", the words "the ad­
ministrator of the Union territory of Daman and Diu ap­
pointed by the President Under article 239 of the Constitu­
tion" shall be substituted. 

3. Section 4 shall be omitted. 
The Goa Public Gambling (Amendment) Act, 1. In Section 1.— 
1993 (Goa Act No. 2 of 1994). © for sub-section (2) the following sub-section shall be sub­

stituted, namely:— 
"(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Central 

Government may, by notification in the Official 
Gazette, appoint" 

(ii) After sub-section (2) so substituted, the following sub-sec­
tion shall be inserted, namely :— 
"(3) it extends to the whole of the Union territory of Daman 

andDiu". 
2. In section 2 for the words and figures "the Goa, Daman and Dhi 

Public Gambling Act, 1976 (Act 14 of 1976)" the words and fig­
ures "Goa, Daman and Diu Public Gambling Act, 1976 (Act 14 
of 1976) as in force in the Union territory of Daman and Diu" 
shall be substituted. 

3. Section 4 shall be omitted. 
~ ~ [F. No. V-llOlS/2/96-UTL(190)] 

P.K. JALALI, Jt. Secy. 

ANNEXUREI 
The Goa Public Gambling (Amendment) Act, 1992 (llof 1992) as extended to the Union territory of 

Daman and Diu 
An Act further to amend the Goa, Daman and Diu Public Gambling Act, 1976 

Be it enacted by the legislative assembly of Goa in the forty-third Year of the Republic of India as follows:— 
1 Short title and commencement— 

(1) This Act may be called the Goa Public Gambling (Amendment) Act, 1992. 
(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Central Government may by notification in the Official 

Gazette, appoint 
(3) It extends to the whole of the Union territory of Daman and Diu. 

2 Amendment of section 2.— 
In clause (3) of section 2 of the Goa, Daman andDiu Public Gambling Act, 1976 (14 of 1976) as in force in 
the Union territory of Daman andDiu (hereinafter referred to as the "Principal Act,"), for the words and 
figure "the Government of Goa, Daman and Diu,the words "the Administrator of the Union territory of 
Daman andDiu, appointed by the President under article 239 of the Constitution" shall be substituted. 

3, Insertion of new section 13A.— 
After section 13 of the Principal Act, the following shall be inserted, namely:— 
"13 A. Authorised Game — 

(1) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, the Government may authorise any game of electronic 
amusement/slot machines in Five Star Hotels subject to such conditions, including payment of such recur­
ring and non-recurring fees, as may be prescribed. 

(2) The provisions of this Act shall not apply to any game authorised nuder sub-section (1)." 

4. Omitted. 



{HCTII—79^3(1)] ^ g f j g g j j g g g g 

ANNEXUREH 
The Goa Public Gambling (Amendment) Act, 1993 (Goa Act No. 2 of 1994) as extended to the Union territory of 

Daman and Diu 
An Act further to amend the Goa, Daman and Diu Public Gambling Act, 1976, 

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Goa in the forty-fourth Year of the Republic of India as follows:— 
Short title and commencement— 

(1) This Act may be called the Goa Public Gambling (Amendment) Act 1993. 
(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Central Government may by notification in the Official 

Gazette, appoint. 
(3) It extends to the whole of the Union territory of Daman and Diu. 

2. Amendment of Section 4.—In sub-section (1) of section 4 of the Goa, Daman and Diu Public Gamling Act, 1976 
(14 of 1976) as in force in the Union territory of Daman and Diu (hereinafter referred to as the 'Principal Act').— 

(i) in clause (a) for the words "two hundred rupees" the words "two thousand rupees" shall be substituted ; 
(ii) in clause (b) for the words "three hundred rupees" the words "three thousand rupees" shall be substituted 

and; 
(iii) in clause (c) for the words "five hundred rupees", the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

3. Amendment of section 11.— 
In sub-section (2) of section 11 of the Principal Act, for the words "five hundred rupees", the words "two 
thousands rupees" shall be substituted. 

4. Omitted. 

Printed by tho Manager, Govt, of Indii Prew. Ring Road, Mayepuri, New Delhi-J 10064 

and Publulied by the Conlroller of Publications, Delbi-l LOOM—1998 




