[ATT 1I—&TE 3(ii)] ST 3T TSI ; STETETLOT

Section 21.— (1) In sub-section (5), omit the second proviso;

(i1) In sub-section (7), for “other than Union territory of Delhi” substitute “other
than Union territory of Delhi, Union territory of Jammu and Kashmir and

Union territory of Ladakh”; and

(iii) In sub-section (8), for “Union territory of Delhi” substitute “Union territory of
Delhi, Union territory of Jammu and Kashmir and Union territory of Ladakh”.

kkdht

43. THE SECURITISATION AND RECONSTRUCTION OF FINANCIAL ASSETS AND
ENFORCEMENT OF SECURITY INTEREST ACT, 2002 (54 0 2002)

Section 13.-  In sub-section (3A), in the proviso, omit "or the Court of District Judge under section
17A".

Section 17A and section 18B.— Omit.
Section 18C.— (a) In sub-section (1), omit, —
@) "or section 17A" and "or section 18B"; and
(ii) "or the court of District Judge" and "or the High Court" wherever they occur;

(b) in sub-section (3) omit "or the court of District Judge" and "or the High Court".

section 19- In section 19,-

(1) omit "or the court of District Judge", "or the High Court" and "or the High Court

referred to in section 18B";

(i1) omit 'or section 17A" and "or section 18A".

kkkkk

[F. No. 11012/21/2020-SRA]
AJAY KUMAR BHALLA, Home Secy.

ST

< faeett, 23 s7FqaY, 2020

FLA. 3775(N).—F~T ALEH, TH-HHT TAeA dfaE=aw, 2019 (2019 F1 34) #i g

96 ZTT W& ATRIT T TART Fd U AZTE TH TST& o dael H FEfeiad raer Fdl g, dAATa-

1. (1) =9 SRS T T ATH TG T AT [ (757 Tafe=i 7 ge) smaer 2020 g

(2) TE THH TSI § THTAH T TG T TLd THATT F T gl



88 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

2. AT G ATAIH, 1897 TH AR & HaTad & U IF & AR N, ST TE AT ToFer T |
g et % form A grar 2

3. ATchTIoTR AT &, T8 AT=9T it Jg=T § sfoated srfafaem, Sra 7% it 372 aa| yrfawrt g
AT a7 Henfaa 987 2 f3ar AT 8, SF Aqg=T gy [afa qgadi i IUTaeon & Teqefi= Twret
g, 37 =tz v feforg far = g &, 77 e gr st

4. g =9 smeer § vHET sruferg g o fReft sifarfeaw f el fafds amr a1 s 9 & s
IT ST F T UL FHAUT 9T Uiaeumiua BFu Smusr, am Fwfauw oeat & T Fw, gt uEr
TTAEATI AT 1T, FgT o (HaTT STgi =47 ATTeTaq & H ITA(ed ¢, Tl Fol HIate 968 IT LT AT THT
¥ 3 g, o sroam)

5. TH AT % UH ITae, ST T fEAfer & sTqgad F3d g, AT SHHT ST FXd g [ored 39 AT
Ofq & afiafaa T s o+ S| AT st ST g ar vEr &t e sefa ar S sqam vt
T ATRAT TATFTT 21, 31 FTFqaY, 20198 Ug 990 & § T At 75 T srterg==r, fhu 1w s, &
TS afdagar, T, a9re e Iufaty, s v few A At #1 oo qow = i 1 G g
SrfatermT q5! aaTur,; e UHT et sfereg=T, saer, sfaasar, Fht, Sutate, == a1 [fAas a7 B aa
&1 a=ft 27 Of7 9, 39 & e =, siw 3= £ ot & sfaggeor, ®ewr = s B ST s amEr
g TEAH ITTFTT GIT T QLT o ATEH 6 TIAT ¥ UH HTHA I IT 9T AR ITUST o STTHTL F19T I97
g, STt T = gt A T = en

6. T e i srEHAT | fafafaee fret fatfer &1 Feae a7 Fomga—

(F) =8 T Aeeq et fafer & q@ad swadq a7 39 = 990F &9 7 6¥ T2 A7 989 Al
TS foRelY T =,

(@) =@ vwr AT T Gt % ofiom, TegE a7 S B satewrr, fErerteewr,
THIZLIT AT I il

(M) == v At B fofe % fAeg wia Gt soere & |99 § I fher onfed,
THIEL AT & &I, AT

(%) FETIETET T U srferenTe, farerarfaerTe, areaar, aTiaE, aried, a99gIer A7 &S & qaY
H g sreawur, fafer wrarer 91 SUAT &,

TATIAT Tel T 37T UH T steawor, f3fer wEamer a1 U= &1 99 gf §fe9d, ST a1 Jatad
TRAT SIT RT3 UHT ToRelt orTied, IHIg AT &€ &l IF @i AT (ohaT ST JehTT ||l STy~
FEHIT [T ATAHIH, 2019 (2019 FT 34) AT T AT qTA 7 AT 74T 7

*kkkkkk



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 89

AT
AREE)
LR ATIRR

1. SR HT TH-FHHIT T GgrEar ATa =7, 1961
(1961 T 22)

ot fAeEe
2. SHT-FeHI TAeiHT sfarf=as, 1959 (1959 #122)
T ATIATH §, ST qF Fa9 T F=AAqT TSt T g1 TEH, TA AT FLHET TSI, o T I¢
FHI: AETE H T JITET, ‘TAETE T T &3 3T oI T |

T 6. — T7 T Fq0” % T4 9¥ “O79 g T90” T |
T 9. — “TUTE T & |IZAT T 9T “WIEA 1T & |ig4T, (1860 FT 45)” T&|
3. THRL-FHLHIT YT T TR Atefaaw, |@a4q. 1977
(HaT 1977 F7 5)

ot s #, 9 A% dad F e SuAf 2, W, SEHeH, T w6 s
WA ST WL TSI BATH U FHI ARG WA ST TATAT, AT HH AL, HIAT

T, “ETE §F TS T 3{¥ T’ 7 |
ot STt H, "9, A & T 0 "M 99 e TUTEa g1 MY st W@

ot STt ®, " G F ' 9w "2 A\ F THSEl B QT FA 6 T 97 AT
e

T 2.~ (i) @< (3) H, “qTaca [« o, 37 fAaers &t 9f<h & #= &7 g0 % oI
T TR HH TSAT YT g1 g 7@, 37

(i) @<= (5-F) FT AT FL|

1T 10. — ST-GTT (1) |, “S[FH AT ATSTH & T 9 -3, [arad
ST eI | 3o Siaa? oY IIarear st strerf=aH, 2013
(2013 =7 st . 30)" & |

T 15. — ITETT (2) H, “TF AL T 5 TAF I “TH AN T90° TH |

T 17. — IT-ATT (4) ®, “agra® ek £ 9fp & = &7 T 20 &7 AT F:2)
gTIT 20-F. — “IT TG Forel & AT |, I e &7 IUTaFa” &7 AT #:3

#TT 20-T. — “1990 T AfAATw &, 10 T5T A AL 7 F T T “q-379i,

HAEA T AT H 3 qiady oY IRErear e



90

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

YT 22-%. —

afafie, 2013 (2013 1 afarfer &. 30)” &

‘g% WiHAT |igdT, §aq 1989”7 F T WX ‘dT wiwAT w@igar, 1973
(1974 FT2)” W& |

*kkkkkk

4. S-FHLHR g wgr (R sifafaas, 2010
(2010 =T 17)

OO ATAHTH &, LA TSI & #7992, " |
OOt ATR=w &, "G F T 9T, A |

IOt —

gqrr 1. -

g 2.

g1 3. —

g 4.

YT 6.

T 8.

g 12, -

g 13. -

g 18. —

"I W/, T U "qEE 89 Teae Tt 7 |

(i) ST-aT=T (1) ¥, "TH-FHT" F T G, "qE@ T OSTEA T,
S 158

(ii) ST-gTT (2) H, "TH-FHHT T[T F T T " qF AT
T |

(i) @< (F) §, "OoT" F T UL, "qEMG G T AT T 37

(ii) BT (), F I TT-

(ST) "TATEA" F FETE §H TS TE T TITHA SAT95d gl

IT-GTT (2) H, TEq® |, "Rt stterg=ra smaer g, & €479 9% "SI0
H srferg=ET g 7|

gT (F) H, “STEL-HHT a9 Ata=aT, 1987 F T T F HHihd

A G, T TATE I AT a9 At g9, 1927 (1927 FT 16) F e
TG §F TG FT a9 &7 TG

(i) ST-gTT (1) &, " F T X "FEG TF TSAAT" TG, 3T
(i) ST-9TT (4) ¥, @ () &, ITE= (i) H, " IGU HEAU 2" F
T I¥ "qETE T TS & TguoT A=y aiufa” @)

Y- (2) H, @ (F) H, "IGUT [0 L F T W qEG T
TS TGO A= FiEf @)

TSRO |, s TieRAT ST, dad 1989 #it &mT 102 =i & 103" *
T UT "&T AT "igar, 1973 Y a1 100 (1974 7 2)" &

TS 3 T Y, "EE 99 OeTaT |
"gifsw ug wifkfeafiar feem e, "=a 2000 siw #15 s fafa"
T 9T, "HE &g @)

[PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 91

T 23. — "I TOHIY E2 Higar" & T U, "M &2 Higar (1860 FT 45)"
|
4T 28. — TS % T 9T, "G G TeTa T W |

*kkkkkk

5. SRI-sweiT Hfow ik R s srfafRae, 2004

(G 2004 77 12)
quid: T Y
6. SR-HeHT FT T UEET Tt s stfgf=e, 1997
(1997 #1 srfarfaw €. 12)
ura: e

*kkkkkk

7. SRL-EHeHT waw yaree FaeEr stfafAae, 1988
(1988 T 15)

OOt SATAAH |, T T HaH & FFIT ST T 21, "qEH1L, A ATRET TSI % €9 90 FHA: A2
T TTSTLT T TITET, A TSI TG

I fereT o fEam, Fqut stfefaae ®, Se-weHe A7 'S U ' S ST & T 0 FeE 899 TSA9T 9|

g 1. — 'TT-ETT (), 'STHH-FeHIT TT' % IH T TG 69 5T+ T
T 2. — (i) @< (9) ®, IU-E< (i) ¥, ", FeHIT AT § "ITe-T1=" F T | AHAL TT
AT " T AT Y

(i) @< (10) ®, 'STHH-FeHIT FTHIT & €T G "TEG T TSTET AT AT
o ; HiT
(iii) @ (13) T A9 F

g 3. — IT-4TT (1) H, ‘T’ T AT FH2

g 4. - T[S FT AT F3

g1 5. — IT-GTT (3) H, TH T AT F2

g 10. - T WHAT |24, Tad, 1989' & TAT9 U¥ 'S WHHAT &igar, 1973 (1974 &1

2)' W& T GT (i) F ITEE (F) H, g 57" F A X "G 42" T

T 11, — T 9157 o T UT, Tgi-Fgl 9g ATAT g, SHeh AT I 'TEMF §9 e
T TATHA TE |

*kkkkkk



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

8. SHI-HHIT agHry arTset sfafaaH, 1989
(1989 T 10)
Toor srferfeer ®, "R T, S HY Ry stawr Sferfeem, g9, 1997" F T T, gt Fal oF
AT g, " i HO R stawer Ay, 1882" T
oot srferfeee ®, SEFRT F fBamT, o9 9% 210 ¥ 7T IuStd T g1 S-ReHIT" 951 F T
Y, "qETE 9 ST T |

ERATEIS (i) TET T "OST HY, F T UL IAAT T I AG-Fel AT 8
TR 99 TTaT §' )

(i) "STFL-FOIHIT F HiAGTT | TqTad a7 & Aid Haor® qacar &

ATETL" T ATT FL|

T 1. — (i) ST-8T=T (1) ¥, "STEH-FLHIT" o TIF I "FEE@ § [T @,
(ii) IT-TT (2) |, "TFL-FHIHT T F T UL "FEG HH ST
" T

T 2. — g (A) F, TG (i) 7, "o T F H W "qLE A ST
T 9T &7 7@

g 3. — ST-ET (1) ®, "HY0 STHH-HLHIT TSI F TIF 9 WO Aard 99
TSI " T

g 10. - SY-TT (1) ®, "TST F FARA F T W "qEMG G T5F&0T &
FEFA" T

T 16. — ST-9TT (1) ®, TqF H, "SfiT UAT TAF A9, TH IA10 J4 %

TeaTq, sftemiaeiis, o7 FamEed & YT 989 & 99, T d
o ST 7 AT

g 17. — 3IY-4TT (1) ¥, -
(i) =< () &, -
(P) 3U-E< (i) ¥, "TH-FeHT "iaar Ateaf=aw, daq 1977" %
AT U, "ATLA T "ieaT e, 1872 (1860 1 21)" T,
@) IT-ET (i) FT AT F; 37T
(i) @< (M) ¥, "STEH-HLHIT AHETEr TSR Atef=aH, daq
1998" % T ¥, "HIHTZT Lo srfarfaay, 1860" w@|

T 35. — T (i) F TqF H, -

(F) "TTT ALCHTL" F T UL, "L T AT TqTEA" TG ; 3T

(@) ""ufxr e stafaaw, g9d, 1977 &t 9y 140 F Iu«e &
FeTeT" T AT FL|



[T [1—=7F 3(ii)]

HILT T TSI AHTYTL

g1 40. —

g1 60. —

g 79. —

g 91. -

g 92. —

gqrr 94. —

g1 107.

g 111,

g 131.

g 132.

grT 134.

grar 143.

grer 153.

grT 155.

grer 171.

g 174.

"TR-RHIT IR AfgeIe, "Eq 1977 F T W,
"TirEdT srfar=aw, 1908 (1908 &7 16)" T

eqre sferfeEe, Had 1977" F T UT, "9AT 2 Aty
1882" (1882 =T 2) TH|

IT-GTT (1) ®, TET TIEE 9T 0 "OoF" F TIH U<, "I A6
TSTET" T |

ST-YTT (1) |, "& I+ I A" T "FH AT G qHUTT F
TR FETIaT AT =aw, Taa 1993 3 =" &1 17 FL|

SU-4TT (2) ®, " «ieT ueeew uAlfere™ stfafa=m, saq 2007 #
Fre AT FTT" % T I "THTT Tgcq ha ot § [iga B ama
% A gU A" T

"SRG TR stafaaw, gaq 1977" F T W,
"I T Afaf, 1908 (1908 T 16)" TH

ST-GTT (1) H, "TH-FeHiT IR afa=as, daq 1977" %
AT UT, "Tored s sfarfaara, 1908 (1908 &1 16)" T
"STHR-HOHIT I GHEO Afa=aw, gaq 199541 g 6 H [Afga
ot aTa & B gu it &1 A1

ST-4TeT (3) ¥, "Frfaer wherar gfgar, daq 1977" % v 97, "«
TRt Ff2aT, 1908 (1908 FT 5)" T&|

IT-4TT (1) |, "7 89F" o TATH UL "UTT 69F" T

ST-ET (1) H, "SHL-FHHIT TR 3T T herar = sfa=a,
1966" & TATH 9T "AETENT 3T ATOMSTH HITRNT ATA I,
2012" &

“STH-FH9HT g TR stferfaay, daq 19907 % &\ T “9-

qo, qAATEd Y qAedaedr d § 3fa wiawe sfiv areatdar
srferTe srfafaae, 2013 (2013 =1 30)” |

gT () ¥, "TH-HHT WER & |4 ar ® " W "R &2
SR (1860 T 45)" T

"qRHTET srferfaaw, daq 1955 FF TaT FAIEHT & A= 182" F
T 9T "TRET Sfaa, 1963 (1963 T 36) i &m=T 137" |

"t rfarfrer, 1956 (1956 T 01)" ¥ T w7, "ot srrarfem,
2013 (2013 F7 18)" &1

ST-4TT (1) ¥, "Frfeer s |fgar, gaq 1977" % e+ uw, "«




94 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

wtwar wf24T, 1908 (1908 =T 5)" TH|

T 176. — IT-4TT (1) |, "T5F" 3 T UY, "qETG 9 qFe T W

*kkkkkk

9. SH[-HHIT TR Tga Afafaaw, 1976

(1976 T 15)

Tt SferfAas @, ST % ST SUSTAT T g1 "HIAH” F T 9T, "I T T AT JATEA" G |
I T — "STH-HOHIT TS 3 T 9T, "AEME Y ST |

T 1. — (i) ST-9TT (2) ®, "TH-HIHT T F T U, "II@ §H TqAT"

T Y

(ii) ST-&TT (3) H, "HCHRTLT TIT=" 3 T7H 9" T 7 |

T 2. — (i)@i‘s’(ﬂﬁ,—
(F) "STHH-FLHIT TRl qETeel ATa=aH, 1960" F T 9T
"SE-RHIT AT ATl e, 1989" W6 ;

(@) IT-ET (i) H, "AT TEL-FHHT FURT sqeor srterf=a+, 1977
#T €T 140" T 1T H3;

(M) IT-TT (v) ¥, TET TAE T, "STH-FLHIT T & T
I "G T ST TATHA" TG ; 3T

(i) T= (2) F TTSHI H, "STHH-FLHIT LA 6 T 9T "FErE q5F
TSI TATHA" T

(iii) @= (9) #, "F-FeHIT TgHT TraTer Atert=ad, 1960" F w9
T, "STHR-HIHT HEHILT FHTEr AfAHae, 1989" T ; i

(iv) ST-a=T (10) ®, "&faes wiwar w@f2ar, gaq 1977" F ©o+ uy,
"farfaer swieraT wfgar, 1908 (1908 &1 5)" & |

T 3. — (i) ST-gTT (1) &, "ITRET TSATA" T I "N T

(ii) ST-GTT (7) H, "TLHRET TATA" 3 TATT I " T 37

(i) ST-gmr (11) ®, “oRET Afaf==m, daq 1995" & == 1T
"gfRET srfarfRa, 1963 (1963 T 36)" &

qRT 4. — TEqE H AT A2

T 12, — "frfaer whRaT |@f2ar, g9 1977" & w0+ v, "ffae whwar |@f2ar,
1908 (1908 =T 5)" TH|

T 22. — "Rrfeer gfrar |@fzar, "= 1977 F wom wy, "Rifae gfr |@fzar,




[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 95

1908 (1908 =T 5)" 7|

1T 30. — ‘ST ST FeHIT TREATHT stferfeaH, daq 1995", & 19 u¥ "IiEHT
srferfrae, 1963 (1963 F7T 36)" |

T 32. — “TOTE T &2 |2AT, §9d 1989" F T 9¥ "ATLAIT & gfar (1860 =T
Ffafaag 45)" @

T 34. — (i) T T 92 "TrSTe AT AT T AT L AT

(ii) "R TTTA" 3 TTH 9, AT TS T |

*kkkkkk

10. STHE-FHHIT IT HEHIAT & A S A, A=A, 1957
(1957 =T 6)
Ui T w1

*kkkkkk

11. STRL-HIHIT YT AT ST THTITT (SuAteaat) AfaFaw, 1956
(1956 T 22)
Ui T w1

*kkkkkk

12. sTp-hed X A stfarfa=m, 1970
(1970 %7 19)

QT St #, ST T AT ISt T 2 g, MR a9 ST s % e 9,
FHET:, "TIATHA", " A" AT "SULSAITA o TATGHL TG |

T 2. — gT (1) ®, " srterrgor srfafaas, 1990 # amT 3" & TI9 %, "94-
S, [AATE 3T [AeAaedTad | 3= s ol qeafear dfawre
aferfaer, 2013 (2013 &7 30) T&)

T 8. — IT-4TT (1) |, "UH TAF S, oEd & BT =i & 7 fBrariera
TRT SIT | 3T "W ST 3 TIT9 9% FHeT: "UH S e 9T 13
& o1 A & & &7 | =iua &6ar @7 8" 8T "Yod® UET S
W |

g 11, — "HTEET TATH o 99T 3" 3 TTF U< "HTEET W1 o 9997 I T4 |

T 11 F 7997, TS
T T AT EATAT—

“11%. (1) ATEE AT AT ST (SR AT F AN 219 % J9ATd, T6h
g w aETa AT o Arer & § i AT AT SUANT Fad U {EET W AT




96

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

ST #R @
SUART TR T
Jagul
CEIGERSEIEIRCIL I
IR RAFE F W T
AT, SR

gqIT 15. -

g 16. —

ST fahTe oA § TAT Sustad § Haem=i & Tqa grm:
U AETE T TASAAT TEHT Tged Rt fater  Suey, e R

¥ F ITANT | qRaa & €9 9% e AqATT Taterd gr, T4 o
Frer FoReT & 9% AR 98T g

(2) F=TE TH TSTET TATEA, TSI H ATHLAAT FIT, AT AT T
ST AT oA\ | S % TATISd SO0 6 #1997 T9E0 %
352 aq ThiH AT FT T, THE AR Frrerwr it fAfer #wr

et 2 &Y gy 50 Maemgam sferd s sfem@e & e" 1w
a8 SUNTA SAFT I GIT HIA o T 9T ITANT | ATT ST For)”

gT 13 F = w7, FReofea @ -

"13 (1) T & AN g il ATE & ATHIET qael T, % 91T 11
& STefI TRTA o T9HATd, VT T2 TTHA i IF AT 7 377
T afegEEr grr Gl oft S oar sew R an @ s
SATTHAH o STHTSIHT & =19 9 TTe & & €9 § q0d HT T

(2) Teawa v foet At & et afasger ara % gra gu o, vt
sfergET % afomesT w2 oft v dwr w9 asae w oA
FranT off g, =9 o= a1 Taw fF & ol o g-smr ar s " w7
T T3 S AT |/, SET AT AT9T 1, T T qgl Rl o a&
% =9ttt & Y™l F SA IIEHr § 39 THh & (G
T % T 97 forfaa st areq 981 i AT |

T @ §9 TSFE TmEA & hEr AEnr AT G o s
STTErReoT ZTeT FoheT T s 7 <<, 2019 % 31 F faF & g oA

feraT T forenme &1 39 TR 3T ST ST FeT 91T AT ST
e

(3) #r off =fxw a1 [T, w12 ag s 2 ar arEs«E g e
TG T TSTAT TATHA T Hls AW AT e TTiareor off 2,
sTrersRer #it foar qF forfea sqafa &, T AR $F Simret F aee
Foreft o Torrelfier e & foret oft STt 3 Sremrse e A, T oft =0 F
fAoaTiad F3 #7 F1F AT T2 A

T T YHT T AqATT F TATSAT 3 T T, VTR0 STE-FHeH T
TTfeET SfAfTE, 2000 (2000 FT 20) F fathea wfwmet
AT FIT:

Tg T T, =0 IT-aT % oefia Ades Sr-awedie 2= @
afafm, 1963 (1963 ¥ 20) ¥ TUae ¥ oefiw oy rew wnaT
i & Be0 % w9 | fow o Rt ot e #7197 A 98t gem
"I H TS T F T UL, "SI H HTEET TATT AT ST (e s
|

3I7-gT (1) ¥, "qr Afwger sfefaaw, s=aq 1990" F I 1%, "q-
Ao, [AATE 3T [AAaedTad | It=a s i qeafear dfa=se

[PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]



[T [1—=7F 3(ii)]

HILT T TSI AHTYTL

97

g 21.

g 22.

g 24.

YT 26.

greT 31.

g 34.

YT 43.

YT 45.

grr 49.

Ffarfaee, 2013 (30 #7 2013) & |

IT-TT (4) |, "$iT T9FhT Tl Ueh Uid [FLEHE & Tl 941 &
qHE T " T ATT FHL|

IT-ATT (2) ¥, "afaey f[Afer sfafaaw, g=9a 1998" F ToH 4¥
"FHET wiasr e sie wehiot Sueer srfafaaw, 1952 (1952 =1 19)"
|

(i) IT-4m=T (1) ®, “5,000/- €.” T “200/- €.", F T IT  FHHAL:
"50,000/- ." 3f< "2,000/- %.“ ¥E|

(i) IT-4TT (2) ®, ‘A9 A = T “TF | 9979 €.", F T 9
F9T: "30,000/- €." 3f¥ "1500/- ®.“ TH|

(i) ST-82T (3) H, “TH gAR &.", % T[T "3TH g9 &;" TH|
IT-4TT (4) |, "7 |7 T0" 3 TIF 92, "<7 g &9 T |

"STTERET 3l 36 TATH I VTR AT AT, & Hey qgHa =9 3w
9Tt 9" T FATT F|

(i) ST-o=T (2) ®, “Ffaer wiwar €@f2qr, d=q 1977" F &+ 1
"y g wf2aT 1908 (1908 7 5) 74 &

(i) ST-gTT (6) H, "HTeAEITH AfATHIH, HAad 2002" F T G "
"HTETEITH ¥ qoAg AT HaH, 1996 (1996 T 26)" T&|

"TUTE Y E€ Higar" & T 9T, "IIA T &€ gigar (1860 FT 45)" T
"gT TiHRAT FEAT, 1989 FT =T 32" F T U, "dT WhHHAT HigAT,
1973 (1974 =7 2) #¥ gTT 29" T

gT () ¥, ‘TH-HHR T qgY A 9o FeEwrEr atg=em, g9 9q
1963” F TN T, ‘TH-HHX T qqreq (RRTwT T ga=)
gfafaw, 20107 &

*kkkdkk

13. e AT AAF G (RE=ror) sreareer), 2005

(FarT 2005 =T STEATL 7 5)

FLATQT |, T Tk AFAT TS 7 Bl "HALHT, 3T TS’ 3T "FLHRET TATT’ 3 T UL, FH:, 'TEMG T
TSI TITHT, TG T ST 3T o0 |

#TIT 37—

"gT yiar 6i2ar, 1989" & TH19 ux "I WhHHAT €igar, 1973 (1974 &1
2)" ¥



98

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

g 8. —

g 10.

g 12.

grT 15.

YT 16.

grT 17.

grr 18.

grT 19.

Y- (2) ¥, "< WiHAT Higar, 1989 & &<T 61" F TIF 9T "IT
gferaT sf2ar, 1973 (1974 7 2) it g7 57" &)

IT-gTT (1) ®, "&= wiFar =@far, 1989" sfi¥ "gamr 30" F T UX
FHT: "aT TiEAT "iRAT, 1973 (1974 F7 2)" i "9 29" )

IT-4TT (2) H, "< whFar €6igar, 1989" & waq1= ux "< Wik "@igar,
1973 (1974 77 2)" TH|

TAT T I, "< IhRAT |igar, 1989" F ¥A19 9T "< YhHHAT Higar,
1973 (1974 7 2)" T

IT-TT (2) ®, "< lerar |i2ar, 1989 #r &mer 439" 9T “4TeT 439 *
Has H o T 9T "€ qiHAT "igar, 1973 (1974 #r 2) Fir g 401"
TAT “401 F FaF #” TH

"gre fefaEw, 1977" F T 9¥ "9 q1eg sfataa|, 1872"
W |

IT-TT (4) H, "<z wfwrar 9igar, 1989" & v ux "< kAT "@igar,
1973 (1974 T 2)" T

FAT T 9T, "€ IhhaT digar, 1989" & ¥ UX "3 WHHAT Higar,
1973 (1974 FT 2)" T

IT-gTT (1) H, "< IR 6igar, 1989" F #q19 9T "< YhHHAT Higar,
1973 (1974 =T 2)" TE|

SU-4TRT (1) |, "d= wiFar @fzgar, 1989" F o ux "d= wiwAr €@,
1973 (1974 %7 2)" T

*kkkkkk

14. TE-FIHIT AR L ATAIH, Gaq 1958 (1901 TS)
(1901 T=T TRWT T Hoheq AT 9)

ot At §, S I a9 F A7TAT IUSTAT T BT, "HIHL” | | U AL qH 5T AT FTEA"

)

ECEENE

g 1. —

g1 3. —

"STFL-HIHIT T F T T, "I 6 T5TAT " T |
(i) 3T-4TT (2) H, "TI5T F AL F T UL, "I HT g T |

g 3 W, —

(i) @< (3) ®, "SLHET TSI, F T WSO T

(i) @= (11), @< (12) 3T @< (13) ¥, " &A" F &9 9, "q&rd 99
TTET" T ; 3T



[T [1—=7F 3(ii)]

HILT T TSI AHTYTL

99

g1 3. —

g1 4.

T b.

T 6.

g 7.

g 11, -

gTar 115,

YT 125,

g1 145,

g1 16. —

g1 165,

g 17 37 24.

grT 32.

g1 34. -

g 38. —

g 39. —

g1 569. —

(iii) @ (18) ®, "TST ALH" T "GLHRT TSIH" F T 4T "L
T TS TATEA" ST "0 |

"FETARTLT TSI 3 T 9T, "I T

IT-4TT (2) |, "ILHRT AT & £ 98 "qNIT" G|

"STEL-HIHIT TS T 9T, "G 69 T8 " T

" o T Y, "EE 99 T8 " G|

"FTARTLT TSI 3 T 9T, "I T |

TS F T 9T, "AETE HY e " 6|

T3 T |, "OST F TIEEl” & T U e 99 TeaetT " |

IT-GTT (2) ¥, "OF TR F T q¥ "AETE T qTAT TITHA"
|
T & Ee (i) 7, -

(F) "STEL-FIHIT" F T U, "L H TS {7

(@) "SF FAHET A B F T 9T, "R 699 ST T 5 |

TS o T Y, "R 99 T8 " @

"TIST kAT | AT 9T H AT Y ST ¥ [REtaat F e v,

"TETE T ST H AT T TS H AATAT AT Y T 4T
IGRIIEERERC]

"SI YT TSI ORI YT, FET e O USders
JTHA" 3T "SI T

"I TgT-Fel dg AT g, F €I I, "qETE /) AT " |

(i) "= iR Hi2aT, 1989" % worr ux, "d¥ ghwar @f2dr, 1973 (1974
T 2)" T ; 3T

(ii) TEGF FT AT HL

AT AT 9T, "ST" 3 T UL, "qErE 5 e " )

‘g2 YhHRAT "2dT, 1989”7 F TTH 9T, “IT WHHAT "igaT, 1973 (1974 =T
2) @

"ZT wiRAT |124T, 1989 F seama 30" F T ¥, "I% wiwAT §fEdr,
1973 (1974 FT 2) & 72977 33" HE|

Y- (2) ¥, "I AhHAT |Far, 1989 Fr AT 2" F € T, "€
stRaT |/fRar 1973 (1974 &7 2) ¥ "sie=t 1" 7E|



100 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

1T 61. — (i) IT-ETT (1), "W & |@iZAT F e 9 " g2 61 2aT (1860
FT45)" T ; 3T
(i) 3T-4TT (2) H, "&= whFAT Gf2ar, 1989" F T UR, TS "I
stk |fzar, 1973 (1974 1 2)" |

T 62. — “STF-FOHTY FLRTET TSI o T O, ‘T 6|

41T 64. — "SFL-HIHIT FERTE" & T U, "I ST raa"” W

*kkkkkk

15. ST-HHIX T FRewdor sifarfRaT, 1988

(1988 #T 9)
Ui T w1
16. STH-FHIHIT TST T FrahT Rg=ror sfrerfaas, 1971
(1971 %7 18)
Ui a4

*kkkkkk

17. STRL-HeH i AT AT sAfafaaw, 2018
(2018 T 16)

TOOT ATARTH |, T T G2 F T=AAqT ITSTAT 7 28I, LR, STEH-FLHIT 3T TR TSI, % T
¥ FHT: TG T TSTAT TIATHT, ‘TG T T[T 37 TSI, G|

EEAE T §" o €9 U e 1 eAe T § " |

T 2. — (i) BT (F) * T9ATT AT TATAT < AT, -
(F%) "TATER" F AT HH ST TATHA" AT &; 3T
(if) @< () FT T F

T 12, — IT-4TT (3) ¥, "o sfafaew, gaa 1995" F Tt u¥ "oy
srferfaaw, 1963 (1963 T 36)" |

g 17. — ‘ST WTHRAT HigaT, dad 1989" F €9 ¥ "I WhHAT Hfgdr, 1973
(1974 T 2)" TH

T 18. — (i) ST-4T2T (1) §, "= ghrT |f3ar, S99, 1989" F v 0¥ "F% whHAT

|f2aT, 1973 (1974 7 2)" W& ; 90X
(ii) ST-&TT (3) ®, "< kAT "@igar ¥ &m=T 403, Had, 1989" F €T



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 101

T "FT whRAT AT, 1973 (1974 #7 2)) Fir &7 300" TH

T 19. — ST FLRT o B9 9T "q9mad” @)

gqTeT 21, — “TUTE T &2 |gaT, Had 1989" F TIT9 U< WA 1F < /{4, (1860 T
45)" TF |

T 22. — 3T - ETT (2) FT AT F2

T 27. — IT-GT (2) ¥, TEI T X, "TSFAA" F O U, "qEE@ g
T T

oY 28. — " TiRAT SfeaT" F T U7 "§T iHaT stear, 1973 (1974 F7 2)" T

*kkkkkk

18. STHL-FHIHIT T 9= v srfarf=ae, 1978

(1978 FT 12)
quid: T
19. STRL-FHH X Meh fawre i< setere arferwor stfarfae, 2013
(2013 T 7)
EURHERCE R

20. SHL-FHT T T Afaf=aw, daq. 1945 (1888 T.t.)
(G 1945 F7 12)

QT ATTw ¥, ST T Ha9 | T AAT IATAq 7 &, A, T, STE-HHT ST HEHRET TSI F
TITH UL, FHT: TG T TSTLT TATHT, "G TF TSI, TETG HF ToFe= A T+ |

g1 10. - AT sfazetoT ¢ -

"ETSTRTT; AT § THTIF | AT T THALT TATHA il JaHT2e I ATTATEA
TRt TSI gl

21, TH-FHH I FEAAT (oracar =) sfefaes, 1978
(1978 F1 4)
o fAeE

*kkkkkk



102 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

22. STT-HeH T T srferfaEe, 2007
(@ 2007 FT 27)

TOOT ATAATH §, "ITRET GEhl", "M EF" AT "TR-HeHIT TS o T IY, FH: "I
TS T TEH", "TEG T TSTST il GEF' A< "TE@ T T T |

IforeRT TR, wqet srferfaae ®, "aawre” & T U, "MErE 69 e e Yerae” W

*kkkkkk

23, sTR-FHeHiT g a8 srfafRaw, 1976
(1976 F17)

quid: T

*kkkkkk

24, STF-FHHIT SIRIF ST (T ATGIR) AFh1eT AT A, 1974
(1974 FT7 13)

OOt AR H, "SR TSI 6 T O, "SI T
ot AT #, 9T 10 &t IT-4TT (1) F @ (1) F M9 "9 & €9 W "qEE G99 5T

JATEA" T

IefHT 1. — "I {" o T U, "R 9 e § T |

gqeT 1. — ST-GTT (2) H, "STHH-FeHIT TT" o B9 9%, "a21@ 89 T5q247 " T

T 2. — GT (F) |, " F T I, "qE@ T A5G T " T |

8T 3. - ST-4TT (2) T &7

1T 6. — IT-GTT (2) |, “TOTIY &< |igar, 1989”7, F TIH I¥ “9IL T &2 "iar
(1860 T 45)" T& |

#TT 8. — ‘T FIU” Y ST G IAE T, F T 9L RAA: I AT a9 4T
F AT T A T

greT 9. — “qi= |1 ®I07 % T ¢ ‘919 go¥ 290 WG |

*kkkdkk

25. STH-FIHIT GTal S I SANT 1€ ATA I, 1965
(1965 #T 16)

quie: T

*kkkkkk



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 103

26. SRT-FeHIT TS e (sreaer i Suwfserat) srfafAaw, 1956

(1956 =T 4)
EUGHIBECE oY
27. Seg-FeHiT TS el afiwe srexer (Suwifeerat) sifafRam, 1962
(1962 T 28)
Ui T
28. SR-FHeHIR ST fremeves aaedt & Yo staf=as, 1984
(1984 FT2)
Ui T
29. SHT-FeH I Tsa famwves (Rgar famon) sfefaaw, 1962
(1962 #T 16)
quie: T w1
30. STR-FeT T fAgTes FAATET (TRTe 93&0) stfaf=ae, 1960
(1960 =1 37)
quie: T w1
31. TH-FIHIT AGIR & e wrfereeor sifarfaae, 2018
o fAeE w1

*kkkkkk

32. STHR-FLHIT AT S T AT &7 9a9 ArafQaw, 1956

(1956 T 6)

quie: T

kkkkdkk



104 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

33. SL-FeH I HAT S Mere i stfart it sqfaer sifafa=m, 1975
(1975 F7 22)
EUGHIBECE oY
34, STHT-FHEHIT GTEHTL ST AT FoT W_TaT Afaf=a#,2010
(2010 7 23)
ot srferfaae ®, 9 T Ta9 | S=AT TS 7 g, "HIante” & T 7 " YA |

I - "STHEL-HIHIT TS F T U, IAT A 9T, " ARG 69 5T &7 " I |

T 1. — (i) ST-GTT (2) |, "TH-FHIHT TT" & T U, " 2@ 99 T &7 " 7, 37
(ii) IT-GTT (3) H, "ILHEET TSI, F T I " AT T |

T 2. — () @= (4) ®, "TH-FHT Fi-A0fea TEEET Toreeed Afaaaw, 1989" F
T U "qETEr Tioredraeor stfarfaere, 1860 (1860 T 21)" T

(i) &= (5) T 9 Referad w -
"(5)" TATET " H “TETE T ST & AT TATHA" AT
(iii) == (8) &, -

(F) IT-GE (i) ®, " AT T AIEHSA FT AT A

(@) IT-ET (T) | "THL-FHHT AETIET Toreese™ Afaaw, daq 1998" w1
I "HETEr e stferfea, 1860 (1860 &7 21)" ¥@ ; 3T

(iv) @< (9) ¥, "S-FHewiT fagmft "ar srtesor Afafaaw1997” F wom 9T "
feremdt FaT sTfaeReT st ==w1987 (1987 &1 39)” ¥@ ;

T 3 - AR TSI, F T 92 "I T

g 8. - IT-4TT (2) H, “&T whwar igar, 1989 F 19 X “E< WhHHAT digdr, 1973 (1974
FT2) T |

T 10. - (i) ST-am=T (5) ® “fafae whwar |@fRar, qaq 1977", F w9 @ "FEe gfEHar

Hf2ar, 1908 (1908 7T 5)" 7 |

(i) IT-T=T (6) H, "t AT wigar, saq 1977", % T a7 fiee abear
Hf24T,1908 (1908 #T 5) & |

7T 26. - "I WA IY &S Higar” & T 92 "WIA T & "igar ( 1860 FT 45)" ¥E|

T 28. - (i) IT-4T=T (1) |, "TLRT T, F A 9L A" @ 37



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 105

(ii) IT-LTT (3) FT AT HI|

41T 29. - LR TSI, F T 92 "o T
oTeT 30. - T 1

*kkkkkk

35. TRE-FeT Jiex e 3T Siore o« (A F<rem) e, 2005

(2005 T 5)
TOUT AT |, ST T GaW F A=AAT TS 7 &I, " T % A U TG §9 AT A" T |
a2, - g (SI) H, "SF-ReHIT wrr fas # sfafaa, 1962 #i gamr 21%F %

e et STfarsReoT” 3 o UR " A"TE " TS & TOTHA 1T qaried
STErRTOT AT TTTEH” T

g 3. - (i) "TEETE TSI, T 9 "SI 9 ST
(ii) ZEL T BT AT HL

g7 3 F. - SU-gT (1) |, "TSA" S HERT TS % BT G FHL: " ARG HH 5T &4
TATHT " S "SI T |

T 7. - IT-GTT (5) F TqF | "HEART G "' F T U ¢ U YIS ST AErd
T TS &7 TTEA g7 fafga o sy " v

T 10. - IT-4TT (1) |, "ICRET TSI, o T 9 "0 |

g 1. - ‘S YTRAT |IZAT, 19897 F TITH X ‘&g ierar §fgdr, 1973 (1974 F712) W& |

grr 12. - ‘g YTRAT |I=AT, 19897 F TITH 9% ‘&€ Tiehar gfgdr, 1973(1974 1 2) & |

g 13. - " g giFAT "6igar, 1989 #F¥ 4T 61" F TV 4T "€ WHHAT Higdr, 1973 (1974
T 2) T g4I 577 I T |

T 15. - “Fz WRAT ST, 19897 3 T U¥ ‘= Wik €igdT, 1973(1974 F12) T |

1T 20. - " AT HAT " T Y, "SI & GATgR T

T 22 . - ITYTT (3) T T FL |

grr 22T, - "HIHTR STtefeae, §aq 1995", % ®I19 9¢ " IREHMAT stferfaaw, 1963 (1963 &
36)" T |

T 227 . - "STFL-HIHTT ATETOT fashl T Afafaaw, 1962 F otefi= Ta ZRT TAad=T daf

R, & T 9% 98 ST & forw “Rrfere = &t a9t et -

(F) O T G AT AT F,

(@) T =iRE AT 0T FAT, ST IO HEAT Sl T AT TIAST 9% SEhl
TEEAT AT



106 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

(1) TETEST U9 FIA o [oIT TSTGL FHEAT; AT

(=) arferat £ adrer F forg e Meresm
qRT22°F . - AT Y

*kkkkkk

36. SR -HIH I AT I FAL ArHaw,1957
(1957 FT 26)
U ATSTHIH |, ST T Ga9 | A=A ITATeT 7 &, " TLh1T 6 ©fF I “Tar@ a6 U&= e |

s fereT- "STRI-HOHIT TS 3 T 9T " AR 6 SAeT " TE |

g . - (i) ST-GTRT (2) ¥, "STH-FeHIT TST" o T I¢ "qEMG 6 T T 3T

(ii) IT-4TT (3) H, "ALHFET TSI, F T I "OSAA" T |

T 2. - T (i), (vi), (vii) 3T (viii) § " TEL-FHHT TeX qTe ATAIH, Faq 1998 %
T 9T "H1eT A1 Afa=ay, 1988 (1988 =T 59) T

€T 3. - (i) ST-8=T (1) § "IRRT TSI ST "R-HRHIT T, 6 T 97 "9
(ii) ST-8ITT (2) ¥, TEGH FT AT H7 |
T 4. - (i) 3T-emT (1) ¥, -

(F) == (1) ®, (rEET 2 § AR srfteraw & smtem)" &1 i #57;

(@) @< (1) §, "qCE T F A1 UL, " TR e T

(1) @ () H, "TRL-FHIT TS F T I "qE 1@ T AT 1@, 3T

(i) IT-47eT (3) F, -

(F) @< (F) F ITEE (i) H, "TH-FHT T5T" F S T " T2 9 T4 "
T ;

(@) E (F) F IUEE (i) H, TEH-FeHIT AT AT ATAIH, Faq 1998 F ==
¥ " gre< a1 srfarfaaw, 1988 (1988 T 59) T; i<

(M) BT (@) |, "TH-HIHT TS F T UL " AL qF e " T

T 9. - "HEERTE TSI T 9 "SI |

ALHAT - e v s 1 307 S 2 F AT w7

kkkkkkk



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 107

37. smr-seefix A s srfafaes, 2000

(2000 T 21)
EUGHIBECE oY
38. SH-HeHIR qieew g e sifafRam, 1981
(1981 F7 22)
g . - (i) 3T-4TT (2) §, "TST " % T U "L 6 T T 37

(ii) ST-4TT (3) ® "TLHRT OO ¥ " WA, F T U "SI MY "FEE 9

T8 |

g 2. - g (@) @ (M) ¥, oedwr afaFay, geq 1977" F e uw, el
e, 1908 (1908 FT 16)" T

g 6. - "ared AtafFEw, 1977" % TM9 9%, "AAT 9req Atdataq, 1872 (1872 FT 1)"
|

*kkkkkk

39. TH-HHI IrHfas faafr fEamer e gam sifaf@em, 2011
(2011 %7 38)

OO ATARIH H, ST qF T&9 o S7AT ITSTAT 7 I, "R, "R TSI ST ST & T 9T FHA:
TETG T TSTET AT, "TI=" 3T G Tsqa= " |

g . - (i) ST-8T=T (1) H, "SEH-FHIT " F T I "FEE G AT T |

T 2. - @e (F) H, “TH-HHT Tariernr sfafeas, 1988”7 F T\ U ¢ SH-HIHIT
TATTerRT arferf==m, 2000 =

T 4. - T (M) |, “STHL-HHIT AMATIrHT AT, 19887, X &= I, 1997 =¥

“ TRL-HIHT UTH =TI ATAHIE, 2000 F TIE T TE-FLHIT ATIATIOIHT
arterf==e, 2000 Y “SFg-FeHIT 9=t T Arferf=aH, 1989” T4 |

T 7. - TN T O, " TAT-HAT [T AR i "5 & w019 U2 "9erE 99 Teger w1
T T |
T 9. - (i) 39T ofids  #, "< srfemrgor srfafaae, 1990 3w amT 4 3w 6" F T X,

“qffr oot Eate siT EeataET sifarfaaw, 2013 (2013 &1 30) # sf=a wfawe siw
qEfeTaT F srferrre i am=T 11 3T 197 ;3%

(i) ST g7 H "R ATERIEOT SAtertHAH, Haq 1990 ST 1T 4 3T 6" F TIH W
FHI: “TATEA, [ aedTae fegi=ad, 2013 (2013 7 30) ¥ “ g1 11 3T a7



108 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

19”7

1T 10. - (i) 3T oftd= &, "5 srferrgor stferfearm, 1990 #i &M=y 15, &M=y 23 3% &mer 24"
F T U A IS, [AArEd $iT qHeaedrd # Ifa afaewe e aeafdar
FrfareRT srfer=ae, 2013 (2013 T 30) #FT &T=T 15, €T 23 3% &7 247 7@, i

(ii) " srfewger sAfafaae, 1990 FT g 15, 9T 23 3T gIT 24" F T\ 9T
‘O oo, qAaEA ST qHeraedrad ® 3t wiade o urefdar stfger
srfarfaara, 2013 (2013 =T 30) = &7 26, &T=T 27 3Hi¥ 41T 28” W&

g 12. - AT

*kkkkkk

40. STHT-HIHIT SO ATHYINT IS (TATAT X o743 ARSI, "daaq 2007
(2007 %7 12)
T ATIHEH #, S 9% 999§ F79AT TSI 7 &I, A oY gl SO F T\ 97 HA
AT T TSTLT TTHA", 3T "o T |
ot AT |, IEFAFT & FEm | STH-HeHiT & T 97 'FerE 99 TSa9 T |
qqur AfEaa §, STIAET Afed, ST dF §a¥ 8 =T IS 7 I, TT' & T\ I TG qF TTeAT
|

g . - IT-GTT (2) §, "Hqof THL-FeHIT T" F T I¢ "GO0 A2 T T80T TG
1T 2. - ()&< (F) % 9297, e ST EAT0T &, 9ATq 2, -

"(F )" TTHA” F “TEE T ST T AT § ; #f7

(ii) @< (3T) T AT F|
qTT 6. - ST-TT (4) ¥, “E% 0T wteaT, HAq 1989" ¥ T U " ¥ whHAT "fgar, 1973

(1974 T 2)” 3T “gTT 98” F TATH UL “TT 94” 7|

g 9. - STIRT (1) €, "@ (iv)" F T 9T, "(iv) TE-HHR S qaqred (RfHEae s
Tared) Afa=aw, 2010 | F9T afeArioa =at, T a1 a9 a7 577 A =,
STA-ART AT A H Bl TR T |

T 10. - (i) IT-4TT (1) &, “5000 %, " F T 9T “50,000 %" THF ; M7 (ji) IT-4WT (2) H,
"10,000 9T T faedqe 21 Fhar g" "10,000 9T | AT TE|

T 12. - ‘T gehaT |igar, Had 1989 #HT &1 260 & €T 265” & T 9T " g WHAT
Hfgar, 1973 (1974 =7 2) T 91T 260, 91T 262 T &T<T 265" TH|

g 13. - IT-GTT (3) H, "gCRET FT H AU F T 9 "TATEA T AATEART T A

[ERIEERRECT

*kkkkkk



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 109

41. sg-seHiT wa-Ffaaar afiae sferfRaw, 2014
(2014 %7 7)

TqOT ATARTH &, ST T T o 74T ITSTA 7 21, ‘T ¥ LRI TSI, F T T FHIA: T2
T ST & TTHA” ST TSI il T |
Tt ATAR=H §, 579 T G2 T F7T9T ITSTAT 7 2T, “ TF Thoreed” F T 9 “FrfereaT iowes” w@)
T rtafaaw #, SR X gy 55 % ATy, 919 9% §a9 § A7q9T IUSTAT 7T 2, "SH-HHIT" F T
Y, "AETE HY ST " 16|
TOUT STTAATw |, SEIET & [FaTy, ST aF 989 8§ 97 SUaTed 7 gl "TsT" & €4 9%, " F2rd 69 77
& " T |
1T 2. - GE (F) F TOATT qFATOT H¥ AT -

(FF) "TTEA" F "TETG T ST TTHA" T ;
(i) @S (3T) T AT FY;
(iii) @ (F) ¥, -

(F) SUET (i) ®H, SH-HHIT Frearel dfFeawe i, 2003 (2003 =T
ATATT 8) T T 2 F @ (F)” o T I “GrEArTft i F=fehear aws
e, 1973 (1973 &7 59) FT &=T 2 7 &< ()" & &

(@) STEE (jii) ¥, “STFH-HeHIT AT 3T AT Sfeey srterf=aH, 1959
(1959 =T ATTH=T 26) FT gTT 2 F FHA: G (2) 3T G (3)” F & "
wTea = =T S e sfafaam, 1970 (1970 FT 48) & 39, 3%

(iv) EE (T ) T AT H

qRT 4. — IT-4TT (1) F T 9T TTaeTiod -
“(1) afwz # JmEe g7 A< gaeg afeafad ghr siq:emaa Hi|

41T 5. - G (F) FT AT HL

T 31.— IT-4TRT (3) ¥, "<= wikar |@f2ar, @aq 1989" F Tt y¥ "<= wiwar |@f2ar, 1973
(1974 =7 2)" &

T 32. - IT-4TRT (4) H,“T57 N7 g% Gigar F we a7 qdT g2 924t (1860 T 45)”
EaRacy

&TeT 38. - IT-4TT (3) H, "Are7 sfAfaEw, aq 1977" F w9 U " "qvew A,
1872 (1872 =T 1)" T

T 42. - AL T 9T, At AfafREw, gaq 19777, "HrEseE JaT (Tare) dtafEe,

Haq 19777 AT AW THRaT |12aT, Jad 1977”7 F TITH 9T FHA: “GIA 1T 917
afafere, 1872(1872 &7 1), “o1% &% (TeaTs) wiafaw, 1850 (1850 #1 37)"
ST “ATTE WRAT |igar, 1908 (1908 &1 5)” T

*kkkdkk




110 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

42, STRL-FHH I AT Hen sifafa, 1963

(1963 #71 12)

Tt ATIAw §, 579 T G919 T JwT9T IUSTAT 7 2T, “TLHL”, o T I AL T 7T &7 TAqTEH” 6|

g . - (i) ST-&ITT (2) H, "SFH-FeHIT TT" F T I, “TE0G 69 T 87" WG|

T 2. - ST (SToToT) H, "S- T Aremeor foeft ¢ srfarfaam, 1962 #t g 21A F srefiw
ST rdfiefi=r srferseor & oM U<, " heor AT ITTAFT0T AETE H TIoTer e
T AT AfEs" v |

T 3. - IT-amT (1) |, "t oft Araer § srfereray & = 99 % stewei, w7 v @ Ay
O fRehea® 797 98 §” &7 AT H

T 9. - IT-ATT (1) § "0 T A" F T UL ST AE0E GF ST 2 TATAA g
Ffea T s <=

g 12. - IT-aT (5) H, "TErfae wiehar |@fgar, @aa 1977" % ==& 9¥, "FiEe g gigar,
1908 (1908 FT 5)" TH|

T 16. - (i) IT-GTT (1) &, AT T 92, "I ThiaT Ar<h (TTEA)" & T 9, "SI
I ;3T
(ii) IT-GTIT (2) FT AT FL|

T 16 4. - "HHTER AfeHEH Haq 1995" & 9 4, " aREET ta=aw, 1963 (1963 FT
36)” TH|

&TT 16 . — “STE-FeHTY JTeTee fesfiee afafaaw, 1962 & srefie I+t gf orf<rat ST 9+
FIRTIANT sl ST Tt &7 % &1 92 fohelt [ofaer =amamers & o+t afwat [etetea
TATSIAT 3 TITH I¥—

(F) T I G TN T FL;

(@) et =f<h &7 9T FEAT, T IO HEAT T 90T T TS 98 Ieehl
AT AT ;

() TEATAST Y97 FXA & TATH UL ATET FLAT; 3%

(=) arferE & ader F oo wtere FAereEm”

7|
9T 16 . - T

T 17. - SY-EE (3) T AT FL

T 19 F. - Y T o, TR TSI F T O, ‘TS0 &l T |

kkkkdkk



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 111

43, TS ST (AT AT sfrenfes SusRH 1 o) srfafaae, 1987

(1987 #T 6)
ot fAeEe w1
44, wp-HeR AR g ez sifaf@em, 1969
(1969 #T 5)
Ut fAeEe w1

*kkkkkk

45. e wm PR afafAe, 2007
(2007 T 26)

q0 ATIHIH §, ST T 939 F A=AAqT ITAted T g, T, “ToT” 3T “STH-HHiT T 3T “Faid
TR oreal I T9e o T 92 FHT: “ARTE T TSTLT TATHA” AT 2T T T+ TE|

g1 3. - "HERTT TSTIA" F T 9, "N T |
41T 6. - " JET-FAT AT AT AR, & o0 u) R e 9 |

*kkkkkk

46. SH-FeR RATE qiear adq (@i ) RRatr s s, 2006
(2006 =T 13)

EULHEEGE Oy
47.  SR-FHHR TST A gfave (FaaT i Srere) sifafaamw, daa@ 2009
(2009 =1 28)

uie: T w1

kkkkdkk

48. TH-FENR TSI I TAV ST AIF-TThd T TS 4al a9 § A-g@aTaHhd] H7 erey
geror sfafaew, 1997
(1997 T 20)
o a1

*kkkdkk



112 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

49. SHI-HGHR it =i FRarfEa @ dufr st sfafem,

(2012 %7 11)
quie: T
50.  SE-HeHIT Gufr R AR swfafAgw, 2013
(2013 %7 11)
quid: T

*kkkkkk

51. SH-HHI A S (ITTEFa SATHIRAT i sa@r) Ara«as, 1988
(1988 T 17)

TOUT ATARTH o, ST T 92 T =47 ITETAT 7 I, “HER 3T TR TSI % T I FHA: T
T TS TATHA” ST T 6|

ot srfarfea & SEforRT, e gy 34 % R, "seg-wesiT" ¥ €T Uz, "TETE He TSae”

qqut AteHIT § ST F A, SE TF G99 T q7FAqT IuASd T &, "VSA F T\ W, " 9"
TSI |

g 1. - ST-GTRT (2) | "THg-FewfiT 17" F T U7, "2 T A" HT TG

qu 2. - gg (7) ¥, -
() 3U-g< 2 (i) ¥ ‘FIAT ATAIHW, 1956’ F £ I FHOAT TiEfta, 2013 )

(i) 3IT-E= 2 (i) § ‘FIAT ATTHIH, 1956’ F AT 9T ‘FUAT AT =4I, 2013’ 3T
“TIST AT gl T 7 o T 92 ‘Fl’ @, 3%

(i) IT-E= 2 (i) H ‘TTA F AT H2

g 11. - ferfarer sferaT /i aT, "aa 19777 & w0+ ux “fFfae gfam =@fgar, 1908 (1908 =t
5) ¥E|

g 14 . - IT-GTT (1) § " I TA T F T4 I¢ “I979 g &0 |

grr15. - ‘T YTHAT |igar, §aq 1989”7 F ¥ U¥ “IT WhHwAT Higar, 1973 (1974 FT 20)”
|

a1 23. - IT-GE (3) FT AT H2|

*kkkdkk



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 113

52. STRI-HeHIX A g sifarfRae, 1978
(1978 %7 6)
TqoT AR o, S T G2 T F=AqT IUSTAT 7 I, LR 3T “FLHRT TN % T I FHA: T2
T TSTAT TATHA” ST “ATEhIT T T |
TqUT ATARTH |, TEqTadT Aigd, S 9% G929 T AT IS 7 &f, ‘T’ & T I "q20@ §9 Tsqe 7"
|
SR TS o T U, "AETE 99 a9 |

g 1. - (i) ST-8TT (1) § "TEL-FIHT" F T UL,"TEG T TsFLTA" T AT

(ii) ST-8ITRT (2)  "STHL-HIHIT T " T UL, 1@ G99 T+ 6|

g 2. - IT-4TT (1) ¥, "= wiwar gf2ar, 1989" & wme 4 "= wikar gfz4ar, 1973 (1974
T 2)" T

g 8. - 3IT-4TT (3) H, -
(%) @< (@) ¥, 3T-ET (jii) §, "0 1¥ & AT T 0 WA g2 #2491 (1860
FT 45)" T, T

(@) @< () ®,"aT AfSHaw, daq 1987" & ©F 9 "W a9 Afai=aH, 1927
(1927 =71 16)" T

g 10. - T T AT |

g 12 . - FT (F) H,"gT2T 87, 47T 88 AT g1 89" F TATT U¥ "gTIT 82, 41T 83, UTT 84 ¥
85" 7 |

€T 14. - (i) IT-ET (F) H, s@:eafod w¢, 7979 ;, -

"I ARG §H TSALT & TATHA, A2 ITAH qA, AT 37 A(AAH F T8
Tqe TS AT 9 7T & & et off wrferreor it aergar 918 F =7 § [y 7
aFEaAT 1" ;

(i) 3ST-eameT (3) H, -

(F) "I ATATAT 3 &I AT F THL §" 7 AT F2; 3T

(@) TgH AT Y " qEq Ig AT & qET I & qwef & o
IF AT TRt =maeter a1 fromia e sie qor =rravefter v e wwv
SeeT AT Fae g Tl AT s

&TT 19. - (F) "HTETIO GE ATARI, Had 1977" F T U " QLT G2 A9, 1897
(1897 T 10)” 7@ "

kkkkdkk



114 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

53. STRL-FeiT e W stfafRam, 1956
(1956 =1 16)
T AR |, S T G2 T F=AqT ITSTAT 7 I, LR 3T “FLHRT TN % T I FHL: T2
HH ST AT AL TS T |

QU7 AT § ILIART & AT, “STH-FLHT 3T “TT” & T U2 "F21@ 99 T[T 7" TE|

s, - (i)  SH-gTT (2) H, TIanr & Tar §=5 0 F v 97 A9 9 AT T
T, T
(i)  ST-4T=T (3) FT AT FI
g7 .- '30 T F TITH 9T ‘100 T TH|
g8 . - TR ATATAIH, 1977 % TIH I GILATT T21FT AT a9, 1899 (1899 #T 2) T

*kkkkkk

54, TRI-HLHI, Tdedh AT AL Hr SIfa=aw, 1978
(1978 #T9)
OOt AR H, “GEhT T 6 S 9T T 76|

QU7 ATATH H, g7 24 | 9, “OLE o T ¥ T2 99 TsFer TrEa” Wl
Fi'ﬁ[ﬂf?ﬂ'f‘aﬁ'qwff, (Uleﬁ(é‘e’&%dl, REL 1989"%?%‘4‘(“%@?‘5’?‘%?”, 1860 (1860 =T 45)" G|

T 1. - () SILRT (2) &, “TH-FHT T F T4 T, "dL@ 9 TT&07 |
g2 .- () @ (F) H, TTSHT 1, H STHH-FLHT & 9 I "T@ §F T5qq7" Fl
|

(i) == (1) ®, T I I, ST’ F T I AL AT |

qT 27 . - T TITAT O, "TAT-HA 1 F T U "R T TSI FT JATEAT " T |

7T 28. - Y- (2) #, "< WOHAT |igaT, §9q  1989" F T U "I WHHAT HigdT,
1973 (1974 T 2)" T

1T 34. - Y- (2) #, "< WHHAT |igar, §9q 1989" F T U "I WHHAT HigdT,
1973 (1974 T 2)" T

& 35. - are farfRay, 1977" % T 9T "ML Ared Atataay, 1872 (1872 H ¥

1)" T

*kkkdkk



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 115

55. SHI-HHIT (mATE ST arforfsae fhoaer) sfafhae, 2012
(2012 %1 5)

g 1. - (i) SY-4=T(2) ¥, -

(F) TS F T U "FEG G AT TE |

(@) TIE |, O " T HEHRT S o T 9T, FH: " AL "
TSTE T TIMHA " 37 " o= T ; 37

(iii) IT-EE (3) H, "ILHET TSIA" F TIF 9L " AT T
qRr2 .- (i) gT (@) |,"SH-HeH e =rratersor srfafaaw, 1988 +

Fefier e Ao =raTfaETor % T % "R JemEd g1
STTerg=ra SATEERr AT TR 7,

(ii) gT (T) % T 7T, Fetofaa w@i-

“(F) "TUTHA" | "TETG T TSTAT T TIATHA T80T 8 "

(i) @ () H, "W FwH AT HT QAT AL

(iv) @ () T (T) § “THR F T I “Tma” T W)

(v) @2 (3) ¥R AEIdrA” o T UL, " T 6 TTiHee arel

IqT IHF ZTET HATAT Eqare " 7§ ; 37

(vi) @ () H," T Q" w5 A

g 3. - (i) @ (F)H, “ToT A ST AR o TIF I T2 99 T
T gemE” =
(i) @ ()|, ORI F T U “ TATEA T AT
(i) =T () H,"TF-FHeT FoFE ATIHTw, 2001" 377 "g¥e AtaETH, qaq
1977" % T UL, FHA: " ToFF ATATATH, 1995" 3T "WTT T8
sferfeam, 1882" T

g 14. - IT-GTT (4) H, ‘TR F T9 9T AT |

€T 29. - (i) "R " T GEERRT TSOA" F TI O "I " Y eI
158

(i) TIF ¥, @ (i) F AT H
gIr30. - (i) "Eafr sfaer sfgfaaw, "aq 1977", F T WX GO HGIO0
fe=aw,1882" w41
(i) TdF H,-

(F) T T 9T, "HORT Sqr sfaf=aH, §aq 1977", % T\ 9%




116 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

"wrofr staeor srfafaT, 1882 w|
(@) "sEe ATy, Jaq 1977", % €M1 9T " T

gfafem, 1872" Wl

grr 31.- (iy sT-g= (1) 7 " stz @=aq 1977, F ww g f&fae shear
wf2ar,1908 (1908 =T 5)" ¥

g1 32. () sv-ge (1) & "@lEw v @@, g9q 1977", F w=m wifEa

wRaT wf2aT,1908 (1908 7 5)" ¥&|

(i) IT-EE (2) H "WrT I Higar ¥ I WhHHAT Gfar, Had, 1989" &
T U FHH: AT g2 |@fgar ( 1860 FT 45) 3T dT whRAT
afgqr, 1973 (1974 #712)" & |

(iii) IT-=T (6) H "= WiHHAT HigAT, HaAqd, 1989" F TH UT "dT WhHAT
TfgaT, 1973 (1974 #1 2)" TH |

& 37. - (i) Saia efide &, s £y "@fera @i w1 o #3; siw
(ii) “Tre7 #r "@=a [ F wam 9= vEr wifger Soemes g AR G
ST T

g1 40. - T FATAT U, “HLRTT F T UL “FT9" T |

g 41. - TR 3 BT I “TATEA T |

*kkkhkk

56. SF-HIHIX oY fAgTarse ga=dl & 9a+ i} s AfafqaH, 1960

(1960 T 19)
quie: T

*kkkkkk

57. SHT-meHI fAuraHes Aqr Yidwet & 999 Ua W A=, 1985

(1985 FT 16)
quie: T w1

*kkkkkk



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 117

58. STHI-HeHIX e AT wgar srferfAae, 1999
(1999 % 10)
EevEEIEIEp R ren r A E e M El e e T Gl Rl e M S | R A G R R e E I I LT
|
QT SATETH #, “STH-HeHIT & T4 9 “Tard 99 5T = T

g 1. - (i) SU-d= (2) #, “TH-FeHIT T F TIE I "TE0G 6 5T T |

a2 .- (i) &= (23) H, “SF-HeHT F dlagm i g7 6 H qrAriod o7 F et
et o w93 "wre AR Tl

(i) = (27) ®, ‘7757 % TTAY fAam” & w19 92 e SwiE ) i)
(iii) @< 30 ®, “forereh gaer 1T & Tt Hart &7 F71 AT F:7
T 3. - IT-4TT (1) #, “TrsF o et [Maret ateafera g &1 a9 &3 i

#TRT 16. - ()&= (F) §,-
(F) IT-E< (i) §,"STH-FeH T Giaar sAfa==w, gaq 1977", & #0997 "
qredtr e srferferm, 1872 (1872 #71 9)" w&; 3w
(@) IT-TT (i) FT AT F7
(i) &= (T) |, STHH-FLHIT AETSET TS0 ATeHad, §aq 1998” & w19
T “HTETEET TEE R siterf=a+, 1860 (1860 T 21)” TE|

4T 59. - “STHL-FOH T TSTELIhor stterf=ae, §aq 19777 & £479 U2 “TRred #heor
e, 1908 (1908 FT 16)” 7|

*kkkkkk

59. SHL-F R e fagdt (shenfie e siw Fem gt

srfarfa, 2018
(2018 #T 10)

T Aty #, g 2 % SuEsE (14) $i¥ ITET (17) AT =947 IUSHT F FEm "9eE F e W
TETG T TSTLT FT TATHA" TG

0t srfefRas §, St aF qaW & AT STATAT T &, "WERR TSI, SR ST ST F T a9
FHI: ", ARG HH TASTE, T TSI T |




118 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

SeferFT- “SRT-FH9HIE TS % T O "2 §9 Toq80=T" T

g2 .- (i) @ (1) % 9991, @ (1) T2 7 777, -

“(FE) TR F "AETE T ST TTEA" AT 2
(il) T (16) FT AT F4

(iii) @<= (23) T AT F<; AT

(iv) @< (25) F T99Td, Fq:wqTMUa &<, 790, -

“(25%) “TeTTE” ¥ "TETE T A" AT 2|

T 3. - ()3T-gT (1) F w9 At siq:efua w2 -

“1 TITEA, LT TSI | SATEAAT G T el & orw e e s
e Tt Rt afEta &1 7o w2 g

T 4. - IT-4TeT (1) ¥, Feferfera sia:eamfog &3 -

“1 TITEA, TR TS | ATIG=AT g7 T4 (el o o0 U #ed &g
uFe gy et afafa 1 7o w2 awm”

AT .- ST-GTT (1) H,- "q=T =", ", Tgur (=7 ais” o7 ", =
ST AT, FaTed HEeT" o6 T T HAL: "HATSHL" ST "STeed, Tguo
fRreror afafae siw "R, 3= 7 arfosT, geer-afa o o 9" ey
e, STE-Feie, Rl aaeg-a=a" &1 a9 F¢

g 6. - "FEHIT/STE" % AT I "qETE T T G|

g7 8. - IT-gTT (2) H, "wrexw sfafait F waw ww "wew afafRewi, e w9
ST H AR FA 6 T4 9L AqHd 74|

g 9. - TS AT & T I "1 a9 g " WG|

g1 26. - (i) ST-EE (3) FT AT F1; AT

(ii) ST-LTT (4) H, T TAeTHHS T 977 07 F T 97 "HEEt 7 |
g 27. - SY-GT (2) FT AT HL

*kkkdkk



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 119

60. SHL-FHR TST AT L&AT IRuT Afa«aw, 2018
(2018 7 5)

Aqut SferfaTs ®, T TSI T ST GEF AT I F T 9¥ TR TSI ST AT |
TSI T2 gLeaT Tue” 74|

ot srferfaere ®, ey 4 % I9-ET (2) F @< (i) F Fary, v e 9 qemE” W
ot srferfae ®, ST % T 9 e ' sTe” W@
Ut SAfereae ®, o7 37 F e | Seg-weH i F T U AEE 699 TSAes W@

qRr2 .- 37T (2) ¥, -

(F) @< (i) F I 9T 7@
(i) “TTEA” F “TET@ T TSTHT TATHA” AT 8; 3T
(@) @< () |, “Fureafd, ST-HeHIT T A sttef=Ee, 2000 I T A

T

1T 3. - IT-ET (1) H,"sTeqer S IRagd (9T & T 731, IUTee F ® § AT &
e A=a 3T UH 77 9ae gl o T 9% "UH 9aeq(" 76|

4T 4. - IT-EE (3) * GT (i) |, ‘T LRI & €A I “qAqTEq” T |

& 10. - ST-ET (1) ¥, TH-HeHT T g [ & o “qer 99 TsaE T 95%
qreaT fAfe” =)

T 22. - SY-GT (2) T AT FL|

g 23. - (i) SU-g= (3) ¥, "o ST [AeTT H2o F THE TEId FIA" FH AT F|

41T 29. - (ii) "ToTE Y g% Higar, @ad 1989" 9rsai & TAT I "AAIT &< |igar (1860 T
45)" 7

€I 34. - (i) ST-ET (3) FT AT F

*kkkkkk

61. TawEe srfafRaw, o 1989

(1989 #T 16)
ot T

kkkkdkk



120

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

quie: T

Ut fAeEe w1

62. TH-FEIR TST WE X W s s i srfefaaw, 1979

(1979 #T9)

*kkkkkk

63. SHT-weHIT Ay stfareeor stfarfRaT, 1988
(1988 FT 12)

*kkkkkk

64. STHI-FHHI T T ToT AT, 1963
(1963 T 20)

T FHLT: “TATAA", TSI, “HH T &7 3T “IT TSI % TATGHL @ |

g2 .-

g1 3. -

g 18. -

4T 26. -

gqr 27. -

YT 28 . -

gT (@) % T I¢ @, qAqq , -

“(@) “TATER” T "TETE T ST TATHA" AT B

ST-ET (M) H, ‘TE-HHR T A sfaEas, |@9q, 20087 A1 ¢ S A
FEHIT T & aAterf=ad, 20117 F TI19 I "TH-FeHT T = srfafaas,
2000" T

ST-ET (6) ¥, “SFH-HeHIT WeFeAar aAtatHad, daq, 20027 F A 9
TETEAAT SI¥ qoAg ATAHIH, 1996 (1996 FT 26)” TH|

"TST g S A, "9 1990" F T 9, " oS, [Hared i
AeaedTIq | I=a Ifase T areafear afaswre stterfaam, 2013 (2013 &t
30) T |

(i) Suta ofide &, "qfer st srferfaae, 1990 FT €T 4 =T 97T 6" & T4 1T,
"SI IS, AT ST [Hedaed I § 3Ia JideT T IEtdar sAtEee
gfarfa=rm, 2013 (2013 =1 30) &t €T 11 3T gRT19” TE

(il) "I gy ot SR, S 1990 F 4T 4 9T 4T 6" SrEi-wEt A
TATAT I¥ 9 AT 8, % T U2, "qiH o, A i Hegaerad § 3t=q
gfaee sie areefetar st srfarfeaw, 2013 (2013 =7 30) &t amr 11 %
T 197, T |

(i) ST ofTee #, "5 TSI srtert=aH, 1990 T &M=T 15, &M 23 ¥ 81T 24"
& T U2 " oS, [AATEd S [HeqaeTad § 3=a Tidshe i qrearear
sfarepTe srfarf=ag, 2013 (2013 =1 30) FY €T 26, &TIT 27 T AT 287 T,
A<




[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 121

(ii) ST-gT=T (1) ¥,"T5T M oS Ate=Ew, qaq 1990 FF gamT 15, 8T 23
ST &MY 24" % T 9T "IH 375, a8 S [[Heqaemid § 3f=d Tase
A ureatdar srfaer srfarf=aw, 2013 (2013 =7 30) T &T=T 26, 91T 27 T
T 28” TE|

*kkkkkk

65. STRI-HHIT WX S srfarfaa, gaa 1954

(1897 =T URwg Hehew H&AT 37)
Ui T
66. SHI-HHIT AGA FURT (ATershaw i) srfaf e, 1971

(1971 771 12)

T a4

67. SH-HHIR AT (Fata ik d=e afave) sifafaes, 2000

(2000 T 16)

UL EEGE Oy

*kkkkkk

68.  STHI-HeHIT Tt fove stfarfaer, 2002
(2002 T 21)

Tt srferfaae §, et Suetad & e, | $fiT S’ F T 97 FHT, A ST TSI
w,

T A= § T&aradr & e a1 SET Se g7 AT §, "SE-Redit 3T TS F T 9Y FHA:

T 1.- ST-GTRT (2) H, “G07 STHH-FIHT TT” o I 92 “HI0 Aerd §9 Tqe= 7@l S0
g1 2. - (i) < (F) F T9=Tq, [Meaferfer sia; eomfua #¢ -



122 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

"(F)" TTEA" F ‘TG T AT HT T
(i) @ (3T) T AT F<;
(iii) @< (2.) , "fSrer forar sfararry” o e a7 et afer o v
(iv) @ () FT AT F7; 37
(v) @ (1) F TATT 9L, "(01)" “Fe AL | AL HF T & AT B
g1 6,7,8,9 3T 10. — FT AT FX)
1T 20 F TLATT 7% & FT FAFATIA FHL., —
20%. wrEae faeme fi B Pyfor &k [ffaa afafa s e

(1)  JTHA, §9 ST & % TTeae Femedi § 6 7 Efaatag w3 oiv [aiia w29 & et
F for "grzee et i i et siv AR afwfe & € 8 S S et atata
T ST FHT|

(2)  |THTT FT TF Teqer g ST TRt Ig ~ATITAT T ~ATATENLT AT TATET T A5 ATIRET T
BT ST 5 TS &= o qiod 7 399 FAL 6 1 ° 1o &1 7 2l

(3)  afHfT F TaeT UH T ST 69 TsT&T % Temad g1 faftga & s

(4)  wremy, giafta & =7 § G sv T safe a1 Gl Arganme Bemes ¥ o BT
stafater & o aeeg % =0 § F% g, Ghg afvfy & geeat f o ger o= 7 afew
SRR

20%. TeqE T IR S AT hi T STd-

gTzae et & e Fateor o7 fFaue & fore afafa & steaer i werater siw |47 $iv o= oat &0
et =7 yah g, ST & semas g AR o s

207, AT & afeaT ik Fd.-

(1) = ATGFRIH F Iuadl a7 aoaqd Tgq T 9w f@ter 1w, wreae Gt & o
et sie R et afafy o erfrat &1 sermr 3t siie U8 e sty St wermres g AT
o StTd i @rg gt far syt grzae Feme, (e & sraareft i sq=a qgarears
H forg 7t 8

(2)  JeITEd ATEEAT TR, WTeae fFamedt & f [Agior i A ge9dt afvfa § AT
ot ® & 2 oft, 39 faware aw S Rfga fra s, sea afafa o steaer &1 somnim #57% aa

(3)  wrzae FEmerEt i fi Mt siv EfRewe gadt afefa g ot sreen w e a9w
BT I B9 | G0 647 T47 AT ST 317 3896 Jearad T A-Aqa1e 92 AR 1T 38 Figdr
(1860 FT 45) it &I 188 F IS AL AT il HITe H ATATI

20%. I T SATYTI.

(1) wTzae fEEmet & $i9 Feior i Faae ga@dt afbta seea, 2014 % ge=ra eonfug &Fo ao
ITzae fE=merdt g off ST aret S FT ATUT0 FId GHT AT GTdi F ATI-HT, T, SUee




[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 123

FFGLAAT, TATHA I¥ 7T, YTede Fames grT a1 Tt s =afxp a7 usier a7 T s
e o7 fafga o s, & feft off &9 # aTea |Jrer, SgdT, A7 §9T i T § TEE

(2) grzae fEEmerat & fi e s e & afvfy aag-awr 9w f{fes afoe F sefe oo
ST ATl T sl STTerea® AT 3 Fe & o sfeg=ear ST &7 el

20T. YTzae et gy w9 69 -

(1) ur=ae e gt a1 sty ¥ fEm seame d, arfts S, afEmgT w o
faerfaer, 2% 3w &% e @9 s e ST a9 ° S TRt & g a7 ol st e S
o Fafea THRAT 7 I F2d & 929Td TTSde [AaTadl & wie e o7 AfHae @94t amt
T STEITad 36T ST, 3 R 1S e e =21 o)
g YTzae frme et ff Ofa & gav sfeatea fia & e waer 6 a1 15 o777 w0 T81 o,
AT I TRt | T | 40 T SI7 S[av 2l

209, =S wam Y afkp - 7f% 75 ot Feear & & yreae Gemea 5 s et 1 Seeew G g ar

T Al 6T g a7 YTae et 1 6| et siv affeme afata B ofr s o s F oo G
ot fa=mers & Ranie 1 |Jar gl gl

20w, AR ¥ FaTaE -

(1)  uzae fEEmet 1 i & Faior ¢ Gfaaae a3t afafa #w oue st & e J
HETAAT Tl o TSI | AT TeqeT o TOHET | T FT GH-a97 92 Ferifia afaawr o
FHATL TaT9 FRT ST

(2)  wrzae Femert £ fe Rt siv AR afwfy F a8 et S gomee g g

[ERISIRR
(3)  IU-am (1) ¥ Ffdy srfaeriat siv se=ntat £ f=r Mags «iw ad "y givtr, ST e
T au-guy g7 gt G s

(4) ST (1) § [ st e w2 At F Al qud FoAr F Hagd F oy
T & s Tematae [Aa=0r e fAaer & srefie ghm

20%1. Iq-gfAfaat - v Ut otk sfw et F Ay " wewe we A1 et F w67 u UHT 9T 39-
Tt 7 5T FT THAT, ST Ar2ae Farerat § i F gt &1 7 R w0 F oo S aaE

207, AW Fam it afve- TTeae Femeat F e et s A @9 afwf@, sfemEar g, v
e a7 Fet, ST T S /fia & =S & Aeafed w3 & o sraed s gl

20-31. QFTH =TT Hi aReai- YTeee FEmert F e Ryt s A g9t atafa i e afatem
& eI foReT off ST 7 & T2 7 T2 FEATR! IF T F A1 6 (o0, Jgr ot givt s f&feer
woraT €T2ar, 1908 (1908 &7 5) * wrefi= foreft frfaer =amrers & [Afga gt 21

GTRT 22. — AT T 2|
4T 25 ¥ = o Ao @ -
25. FTARTRAT FT ai -




124 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

(1) f&rferer sk =fgaT, 1908 (1908 =71 5) a7 aeawa wa et st fafer # siqfeee frfy oft afasger
1T & I g4 A1, I AT FTATAT Fils AT Al T AT 38 SATITAIAT o STefie 1 ST Tt AT 6l ST
FTAT TRt ft FTAATET T (TG FLA ATAT SAATH AR Tl &M

(2) rzaet et F e et siv Afaaae afaf o srerer a7 G ot gee a7 G sfesr
IqT T FHATL AT TATAT AT ST AHIA ) F Ao & o e arer ffy of =af=p, ot =@ srfarfmay
F IUSLT T 396 A TATC 0 AT AT A<t F AT § TGTd H AT AT FIA FT qrerT o,
3o+ foreg #rg are, At 2t o Bfess wrfarer 981 i S

YT 27 F T 9T W™& -
27. srfe. -

(1) wTzare fE=mert & f e Faior i Feme ot gt gro S aer F e & feEm, |
Fre ot == stfaffam a1 sa gdfim 9T o et F G ot STy w1 SooEe Far g AT 98
e foreaT Meers g7 ToH sty % ol dag g9 oY Yo qearaad| a0 & o7 50 g
U H g S[AI % o7 Tt Rl

(2) &1 AT =TE AT Teae Famed ST IEee FRmet o e [y o &ResT oo atafa s
TSerT =7 Soered AT g, a8 TIH AU F (o0 979 g1 €99 3T T TeATaad! Tqare o forw
T TG 93 | Agd AT & o0 I0T g0 a9T I A UH ITSde [Aradl & TaFE Hid &
for ot fereTer 2 Tt 81"

T 28 F T U< .-
28.  qAORAOT Sf) e

(1) &mer 27 F IT-amer (1) 3 stefier et smfersrrd g anfia et of 1 seer & difq 1 ==t~

TH wEY & Gfa # S A B S, sraer i are F o At B saty F o [, =
TOreAT o THET AL ATMHT BT FT T

(2) @& =T AT Tede Fame, S fF wede GameEt & § Faior & @R 7 o
AT g &TT 27 #¥ IT-ATT (2) F a7 T arf<rat &1 TIRT o aro el ot sreer & fifeq g av
TH e & fowg, sraer f aritE § o A1 fi srate & WAy T-Hei 39 A § i w7

THT|

qRT29.-  IT-9TT (2) H, &2 (F) FT AT FL <

*kkkkkk

69. STH-FHIHIX et frear e srfafae, 1975
(1975 T 28)

TEQOT SATETATw o, ST SUEted & Far "HeaEwn” ST e T 97, "Erd 9 05T 85 Jeraa”
ST "SI 978 T ST

arql srterfeem §, ST A7 i srfearfea Y amT 44 § A7 sy IvEtad & Hary Se-weHi s
"TST" o TATT UT HHOT " TR 6 S S ST "HE e & 97w W |




[T [1—=7F 3(ii)]

ATLT T TSI ; STHTETIOT 125

SRR .-

g . -

qra 2. -

g< 3. -

g 4. -

TS AT “SE-FHTT T " o TAT I FH: T T[T & AT "eTEre Ho 9
& {98 T

Y- (2) #, “TFY0T STHY-FeHIT 5T o T I “HF0] A1 & 5 7T 451 957
staeTiod #7¥)

(i) % (F) F == a2 Aetorfeg w@-

"(F)" TRV TATALT 6 AT “Tag” o et T2 F gasf § Y gl i Ial

FT AT IS & [FATTAF F 0 T997 F T % [0 9IS T Jag I1 avag g7
ST &

() "9 | @ 3 F i wrriud vt forar e srfea g

(i) @ (3T) % TITH 9T G-

"(M)" sTetReE foraT " wew areAfure e g AR sremE % utsaww &
HTATT T=-| H U=-8 F THATHT Tl § TIEHF T2 ¢ Frear vty 25"

(iii)) T (%) F TAT HTFATIAT Fot-

"(5)" HEAT F @ "W, Rl Hag TEAT % THTHEATIE AT TLEEE AT Fie o
TETATATS AT Feaforen sty srfea 2, S et oft weam & S s

(iv) ©T () F I 9% 74 -

"(ST)" HEATHT % HIH H UIET "TEOT ATHOE (HAATA ST AATAT TRT K AT,
AT o

T ITATH, ST, ATeqtas, Isaa¥ Aredtie, S=aq¥ ATegiaE a1 forersh woveror
T 9T AT e ve #A ¥ O dqurg "6 wew 4 F7 YmEd g
ATIATIT Tl AT HEAT AT 6,75 TAT

(v) @ (T) & T U< TE-

"(2)" “STRrETOT e & A &, T T SR de Rt At o

T ST &7 % T FIRT AATAT ST ¢ ST Aerd 89 T A5 & TTEe g
HIIAT ITH & ST U 91 § a4 g S q9rad g &g Bar st

(i) ST-EITT (1) #, " forar % et o "g-srerfien fore, srifie frer o
(ii) ST (1) #, 3 wriUT -

"I TTEH, &S 1 14 |17 qhal g AT Rt o= T a1 ot s &9 s &0y am
FRIT ATEATHE TreT a7 T o=y AT F UH AT F §9g F G991 g S o H
TSI o forw e e T sl i

(iii) ST-TT (2) H "THH-FLHIT TST A" % S I, "Fard 99 T &7 FT qre”
915% TH|

T 4 % TJT9 92 TG -

"4, T AT HLAAT - A1 H UH g2 oqrHe g g yerree g s R sy




126

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

g 9. -

g 10. -

g 11. -

g 13. -

(i) ITea offder o, "Sfi¥ SEeh &7 T T AT e ;

(ii) "= T S W UET srater & O ST sfeder qA-gHT 9T AGUTd w0 6
T I ‘T2 69 1T &7 TAUTE g1 797 fafga fohar smu” orss w, 8w

(iiii) T T AT A
(i) @ (i) ® "ITEIHF" F AT 9T "qE-ITAHE AT AEATF"; 9157 T WY
(i) "TEYEATSA" o TLHAT "I TTEIIF FreqT® FIALAT qTSTHH" 915 ST FATHOT FY

(i) @< (i) ®, "UTSIHA" F qeATq, " foreqw wiereror forer urewwmA" oew
T 3

(iv) ©< (iii) &, "9E" F T9ATq, "TAFE(HE A e AT F ATAH " S eI
Y,

(v) @ (v) ¥, "gTAT HhST HEE" F T9ATq, "7 T2tk Sirequr qrehd e aes
i 3

(vi) ®T (xiii) #, " FrafEemes, st e & o\ W R
[ECIEECICEMEECR

(Vi) ET (xv) F T U< TE;

"(xv) TS F AT HIFAT & [T SAEEA FA ATl TheA ! HIAAAT TAT IHH ITAE
st 3 arv H et fover F wefea feers & fore @ 2q;

(viii) @T (xvi) ¥, "HafIA" F TAT "qE-TAEE" ST AT F qe=Ta "foresw
TTOTETOT UTSTRH" 9Tex 37 TATIT FY;

(ix) ©E (xviii) F T 9T T -
"(xviii) srfarfRere 3 frfSre e v oy F F forg fEfRee e s
(X) @T (xxvii) F T 9T G,

“(xxvii) (F) STErH foreqsn forear afga fBfser =2 & sreaaer & fafs= Ao & o
faterr arer afata #1 e w2 71 g w2 * o,

(@) HEterd qreawe aiHfd T 73 A7 T i sTHitad q1ea TEasi 6 gare
ST TRTAT T 1 FIAT; AT

(xi) T= (xxviii) F TITH 9T T

"(xxviii) STETT % IZ9ET F T F & forw Areatas forer ar€ (COBSE), g
STfer et 3 Jiereror 9wa (NCERT), TTg seamaa f9rer aivwg (NCTE)
afed TS dag w@rad1 & 919 /9 FHAT|

ITYTT (3) T AT Y ;

ST (4) F =19 9% TG,



[T [1—=7F 3(ii)]

ATLT T TSI ; STHTETIOT 127

T 16 3T 17.

“(4) =t stemer f T 7 g oft s RRafa soow 21§ ek o e wrars

FT AT ATRY, qT T8 T TG 0l FHATe HIT ST g8 I(9d THH T I T4,

TH YATSI o o7 TS TS S5k § AT SRTeAT 92 § 9IS &1 AT T T8 FEATS AT
e )

g Temed sTfaefie sraet wrars & R 3w |fgd wrEtad st A
IS AT AE F T Farar, ST ot 90T B, F7 FT T T g, ST Fremer afa & amaer
T T 2

g TE 37 T = orfpat 3 srefie forelY oft were Y fRegf=e =€t o siro:
T T ST o =7 orfRRat F erefie et off sepe Y S et gy ¥ s

AT F-

#IRT 17 F 9991, 7% ar &1 17%. dafors Ao - 3w sfie ggw faget v Qe w1 =

A TTI -

ITEIwH AT, forervr-afenT qgfa, ST At § "SI T S
afgd fafesr q2i i v aufY @afea araett o2 w2dt aw=t g1, § & derfors
3o &l T §9 ST & T8 1T =h 7ar Srosm

"179. Srertors fAaers F afRdt T FieT ;e & I &Y At

FeAT TEd gu AeAfors Heer, aI F UH IWEI 6 T ghl S ale &
faferer drfers szt &t wifa & forg A= # Iwafaq fFo S & 39+
et emfeer givr-

() Terear = T =2l 3 o0 9Teashy a1 3T,
(=) fafere forera foreaT aroersrat % foru ursrsRy 3= AT,
(T) SATIATIAF ITSTHRAT T AT fOrear o forw arsasy o AT,

() &= T & § oreAr, Y= S qurer forer F A F At =won
o TorT FTHYT AT TEaeh T FHEAT;

(S.) TLTEATSAT AT T T [ATAA TR IT TALEAT AT TATL FIAT;
(F) TATHRT & qT 0T § AT TSR H GATTd AT,

() < THHT AT AU ITSAHA T TRTH F Gael H frerht F ROperT qreaswme
FT GATAAT HLAT| "

T 22 ¥ 9%, q997q 9% 810 "22%. A< aargs- (1) Sema«=s at=a, o fEramr, a7 aeme 99 a7

T AT DAY=

& TATE G AT0HT &l AT ATIFRET A1 HT TG A< 17 TATZHL g Tl
(2) A<t AT IS ¥ SThT A AU AT ToT T2 gR

(3) fa<f FeTEgshTT UHT SRRl T TANT FT ¥ UH FAAT T qTA
FT ST 28 ATATH F el F9T0 10 Fre =i [t g f&aea o
S|




128

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

& 33.-
o 34. -

g1 35. -

& 36. -

g1 38.-

IT-4TT (2) F @< () § AT I 92 "HIEIAT" & T4 92 "Hagdr” 90e8 @
AT F|
1T 35 % T 9 A ferfeT ),

"35. faffaa i 3wk ufadet &t afaai- 9 g 91 33 F 7efiq a970 T g3+
AT &iie S9H Yo® AT AT A& &l UF Td SRl & (U g 89
TIS &1 o TITE T T 6T JAT0IAT"

e Th 3T I=aqL HIeATHE Thetl [T F I 9¢ "gs T, I=aq? ATeaftds®
TH ST YT forerss wioreror foraam” <&

T 37 % FITH ¥ TE-

"37. A & AT % forw §eq=1 7 J99T- (1) 5T AT AT 6 d1g< (0 e
T FeT, FIE & FFAuTteE & o a7 # saad 7 Gl g A a1 UHT orat i
Staeet & Teaeid Tgd gu, S [Ated T STy, e & fererarfesrs & forg st "o
& ATAE I TR HT ThdT gl

(2) STET T =0 a1 & dq¢ g & G oft dag qean gy oo fEerrteerrr &1
TEOINT 7T ST 2T &, A7 U "@eAT g [Atea |t A1 Gidae it w Sqarad dat
FaT ST T@T 8, AT 1S SeATH1 7 9 feroTiasTe ar9e of FehdT 8, 3T Ik q9a1d
HEIT T a5 9619 Aol e

g FAOUTiEERT AT @ € g, dIe g0 G & 98 Q@r &l s raeTshar g
o = aeg &t It 39F faeg #9181 f ST AT 3T JIE J8IT 1T T&qd
et ot Tt TR F awar g1

AT F|

T 40 F €I 9T 74|

T AT ToFh- (1) dE UH a9 | FF F FF I I AT doh AT FHAT o
ST ST TS T STAT d5 o AT AT He I+ 1 qL Agl R

(2) ATE FT TAF S5 I TLTAAT FLTeT FHLITI

(3) ATE T 52 | AT ATH IUMEAT ¥ AAG FI AT AGEAT % qgHT GIT aF
B ILE

T HAl T FHEAT % A H, Teqe], THh 9367 & & § AqT 7 o A <ad 7d &
AT 2

(4) T Faeat T 2A-fAgTs a1 fiY 5% § TFH FEH S0

g AR FEHA T g 9T 95F TNT Al AT g, ar SHT HF & 0 [T Soh |
FICH AT T2l R

(5) 3% AT BIA BT a18 i TeAF I3 T FrAarar it Ifa Tf=a g T2ra @9
T[S &7 TTHA T AT &7 S0




[T [1—=7F 3(ii)]

ATLT T TSI ; STHTETIOT 129

(6) &S g =TH ATATTH & i 1 T2 KT FATE, AT FEATE!, TI4T F d1=
et =R % BT T & e o2 a1 39 e § 0 A7 ST § st fiaar
FRO HATAA % I[OTEROT FT TATET 7 Fd el rdr ot sA==atdaar & #eor
SfafeeT=T 951 g

4T 43 % T U< W@-

"43. Tafe FEATRAT : - dTE, AT ITH TRt AT T30, AT 396 TRl SATeETT a7 o7

FHATRAT, I7 912 Qe F o1efiw w19 w2 arer Tt =afe a7 9 & B oft
ATAFRTLT AT 37 FHATRAT & Aeg =9 sfa=ay a1 ga+ refie a=mu 1o et e
77 e sgaer § o T A B S arer T Rt e  fore o Afew
AT &1 |TH =l Aafer T AT T, 3T Rl o+ ATl §, 39 ATh SH6 [deg
T T AT ST 8, F wATET AT Fare e 97 ifew U S & A4 A
AT | T Y ST a6 ©F =7 g it g=A1 § T7% &9 F FRA1 F1 F07, TR T
AT ¥ THT, FTET AT T TfT 1 FT AT T T AT TogE ATEl & AT o Har
I FT Io0d A5l g 3T ST qh ATl g Al Fg <ar, o JMed Fl Tq THE &ar
AT AT IRE & (3T A7 87 a9 T I AT 918 qal dredd ha1 S

g 43 F qATq, A% "43F. FiAT W (1) AE G AHEa, qad o7 Tt Gt araREr f widr

YT T Fq-SATIA-

T qIE | g [Migd g
(2) S, TFe et & waterq araaft et off uSiet & e, werfera 3 qiea
FLAT Gl g, o a8 & fgd # 3h=a aw= 7

"A3T. IAT hl HiETed ATHAL: - Thet {7 A FRT FRET ot SR & TRl
7, fasa, IEg, qE0T, WSTOT AT IT0TAA i el Sl G aRiT § FHt 6
FIT AT TS & TRITRAT G AT THAT &7 [ra=anr @ g, Saa ot
FGA T T € a1 UH ARE T UH g A TGAT 60 STOIAT 37T awgett i Tioar
g e stfafaaw, 1996 it gy 90 F srefia fafga wfear & srqam &t

STt

*kkkkkk

70. STHRL-FeHR TN TS (STATa &t AR e 4 &1 @ siik $Em witen dan) sifaf@a,

2018
(2018 =T THAME)

Trqul srferfaae ®, e IuEtaa & e e, "SR-weHi! $iY SO, T 9Y "HE O e,
TEqT At ®, 9T 21 FT IT-GTT (1) IT T=TAT ITSTAT o (#ar "qeare” & €9 9, "qEME G99 75T

& JTHA", 9Te% TE;

T 2. - (i) T (F) F T9AT AT FATOT Fl-

"(FF) "TITE " H TETE HH TST &7 T TITHA" AT &;



130 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

(ii) @< (1) ®, "HLHIT 3T TG A de ST F AT HL
(iii) @< (1) T AT FL; AT

(iv) ©T (T) H, "STHH-FeHIT T5T" F T I "TE0G 99 T &85 9058 7|

g 5. - 1T 5 ¥, "eqET, THL-FHIHIT TT FIATad USiHT [/ TTEAT A=, T TEITAT 37 A
TrITT & FraterT | % T 9T " WOTEE g AATAT =T 9758 T |

grr 9. - Y- (1) H, "SHH-FHIT 7" o T 9T "qE T 0T 7" 9058 76 |

T 17. - (i) IT-8T=T (1) H, "STHL-FHeHT e srferpeor srfafaaw, 1988 (1988 T srterf=as €&t 19)
& ST ST AT o AT 9T "TLTEA G AT A= UH Iieawr”; s

(ii) IT-GTT (2) F "STIAFTOT" F TATH IT "UH TTIEHLT" 9767 TTaeqTiaa Fi|

g1 18. - ST-4TT (2) H, "SH-FeHIT g€ THhaT |iedl, §ad 1989 (1933 A.D)" & &9 U¥ "&€ wiehar
Hf34T, 1973 (1974 F7 2)" 7|

g 29. - "TUTEIT & |igAT, §ad 1989" F T UX "I &€ Higdr, 1860 (1860 T 45)" 7|
T 32. - ITETT (3) FT ATT FT <
g 34. - "STHY [ FEHIT" AT o T U "R 9458 1@

*kkkkkk

71. STH-HeHIT arreft oo stfarfae, 2002
(2002 FT 12)

OOl ATATTH H, SEIHT AT AT ST (AT F AT, "SE-heHIT" AT "ToT" 3 T G FHM: "R qT
T " AT O T & 9o 19

TET ST &, 91T 6 T ITETT (4) F @2 (ix) F FHarT a1 =1 Iuateaa, " & w279 92 "qere”
9Teg T,

TEqUT SAfertaae ® T T0ET 3 |igar digdr §aq 1989 & T 9¥ AT &€ |igar (1860 FT 45) ¥@|

g 1. - ST-4TRT (2) H, "SH-FHeHIT T o T 97 "q21@ 9 1T & 7" 9058 TE |
€T 2. - (i) @< (F) F T9ATY AT &A1 -

"(F)" TITEA" | TG T ST & T Tma" AT g,

(ii) T () F TLAT, T (TRT) FTFATHOT FH, AT -

“(TT)” FAFET VT AT g FelFeL, AT A e ATIIH, qad 1996 F
et gfverrioa 2

(iii) = (%) FT AT



[T [1—=7F 3(ii)]

ATLT T TSI ; STHTETIOT 131

g 30. -

Y 32. -

Y1 34. -

(iv) T (F) F T I AT FATHT HY, -

") w1 o9 g s afewrd, uw Ay A uw o S
srferfaer 3 refie e 5T = yw e s i T

(v) @€ (3) F Sy@e (iv) ¥ "#o=r Afaf=aw, 1956" F T« 9T "duel
srfarfaee, 2013 (2013 #7 18) 7 3T

(i) ST-EE (v) ¥ "W o srfarfFaw, 1980" F T 9¥ "era srtataa,
1989 (1989 =T 24)" ¥H;

1T 3 3i¥ 4 % &9 9% Aeftea w;

"3. fmaat = foro =arwor - sraeas gt s o ue ywarfad swereft
TS AN % Hae H TATHT % ATl UFh Togh THET gRT Td& =TT
HARI ATGH 1 TF A9 & & § T 00 S0

4. FTYOTT 6T FAoTae] — UH T4 A & 91 990% & & 999 95 90T
STTURTT % =9 et et ghr:

(i) T=reare T foaor sfiT Teartad SArhrefl TSSART g7 SAqaid q1;

(if) TRHTOT ST Jaee &t Sorrett 1 fFawor S et AR § 9HETT H
Tufera T

(i) =R THATOT T AT AT ATATAT ATAT, TAT

(iv) T AT & TF, TroeT, G, = i v St Rk a2 & 99
T[T & o TATHA &l Teq1d 92 = FLeA it AraqeavaT gf gl gl "

T 18 o T 9¥ TF -

"18. HYFdE 3¢ FIT T T~ HIAdH AT AT TSAN, 9T FH FIA F TSl

& oI, STl TSt 9% AT, STHat a1 JrEE A MEr o & g w2
T STAAT STed gRIT

T UHT 3 TH dIg Al ATSHAH i gAAH I & qegeia g, g
o AT fReET T arfdERrT g R, A, a7 A agrar
Ao § fafga a7 smefera T s =)

"SI I S At §aq 1990" F T 9¥ "7 S, [AATEd 7
A staf=aa § 3t afdwe e JRafear #1 steew, 2013 (30 FT
2013)” T

IT-ETT (4) FT AT F2

"I FATY A" F T 9¥ O g &I 9768 TE|

*kkkdkk



132 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

72. STRT-HeHIT A (SvT) s srferf==ae, 2001
(2001 =T 6)
TET &7 [AeET F
73. T @ e sfafaw, 1977
(1997 =T 1)
gl srferfaa ® "S-ReH T TS T 9T, "R 69 ST 8" |

G T 4. - T &1 T0F" 3 1 92 "= g &0 9158 6|

*kkkkkk

74. NS 3 TemE= Afaf=aw, g9q 1977 (1920 )
(1977 %1 29)

TVOT AT | =TT ITSTET & AT "weahr” o7 ", SE-HeHI ! ST ST I U HH:
"TITEA" Y "SI, "R T ST " AT "6 O & 9% T |

gt srfefaaw o, "ffEe ateear |@f@ar, gaa 1977" & w09 97, "fiae stwar |f@ar, 1908 (1908 #7 5)"
T,

Tl sferfaae o, "UE Y §F Higar” & T 9T, el | F A1d §, 9T a2 |@igar (1860 FT 45) ¥,

g 1. - SY-GTRT (2) H, "SH-FeHIT ST o T I¥ "qEM 99 1T 47" 7,

g1 3. - (i) "S- W FT 7T g ST AT Tq AT FLHIT FT Tq" A58 % T 92 "Tid- T0q H7 0 g
ARG 9 T &"; A7

(ii) “TETe” ¥ AT § "TAERAT AfAHAw, 1977," F T 9T " IIEhAT AAHAH, 1875

(1875 &1 9)" 7|
1T 59. - "HEOT TS o T O "0 9 15T &7 9751 76|
€T 60. - ST (2) H, IO H "HF0T TeF" & TATH I "qFEYOT T T 7" 9758 T |

*kkkkkk

75. STH-HeH IR g Aty feafaener stfafaaw, 2018

(2019 %7 2)
TEqUT &7 FAeE F

*kkkkkk



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 133

76. =TT 3R i Fereex Reafene srfarf{gw, 2016

(2016 7 3)
TET &7 [AeET F

*kkkkkk

77. STF-FHSH I TATt TmaT g (TiRTeor, S i Feerad s 9 sEy sifafRae, 1997

(1997 %7 16)
TET A7 FeET F
78. STH-FHHIT YT (FREETRAT I ) AT a7, 1997
(1997 #T 17)
TEOT &7 FAeET F

*kkkkkk

79. STH-FHHIR 918 Yaqvr & (R i @) st e, 2005

(2005 FT 17)
TEUT &7 FAeET F

*kkkkkk

80. STH-FHIHIT FTET AW Mg J1aeg ferafaemay sfefaaw, 2002

(2002 #T 16)
TEUT &7 FAeE F
81. STH-HeH R fasafaemer stfefaas, 1969
(1969 T 24)
TEQUT &7 FAeEe F

*kkkkkk

82. STH-FHeHIT =t wrar awoy aft farfaemerr stfafa=, 1999
(1999 FT 12)

TEqUT &7 FAeE F

kkkkdkk



134 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

83. SL-Feeix sfvreaw fmamarerat &1 fRamor sk g srferfRae, 1965

(1965 #71 22)
TET &7 [AeET F

*kkkkkk

84, srT-wei< frfae =marerr siferfRas, @aq 1977
(€aw 1977 F7 46)

Trl ATRTw H, S T [ =1 ITEted 7 g1 T T TqSAAA 6 1 T, FAL:, Tard 99 T
& JUTHA ST TSI 9761 T

Tt srferfaae ® "t whwar |@fgar & s ux ffae ghrar  fgar, 1908 (1908 #7 5) 7,

TEQT AT o, " F T U ¢ AEE 6 1T S 907 7 |

€T 1.- ST-GTRT (2) H, “STHL-H9HIT” % T ¥ “AEd HH 157 &7 9158 TE |
g 2. - (i) @ (i) FT A9 7T &,

(ii) @ (i) F T9AT AT FATAT FY -

"(i%)" IF AT Y SE-FHT TS Afafere, 2019 (2019 FT 34) F Wit VIII
LT AT TC STH-FHT T TST &0 ST T2 Ho ST & % o7 T 2f 37

T AT "
g1 3. - EIRKaY
YT 4. AT H|
€T 8. - ST (1) % @< () §, "q1" & o "I 958 7 |
g 13. - T TG ATATAT ATATAIH o Tl AT FAHATE ATATAF, ST, 957 AT AT FL|

T 24.- AT F|

T 25. - (i) ITETT (2) H, (F) @ (F) |, "ol S TATHA" 3 "THL SATLAT HT Tr=aT 927" 3 €A1
T "I ST AfAATe, 1925 (1925 FT 39)" Sii¥ "qhT AT FT 92T 3"; 951
;T
(@) "HTerew 3T Fiaured Aty & w419 9% " S wiadTen statea|, 1890 (1890
FT 8)" T |

g1 39. - ST (2) H, "TEE AT FT 97 17 AT FT AT F2

g 43. - “STH-FOHT 15T & =9 ATATAT” & T T "IF A" G|

kkkkdkk



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 135

85. srr-weefix fremgfa FRemor sifafmas, 1960

(1960 FT 40)
TET &7 [AeET F
86. STRT-HeHIT g e 7T S sfaf=aeT, 2002
(2002 T 25)
TFOT &7 [HeaT F

*kkkkkk

87. TRI-FeHT (srgf=ra are adrer e sfgf=ae, 1987
(1987 T 20)
FeAT TSt F fHar, g Afaf=aa § qeEre, ST T, F T 9 FH TATHA ST TS0 057
T,

ST | AT A= AT ITSTET o FHETT "FTHL-FHeHT" &Y "Osg” % €A I "qEE 9 9T 87" {7 6T O
" 9TeT TTAEATHod FY|

g 1. - ST (2) H, "STH-FHeHIT TS o T 97 "qE1@ 9 17 &7 958 & |

€T 2. - (i) @< (F) H, "TFE-FLHT T & €9 ¢ "FE0@ 99 T5F &7 A7 "§H-
FEHIT T AT A1 Afarf=as, 1975 STaT TTHT FIT ATE=d Hle o
e 9153 TE;

(ii) T (F) F T9AT, T (FE) AT AT e, AT

"(F@)" AT " | AL T ST G AT AT AT &

(iii) T () # "THL-FHHIT THet TA&AT A< Atefa=w, 1975" F T T "$H-
FeHY et forer srferfaem, 1975 strar werre g srfasgf=a s v 9187
9Teg TE”;

(iv) @< (3) ®, "uroa Femavee g arhia et siferfeas & srefie worfua

#rE fReafeemea” F W 9 = afafREw F s & o e g
srfergf=a #rE frataemea” a1 @)

g 7. - "% giRAT |12aT, H9d 1989" F T U "&T WiHHAT "Higar, 1973 (1974 =T
2)" T |
€T 8. - (i) "&= T =igar, sad 1989" F w19 U¥ "s< kAT "igar, 1973 (1974

T 2)" 957 T, 3T



136 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

(i) == (i) ®, "&= whFar G2, @aq 1989 it 4T 259-F " F T I¥ "3
wRaT wf24T, 1973 (1974 T 2) T 31247 19" 9Te8 TH|
g1 10. - “TUTE T & |IZAT F T I 9T & |124aT (1860 FT 45)” 9rex & |

*kkkkkk

88. S-St wgTeene (RfFww sk =) s, 2002
(2002 FT 22)

TRT 17 3 G (2) AT A+TAT ITS T o FBamry avqor Jff= = §, '9eate’ F T U 'qErg 99 97T & 053
T,

AT IUSTAT o THaTT Feqet srfefaae ®, ‘S, % T 9 TSI 97e% |

oy stferfaae #, sfaf=as i am=r 24 srrar w97 39aiad & Har, TRE-FeHT & e 0 ‘qard 99
ST &7, 9158 T |

e Sferfaae o, ST Afgd TIaT w97 IS AT Aigd ‘T’ F T U< “TErd 99 57 &7 908 TE |

g 1. - ST-8TRT (2) § STH-FeHT TT 6 TIF X 'T21@ 99 17 &7 958 4|
T 2. - (i) @< (F) & 99T, T (F@) AT TATAT F, FAATA-
"(FE)" TTET " | AL T ST & AT TLATE; AT &
(ii) @< () H, -
() ‘FeH FErata=me a1 s+ FrafEaemes ¥ 995 & T\ ) “Jgrd aEemay
IT TATET T AT~ et o7 ferafeemas & qag”; o2 7@l

(@) ST-8T (i) ®, “FeH¥ fFrataamea a1 5wy GrafEemes & o 9w =9 afaftaay
& TATSTHT o ToIT J9ee 1T At~ s {7 CraEemas a8 @)

(iii) @ () FT AT F<;

(iv) @ (i) & "T5F" F FeHT ST ATIYT 87 F T I "6 O 4" F AL 1o
T & AT g

(v) @T () ¥, FeHe-ovg FratEaemas afaam, 1969 F ofefia wamfua wediy
Freafaemeas o1 5= Reafaemes & T\ qEm Eataemed a1 ey, FeH a1
TETE THAT FT Fls 9T AT TE)

T 3. - ST-gTT (2) ¥, FH-weH Frafaemes afafaaw, 1969 F v\ o aE
st starf=aw, 2018" as3 @)

gT 9. - IT-GTT (2) H, FLRIET AATT' F T G¥ 2T 6T 7T &7 T8 o Aefi= e
"



[T [1—=7F 3(ii)]

ATLT T TSI ; STHTETIOT 137

g 17. -

g 19. -

T (3) H, “STH-FeH T frataemea afaE=as, 19697 % _ 9" dg1| [arataead,
2018” 9rs% |

“Torfaer wlerar wfgar, #aq 19777 & o= w2 ‘Ffae gfFar wfzar, 1908 (1908 =+t
5)” ¥E|

*kkkkkk

89. gfer srfaferT, 1983

(e 1983 #7 2)

Trql SAfAHaw H, o7 IvEtad & e, 9w, TS Y SE-HHT a9’ F I UY, wEn
“TETE HH ST &7 TITET “TETE 7 15T &7 3“0 97e2 76|

g 2. -

g 4. -

grr 8. -

g 17. -

g1 27. -

TEQUT &7 fAeEe F

" L RT3 T I, "THe TR T

g7 4 % ¥ H, TH AGWIH H "HgIEAAw", "ST GgiEies”, ""9gd
AETALeAs", "arefTersh”, "SU areffersh”, "Hgra® sfefteqs" A7 qfore 9 | &l 9+F 1T,
A% AT AL T AL F T AT 4 § A AL 8, AT UF THHA U AT UF T A
IeE LA o (o0 AT Y, AT AL T ST &7 oF TTHA ZIT 39 3297 % o0
srtergf=ra T T R

“STE-FOHIT % HIALTT FT a7 126 F IUGL” F TIF I ARG % S(aeTT F ATo83
311 & Y=Y’ E|

IT-TT (1) | "< herar Sf2ar F &mT 386 3fiT 387" F TI9 X "< WhHwaAT gf2ar,
1973 (1974 %7 2) 1 &7 421 T 422" 71

Y- (2) |, "&= THHRAT §i2aT, 1989 #t 4Ty 525" % T X "I kAT wfEAT,
1973 (1974 =7 2) T 4T 459” 9153 TH|

*kkkkkk

90. FHL-FHeHX AT X enfidr Hefix swtas Reafasmag

sfafa=m, 2005
(2005 =T 18)

*kkkkkk



138 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

91. SHRT-FeHIT T S AT 97 TR (Arasti+e qeasray) sfaf=asT, 1961
(1961 7 13)

TEqul 7 fAeEe F

*kkkkkk

92, STHT-FeHT araRT Herr 37 aRwer sifafRa, 2010
(2010 =7 15)

Trqul Sfefaae o, seeT SUEtdq & fEm, "R ST e F T 9T, w9, "W 99 T o
JITEA" 3 "I T |

et AR &, SRFAT AT ST ITATA 3 RET, - ST e 6 T R AT T 6
TS " ST " ST A" 9re T |

T 2. - (i) @< (F) F T9AT, AT FATAT <
"(Feh) "TATEA" H I T TS & T TATHA" AT 8; A<
(ii) ©E () FT AT F

g 15. - IT-ETT (i) H "I g TG 3 T I "TATH ZATE TG 9758 T |

*kkkkkk

93. S-S T Esreer Afafagw, 1967
(1967 T 21)

TEqUT &7 FAeE F

*kkkkkk

94, AT-T-FHIT sgfasT derr (Reft srgam) srfarf=aT, 1983
(1983 FT 13)
TEqUT &7 FAeE F

*kkkdkk



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 139
95. STRT-FeiT AT fAfer (Rdry sweten) sifafaam, 2014

(2010 T 13)

TET &7 [AeET F

*kkkkkk

96. STHI-FeHIT FA GTEILMTAT (TI) AT, 1987
(1987 =1 22)
TEqT AT |, ST TF F=AAT ITATeT T i AT, AT FLRET AT F €IH I, HHq:, TG 99
TS &1 TATHA’ ST T TS0 9058 T |

oy stterfaae § IR o fHam, ST O AT STElad T g1 “TH-HeHIT” F T 9 “TErE 9 1Y
8" 9Tex T |

IR AT~ "STFE-FeHIT ST o T I "TE1d 9 157 &7 9758 TE |

g 1. - ST-GTRT (2) H, "SF-HHIT T o T 9T "q21@ §9 77 &7 958 74|

g 7. - "I o T U, Tl Fel 9T g, "G T ST &7 9758 T |

g 17. - "%T WHAT |igaT, Had, 1989" & T U¥ "3 WHHAT |igar, 1973 (1974 F7 2)" @)
€T 18. - TST TUTE T & |igar" o T79 9 "qId 17 &€ §igdT (1860 FT 45)" ¥

g 21. - IT-ETT (3) T AT |

*kkkkkk

97. FF FAY AfAIwH, 1983

(G 1983 FT 1)

TEqUT &7 FAeE F
98. STH-FHIHIT TLHT FIT FAHI &l dgrIaT Ua [ e srafaw
(1993 #77)
TEqu 7 fAeEe F

*kkkkkk



140 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

99. STRT-FeHT A a7 T srfarfRaE, 2011
(2011 #79)
arqul fafRaw &, T aF o = IuEtaa 7 g7 9T, s SIS’ F T 9Y, wE,, TG 99 T
& TTE, 3T T |
TEQT SATAATs H IEIHT AT AT ITATET F HaTT S-FeHIT F A 92 T TsT % €11 I 'T2E
T ST &7, W
I TRT - ST % T UL "qETE T 1T &4 9% WG|

T 2. - (i) T (F) F T9ATq, G (F@) AT AT T, AT -
()" TATHA" | ETE T TT & TR AT g S
(i) ©T (2.), () UF 3T (3) F AT FT
g 9. - “Ferfarer gierar |fgar & = a2 “ffae whwRar g fgar, 1908 (1908 &1 5)” i
gz 15. - “Frer foregeer” & ST 9T “}ETE 169 TS & TTH G AT STier” |

*kkkkkk

100. FETE g qURT ST Afa«Haw, 2000

(& 2000 FT 18)
I i - TETE F 1" & T I¥ "G 69 1T &7 F dlg" 98 G|
-1, - "STHRL-HIHIT T F T 9T ST (ji) H, "G 69 5T & 9051 |
R 2. - g (9) |, "a=TE ST AfSd 8" % T 9 e 9 1T 47 Ai9da g7 ores T

*kkkkkk

101. SHT-FeH R fafaer aar (FRrdrr Suse) srfaf=as, 2010

(2010 7 14)
TEqUT &7 FAeE F

*kkkkkk

102. Tt TeT fAfer wmer gufty T (=iw S s o) sifaf=aw, 1963
(1963 7T 5)
TEQOT AT |, ST T o6 1= Iuafaa 7 &1 "o €68 & €79 U%, "Tma " 68 TH |

g 4. - IT-TT (1) H, "= F T 9 "SI

*kkkkkk



[T [1—=7F 3(ii)]

ATLT T TSI ; STHTETIOT 141

TET &7 [AeET F

TET &7 [AeET F

TRl &7 FAeET F

TFT &7 [AeEe F

T T AT 4

103. =i srfaf{gw, gaq 1977

(1977 1 40)

*kkkkkk

104, ST-FHLHIT AT ST a7 w sAfaf=aT, 2017

(2017 7 5)

*kkkkkk

105. FeHT Yo geeror A, 1964

(1964 T 14)

*kkkkkk

106. ST-FeHIT e (A o< Teeron)srfarfaaer, 1988

(1988 T 28)

*kkkkkk

107. STRI-HRH I AT Farrerdt [Re=ror stfafaas, @9 2010

[€a 2010 (1953 £.3.) #7 6]

kkkkdkk

108. STRI-HHIX y=tora Fr (M<ae) stfafaem, 2010
(2010 %7 27)

TS o T U R §9 O 87 et w2

*kkkkkk



142 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

109. s TS o=y s sifarfRs, 2006

(2006 FT 18)
TET &7 [AeET F

*kkkkkk

110. ST Terfahty SR i a9ie yay sfafaaw, 2006

(2006 FT 12)
TRl &7 FAeET F
111. T g At W daa 1995
(1995 T 8)
TFOT 7 [HeET F4

*kkkkkk

112. TR-FHI g, AR, Astifaen i A sfafaaw, 2005

(2005 =T 9)
TFT &7 [AeET F)
113. STH-FIHI T 9T gy fFfer stfafaae, 1960
(1960 %7 13)
TET &7 [AeET F

*kkkkkk

114. 3= =wor srfafRaw, 9aq 1977

(1977 %1 47)
TEqu 7 fAeEe F



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 143

kkkkdkk

115. ST-FeH RErasrar (R s §) F Bt #1 | afaf=a, 2018

(2018 T 13)
TET &7 [AeET F
116. STR-HeH I et v sfafiaw, daq 2001
(@ad 2001 FT 14)
TEOT &7 FAeET F

*kkkkkk

117. STET-FeHI gt ®mae qufxy T (R i =g ) sfaf@am, 2002

(2002 T 28)
TEUT &7 FAeET F
118. SE-FeHI et srfafaaw, 1980
(FaT 1980 T 2)
TFT &7 [HeET F

*kkkdkk

119. SHT-FeHR Tl (ISt Framer 9 %) st 1966
(1966 T 33)
o7 T AT
120. SE-FeHfiR Sorsh geoty yeaTeaw afafaw, 1976

(1976 F7 14)
TET &7 FeET F



144 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

kkkkdkk

121. ST-heHIT ergqa ST srferf{aw, daa 2006
(2006 FT 10)
TET &7 [AeET F

*kkkkkk

122, THT-FHI FIOEATE AGIALES (T4 | gRad«) strefaaw, 2001
(2001 FT 13)
TRl &7 FAeET F

*kkkkkk

123. ST-FeA i o e ok anfie o sfafaem, 1973
(1973 %7 15)

Tl srferfeae ® TS & o e |

TEquT AT o, &7 4 F @< (vi) F (9, "SI o T 9 e G 15T &7 AT AT 9058 1@ |
IefwT - "STE-FIHIT TS F AT T, "L T T & qiaedtiug w3

g 1. - (i) ST-GTRT (2) H "STHL-FLHIT TT" & T U, "qE@ TH 7T 47" 9058 TE; Y

(ii) ST-ETRT (2F) H "TST" F T UK TG §H TS & T

g 2. - gT (F) |, "TST" F T G, "qETG T AT G |

g 2 F - "STFL-HIHIT HEE T g T R sftafeem, 1966" F v 9, "S-
FIHIT AT {¥ ariorfsTw e afafRaw, 2012" =&

T 4. - (i) @< (v) H, "STH-FeHIT T o T 9%, "T21@ 69 75T &7 M58 74|
(ii) ©E (vi) T AT FL

T 6. - “SFTTT 31T ST H T[T ZIRT™ T AT F<

qRr 7. - "STH T SRR § FETAI T U, "M ¥ UE R 9 TG

& 8. - T T AT AL

gT 12. - T (Vi) FT AT FHL



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 145

kkkkdkk

124, SR-HH I I 71 (R g o) sfafRaw

(1963 FT 40)
TET &7 [AeET F
125. ST-HeHIT Fagdr srfafRaw, 2011
(2011 %7 18)

ot Afafaaw ®, o 3 6 s Suafaa 7 g1 "Hew, SR-HReH ! A7 s, #fT TS 6 T O
'TETE T TS & TITE, "2 T T[T &7 3{¥ "=, G T &7, 958 |

gqRT 1.- SY-GTRT (2) H, "S-FeHIT ToT" o TIF 97, "qEMG 69 1T &7 9058 Td|

gT 3. - (i) ST-GTT (4) H "SEH-FeHT a9 Aterf==aH, 1987" ¥ "3 AW & AT 751" %
AT I "G a9 AT =aw, 1927 (1927 FT 16") 3i¥ "q=rd §F 1T &7 Terra+”
T,
(ii) ST-4TT (9) H, "SI foF swewe 7Tt ° afafera ToFET S # AT F

g 12. - T (i) T AT F

g 22. - ST-gTT (1) H, "a 9T & AT 73" o €60 W "FEE 69 ST &7 H T
9re% TE|

€T 25. - "ST YTHAT Higar" & T 9¥ "E€ TheRAT "@igar, 1973 (1974 F7 2)" 7|

g 32. - "ST YTHAT Higar" & T 9¥ "E€ TheRaT |@igar, 1973 (1974 F7 2)" 7|

*kkkkkk

126. STFI-FHIHIT Hostl 1o TfafAaH, gad- 2009

(1973 %7 14)
TEOT &7 [AeET F
127. o srteat sreaTasT, 2005

(Faa 2005 FT 3reqTaeT 8)

TFIUT AT |, T T o A AT ITSTAT 7 I, FLHT AT T’ & T UL, FH: TEG T 157 & Hl
T, ST “T=2TE 69 1T &7 7|



146 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

T 1.~ ST-ITRT (2) ¥, “STFE-FeHT 1T & TIF U2, AT SIE0 9, T o AT g, “HF T[T &7
TETE” 7|

g 9. - IT-TT (2) ®, IAT SET UL, Tl o AT g “eTT 439” F T 9¥ "gTeT 401" TH)

T 12. - “TTE ATATAH, 19777 F €79 9T “qTed 7 /127 fafa=g, 1872 (1872 &1 1)” W&

T 13. - IT-TLT (4) |, "aT wiHar |@f2ar, 1989" F w1 4¥ "< whkar gfzar, 1973 (1974 =1 2)"
|

g 15. - "% WiRAT |i2aT, 1989" F forg "de wiwkam wfar, 1973 (1974 #71 2)" T

g 16. - "Z TiHRAT HT2aT, 1989" F T U¥ "< WhHAT "igar, 1973 (1974 F7 2)"

*kkkkkk

128. STRL-FeHIX AR ATAaH, 1956
(1956 T 37)
Trqol ATIRTw § 99 7o SUEtaq & e O sy TS F T 9, e 99 ST S LT,
T TSI T |

ST AT ST AT ITSTAT F HETT "Se-FHeH " 37 "ST" % T U FHAT "I 69 ST 87" Y "0
TS 87" |

ECATIE "STR-HIHIT TT | F I U A 69 AT &7 °' T
g 1. - ST-GTRT (2) H, "SH-FHeHIT T o T 97 "q21@ 99 77 &7 9758 TE |
T 11— “ToET 42 |RAT, 1989” ¥ €T T “qreT d2 Hf2T, 1860 (1860 T 45)” T

*kkkkkk

129. STF-FIHIT TTQT T SR ATerFshia srfarfaas, 1973

(1973 77 14)

TEQUT AT ITATET  HarT "gwh” o7 S F T 9T FET:, "MEr 69 ST o7 Va3
"SI 9Te% T |

EEATIE " o T 9" AT 99 T 87" 9e8 W |
€T 1. - ST-4TRT (2) § "STH-HeHT " F o0 "FErE 69 TS &9 951 |
& 10. - IT-ETT (3) |, "I1= 1 F0" o T I "I o< &9 9053 7|

€T 16. - IT-ETT (4) FT AT F2

*kkkkkk



[T [1—=7F 3(ii)]

ATLT T TSI ; STHTETIOT 147

TET &7 [AeET F

130. STR-FHHIT St FHATT St q& T T sAtefaae, 2000

(2000 T 18)

*kkkkkk

131. SE-FeHIT =ft AT FEer ¥ St 3R =i wrar arer gk g e ata[{e, 2013

TET A7 FeET F

TEOT &7 FAeET F

TEUT &7 FAeET F

TEUT &7 FAeE F

T FT A\ F)

TEqUT &7 FAeE F

(2013 =7 3)

*kkkkkk

132, STHL-FHLHIT =t ATQT 501 <t gIT T staf=a, 1988

(1988 T 16)

*kkkkkk

133. STRI-FHIHIT =1 o @it g1 e sfaf[as, 2008
(2008 T 4)

*kkkkkk

134, STRI-HHI TAAT A9 gam s« sAfafagH, 2018
(2018 FT 42)

*kkkkkk

135. STT-HeHIT farery g avg srfarf=ae, 2000

(2000 T 6)

*kkkkkk

136. STT-HeHIT Fa< srfarfaaw, 2007
(2007 =T 5)

kkkkdkk



148 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

137. STHT-FeHIT TsT Fahat AT sifafHaw, 2011

(2011 FT 1)
TET &7 [AeET F

*kkkkkk

138, STHT-HeHIT sraae st sraxreY (=T si geam) sifarfRam, 1956

(1956 T 11)
TET &7 [AeET F

*kkkkkk

139. STHI-FHIHIT gIF e sAfafaaw, 2006
(§aF 2006 FT 3)

TRl ST §, ST o o =T ITaterd T 21, “Aar”, “Xsg” 3T TS, & €9 9 qEE 99 57
& TITHT, ‘2T TF ST & AT T @

TR 2 % BT 9 TRASTNT FX : “2. FIARITE T T3 377 FHIS e T ofiT FATee Hit FAgfe:

(i) FETE T [T &1 TLATHA ZIRISH ATHE U TqAHal HedT &1 T wT, 5\ qaeg
RAT T GLEAT, HAT I GLEAT ST AT AGEAT, A% LT ¥ 38 qg & UH Fedl
T FHAAT TAT UH 7T FAT &/l w30, Neg 200 ATARTH F 7T ¥ I8 Tl qAT0 T0
Rt % SIgaT™ 37 |7 =T 2

(ii) FETE T TST & TATHT GIAISH & STIH SATSAT o Ueh ATRET Bl (HI<h FHIT S
TETE HH ST &7 H gIAISH 7 qIHT THaeq0 FT 3T 39 [Fa=a wam|

(iiil) TETE T ST &1 TATHT UH 5 ATATTh SATHIAT %0l (H<h Y T, ST ATAITF 2T
s o srfesT &1 @w (i) § Ffdse G w21, ag st afeai &1 g ag graee #i
TRreregor, TR S wtereqr % for strareash 9w, 39 €19 9T g

(iv) TEE | ST AT H TATEA TAF O § grwne F oo uw wwice fir Agie of

FT| "
€T 6-4. - (i) IT-4TT (1) ®, "TorEfT d2 |i2ar 1989" F w9 9 "WTIAT &< HigaT, (1860 FT
45)" TE; 3T
(ii) IT-LTIT (2) FT AT FL|
TR 67T - IT-ATT (2) ®, "= ierar gfgar, 1989" F ©or+ ¥ "&g whkar fgdar, 1973 (¥aa

1974 =T 2)" T

kkkkdkk



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 149

140. S-FLHIT 0 I srferfaaw, 1967
(1967 %7 12)
gt srferfea ®, ST 9% o "a9 | s Suetaa 7 21, ", oY e F o whern awre 99 sy
&7 T TITH ST oI 972 7E|

arql srfarfaae & IEFAT & A 5o 9% & e IuEtaa 9 81 'OST F T WO 9EE 699 ST 847
9Ie% TE|

T 2 - gT (9) § "TRL-HHT T ATUHT T F T U TG ARHA T q=1T AT M5
EEC]

T 3. - “STH-FOH T 1T AT I % T UX “TE0G AU 3T T #a1” 6|

T 14. - “oro7 it gi=a [t & oo “area Fi gt [ senfta #5390

T 17. - GT () T IT-GTT (2) § "S-FH9HT Feqeoqdr Afaf==m, gad 2002" F €19 9%, "Heqeqqr
T goTg ATAHaH, 1996 (1996 FT 26)" TH|

g1 19. - "Ry sl |2, waa, 1977" % & w7, "Rifaer gt wfzar, 1908 (1908 #7 5)" T

T 21. - "STHL-HIHIT TT TE X |igqT, §aq 1989" & forw "wrediy g2 "igar, (1860 1 45)" ¥@|

*kkkkkk

141. STRL-FHLHR TST qHAThT Frer 918 stfafaa, 2002
(2002 T 24)
TEqT Sferfeae ® ST=rT ITATerd & Fam, S’ % T U, TSI 9058 W

TEQT Srterfeare § ITHT 3T 41T 4 AT FFAT ITSTHT  ({arT T F T UL, 'qEMG 6 ST &7 9051
|

T Srferfaae ® IEIOHT, M7 4 3T 91T 36 AT AT IUSTHT & FarT SE-FeHT % €F 9T T2 99
TS &7 972 TE|

T 2 % @< (M) § [Afdee argier ara g & fa @ afafeam § 9 F w0 97 vemEd 05
EEC]

ECATIEO T e AT “OeT H F T U T e d1S 99T “HT ST &9 1§

g 1. ST-GTRT (2) § “HF0T STEY-FeHIT T F T I "I A2 §9 1T &7 905
|

T 2.- (i) @< (F) * T2 G (F@) ATTITAT FY, T,

‘(FE) AT F TG G T &7 T TATEA AT 25
(i) ©T (%) T AT H2
(iii) = () T AT L 3T



150

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

g1 3.-

YT 5-

g 18.-

g 19.-

g 22.-

g 30.-

grar 32.-

(iv) BT (W) F TATY TS (W) SIq-TATIIT, AT -

‘(F@) ST & | ARG HF 1T G AT B

1T 3 3 T9ATH, TLqH I ATTIT &Y, T -

"I TITEH, SIS &1 13 S17 qhal g AT Rt o= T AT Foheft st &9 T &y &
TRHT o7 T & UH 9IS &l 993 F 9al § S 39 3297 & o7u srfesgf=ra f=har
=T

“Freferiad geeat & ™ ... (3) 9ee7-a=d, e g0 Haad a1 SITuar & &6
T UH gEEl, (S 9T g M AT ST g eeE T

SHL-FHeHT [ofae #ar AfAEEt § vt ‘aiaFgie fF a9 gaaqr” & &1+ 97
‘T T Afed faf=is #it ad” oz @l

ST [AEgTEed g 39 [Ataa [Ater g e T st AESe F g &1
L

(i) IT-aTT (2) ®, “Fu«T Afarf==aw 1956 FT 4T 226 F T 9T, FIAT AT I,
2013 (2013 &7 18) ¥ &7 141 T&, q7

(ii) IT-LTT (5) FT AT F|

(i) “STF-FeHIT ST TER &€ |igdl, §9q, 1989 Sgf ff g1 9 od § ‘WA &€
H2aT 1860 (1860 FT 45)’; T& T4T

(i) IT-4TT (2) ¥, '&= wHHAT Gigar, 1989 & forw <= wikar gfzar, 1973 (1974 =t
2)' T

IT-4TT (3) FT AT 2

*kkkkkk

142. Steg-Feeie IR wfaver sfafaam, 2011
(2011 %7 6)

Trql TR &, 77T ISt & FamE, 9w, 67 ueu” F o wmen ‘dEre '/ sy o
JITER” AT TSI, 9Te8 TE|

I § AT AT ITSTAT & Harg, T ATIHIH7 § "SH-HediT" 3T """ & T\ U "FErg 99 5T
" 3T "HE T g T

SR -

T 2. -

TE-FOHIT T § o T I T G T &7 |’ 9758 74|
(i) @< (F) ¥ 9991 < (F@) FTEATUT, TE|
"(F@)" TTEA " q TR W ST A T T4, AT ¥

(i) ©E (F) F AT H; 3T



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 151

(iii) @ (I) H "TSA” F A “TE-FLHIT TT 87 % T UL ‘g AT T2 T 3 g A1
T ST &7 952 7|

*kkkkkk

[®1. 9. 11012/21/2020-7H3170)

S pHTY wwl,ﬂ‘a’ﬂiéa

ORDER
New Delhi, the 23rd October, 2020

S.0. 3775 (E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 96 of the Jammu and Kashmir
Reorganisation Act, 2019 (34 of 2019), and of other powers enabling it in that behalf, the Central Government
hereby makes the following Order in respect of the Union territory of Ladakh, namely:-

1. (1) This Order may be called the Union territory of Ladakh Reorganisation (Adaptation of
State Laws) Order 2020.

(2) It shall come into force with immediate effect.

2. The General Clauses Act, 1897 applies for the interpretation of this Order as it applies for the
interpretation of laws in force in territory of India.

3. With immediate effect, the Acts mentioned in the Schedule to this Order shall, until repealed or
amended by a competent authority, have effect, subject to the adaptations and modifications directed by the
said Schedule, or if it is so directed, shall stand repealed.

4. Where this Order requires that in any specified section or other portion of an Act, certain words
shall be substituted for certain other words, or the certain words shall be omitted, such substitution or
omission, as the case may be, shall, except where it is otherwise expressly provided, be made wherever the
words referred to occur in that section or portion.

5. The provisions of this Order which adapt or modify or repeal any law so as to alter the manner in
which, the authority by which or the law under or in accordance with which, any powers are exercisable, shall
not render invalid any notification, order, commitment, attachment, bye-law, rule or regulation duly made or
issued, or anything duly done before the 31* day of October, 2019; and any such notification, order,
commitment, attachment, bye-law, rule, regulation or anything may be revoked, varied or undone in the like
manner, to the like extent and in the like circumstances, as if it had been made, issued or done after the
commencement of this Order by the competent authority and in accordance with the provisions then applicable
to such case.

6. The repeal or amendment of any law specified in the Schedule to this Order shall not affect—

(a) the previous operation of any law so repealed or anything duly done or suffered
thereunder;

(b) any right, privilege, obligation or liability acquired, accrued or incurred under any law so
repealed;

(c) any penalty, forfeiture or punishment incurred in respect of any offence committed against
any law so repealed; or

(d) any investigation, legal proceeding or remedy in respect of any such right, privilege,
obligation, liability, penalty, forfeiture or punishment as aforesaid,



152 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

and any such investigation, legal proceeding or remedy may be instituted, continued or enforced, and any such
penalty, forfeiture or punishment may be imposed, as if the Jammu and Kashmir Reorganisation Act, 2019 (34
of 2019) or this Order had not been passed or issued.

o ok skeoskosk sk ke skock

THE SCHEDULE

(See paragraph 3)
STATE LAWS
1. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR STATE AID TO INDUSTRIES ACT, 1961
(XXII of 1961)
Repeal as a whole.
skoskoskoskokoskosk

2. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR ANATOMY ACT, 1959
(XXII of 1959)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for ‘Government’, ‘State’ and ‘Government Gazette,
substitute ‘Administration of Union territory of Ladakh’, ‘Union territory of Ladakh’ and ‘Official
Gazette’, respectively.

Section 6. — For “five hundred rupees” substitute “five thousand rupees”.
Section 9. — For “Ranbir Penal Code” substitute “Indian Penal Code (45 of 1860)”.
skoskeoskoskokosk ok

3. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR ANCIENT MONUMENTS PRESERVATION ACT, SVT. 1977
(V of Samvat 1977)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for ‘Government’, “Jammu and Kashmir”, “State
Protected Monument”, “Minister” and ‘Government Gazette, substitute respectively “Administration of
Union territory of Ladakh”, “Union territory of Ladakh”, “Protected Monument”, “Administration of
Union territory of Ladakh and ‘Official Gazette’.

Throughout the Act, for “Director, Archaeology” substitute “the officer appointed by the Administration
of Union territory of Ladakh”.

Throughout the Act, for “Archaeology Department” substitute “the Department entrusted for carrying out
the purposes of this Act”.

Section 2.— (1) In clause (3), for “of the Archaeology Department, not below the rank
of Deputy Director.” substitute “appointed by the Administration of
Union territory of Ladakh.” ; and
(i1) omit clause (5-a).

Section 10. — in sub-section (1), for “Land Acquisition Act” substitute “Right to Fair
Compensation and Transparency in Land Acquisition, Rehabilitation and
Resettlement Act, 2013 (Act No. 30 of 2013)”.

Section 15. — In sub-section (2), for “one thousand rupees” substitute “ten thousand
rupees”.

Section 17. — In sub-section (4), omit “not below the rank of Assistant Director”.



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 153

Section 20-A. — Omit “or in the case of Ladakh District, the Deputy Commissioner of
that District”.
Section 20-C. — For “State Land Acquisition Act No. X of 1990 substitute “Right to

Fair Compensation and Transparency in Land Acquisition,
Rehabilitation and Resettlement Act, 2013 (Act No. 30 of 2013)”.

Section 22-A. — For “Code of Criminal Procedure, Samvat 1989 substitute “Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Hkeok ok ok
4. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR BRICK KILNS (REGULATION) ACT, 2010 (XVII of 2010)
Throughout the Act, for “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official Gazette”.
Throughout the Act, for “Government”, substitute “Administration”.
Preamblel. — For “in the State”, substitute “in the Union territory of Ladakh”.

(i) in sub-section (1), for “Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh” ; and

Section 1.

(i) in sub-section (2), for “State of Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute

“Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 2. — (i) in clause (a), for “State”, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh” ; and
(i1) for clause (h), substitute-
‘(h) “Administration” shall mean Administration of the Union territory
of Ladakh.’

Section 3. — In sub-section (2), in the proviso, for “by a notified order”, substitute “by
notification in the Official Gazette”.

Section 4. — In clause (d), for “demarcated forest area of the State under the Jammu
and Kashmir Forest Act, 1987”, substitute “forest land of Union territory
of Ladakh under the Indian Forest Act, 1927 (16 of 1927)”.

Section 6. — (1) in sub-section (1), for “State”, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”
; and
(il) in sub-section (4), in clause (II), in sub-clause (ii), for “State
Pollution Control Board”, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh
Pollution Control Committee”.

Section 8. — In sub-section (2), in clause (f), for “Pollution Control Board”, substitute
“Union territory of Ladakh Pollution Control Committee”.

Section 12. — In the Explanation, for “sections 102 and 103 of the Code of Criminal
Procedure, Samvat 1989, substitute “section 100 of the Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 13. — For “State”, substitute “Union territory of Ladak”.

Section 18. — For “the Hoarding and Profiteering Prevention Ordinance, Samvat 2000
and any other law”, substitute “any law”.

Section 23. — For “State Ranbir Penal Code”, substitute “Indian Penal Code (45 of
1860)”.

Section 28. — For “State”, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.



154 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

5. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR CAMPING AND MOORING SITES ACT, 2004
(XII of Samvat 2004)

Repeal as a whole.

skok skoskok ko

6. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR STATE COMMISSION FOR BACKWARD CLASSES ACT,
1997
(XII of 1997)
Repeal as a whole.

skskoskoskoskokosk

7. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR CONTROL OF BUILDING OPERATIONS ACT, 1988
(XV of 1988)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for “Government”, and “Government Gazette”, substitute
“Administration of Union territory of Ladakh”, and “Official Gazette”, respectively.

Throughout the Act, for “Jammu and Kashmir” or “J&K” and “State” substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”
except in the preamble.

Section 1. — In sub-section (2), for ‘State of Jammu and Kashmir’ substitute ‘Union
territory of Ladakh’.

Section 2. — (1) In clause (9), in sub-clause (i), omit “, commonly known as “PAND-
PAND” in Kashmir Valley’ ;
(i) in clause (10), for “Jammu and Kashmir Government” substitute
“Administration of Union territory of Ladakh”. ; and
(iii) omit clause (13).

Section 3. — In sub-section (1), omit ‘State’.

Section 4. — Omit State’.

Section 5. — In sub-section (3), omit ‘State’.

Section 10. — For “Code of Criminal Procedure, Samvat, 1989” substitute “Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)” and in sub-clause (a) of clause (ii), for
“section 57 substitute “section 42”.

Section 11. — For “Minister” wherever occurring substitute “Administration of Union

territory of Ladakh”.

skokskoskokoskok

8. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETIES ACT, 1989
(X of 1989)

Throughout the Act, for “Government Gazette”, and “the Transfer of Property Act, Samvat, 1997,
wherever occurring, substitute “Official Gazette” and “the Transfer of property Act, 1882~
respectively.

Throughout the Act, other than in preamble unless otherwise provided, for “Jammu and Kashmir”,
substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

Preamble — (1) for “in the State”, occurring at both the places, substitute “in the
Union territory of Ladakh”.

(i1) omit “in accordance with the directive principles of State policy
enunciated in the Constitution of Jammu and Kashmir”.

Section 1. — (i) In sub-section (1), for “Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh”;



[T [1—=7F 3(ii)]

HILT T TSI AHTYTL

155

Section 2. —

Section 3. —

Section 10. —

Section 16. —

Section 17. —

Section 35. —

Section 40. —

Section 60. —

Section 79. —

Section 91. —

Section 92. —

Section 94. —

Section 107.

Section 111.

Section 131.

Section 132.
Section 134.

(i1) in sub-section (2), for “State of Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute
“Union territory of Ladakh”.

In sub-clause (iii) of clause (f), for “Apex level”, substitute “Apex
level of the Union territory of Ladakh”.

In sub-section (1), for “whole of the State of Jammu and Kashmir”,
substitute “whole of the Union territory of Ladakh”.

In sub-section (1), for “programmes of the State”, substitute
“programmes of Union territory of Ladakh”.

In sub-section (1), in proviso, omit “and every such order shall be
laid, as soon as may be, after it is made, before each House of the
State legislature.”.

In sub-section (1), -
(1) in clause (a), —

(a) in sub-clause (i), for “Jammu and Kashmir Contract Act,
Samvat 1977”, substitute “Indian Contract Act, 1872 (21
of 1860) ;

(b) omit sub-clause (ii) ; and

(i) in clause (c), for “the Jammu and Kashmir Societies Registration
Act, Samvat 1998, substitute “the Society Registration Act, 1860.”

In the proviso to clause (i), —

(a) for “State Government”, substitute “Administration of Union
territory of Ladakh”; and

(b) omit “subject to the provisions of section 140 of the Transfer of
Property Act, Samvat, 1977”.

For “Jammu and Kashmir Registration Act, Samvat 1977, substitute
“Registration Act, 1908 (16 of 1908)”.

For “Trust Act, Samvat 19777, substitute “Indian Trust Act 1882” (2
of 1882).

In sub-section (1), for “the State”, occurring at both the places,
substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

In sub-section (1), omit “arising from a” and “under the Aid to
Agriculturists and Land Improvement Act, Samvat 1993”.

In sub-section (2), for “Nothing in the Big landed Estates Abolition
Act, Samvat 2007”, substitute “Notwithstanding anything contained
in any law for the time being in force”.

For “Registration Act, Samvat 19777, substitute “Registration Act,
1908 (16 of 1908)”.

In sub-section (1), for “Jammu and Kashmir Registration Act,
Samvat 19777, substitute “Registration Act, 1908 (16 of 1908)”.

Omit “Notwithstanding anything contained in section 6 of the Jammu
and Kashmir Land Alienation Act, Samvat 1995”.

In sub-section (3), for “Code of Civil Procedure, Samvat 1977,
substitute “Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 (5 of 1908)”.

In sub-section (1), for “section 89A”, substitute “section 69A”.

In marginal head and sub-section (1), for “Jammu and Kashmir
Houses and Shop Rent Control Act, 19667, substitute “the



156 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

Residential and Commercial Tenancy Act, 2012”.

Section 143. — For “Jammu and Kashmir Land Acquisition Act, Samvat 19907,
substitute “Right to Fair Compensation and Transparency in Land
Acquisition, Rehabilitation and Resettlement Act, 2013 (30 of
2013)”.

In clause (c), for “Jammu and Kashmir Ranbir Penal Code”,
substitute “Indian Penal Code (45 of 1860)”.

Section 153.

Section 155. — For “Article 182 of the First Schedule to the Limitation Act, Samvat
19957, substitute “section 137 of the Limitation Act, 1963 (36 of
1963).

Section 171. — For “Companies Act, 1956 (01 of 1956)”, substitute “Companies Act,

2013 (18 of 2013)”.

In sub-section (1), for “Code of Civil Procedure, Samvat 19777,
substitute “Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 (5 of 1908)”.

Section 174.

Section 176.

In sub-section (1), for “State”, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

seskeoskoskoskoksk

9. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR DEBTORS RELIEF ACT, 1976
(XV of 1976)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for “Government”, substitute “Administration of
Union territory of Ladakh”.

Preamble. — For “in the Jammu and Kashmir State”, substitute “in the Union territory
of Ladakh”.

Section 1. — (1) in sub-section (2), for “State of Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute
“Union territory of Ladakh”; and

(i1) in sub-section (3), for “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official
Gazette”.

Section 2. — (i) In clause (1), —

(a) in sub-clause (ii), for “Jammu and Kashmir Co-operative
Societies Act, 19607, substitute “Jammu and Kashmir Co-
operative Societies Act, 1989”;

(b) in sub-clause (ii), omit “or section 140 of the Jammu and
Kashmir Transfer of Property Act, 1977”;

(c) in sub-clause (v), for “Government of Jammu and Kashmir”,
occurring at both the places, substitute “Administration of Union
territory of Ladakh”; and

(i) in Explanation to clause (2), for “Government of Jammu and
Kashmir”, substitute “Administration of Union territory of Ladakh” ;

(iii) in clause (9), for “Jammu and Kashmir Co-operative Societies Act,
19607, substitute “Jammu and Kashmir Co-operative Societies Act,
1989”’; and

(iv) in sub-section (10), for “Code of Civil Procedure, Samvat 19777,
substitute “Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 (5 of 1908)”.

Section 3. — (1) in sub-section (1), for “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official
Gazette”;

(i1) in sub-section (7), for “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official
Gazette”; and



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 157

(ii1) in sub-section (11), for “Limitation Act, Svt. 1995”, substitute
“Limitation Act, 1963 (36 of 1963)”.

Section 4. — Omit proviso.

Section 12.

For “Code of Civil Procedure, Samvat 1977, substitute “Code of Civil
Procedure, 1908 (5 of 1908)”.

Section 22. — For “Code of Civil Procedure, Samvat 19777, substitute “Code of Civil
Procedure, 1908 (5 of 1908)”.

Section 30. — For “Jammu and Kashmir Limitation Act, Svt. 19957, substitute
“Limitation Act, 1963 (36 of 1963)”.

Section 32. — For “Ranbir Penal Code, Svt. 19897, substitute “Indian Penal Code (Act
45 of 1860)”.

Section 34. — (i) Omit “the Revenue Minister or”, occurring at both the places; and

(ii) for “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official Gazette”.

skokskoskok skok

10. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR DEPUTY MINISTERS' SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES
ACT, 1957
(VI of 1957)

Repeal as a whole.

sheskeoskoskoskoksk

11. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR DEPUTY SPEAKER'S AND DEPUTY CHAIRMAN'S
(EMOLUMENTS) ACT, 1956
(XXII of 1956)

Repeal as a whole.

shskeoskoskoskoksk

12. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR DEVELOPMENT ACT, 1970
(XIX of 1970)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for “Government”, “Government Gazette” and
“State”, substitute “Administration”, “Union territory” and “Advisor to the Lieutenant Governor”,
respectively.

Section 2. — In clause (1), for “section 3 of Land Acquisition Act, 1990,
substitute “Right to Fair Compensation and Transparency in
Land Acquisition, Rehabilitation and Resettlement Act,
2013 (30 of 2013)”.

Section 8. — In sub-section (1), for “for each of the zones into which a
Local Area may be divided” and “each zone”, substitute “for
such zones which are declared as development areas under
section 13”and “each such zone”, respectively.

Section 11. — For “after the Master Plan and”, substitute “after the Master
Plan or”.

Insertion of new section -

Permitted land use and levy of After section 11, insert —

land use charges. “11A. (1) Upon coming into operation of the Master Plan or
the Zonal Development Plan, the land use permitted in the
area covered thereunder shall only be as provided in terms



158 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

of such Master Plan or Zonal Development Plan:

Provided that the provisions of any law for the time being in
force in the Union territory of Ladakh requiring any
permission to change the usage of any land shall not be
applicable to any area so covered.

(2) The Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh
may, by notification in the Official Gazette, notify a scheme
for levy of charges for use of land as permitted in the Master
Plan or the Zonal Development Plan, the proceeds of which
shall form part of the fund of the Authority and may be used
to meet the expenses incurred for acquisition of land
required in terms of section 50.”.

For section 13, substitute —

Declaration of development “13 (1) After a notice approving the date of operation of the
areas and permission for  plan is published under section 11, the Authority may, with
development, etc. prior permission of the Ladakh Administration and by

notification in the Official Gazette, declare any zone or part
thereof as a development area for the purposes of this Act.

(2) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary in any law for
the time being in force, consequent upon such notification,
no person, including a Department of the Union territory of
Ladakh, shall undertake or carry out development of any
land or building in the zone or part thereof, as the case may
be, unless permission for such development has been
obtained in writing from the Authority in accordance with
the provisions of this Act:

Provided that the development of any land commenced by a
Department of the Administration of Union territory of
Ladakh or any local authority before the 31* day of October,
2019 may be completed by that Department or local
authority.

(3) No person or entity, whether private or public, including
a Department of the Administration of the Union territory of
Ladakh or any authority, shall undertake the implementation
of any street or layout plan, in any form whatsoever, in any
local area outside municipal limits, without prior written
permission of the Authority:

Provided that for the purposes of such permission, the
Authority shall follow the procedure laid down in the
Jammu and Kashmir Municipal Act, 2000 (XX of 2000):

Provided further that the restriction under this sub-section
shall not apply to any development undertaken as part of a
town planning scheme implemented under the provisions of
the Jammu and Kashmir Town Planning Act, 1963 (XX of
1963)”.

Section 15. — For “a plan in a zone”, substitute “Master Plan or a Zonal
Development Plan in a zone”.

Section 16. — In sub-section (1), for “Land Acquisition Act, Samvat
19907, substitute “Right to Fair Compensation and



[T [1—=7F 3(ii)]

ATLT T TSI ; STHTETIOT 159

Section 21.

Section 22.

Section 24.

Section 26.

Section 31.

Section 34.

Section 43.

Section 45.

Section 49.

Transparency in Land Acquisition, Rehabilitation and
Resettlement Act, 2013 (30 of 2013)”.

In sub-section (4), omit “and Government shall cause a copy
of the same to be laid before both Houses of the
Legislature”.

In subsection (2), for “Provident Funds Act, Svt. 1998,
substitute  “The Employees Provident Funds and
Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952)”.

(i) in sub-section (1), for “Rs. 5,000/-” and “Rs. 200/-”,
substitute “Rs. 50,000/~ and “Rs. 2,000/-“, respectively;

(i1) in sub-section (2), for “Rs. Three thousand rupees” and
one hundred and fifty rupees®, substitute “Rs. 30,000/-”
and “Rs. 1500/-", respectively;

(iii) in sub-section (3), for “one thousand rupees”, substitute
“ten thousand rupees”.

In sub-section (4), for “two hundred rupees”, substitute “two
thousand rupees”.

Omit “on terms and conditions agreed upon between the
Authority and that local authority or the department, as the
case may be”.

(i) in sub-section (2), for “Code of Civil Procedure, Svt.
1977, substitute “Code of Civil Procedure,. 1908 (5 of
1908)”; and

(i) in sub-section (6), for “Arbitration Act, Svt. 20027,
substitute “Arbitration and Conciliation Act, 1996 (26 of
1996).

For “Ranbir Penal Code”, substitute “Indian Penal Code (45
of 1860)”.

For “section 32 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 19897,
substitute “section 29 of the Code of Criminal Procedure,
1973 (2 of 1974)”.

In clause (c), for “Jammu and Kashmir State Canal and
Drainage Act, Svt. 19637, substitute “Jammu and Kashmir
Water Resources (Regulation and Management) Act, 2010”.

skosk skoskosk skok

13. THE EGRESS AND INTERNAL MOVEMENT (CONTROL) ORDINANCE), 2005

(Ord. V of Samvat 2005)

Throughout the Ordinance, unless otherwise provided, for ‘Government’, ‘State’ and ‘Government
Gazette, substitute ‘Administration of Union territory of Ladakh’, ‘Union territory of Ladakh’ and
‘Official Gazette’, respectively.

Section 3-C.—

Section 5. —

For “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989 substitute “Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

In sub-section (2), for “section 61 of the Code of Criminal Procedure,
1989” substitute “section 57 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2



160 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

of 1974)”.

Section 8. — In sub-section (1), for “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989 and “section
30” substitute “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)” and
“section 297, respectively.

Section 9. — In sub-section (2), for “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989” substitute
“Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 10. — For “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989 occurring at two places
substitute “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 12. — In sub-section (2), for “section 439 of the Code of Criminal Procedure,
1989 and “section 439 refers” substitute “section 401 of the Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973 and “section 401 refers” (2 of 1974)”.

Section 15. — For “Evidence Act, 1977” substitute “Indian Evidence Act, 1872 (1 of
1872)”.

Section 16. — In sub-section (4), for “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989 substitute
“Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 17. — For “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989 occurring at both the places
substitute “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 18. — In sub-section (1), for “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989” substitute
“Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 19. — In sub-section (1), for “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989 substitute
“Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

skoskeoskoskokosk ok

14. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR EXCISE ACT, SAMVAT 1958 (1901 A.D.)
(State Council Resolution No. 9 of 1901)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for “Government” substitute “Administration of Union
territory of Ladakh”.

Preamble. — For “Jammu and Kashmir State” occurring at both the places, substitute
“Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 1. — in sub-section (2), for “territories of the State”, substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh”.

Section 3. — In section 3, —

(i) in clause (3), for “Government Gazette”, substitute, “Official
Gazette” ;

(i1) in clauses (11), (12) and (13), for “State territory”, substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh” ; and

(iii) in clause (18), for “State Government” and “Government Gazette”,
substitute “Administration of Union territory of Ladakh” and “Official

Gazette”.

Section 3A. — For “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official Gazette”.

Section 4. — In sub-section (2), for “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official
Gazette”.

Section 5. — For “Jammu and Kashmir State”, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 6. — For “State”, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 7. — For “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official Gazette”.

Section 8. — For “State”, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”



[T [1—=7F 3(ii)]

HILT T TSI AHTYTL

161

Section 11. —

Section 11A. —

Section 12A. —

Section 14A. —

Section 16. —

Section 16A. —

Section 17 and 24.
Section 32.

Section 34.

Section 38.

Section 39.

Section 56B. —

Section 61. —

Section 62. —

Section 64. —

In the second proviso, for the “territories of the State”, substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh”.

In sub-section (2), for “State Government”, substitute “Administration of
Union territory of Ladakh”.

In clause (i) of the proviso, —

(a) for “Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute “in the Union territory of
Ladakh” ; and

(b) for “at Jammu or Srinagar”, substitute “in the Union territory of
Ladakh”.

For “State”, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

For “in the territories of the State or imported into or exported from the
State”, substitute “in the Union territory of Ladakh or imported into or
exported from the Union territory”.

For “State” and “Government Gazette”, substitute “Administration of
Union territory of Ladakh” and “Official Gazette”, respectively.

For “State”, wherever occurring, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

(i) For “Code of Criminal Procedure, 19897, substitute “Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”; and

(i1) omit the proviso.
For “State”, occurring at both the places, substitute “Union territory of

Ladakh”.

For “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989”, substitute “Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974).

For “Chapter XXX of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989”, substitute
“Chapter XXXIII of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

In sub-section (2), for “Schedule II of the Code of Criminal Procedure,
19897, substitute “Schedule I of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973
(2 0of 1974)”.

(i) in sub-section (1), for the “Ranbir Penal Code”, substitute “Indian
Penal Code (45 of 1860)”; and

(il)) in sub-section (2), for “Code of Criminal Procedure, 19897,
substitute “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974).

For “Jammu and Kashmir Government Gazette”, substitute “Official
Gazette”.

For “Jammu and Kashmir Government”, substitute “Administration of
Union territory of Ladakh”.
skskeoskoskokoskosk

15. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR EXTRACTION OF RESIN ACT, 1988

Repeal as a whole.

(IX of 1988)

skskoskoskosk ok

16. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR FERRY BOATS CONTROL ACT, 1971

Repeal as a whole.

(XVIII of 1971)

skok skoskok skok



162 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

17. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR FISHERIES ACT, 2018
(XVI of 2018)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for ‘Government’, ‘Jammu and Kashmir’ and
‘Government Gazette, substitute ‘Administration of Union territory of Ladakh’, ‘Union territory of
Ladakh’ and ‘Official Gazette’, respectively.

Preamble.— For “in the State” substitute “in the Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 2. — (i) After clause (a), insert —
‘(aa) “Administration” means the Administration of Union territory of
Ladakh’ ; and
(i1) omit clause (g).

Section 12. — In sub-section (3), for “Limitation Act, Svt. 1995 substitute “Limitation
Act, 1963 (36 of 1963)”.

Section 17. — For “Code of Criminal Procedure, Svt. 1989” substitute “Code of

Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 18. — (1) In sub-section (1), for “Code of Criminal Procedure, Samvat, 1989”
substitute “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)” ; and

(i) in sub-section (3), for “section 403 of the Code of Criminal
Procedure, Samvat, 1989” substitute “section 300 of the Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 19. — For the “State Government” substitute “Administration”.

Section 21. — For “Ranbir Penal Code, Svt. 1989 substitute “Indian Penal Code (45 of
1860)”.

Section 22. — Omit sub-section (2).

Section 27. — In sub-section (2), for “State territories” occurring at both the places
substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 28. — For “Code of Criminal Procedure” substitute “Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

skoskoskeoskokoskosk

18. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR STATE FOREST CORPORATION ACT, 1978.
(XII of 1978)

Repeal as a whole.

skskoskoskosk ok

19. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR GOLF DEVELOPMENT AND MANAGEMENT AUTHORITY
ACT, 2013
(VII of 2013)

Repeal as a whole.

skskoskoskosk ok



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 163

20. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR GOVERNMENT GAZETTE ACT, SVT. 1945 (1888 A.D.)
(XII of Svt. 1945)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for ‘Government’, ‘State’, ‘Jammu and Kashmir’ and
‘Government Gazette, substitute ‘Administration of Union territory of Ladakh’, Union territory of Ladakh’,
‘Union territory of Ladakh’ and ‘Official Gazette’, respectively.

Section 10. — Insert, —

“Explanation. — Publication in Official Gazette shall mean online publication on
the official website of the Administration of Union territory of Ladakh.”.

skkoskoskoskkk
21. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR HANDICRAFTS (QUALITY CONTROL) ACT, 1978
(IV of 1978)

Repeal as a whole.

skokskoskok skok

22. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR HIGHWAYS ACT, 2007
(XXVII of Samvat 2007)

Throughout the Act, for “Government roads”, “Government road” and “Jammu and Kashmir State”,
substitute “Union territory of Ladakh roads’, ‘Union territory of Ladakh road’ and ‘Union territory of
Ladakh”, respectively.

Throughout the Act, other than in the preamble, for “Government”, substitute “Administration of
Union territory of Ladakh”.

skokskoskok skok

23. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR HOUSING BOARD ACT, 1976
(VII of 1976)

Repeal as a whole.

shskeoskoskoskokosk

24. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR INDUSTRIAL ESTABLISHMENTS (NATIONAL AND
FESTIVAL) HOLIDAYS ACT, 1974
(XIII of 1974)

Throughout the Act, for “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official Gazette”.

Throughout the Act, other than in clause (c¢) of sub-section (1) of section 10, for “Government”,
substitute “Administration of Union territory of Ladakh”.

Preamblel. — For “in the State”, substitute “in the Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 1. In sub-section (2), for “Jammu and Kashmir State”, substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh”.

Section 2. In clause (a), for “State”, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 3. Omit sub-section (2).

Section 6. — In sub-section (2), for “Ranbir Penal Code, 1989, substitute “Indian
Penal Code (450f 1860)”.

Section 8. For “twenty-five rupees” and “two hundred and fifty rupees”, substitute

“two thousand and five hundred rupees” and “twenty-five thousand



164 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

rupees”’, respectively.

Section 9. — For “five hundred rupees”, substitute “five thousand rupees”.

25. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR KHADI AND VILLAGE INDUSTRIES BOARD ACT, 1965
(XVI of 1965)

Repeal as a whole.
skoskeosk skokosk sk

26. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY SPEAKER'S EMOLUMENTS
ACT, 1956
(IV of 1956)

Repeal as a whole.
skoskoskoskokoskosk

27. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL CHAIRMAN'S (EMOLUMENTS)
ACT, 1962
(XXVIII of 1962)

Repeal as a whole.
skoskeoskoskokosk sk

28. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR STATE LEGISLATURE MEMBERS' PENSION ACT, 1984
(11 of 1984)

Repeal as a whole.
skskeoskoskokosk sk

29. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR LEGISLATURE (PREVENTION OF DISQUALIFICATION)
ACT, 1962
(XVI of 1962)

Repeal as a whole.
skoskeskeoskokoskosk

30. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR STATE LEGISLATURE PROCEEDINGS (PROTECTION OF
PUBLICATION) ACT, 1960
(XXXVII of 1960)

Repeal as a whole.
skskoskoskosk ok

31. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR METROPOLITAN REGION DEVELOPMENT
AUTHORITIES ACT, 2018.

Repeal as a whole.
skskeosk skokosk sk

32. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR MINISTERS AND MINISTERS OF STATE SALARIES ACT,
1956
(VI of 1956)

Repeal as a whole.
skokoskoskok skok

33. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR MINISTERS AND PRESIDING OFFICERS MEDICAL
FACILITIES ACT, 1975



[T [1—=7F 3(ii)]

HILT T TSI AHTYTL

165

Repeal as a whole.

(XXII of 1975)

skskoskoskoskokosk

34. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR MONEY LENDERS AND ACCREDITED LOAN PROVIDERS

ACT, 2010
(XXIII of 2010)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for the words “Government”, substitute

“Administration”.

Preamble. —

Section 1. —

Section 2. —

Section 3. —

Section 8. —

Section 10.

Section 26.

Section 28.

Section 29.

Section 30.

For “State of Jammu and Kashmir”, occurring at both the places,
substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

(i) in sub-section (2), for “State of Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute
“Union territory of Ladakh”; and

(i1) in sub-section (3), for “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official
Gazette”.

(1) In clause (4), for “Jammu and Kashmir Co-operative Societies
Registration Act, 19897, substitute “Societies Registration Act, 1860 (21
of 1860)”;

(i1) for clause (5) substitute-

‘(5) “Administration” means Administration of Union territory of
Ladakh.’;

(ii1) in clause (8),-
(a) in sub-clause (i), omit “or the State Legislature”;

(b) in sub-clause (n), for “Jammu and Kashmir Societies
Registration Act, Samvat 1998, substitute “Societies Registration
Act, 1860 (21 of 1860)”; and

(iv) in clause (9), for “Jammu and Kashmir Legal Services Authority
Act, 19977, substitute “Legal Services Authorities Act, 1987 (39 of
1987)”.

For “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official Gazette”.

in sub-section (2), for “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989”, substitute
“Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974).

(i) in sub-section (5), for “Code of Civil Procedure, Samvat 1977,
substitute “Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 (5 of 1908)”.

(i) in sub-section (6), for “Code of Civil Procedure, Samvat 1977,
substitute “Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 (5 of 1908)”.

For “State Ranbir Penal Code”, substitute “Indian Penal Code (45 of
1860)”.

(1) In sub-section (1), for “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official
Gazette”; and

(i1) omit sub-section (3)
For “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official Gazette”.
Omit

skookoskoskok kock

35. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR MOTOR SPIRIT AND DIESEL OIL (TAXATION OF SALES)

ACT, 2005



166 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

(V of 2005)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for “Government” substitute “Administration of
Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 2. — In clause (hh), for “Appellate Tribunal constituted under section 21 A
of the Jammu and Kashmir General Sales Tax Act, 1962”, substitute
“Tribunal or authority designated by the Administration of Union
territory of Ladakh”.

Section 3. — (i) For “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official Gazette”; and

(i1) omit the second proviso.

Section 3A. — In sub-section (1), for “State” and “Government Gazette”, substitute
“Administration of Union territory of Ladakh” and “Official Gazette”
respectively.

Section 7. — In the proviso to sub-section (5), for “into the Government Treasury”,

substitute “to such authority as may be prescribed by the
Administration of Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 10. — In sub-section (1), for “Government Gazette”, substitute, “Official
Gazette”.

Section 11. — For “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989, substitute “Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974).

Section 12. — For “Code of Criminal Procedure, 19897, substitute “Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974).

Section 13.— For “section 61 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989”, substitute
“section 57 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 15.— For “Code of Criminal Procedure, 19897, substitute “Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974).

Section 20. — For “Minister-in-charge”, substitute “Advisor to the Licutenant
Governor”.

Section 22B. — Omit sub-section (3).

Section 22C. — For “Limitation Act, Samvat, 1995”, substitute “Limitation Act, 1963
(36 0of 1963)”.

Section 22D. — For “the same powers as are exercisable by it under the Jammu and

Kashmir General Sales Tax Act, 19627, substitute “all the powers of
a civil court for the purposes of —

(a) proof of facts by affidavit ;

(b) summoning and enforcing and attendance of any person and
examining him on oath or affirmation ;

(c) compelling the production of documents ; and
(d) issuing commissions for the examination of witnesses.”.
Section 22E. — Omit.

skskoskoskosk ok

36. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR MOTOR VEHICLES TAXATION ACT, 1957  (XXVI of
1957)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for “Government” substitute “Administration of
Union territory of Ladakh”.



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 167

Preamble. — For “Jammu and Kashmir State”, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 1. — (i) in sub-section (2), for “State of Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute
“Union territories of Ladakh”; and

(i) in sub-section (3), for “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official

Gazette”.

Section 2. — In clauses (i), (vi), (vii) and (viii), for “Jammu and Kashmir Motor
Vehicle Act, Samvat, 19987, substitute “Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 (59
of 1988).

Section 3. — (i) in sub-section (1), for “Government Gazette” and “State of Jammu

and Kashmir”, substitute “Official Gazette” and “Union territory of
Ladakh” ; and

(ii) in sub-section (2), omit the proviso.
Section 4. — (i) in sub-section (1), —

(a) in clause (c), omit “(not exceeding the maximum specified in the
Schedule I1)”;

(b) in clause (c), for “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official
Gazette”;

(c) in clause (d), for “State of Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute,
“Union territory of Ladakh”; and
(ii) in sub-section (3), —
(a) in sub-clause (i) of clause (a), for “State of Jammu and
Kashmir”, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”;

(b) in sub-clause (ii) of clause (a), for “Jammu and Kashmir Motor
Vehicle Act, Samvat, 1998, substitute “Motor Vehicles Act,
1988 (59 of 1988); and

(¢c) in clause (b), for “State of Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute
“Union territory of Ladakh

Section 9. — For “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official Gazette”.
Schedule - Omit Schedule I and Schedule 11 to the Act.
skskoskoskokosksk

37. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR MUNICIPAL CORPORATION ACT, 2000
(XXI of 2000)

Repeal as a whole.

skskoskoskosk ok

38. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR MUSLIM MARRIAGES REGISTRATION ACT, 1981
(XXII of 1981)

Section 1. — (1) in sub-section (2), for “State”, substitute”*Union territory of Ladakh”
; and

(i1) in sub-section (3), for “Government Gazette” and “State”, substitute
“Official Gazette” and “Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 2. — In clauses (b) and (c), for “Registration Act, Samvat 19777, substitute
“Registration Act, 1908 (16 of 1908)”.



168 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

Section 6. — For “Evidence Act, 19777, substitute “Indian Evidence Act, 1872 (1 of
1872)”.

skok skoskok ko

39. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR NATURAL CALAMITIES DESTROYED AREAS
IMPROVEMENT ACT, 2011
(XXXVIII of 2011)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for “Government”, “Government Gazette” and
“State”, substitute “Administration of Union territory of Ladakh”, “Official Gazette” and “Union
territory” respectively.

Section 1. — In sub-section (1), for “Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute “Union
territory”.
Section 2. — In clause (a), for “Jammu and Kashmir Municipal Act, 1988”, substitute

“Jammu and Kashmir Municipal Act, 2000”.

Section 4.

In clause (o), for “Jammu and Kashmir Municipal Act, 1998, the Town
Area Act, 1997 and the Jammu and Kashmir Village Panchayat Act,
20087, substitute “Jammu and Kashmir Municipal Act, 2000 and the
Jammu and Kashmir Panchayati Raj Act, 1989”.

Section 7. — For “Minister-in Charge Rehabilitation Department”, occurring in two
places and “Minister”, substitute “Administration of Union territory of
Ladakh”.

Section 9. — (1) In the marginal heading, for “sections 4 and 6 of the Land Acquisition
Act, 19907, substitute “sections 11 and 19 of Right to Fair
Compensation and Transparency in Land Acquisition, Rehabilitation and
Resettlement Act, 2013 (30 of 2013)”; and

(i) for “Land Acquisition Act, Svt. 1990” and “sections 4 and 6”,
substitute “Right to Fair Compensation and Transparency in Land
Acquisition, Rehabilitation and Resettlement Act, 2013 (30 of
2013)”and “sections 11 and 197, respectively.

Section 10. — (i) In the marginal heading, for “Sections 15, 23 and 24 of the Land
Acquisition Act, 19907, substitute “Sections 15, 23 and 24 of the Right
to Fair Compensation and Transparency in Land Acquisition,
Rehabilitation and Resettlement Act, 2013 (30 of 2013)”; and

(i) for “sections 15, 23 and 24 of the Land Acquisition Act, Svt. 19907,
substitute “sections 26, 27 and 28 of the Right to Fair Compensation and
Transparency in Land Acquisition, Rehabilitation and Resettlement Act,
2013 (30 0of 2013)”.

Section 12. — Omit.

skskoskoskosk ok

40. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR NON-BIODEGRADABLE MATERIAL (MANAGEMENT,
HANDLING AND DISPOSAL) ACT, SVT. 2007
(XII of 2007)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for ‘Government’, and ‘Government Gazette, substitute
‘Administration of Union territory of Ladakh’, and ‘Official Gazette’, respectively.



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 169

Throughout the Act, for ‘Jammu and Kashmir’ substitute ‘Union territory of Ladakh’ except in the preamble.

Throughout the Act, including Preamble unless otherwise provided, for ‘State’ substitute ‘Union territory of
Ladakh’.

Section 1. — In sub-section (2), for “whole of the State of Jammu and Kashmir”
substitute “whole of the Union territory of Ladakh”

Section 2. — (i) After clause (a), insert —
‘(ab)  “Administration” means Administration of Union territory of
Ladakh.’ ; and
(i1) omit clause (c).

Section 6. — In sub-section (4), for “Code of Criminal Procedure, Samvat 1989~
substitute “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)” and for “section
98” substitute section 94”.

Section 9. — In sub-section (1), for “clause (iv)”, substitute “(iv) damage the lakes,

rivers or wetland or other water channel, water-course or water source as
defined in the Jammu and Kashmir Water Resources (Regulation and
Management) Act, 2010”.

Section 10. — (1) In sub-section (1), for “Rs. 5000 substitute “Rs. 50,000”; and

(i) in sub-section (2), for “may extend up to Rs.10,000” substitute “not less
than Rs.10,000”.

Section 12. — For “sections 260 to 265 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, Samvat
1989”, substitute “sections 260, 262 to 265 of the Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 13. — In sub-section (3), for “remitted in the Government Treasury” substitute
“remitted in a manner as prescribed by the Administration”

skokskoskok skok

41. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR PARAMEDICAL COUNCIL ACT, 2014
(VII of 2014)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for ‘Government’, and ‘Government Gazette, substitute
‘ Administration of Union territory of Ladakh’, and ‘Official Gazette’, respectively.

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for “State Register” or “state register”, substitute “Medical
Register”.

Throughout the Act, for ‘Jammu and Kashmir” substitute ‘Union territory of Ladakh’, unless otherwise
provided, except in the preamble and section 55.

Throughout the Act, for “State” substitute ‘Union territory of Ladakh’, unless otherwise provided, except
in the preamble.

Section 2.— (i) After clause (a), insert —

‘(aa) “Administration” means the Administration of Union territory of
Ladakh’ ;

(i1) omit clause (c);



170

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

Section 4. —

Section 5. —

Section 31.—

Section 32. —

Section 38. —

Section 42. —

(ii1) in clause (d), —

(a) in sub-clause (ii), for “clause (d) of section 2 of the Jammu and
Kashmir Homeopathic Practitioners Act, 2003 (Act No. VIII of 2003)”
substitute “clause (d) of section 2 of the Homeopathic Central Council
Act, 1973 (59 of 1973)” ;

(b) in sub-clause (iii), for “clauses (2) and (3) respectively of section 2 of
the Jammu and Kashmir Ayurvedic and Unani Practitioners Act,1959
(Act No. XX VI of 1959)” substitute “provisions of the Indian Medicine
Central Council Act, 1970 (48 of 1970)” ; and

(iv) omit clause (q).

For sub-section (1), substitute —

“(1) The Council shall consist of members appointed by the
Administration”.

Omit clause (a).

In sub-section (3), for “Code of Criminal Procedure, Samvat 1989”
substitute “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

In sub-section (4), for “State Ranbir Penal Code” substitute “Indian
Penal Code (45 of 1860)”.

In sub-section (3), for “Evidence Act, Samvat 1977 substitute “Indian
Evidence Act, 1872 (1 of 1872)”.

For “Evidence Act, Samvat 19777, “the Public Services (Inquiries) Act,
Svt. 1977 occurring at both the places and “Code of Civil Procedure,
Samvat 1977 substitute respectively “Indian Evidence Act, 1872 (1 of
1872)”, “the Public Servants (Inquiries) Act, 1850 (37 of 1850)” and “

Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 (5 of 1908)”.

skokskoskok skok

42. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR PASSENGERS TAXATION ACT, 1963

(XII of 1963)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for “Government” substitute “Administration of

Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 1. —

Section 2. —

Section 3. —

Section 9. —

Section 12. —

Section 16. —

in sub-section (2), for “State of Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute
“Union territory of Ladakh”.

In clause (hhh), for “Appellate Tribunal constituted under section
21A of the Jammu and Kashmir General Sales Tax Act, 19627,
substitute “Tribunal or authority designated by the Administration
of Union territory of Ladakh”.

in sub-section (1), omit “subject to a maximum of two Naya Paise
in any one case, the amount of tax being calculated to the nearest
Naya Paisa”.

in sub-section (1), for “of Twenty-five rupees”, substitute “as may
be prescribed by the Administration of Union territory of Ladakh”.

in sub-section (5), for “Code of Civil Procedure, Samvat 19777,
substitute “Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 (5 of 1908)”

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “Deputy Sales Tax
Commissioner (Adm.)”, occurring at both the places, substitute



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 171

“Deputy Commissioner”; and

(i1) omit sub-section (2).

Section 16B. — For “Limitation Act Samvat 1995”, substitute “Limitation Act,
1963 (36 of 1963)”.
Section 16C. — For “the same powers as are exercisable by it under the Jammu and

Kashmir General Sales Tax Act, 1962, substitute “all the powers
of a civil court for the purposes of —

(a) proof of facts by affidavit ;

(b) summoning and enforcing and attendance of any person and
examining him on oath or affirmation ;

(c) compelling the production of documents ; and

(d) issuing commissions for the examination of witnesses.”.

Section 16D. — Omit.

Section 17.— Omit sub-section (3).

Section 19A. — In the third proviso, for “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official
Gazette”.

43. THE PLYBOARD INDUSTRIES (ACQUISITION OF SHARES AND OF THE INDUSTRIAL
UNDERTAKINGS) ACT, 1987
(VI of 1987)
Repeal as a whole.

skokskoskok skok

44. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR PRESERVATION OF SPECIFIED TREES ACT, 1969
(V of 1969)
Repeal as a whole.

shskeoskoskoskoksk

45. PREVENTION OF RIBBON DEVELOPMENT ACT, 2007
(XXVI of 2007)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for the words “Government”, “State” and “Jammu and
Kashmir State” other than in the words “Central Government”, substitute “Administration of Union
territory of Ladakh”, and “Union territory of Ladakh” respectively.

Section 3. — For “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official Gazette”.
Section 6. — For “Minister-in-charge Public Works Department”, substitute “Ladakh
Administration”.
skskeosk skokosk sk

46. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR PROHIBITION ON MANUFACTURE OF SPECIFIED
COPPER UTENSILS (BY MACHINE) ACT, 2006
(XIII of 2006)

Repeal as a whole.

skok skoskok skok



172 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

47. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR STATE PROHIBITION OF SMOKING (CINEMA AND
THEATRE HALLS) ACT, SVT. 2009
(XVIII of 2009)

Repeal as a whole.

shoskoskokoskokosk

48. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR PROHIBITION OF SMOKING AND NON-SMOKERS
HEALTH PROTECTION IN PUBLIC SERVICE VEHICLES ACT, 1997 (XX of 1997)

Repeal as a whole.
skoskeosk skokosk sk
49. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR PROPERTY RIGHTS TO SLUM DWELLERS ACT,
(XTI of 2012)

Repeal as a whole.

skokskskskskk
50. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR PROPERTY TAX BOARD ACT, 2013
(XI of 2013)

Repeal as a whole.

skokskoskok skok

51. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR PUBLIC PREMISES (EVICTION OF UN-AUTHORISED
OCCUPANTS) ACT, 1988
(XVII of 1988)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for ‘Government’, and ‘Government Gazette, substitute
‘Administration of Union territory of Ladakh’, and ‘Official Gazette’, respectively.

Throughout the Act, for ‘Jammu and Kashmir’ substitute ‘Union territory of Ladakh’ except in the preamble
and section 34.

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for ‘State’ substitute ‘Union territory of Ladakh’ except in the
preamble.

Section 1. — In sub-section (2), for “State of Jammu and Kashmir” substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh”.
Section 2. — In clause (d), —

(i) in sub-clause 2(i), for ‘Companies Act, 1956’ substitute ‘Companies Act,
2013’ ;

(i1) in sub-clause 2(i), for ‘Companies Act, 1956’ substitute ‘Companies Act,
2013’ and for “a State or Central” substitute ‘any’; and

(ii1) in sub-clause 2(ii), omit ‘State’.

Section 11. — For “Code of Civil Procedure Samvat 1977, substitute “Code of Civil
Procedure, 1908 (5 of 1908)”.

Section 14. — In sub-section (1), for ‘five thousand rupees’ substitute ‘fifty thousand rupees’.



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 173

Section 15. — For ‘Code of Criminal Procedure Samvat 1989°, substitute ‘Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973 (20 of 1974)’.
Section 23. — Omit sub-section (3).
skskskskskskek

52. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR PUBLIC SAFETY ACT, 1978
(VI of 1978)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for ‘Government’, and ‘Government Gazette, substitute
‘Administration of Union territory of Ladakh’ and ‘Official Gazette’, respectively.

Throughout the Act including Preamble, unless otherwise provided, for ‘State’, substitute ‘Union territory
of Ladakh’.

Preamble. — For “State”, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 1. — (i) In sub-section (1), for “Jammu and Kashmir” substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh” ; and

(i1) in sub-section (2), for “Jammu and Kashmir State”, substitute
“Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 2. — In sub-section (1), for “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989 substitute
“Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 8.

In sub-section (3),—

(a) in clause (b), in sub-clause (iii), for “Ranbir Penal Code” substitute
“Indian Penal Code (45 of 1860)” ; and

(b) in clause (c), for “Forest Act, Samvat 1987 substitute “the Indian
Forest Act, 1927 (16 of 1927)”.

Section 10. — Omit the proviso.

Section 12. — In clause (a), for “sections 87, 88 and 89” substitute “sections 82, 83, 84
and 85”

Section 14. — (1) In sub-section (1), insert —

“Provided that the Administration of Union territory of Ladakh may, if it
deems fit, by order, designate any such authority in the adjoining State
or Union territory as the Advisory Board for the purposes under this
Act.”;

(i1) in sub-section (3), —
(a) omit “in consultation with the Chief Justice of the High Court” ; and

(b) insert — “Provided that no sitting Judge of the High Court or sitting
District and Sessions Judge shall be appointed as Chairman or member
of the Board except in consultation with the Chief justice of the High
Court.”.

Section 19. — For “General Clauses Act, Samvat 1977 substitute “General Clauses
Act, 1897 (10 of 1897)”.

skosk skoskosk ko

53. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR REGISTRATION OF CONTRACTORS ACT, 1956
(XVI of 1956)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for ‘Government’, and ‘Government Gazette, substitute
‘ Administration of Union territory of Ladakh’, and ‘Official Gazette’, respectively.

Throughout the Act, for ‘Jammu and Kashmir’ and ‘State’ substitute ‘Union territory of Ladakh’ except in the
preamble.



174 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

Section 5. — (i) in sub-section (2), for “Minister-in-Charge of the Department” substitute
“Administration of Union territory of Ladakh” ; and

(i1) omit sub-section (3).

Section 7. — For “Rs. 30” substitute “Rs. 100”.
Section 8. — For “Stamp Act, 1977” substitute “Indian Stamp Act, 1899 (2 of 1899)”.
skoskoskoskok skosk

54. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR, REGISTRATION OF TOURIST TRADE ACT, 1978
(IX of 1978)

Throughout the Act, for “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official Gazette”.

Throughout the Act, other than in section 24, for “Government”, substitute “Administration of Union

territory of Ladakh”.
Throughout the Act, for “Ranbir Penal Code, Samvat 1989, substitute “Indian Penal Code (45 of
1860)”.
Section 1. — In sub-section (2), for “State of Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh”.
Section 2. — (i) in clause (g), in Explanation 1, for “Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute
‘Union territory of Ladakh”.
(i) in clause (o), for “State” occurring at both the places, substitute
“Union territory of Ladakh”.
Section 27. — For “Minister-in-Charge”, occurring at both the places, substitute
“Administration of Union territory of Ladakh”.
Section 28. — In sub-section (2), for “Code of Criminal Procedure Svt 19897,

substitute “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 34. — For “Code of Criminal Procedure Samvat 1989, substitute “Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 35. — For “Evidence Act Samvat 1977”, substitute “Indian Evidence Act, 1872
(1 of 1872)”
Section 37. — For “Code of Civil Procedure Samvat 19777, substitute “Code of Civil

Procedure, 1908 (5 of 1908)”.

sfeseseoskeoskoskok

55. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR (RESIDENTIAL AND COMMERCIAL TENANCY) ACT, 2012
(V of 2012)
(1) In sub-section (2), —
Section 1. — (a) for “State”, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”;

(b) in the proviso for “Government” and “Government Gazette”,
substitute “Administration of Union territory of Ladakh” and
“Official Gazette”, respectively; and
(i) in sub-section (3), for “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official
Gazette”.

Section 2. — (1) In clause (b), for “Special Tribunal established under the Jammu and
Kashmir Special Tribunal Act, 1988, substitute “tribunal or authority
notified by the Ladakh Administration” ;

(i1) for clause (e), substitute-

‘(e) “Administration” means Administration of Union territory of
Ladakh.’;



[T [1—=7F 3(ii)]

HILT T TSI AHTYTL

175

Section 3. —

Section 14.
Section 29.

Section 30.

Section 31.

Section 32.

Section 37.

Section 40.

Section 41.

(ii1) in clause (h), omit “a Municipal Corporation or”;

(iv) in clauses (i) and (k), for “Government”’, substitute
“Administration”;

(v) in clause (1), for “Government Hospital”, substitute “Hospital owned
or run by Administration” ; and

(vi) in clause (u), omit “Municipal Corporation,” .

(1) In clause (a), for “State Government” and “government”, substitute
“Union territory of Ladakh” and “Administration”;

(ii) in clause (e), for “Government”, substitute “Administration”; and

(iii) in clause (f), for “Jammu and Kashmir Wakfs Act, 2001” and “Trust
Act, Samvat 1977, substitute “Wakf Act, 1995” and “Indian Trust Act,
18827, respectively.

In sub-section (4), for “Government”, substitute “Administration”.

(i) For “Government” and “Government Gazette”, substitute
“Administration” and “Official Gazette” ; and

(ii) in the proviso, omit clause (i).

(i) For “Transfer of Property Act, Samvat 19777, substitute “Transfer of
Property Act, 1882”;

(ii) in the proviso,—

(a) for “Transfer of Property Act, Samvat 1977 occurring at both
the places, substitute “Transfer of Property Act, 1882”; and

(b) for “Contract Act, Samvat 19777, substitute “Indian Contract
Act, 1872”.

In sub-section (1), for “Code of Civil Procedure, Samvat 1977”,
substitute “Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 (5 of 1908)”.

(i) in sub-section (1), for “Code of Civil Procedure, Samvat 1977,
substitute “Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 (5 of 1908)” ; and

(il) in sub-section (2), for “Ranbir Penal Code” and “Code of Criminal
Procedure, Samvat 1989”, substitute Indian Penal Code (45 of 1860)”
and “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)” respectively.

(ii1) in sub-section (6), for “Code of Criminal Procedure, Samvat 1989,
substitute “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

(i) In the marginal heading, omit “consolidated fund of the State”; and

(i1) for “consolidated fund of the State”, substitute “such authority as
may be prescribed by the Administration”.

For “Government”, occurring at both the places, substitute
“Administration”.

For “Government”, substitute “Administration”.

skosk skoskosk ko

56. SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES OF THE MEMBERS OF JAMMU AND KASHMIR STATE

Repeal as a whole.

LEGISLATURE ACT, 1960
(XIX of 1960)

skok skoskok skok



176 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

57. SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES OF LEADER OF OPPOSITION IN THE STATE
LEGISLATURE ACT, 1985
(XVI of 1985)

Repeal as a whole.

skok ks ok skok

58. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR SELF-RELIANT COOPERATIVES ACT, 1999 (X of 1999)

Throughout the Act, for “Government Gazette” and “Government” substitute “Official Gazette” and
“Administration of Union territory of Ladakh”, respectively.

Throughout the Act, for “Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 1. — In sub-section (2), for “State Of Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh”.

Section 2. — (1) in clause (23), for “a permanent resident of the State as defined in
section 6 of the Constitution of the Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute
“any person”;

(i) in clause (27), for “permanent resident of the State”, substitute “any
person”’; and

(ii1) in clause 30, omit “whose members are permanent residents of the

State.”.

Section 3. — In sub-section (1), omit “comprise of permanent residents of the State
and”.

Section 16. — (i) In clause (a), —

(a)in sub-clause (i), for “Jammu and Kashmir Contract Act, Samvat
19777, substitute “Indian Contract Act, 1872 (9 of 1872); and

(b)omit sub-clause (ii);

(i1) in clause (c), for “Jammu and Kashmir Society Registration Act,
Samvat 1998, substitute “Societies Registration Act, 1860 (21 of
1860)”.

Section 59. — For “Jammu and Kashmir Registration Act, Samvat 19777, substitute
“Registration Act, 1908 (16 of 1908)”.

skskoskoskosk ok

59. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR SINGLE WINDOW (INDUSTRIAL INVESTMENT AND
BUSINESS FACILITATION) ACT, 2018.

(X of 2018)

Throughout the Act, except in sub-sections (14) and (17) of section 2 or as otherwise provided, for
“Government”, substitute “Administration of Union territory of Ladakh”.



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 177

Throughout the Act, except as otherwise provided, for “Government Gazette” and “Jammu and Kashmir” and
“State”, respectively, substitute “Official Gazette”, “Union territory of Ladakh”, “Union territory”.

Preamble.— For “State of Jammu and Kashmir” substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.
Section 2. — (1) After clause (1), insert —

‘(ab) “Administration” means the Administration of Union territory of
Ladakh ;”

(i1) omit clause (16);

(iii) omit clause (23); and

(iv) after clause (25), insert —

“(25a) “Union territory” means the Union territory of Ladakh”.
Section 3. — (1) For sub-section (1) substitute —

“(1) The Administration may constitute a District Level Single Window
Clearance Committee for each district by notification in the Official Gazette.”;

Section 4. — For sub-section (1) substitute —

“(1) The Administration may constitute a Divisional Level Single Window
Clearance Committee by notification in the Official Gazette.”.

Section 5.— In sub-section (1), for “Chief Secretary”, “Chairman, Pollution Control Board”
and “Director, Industries and Commerce, concerned  Member” substitute
“Advisor” and “Chairman, Pollution Control Committee” and “Director,
Industries and Commerce, Member-Secretary”, respectively, and omit “9.
Managing Director, J&K, SIDCO Member-Secretary”.

Section 6. — For “Kashmir/Jammu” substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 8. — In sub-section (2), for “State Acts” substitute “State Acts, as adapted for
application in Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 9. — For “State Government” substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 26. — (1) Omit sub-sections (3) ; and
(i1) in sub-section (4), for “so made by the State Legislature” substitute “in the
rules”.

Section 27. — Omit sub-section (2).

skosk skoskosk skok

60. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR STATE ROAD SAFETY COUNCIL ACT, 2018
(V of 2018)

Throughout the Act, for “Government Gazette” and “State Road Safety Council”, substitute “Official
Gazette” and “Union territory of Ladakh Road Safety Council”.

Throughout the Act, other than in clause (iii) of sub-section (2) of section 4, for “Government”,
substitute “Administration”.

Throughout the Act, for “State”, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

Throughout the Act, other than in section 37, for “Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute “Union territory of
Ladakh”.



178 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

Section 2. — In sub-section (2), —
(a) for clause (i) substitute-

‘(1) “Administration” shall mean Administration of the Union
territory of Ladakh.” ; and

(b) in clause (k), omit “and the Jammu and Kashmir Municipal
Corporation Act, 2000 as the case may be”.

Section 3. — In sub-section (1), for “Chairman, who shall be Incharge Minister of
Transport Department, Chief Secretary of the State as Vice-Chairman
and such other members”, substitute “such members”.

Section 4. — In clause (ii) of sub-section (3), for “State Government”, substitute
“Administration”.

Section 10. — In sub-section (1), for “Jammu and Kashmir Road Safety Fund”,
substitute “Union territory of Ladakh Road Safety Fund”.

Section 22. — Omit sub-section (2).

Section 23. — (1) In sub-section (3), omit “and the Government shall lay the same

before the State Legislature”;

Section 29. — (i) for “Ranbir Penal Code, Samvat 19897, substitute “Indian Penal
Code (45 of 1860)”.
Section 34. — Omit sub-section (3).

skskoskoskosk

61. THE SAPPHIRE ACT, SVT. 1989
(XVI of 1989)

Repeal as a whole.

shskeoskoskoskoksk

62. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR STATE SHEEP AND SHEEP PRODUCTS DEVELOPMENT
BOARD ACT, 1979

(IX of 1979)

Repeal as a whole.

skskoskoskosk ok

63. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR SPECIAL TRIBUNAL ACT, 1988
(XIX of 1988)

Repeal as a whole.

skosk skoskok ko

64. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR STATE TOWN PLANNING ACT, 1963
(XX of 1963)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for “Government”, “Government Gazette”, “State”,
and “Minister”, substitute “Administration”, “Official Gazette”, “Union territory” and “Advisor to the
Lieutenant Governor”, respectively.



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 179

Section 2. — For clause (b), substitute —
‘(b) “Administration” means Administration of the Union territory of
Ladakh.’;

Section 3. — In clause (o), for “Jammu and Kashmir Municipal Act, Svt. 2008’ or the

Jammu and Kashmir Town Area Act, Svt. 20117, substitute “Jammu and
Kashmir Municipal Act, 2000”.

Section 18. — In sub-section (6), for “Jammu and Kashmir Arbitration Act, Svt. 2002”,
substitute “Arbitration and Conciliation Act, 1996 (26 of 1996)”.
Section 26 . — For “State Land Acquisition Act, Svt. 19907, substitute “Right to Fair

Compensation and Transparency in Land Acquisition, Rehabilitation and
Resettlement Act, 2013 (30 of 2013)”.

Section 27. — (i) In the marginal heading, for “sections 4 and 6 of Land Acquisition
Act, 19907, substitute “sections 11 and 19 of the Right to Fair
Compensation and Transparency in Land Acquisition, Rehabilitation and
Resettlement Act, 2013 (30 0f 2013)”;

(ii) for “ sections 4 and 6 of State Land Acquisition Act, Svt. 19907,
occurring at both the places, substitute “sections 11 and 19 of Right to
Fair Compensation and Transparency in Land Acquisition,
Rehabilitation and Resettlement Act, 2013 (30 of 2013)”.

Section 28. — (1) In the marginal heading, for “sections 15, 23 and 24 of the Land
Acquisition Act, 19907, substitute “sections 26, 27 and 28 of the Right
to Fair Compensation and Transparency in Land Acquisition,
Rehabilitation and Resettlement Act, 2013 (30 of 2013)”; and

(i) in sub-section (1), for “sections 15, 23 and 24 of the State Land
Acquisition Act, Svt. 1990 substitute “sections 26, 27 and 28 of the
Right to Fair Compensation and Transparency in Land Acquisition,
Rehabilitation and Resettlement Act, 2013 (30 of 2013)”.

65. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR TREASURE TROVE ACT, SVT. 1954
(Council Resolution No. 37 of 1897)

Repeal as a whole.

shskeoskoskoskokosk

66. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR URBAN PROPERTY (CEILING) ACT, 1971 (XII of 1971)

Repeal as a whole.

skskoskoskosk ok

67. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR WILLOW (PROHIBITION ON EXPORT AND MOVEMENT)
ACT, 2000
(XVI of 2000)

Repeal as a whole.

skskoskoskosk ok



180 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

68. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR SCHOOL EDUCATION ACT, 2002
(XXI of 2002)

Throughout the Act, except as otherwise provided, for “Government” and “Government Gazette”, substitute
“Administration” and “Official Gazette”, respectively.

Throughout the Act, except in preamble or as otherwise provided, for “Jammu and Kashmir” and “State”
substitute “Union territory of Ladakh” and “Union territory”, respectively.

Section 1. — In sub-section (2), for “whole of the State of Jammu and Kashmir” substitute
“whole of the Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 2. — (i) After clause (a), insert, —

‘(aa) “Administration” means the Administration of the Union territory of
Ladakh”;

(i1) omit clause (c);

(iii) in clause (e), for “District Education Officer” substitute “Chief Education
Officer”;

(iv) omit clause (h); and
(v) for clause (0), substitute —

‘(o) “Union territory” means the Union territory of Ladakh’.

Sections 6,7,8,9 and 10. — Omit.

Insertion of new section — After section 20, insert. —

Constitution of Fee “20A. (1) The Administration shall constitute a Committee to be known as
Fixation and the Committee for Fixation and Regulation of Fee of Private Schools for
Regulation the purposes of regulating and determining the fee in private schools in the
Committee of Private Union territory.

School.

(2) The Committee shall be headed by a Chairperson who has been a
Judge of a High Court or an officer of the Administration not below the
rank of a Secretary of the Union territory or above.

(3) The members of the Committee shall be such as may be prescribed by
the Administration of the Union territory.

(4) The Chairperson may co-opt any other independent person of repute or
a representative of a recognised School Association as an expert
member, but the total number of members of the Committee shall not
exceed five.

Term of office and 20B. The term of office and other conditions of service of the

other conditions of Chairperson of the Committee for Fixation and Regulation of Fee of

service Chairperson. Private Schools shall be such as may be prescribed by the
Administration.

Powers and functions 20C. (1) Subject to the provisions of this Act or any other law for the time



[T [1—=7F 3(ii)]

HILT T TSI AHTYTL

181

of the Committee.

Determination of fee.

Fee to be charged by
private Schools.

Power to call for
records.

Staff of Committee.

being in force, the Committee for Fixation and Regulation of Fee of
Private Schools shall exercise such powers and perform such
functions as may be prescribed by the Administration to ensure that
the private schools are not indulging commercialisation of education
and undue profiteering.

(2) The Administration may by notification, delegate any of the
powers vested in the Committee for Fixation and Regulation of
Fee of Private Schools to the Chairperson of the said Committee,
to the extent as may be prescribed.

(3) Orders passed by the Committee for Fixation and Regulation of
Fee of Private Schools shall be deemed to have been duly passed
by a public servant and its violation or non-compliance shall
amount to disobedience under the provisions of section 188 of
Indian Penal Code (45 of 1860).

20D. (1) The Committee for Fixation and Regulation of Fee of Private

Schools shall while determining the fee to be charged by the
private schools established after August, 2014 take into account
inter alia the location, available infrastructure, expenditure on
administration, aid, assistances and support in any form received
by the private school from the Administration or any other person
or agency or any other factors as may be prescribed.

(2) The Committee for Fixation and Regulation of Fee of Private
Schools may from time to time issue notification for fixing
maximum ceiling of the fee to be charged under wvarious
categories.

20E. (1) The private schools shall not charge any fee from the students
or guardians, except tuition fee, annual fee, transport fee and voluntary
special purpose fee such as the picnic, tour and excursions, etc.
completely voluntary in nature or any other fee as may be approved by
the Committee for Fixation and Regulation of Fee of Private Schools
after following the procedure prescribed:

Provided that private schools shall not charge in any manner, any other
fee including admission fee or any amount, by whatever name called
than the fee mentioned above.

20F. The Committee for Fixation and Regulation of Fee of Private
Schools may at any stage call the record of any school for scrutiny if it
comes to the conclusion that the private school has violated or is not
adhering to its directions.

20G.(1) The Committee for Fixation and Regulation of Fee of Private

Schools shall, for the purpose of assisting it in the discharge of its
functions, be provided by the Administration, such officers and
employees as may be determined from time to time by the
Administration in consultation with the Chairperson of the
Committee.

(2) All establishment charges of the Committee for Fixation and
Regulation of Fee of Private Schools shall be borne by the



182

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

Sub-committees.

Power to make
regulations.

Powers of Civil
Court.

Administration.

(3) The terms and conditions of service of the officers and employees
referred to in sub-section (1) shall be such as may be determined
by the Administration from time to time.

(4) In the discharge of their functions under this Act, the officers and
employees referred to in sub-section (1) shall be subject to the
exclusive administrative control and direction of the Committee.

20H. The Administration may constitute such other sub-committees at
Union territory level or Districts level with such powers and functions
as it may deem fit to effectively regulate the fee in private schools.

20-I. The Committee for Fixation and Regulation of Fee of Private
Schools may, by notification, makes such regulations as it may deem
necessary for carrying out the purpose of the said Committee.

20J. The Committee for Fixation and Regulation of Fee of private
Schools shall for the purposes of making any inquiry or initiating any
proceedings under this Act, have the same powers as are vested in a
Civil Court, under the Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 (5 of 1908)”.

Section 22. — Omit.

For section 25, substitute —

Bar of “25. (1) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in the Code of Civil

jurisdiction.

@

For section 27, substitute —

Penalties.

Procedure, 1908 (5 of 1908) or any other law for the time being in force, no
court shall grant any injunction or make any interim order restraining any
proceedings which is being or is about to be taken under this Act.

)No suit, prosecution or other legal proceedings shall lie against the
Chairperson or any member of the Committee for Fixation and
Regulation of Fee of Private Schools or any officer or other employee or
any person acting under the direction either of the Administration or of
the said Committee, in respect of anything which is in good faith done or
intended to be done in pursuance of the provisions of this Act or the rules
or orders made there under.".

“27.(1) Whosoever contravenes any of the provisions of this Act or rules
made there under except the violation of directions issued by the
Committee for Fixation and Regulation of Fee of Private Schools shall be
liable to a fine of not less than fifteen thousand rupees for first offence and
fifty thousand rupees for every subsequent offence by the Director School



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 183

Education.

2) Any person or private school which contravenes the directions of
the Committee for Fixation and Regulation of Fee of Private Schools shall
be liable to a fine of not less than fifty thousand rupees for first offence and
one lakh rupees for every subsequent offence including recommendation
for disaffiliation of such private school by the said Committee.".

For section 28, substitute —

Revision and appeal.

“28.(1) Any person aggrieved of any order passed by the authority
under sub-section (1) of section 27 may file a revision petition before
the Director School Education within a period of thirty days from the
date of the order in such form and manner as may be prescribed.

2) Any person or private school aggrieved by any order made by
the Committee for Fixation and Regulation of Fee of Private Schools in
exercise of its powers conferred under sub-section (2) of section 27 may
prefer an appeal against such order to the High Court of Jammu and
Kashmir within a period of thirty days from the date of the order.".

Section 29.— In sub-section (2), omit clause (g).

skokskoskok skok

69. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR BOARD OF SCHOOL EDUCATION ACT, 1975
(XXVIII of 1975)

Throughout the Act, except as otherwise provided, for “Government” and “Government Gazette”, substitute
“Administration of Union territory of Ladakh” and “Official Gazette”, respectively.

Throughout the Act, except in preamble and in section 44 of the Act or as otherwise provided, for “Jammu and
Kashmir” and “State” substitute “Union territory of Ladakh” and “Union territory”, respectively.

Preamble.— For “State” and “in the State of Jammu and Kashmir” substitute “Union
territory” and “in the Union territory of Ladakh”, respectively.

Section 1. — In sub-section (2), for “whole of the State of Jammu and Kashmir”
substitute “whole of the Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 2. — (i) For clause (a), substitute—

‘(a)"Affiliated" with its grammatical variations and cognate expressions
used with reference to an institution means affiliated or deemed to be
affiliated to the Board for the purposes of admission to the privileges of the
Board;.;

(aa) "Board" means the Board of School Education established under
section 3;’;



184 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

(ii) for clause (¢), substitute—

‘(c) "Elementary Education" means education at the elementary stage in a
school corresponding to Grades I to VIII as per courses of study prescribed
by a competent academic authority;’;

(ii1) after clause (d), insert—

‘(da) "Head of the institution" means Headmaster or Principal or any other
Principal or Academic Officer, by whatever designation called, of an
affiliated institution;’;

(iv) for clause (h), substitute—

‘(h) "Recognised” with its grammatical variations and cognate expressions,
used with reference to institutions means recognised schools or institutions
by the Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh for imparting
education to the students at Pre-primary, Elementary, Secondary, Higher
Secondary or Teachers Training level;’; and

(v) for clause (m), substitute—

‘(m) “Training Institution" means a training institution run privately or by
the Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh and recognised by the
Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh and affiliated to such Board
as may be prescribed by the said Administration’.

Section 3. — (i) In sub-section (1), for "Elementary Education” substitute “Pre-primary
Education, Elementary Education” ;

(i1) in sub-section (1), insert,—

“Provided that the Administration may entrust job of the Board or affiliate
to such Board of any other State or any other Union territory or Central
Board of Secondary Education or any other body as may be notified for this
purpose.”; and

(iii) in sub-section (2), for “Jammu and Kashmir State Board” substitute
“Union territory of Ladakh Board”.

Section 4. — For section 4, substitute,—

Composition of Board “4. The Board shall consist of such members as may be appointed by the
Administration.”.

Section 9. — (1) In the marginal heading, omit “and its two Divisions”;

(i) for “at Srinagar and Jammu for such periods as the Chairman from time
to time determine” substitute “as prescribed by the Administration of the
Union territory of Ladakh”; and

(ii1) omit the provisio.

Section 10. — (1) In clause (i), for "Elementary", substitute “Pre-primary and Elementary”;
and

(ii) after “examinations” insert “and Elementary Teachers Training Course"

b



[T [1—=7F 3(ii)]

HILT T TSI AHTYTL

185

Section 11. —

Section 13. —

Section 16 and 17.

(ii1) in clause (ii), after "courses”, insert “and Teacher Training Education
Courses™;

(iv) in clause (iii), after "Board", insert "through electronic and print
media";

(v) in clause (v), after "Higher Secondary Courses", insert “and Teachers
Training Courses, etc.”;

(vi) in clause (xiii), for “University of Jammu, University of Kashmir”
substitute “University of Ladakh”;

(vii) for clause (xv), substitute—

“(xv) to call for reports from the concerned Director of School Education
about the working and facilities available in a school applying for affiliation
with the Board";

(viii) in clause (xvi), insert "Pre-primary" after "relating to" and insert
“Teacher Training Courses” after “education”;

(ix) for clause (xviii), substitute—

"(xviii) to frame regulations for implementing various provisions of the
Act.”;

(x) for clause (xxvii), substitute—

“(xxvii) (a) to constitute or appoint different Boards of Studies for different
subjects of studies at different stages including elementary teacher
education;

(b) to undertake printing and publication of textbooks prepared or
developed and approved by the concerned Courses Committee”; and

(xi) for clause (xxviii), substitute—

“(xxviii) to liaise with different sister organisations at the national level
including the Council of Boards of Secondary Education (COBSE), the
National Council of Educational Research and Trainings (NCERT) and the
National Council for Teacher Education (NCTE) for furthering the
objectives of this Act.".

Omit sub-section (3).
For sub-section (4), substitute—

“(4) If in the opinion of the Chairman any emergency has arisen which
requires that immediate action should be taken, he shall take such action as
he deems appropriate and shall thereafter, report the action taken to the
Board at its next meeting or a meeting convened for the purpose:

Provided that the Chairman shall as soon thereafter as may be, report his
action together with reasons thereof to the office, authority or other body of
the Board or the Board, as the case may be, who or which would ordinarily
have dealt with the matter:

Provided further that no appointment of any nature, whatsoever, shall be
made under these powers:

Provided also that no promotions of any nature, whatsoever, shall be made
under these powers.”.

Omit.



186

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

Insertion of new section — After section 17, insert —

Director
Academics.

“17A.The Director Academics shall be appointed by the Administration of
the Union territory of Ladakh from amongst senior and competent academicians
or educationists having a deep understanding on various issues including that of

curriculum making, teaching-learning methodology, contemporary advances in
cognitive learning and all such related matters.

Powers and
functions of
Director

Academics.

Insertion of new
section — After Section
22, insert-

Financial Advisor

Section 33.-

Section 34. —

For section 35,

substitute—

Copies of regulations
and alterations

17B. Subject to the control and regulations of the Board, the Director
Academic, shall head such Divisions of the Board as may be provided in the
regulations for realisation of various educational objectives of the Board
including that of-

(a) preparation of curricula for different stages of education;
(b) preparation of curricula for various Teacher Education Courses;
(c) preparation of curricula for Vocational Courses and Physical Education;

(d) development of material or books for various stages of education,
promotion and development of quality education in the Union territory;

(e) review, revision or preparation of scheme or schemes of examinations;
(f) conduct of orientation courses in new methods of evaluation;

(g) conduct refresher courses of teachers in new schemes or teaching new
curricula.”.

“22A.(1) The Administrative Secretary, Finance Department, or any officer
nominated by the Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh shall be
the ex officio Financial Advisor to the Board.

(2) The Financial Advisor shall be an ex officio member of the Board and
its Finance Committee.

(3) The Financial Advisor shall exercise such powers and performs such
duties as may be prescribed by the Statutes and regulations made under this
Act.”.

In sub-section (2), in clause (d), for “recognition” occurring at both the
places substitute “affiliation”.

Omit.

“35. A copy of every regulation made by the Board under section 33 and of

[PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]



[T [1—=7F 3(ii)]

HILT T TSI AHTYTL

187

thereof.

Section 36.

For Section 37
substitute—

Admission of
institutions to

privileges of Board.

Section 38.-

For section
substitute—

40,

Meetings of Board.

every modification or revision thereof shall be submitted to the
Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh for information.".

For "High School and Higher Secondary School Education" substitute—

"High School, Higher Secondary School and Elementary Teacher Training
Education".

“37. (1) Any Institution, in or outside the Union territory, may apply to the
Board for being admitted to the privileges of the Board and the Board may,
subject to such conditions and restrictions as may be prescribed, admit such
institution to the privileges of the Board.

(2) Where the Board is satisfied that its privileges are being abused by any
affiliated institution or that the prescribed conditions or restrictions are not
being compiled with by such institution, the Board may withdraw its
privileges from the institution, and thereon the institution shall cease to be
an affiliated institution:

Provided that before withdrawing the privileges, the Board shall require the
institution to showcase why such action should not be taken and consider
any explanation which may be furnished by it.”.

Omit.

“40.(1) The Board shall hold its meetings at least four times in a year but
three months shall not intervene between its last meeting and the next
following meeting.

(2) The Chairman shall preside every meeting of the Board.

(3) All matters in a meeting of the Board shall be decided by the vote of the
majority of the members present and voting:

Provided that in the case of equality of votes, the Chairman, in addition to
his vote as a member, have a casting vote.

(4) Two-third of the total membership shall form a quorum at a meeting of
the Board:

Provided that if a meeting is adjourned for want of quorum, no quorum
shall be necessary at the next meeting for transacting the same business.

(5) Copy of the proceedings of every meeting of the Board shall be sent to
the Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh by the Secretary as
soon as the meeting is held.

(6) No action taken, or proceedings taken, under this Act by the Board shall



188 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

be invalid merely on the ground of the existence of any vacancy amongst
members, or by reason of defect or irregularity in its constitution or any
irregularity in procedure not affecting the merits of the case.”.

For section 43,
substitute—

Legal proceedings. “43.No suit shall be instituted against the Board, or any member thereof, or

any of its officers or other employees, or any person acting under the
directions of the Board or any member or any officer or other employees of
the Board in respect of any act done or purporting to have been done in
pursuance of this Act or any rule or regulation made there under until the
expiration of two months after notice, and in any other case, delivered to, or
left at the office or place of abode of, the person to be sued and unless such
notice state explicitly the cause of action, the nature of relief sought, the
amount of compensation claimed and the name and place of residence of
the intending plaintiff and unless the plaint contains a statement that such
notice has been so left or delivered.”.

Insertion of new
section — After section

43, insert—

Copy right. “43A. (1) Copy right of all materials developed, printed and published by
the Board shall vest with the Board itself.
(2) The Board may get material pertaining to School Education developed,
published or printed from any agency as it may consider appropriate in the
public interest.

Summary powers of 43B. In case any sum is recoverable by the Board of School Education from

recovery. any person on account of purchase, sale transportation, printing, storage or

transit shortage of books and printing material or other sums found to have
been misappropriated by the officials of the Board, the said sum of money
shall be recoverable from such a person and the procedure of recovery shall
be the same as prescribed under section 90 of the Land Revenue Act,
1996.”.

skskoskoskosk ok

70. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR BOVINE BREEDING (REGULATION OF PRODUCTION,
SALE OF BOVINE SEMEN AND ARTIFICIAL INSEMINATION SERVICES) ACT, 2018

(LI of 2018)

Throughout the Act, except as otherwise provided, for “State”, “Jammu and Kashmir” and “Government

99 ¢

Gazette”, substitute “Union territory”, “Union territory of Ladakh” and “Official Gazette”, respectively.



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 189

Throughout the Act, except in sub-section (I) of section 21 or as otherwise provided, for “Government”,
substitute “Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 2. — (i) After clause (a), insert, —

‘(aa) “Administration” means the Administration of the Union territory of
Ladakh’ ;

(ii) in clause (j), omit “”’Kashmir and Livestock Development Board Jammu” ;
(ii1) omit clause (0); and

(iv) in clause (p), for “Jammu and Kashmir State” substitute “Union territory
of Ladakh”.

Section 5. — In section 5, for “at the office of the Chairman, Jammu and Kashmir State
Implementing Agency/Administrative Secretary, Animal Sheep Husbandry
and Fisheries Department”, substitute “such as notified by the

Administration”.

Section 9. — In sub-section (1), for “State of Jammu and Kashmir” substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh”.

Section 17. — (1) In sub-section (1), for “the tribunal established under the Jammu and
Kashmir Special Tribunal Act, 1988 (Act No 19 of 1988)” substitute “such
authority as may be notified by the Administration” ; and
(i1) in sub-section (2), for “The Tribunal” substitute “Such authority”.

Section 18. — In sub-section (2), for “Jammu and Kashmir Code of Criminal Procedure Svt,
1989 (1933 A.D)” substitute “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 29. — For “Ranbir Penal Code, Samvat 1989 substitute “Indian Penal Code (45 of
1860)”.

Section 32. — Omit sub-section (3).

Section 34. — For “Jammu/Kashmir” substitute “Ladakh”.

skokskoskokoskok

71. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR AERIAL ROPEWAYS ACT, 2002
(XII of 2002)

Throughout the Act, except in preamble or as otherwise provided, for “Jammu and Kashmir” and “State”
substitute “Union territory of Ladakh” and “Union territory”, respectively,

Throughout the Act, except in clause (ix) of sub-section (4) of section 6 or as otherwise provided, for
“Government” substitute “Administration”.

Throughout the Act, for State Ranbir Penal Code Samvat 1989”, substitute Indian Penal Code (45 of 1860).

Section 1. — In sub-section (2), for “State of Jammu and Kashmir” substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh”.
Section 2. — (i) After clause (a), insert, —

‘(aa) “Administration” means the Administration of the Union territory of



190 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

Ladakh’;
(ii) after clause (c), insert —

‘(cc) “Collector” means Collector as defined under the Land Revenue Act,
Svt. 1996°;

(ii1) omit clause (d);
(iv) for clause (f), insert, —

‘(f) “Inspector” means an officer, a Committee or an Agency so appointed by
the Administration under this Act’;

(v) in clause (k), in sub-clause (iv), for “Companies Act, 1956 substitute
“Companies Act, 2013”(18 of 2013); and

in sub-clause (v) for “Indian Railway Act, 1980” substitute

“The Railways Act, 1989 (24 of 1989)”.

For sections 3 and 4

substitute—

Declara.tlon for “3.Every declaration by an intending promoter other than the

concessions. Administration in regard to a proposed aerial ropeway for undertaking the
necessary preliminary investigations shall be submitted on an application
to the Divisional Commissioner.

Contents of 4. Ev.ery such application shall be supported by a duly sworn affidavit and

. shall include—
Declaration.

(i) a description of the undertaking and of the route to be followed by the
proposed aerial ropeway;

(i1) a description of the system of construction and management and the
advantages to the community to be expected from the aerial ropeway;

(iii) an approximate estimate of the cost of construction thereof; and

(iv) such maps, plans, sections, diagrams and other information as the
Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh may require in order to
form an idea of the proposal.”.

For section 18
substitute.-

Promoter to fix

rates "18.The promoter shall, for the purposes of working an aerial ropeway,

have powers to fix the rates for the carriage of passengers, animals or
goods on the aerial ropeway:

Provided that such rates shall be subject to such maximum and
minimum rates as may be prescribed or ordered in case where concession,
guarantee, or financial assistance have been granted by the Administration
or any local authority.".



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 191

Section 30. — For “State Land Acquisition Act, Samvat 1990 substitute “the Right to
Fair Compensation and Transparency in Land Acquisition, Rehabilitation
and Resettlement Act, 2013 (30 of 2013)”.

Section 32. — Omit sub-section (4).

Section 34. — For “one thousand rupees” substitute “five thousand rupees”.

72. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR FOREST (PROTECTION) FORCE ACT, 2001
(VI of 2001)
Repeal as a whole.
skoskoskoskokskosk
73. THE PREVENTION OF RUM RASUM ACT, 1977
(I0f 1997)
Throughout the Act, for “Jammu and Kashmir State”, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 4. — For “five hundred rupees” substitute “five thousand rupees”.

seskeoskoskoskoksk

74. THE PROBATE AND ADMINISTRATION ACT, SVT. 1977 (1920 A.D.)
(XXIX of Svt. 1977)

Throughout the Act, except as otherwise provided, for “Government” and “Government Gazette”,“Jammu and
Kashmir” and “State” substitute “Administration” and “Official Gazette”, “Union territory of Ladakh” and
“Union territory”, respectively.

Throughout the Act, for “Code of Civil Procedure, Samvat 19777, substitute “Code of Civil Procedure, 1908
(5 of 1908)”.

Throughout the Act, for “Ranbir Penal Code”, wherever occurring, substitute ‘Indian Penal Code (45 of
1860)”.

Section 1. — In sub-section (2), for “Jammu and Kashmir State” substitute “Union territory of
Ladakh”.
Section 3. — (i) For “Province- Province means the province of Jammu or the province of

Kashmir” substitute “Province- Province means Union territory of Ladakh”; and

(i1) in the definition of “Mines” for “the Majority Act, 1977,” substitute “the
Majority Act, 1875 (9 of 1875)”.

Section 59. — For “the whole of state” substitute “the whole of the Union territory”.
Section 60. — In sub-section (2), in example, for “the whole of the State” substitute “the whole of
the Union territory”.
skskeosk skokosk sk

75. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR NATIONAL LAW UNIVERSITY ACT, 2018
(11 of 2019)

Repeal as a whole.

skskoskoskosk ok



192

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

76. THE SRINAGAR AND JAMMU CLUSTER UNIVERSITIES ACT, 2016
(111 of 2016)

Repeal as a whole.

77.

78.

79.

80.

81.

82.

83.

skok ks ok skok

THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR MIGRANT IMMOVABLE PROPERTY (PRESERVATION,
PROTECTION AND RESTRAINT ON DISTRESS SALES) ACT, 1997
(XVI of 1997)

Repeal as a whole.

sheskoskoskoskokosk

THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR MIGRANTS (STAY OF PROCEEDINGS) ACT, 1997
(XVII of 1997)

Repeal as a whole.

seskeoskoskoskoksk

THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR FLOOD PLAIN ZONES (REGULATION AND
DEVELOPMENT) ACT, 2005
(XVII of 2005)

Repeal as a whole.

skokskoskok skok

THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR BABA GHULAM SHAH BADSHAH UNIVERSITY ACT, 2002
(XVI of 2002)

Repeal as a whole.

shskeoskoskoskoksk

THE KASHMIR AND JAMMU UNIVERSITIES ACT, 1969
(XXIV of 1969)

Repeal as a whole.

skskoskoskosk ok

THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR SHRI MATA VAISHNO DEVI UNIVERSITY ACT, 1999
(XII of 1999)
Repeal as a whole.

skosk skoskok ko

THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR PREVENTION AND SUPPRESSION OF SABOTAGES ACT,
1965

(XXII of 1965)

Repeal as a whole.

skok skoskok skok



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 193

84. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR CIVIL COURTS ACT, SVT. 1977
(XLVI of Samvat 1977)

L1

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for ‘Government’, “and ‘Government Gazette, substitute
‘Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh’ and ‘Official Gazette’ respectively.

Throughout the Act for “Code of Civil Procedure” substitute “Code of Civil Procedure 1908(5 of 1908).

Throughout the Act, for “the State” substitute ‘the Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 1.— In sub-section (2), for “Jammu and Kashmir” substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh”.
Section 2. — (i) Omit clause (i);

(i1) after clause (i), insert -

‘(ia) “High Court” means the common High Court for the Union
territory of Jammu and Kashmir and the Union territory of Ladakh
created under Part VIII of the Jammu and Kashmir Reorganisation Act,

2019 (34 of 2019)’.
Section 3. — Omit.
Section 4.— Omit.
Section 8. — In sub-section (1), in clause (d), for “sued” substitute “used”.
Section 13. — Omit “ the Courts of Small Causes established under the Small Cause

Court Act, and”
Section 24.— Omit.
Section 25. — (i) In sub-section (2), -

(a) in clause (a), for “Probate and Administration Act” and “fifth
paragraph of the Third Schedule” substitute = “Indian Succession
Act,1925 (39 of 1925)” and “paragraph 3 of Schedule III ” ; and

(b) for “Guardian and Wards Act” substitute “Guardians and Wards
Act, 1890( 8 of 1890)”.

Section 39. — In sub-section (2), omit “in paragraph 17 of the second Schedule or”.
Section 43. — For “High Court of Judicature, Jammu and Kashmir State” substitute
“High Court”.
skskeosk skokosk sk

85. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR PREVENTION OF BEGGARY ACT, 1960
(XL of 1960)

Repeal as a whole.

skok skoskok skok



194 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

86. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR BOARD OF PROFESSIONAL ENTRANCE EXAMINATION
ACT, 2002

(XXYV of 2002)
Repeal as a whole.

skok ks ok skok

87. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR (PREVENTION OF UNFAIR MEANS) EXAMINATIONS
ACT, 1987

(XX of 1987)

Throughout the Act except as otherwise provided, for ‘Government’, and ‘Government Gazette, substitute
‘Administration’ and ‘Official Gazette’, respectively.

Throughout the Act except in the preamble or as otherwise provided, for “Jammu and Kashmir” and “State”
substitute “Union territory of Ladakh” and “Union territory”, respectively.

Section 1. — In sub-section (2), for “State of Jammu and Kashmir” substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh”.
Section 2. — (1) In clause (a), for “Jammu and Kashmir State” substitute “Union territory of

Ladakh”, and for “Jammu and Kashmir Board of School Education Act 19757,
substitute “Jammu and Kashmir Board of School Education Act 1975 or any
other Board notified by the Administration”;

(ii) after clause (a), insert —

‘(ab) “Administration” means the Administration of the Union territory of
Ladakh ;’ ;
(iii) in clause (h), for “Jammu and Kashmir Board of School Education Act

1975” substitute “Jammu and Kashmir Board of School Education Act 1975 or
any other Board notified by the Administration”; and

(iv) in clause (1), for “an university established under any act passed by the
State Legislature” substitute “any University notified by the Administration for

the purposes of this Act”.

Section 7. — For “Code of Criminal Procedure, Samvat 1989 substitute “Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 8. — (i) For “Code of Criminal Procedure, Samvat 1989 substitute “Code of

Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”; and

(i) in clause (iii), for “section 259-A of the Code of Criminal Procedure,
Samvat 1989” substitute “Chapter XIX of the Code of Criminal Procedure,
1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 10. — For “Ranbir Penal Code” substitute “Indian Penal Code (45 of 1860)”.

skosk skoskosk skok

88. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR PRIVATE COLLEGES (REGULATION AND CONTROL)
ACT, 2002

(XXII of 2002)

Throughout the Act except in the clause (2) of section 17 or as otherwise provided, for ‘Government’,
substitute ‘Administration of Union territory of Ladakh’.

Throughout the Act except as otherwise provided, for ‘Government Gazette, substitute ‘Official Gazette’.

Throughout the Act except in section 24 of the Act or as otherwise provided, for ‘Jammu and Kashmir’
substitute ‘Union territory of Ladakh’.



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 195

Throughout the Act including the preamble or as otherwise provided, for ‘State’ substitute ‘Union territory of
Ladakh’.

Section 1. — In the sub-section (2), for “State of Jammu and Kashmir” substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh”.
Section 2. — (i) After clause (a), insert—

‘(ab) “Administration” means the Administration of the Union territory of
Ladakh ;’ ;

(i1) in clause (¢), —

(a) for “affiliated to the University of Kashmir or the University of
Jammu” substitute “affiliated to University of Ladakh or any other university
notified by the Administration” ;

(b) in sub-clause (i), for “University of Kashmir or University of Jammu”
substitute “any university notified by the Administration for the purposes of
this Act”.

(ii1) omit clause (f) ;

(iv) in clause (i) for “State” means the State of Jammu and Kashmir”
substitute “Union territory means the Union territory of Ladakh” ;

(v) in clause (j), for “University of Kashmir or the University of Jammu as
established under the Kashmir and Jammu University Act, 1969” substitute
“University of Ladakh or any other Universities as may be notified by the
Administration”.

Section 3. — In sub-section (2), for “Kashmir and Jammu University Act, 1969” substitute
“University of Ladakh Act, 2018”.

Section 9. — In the sub-section (2) for “Government Services”, substitute “services under
Administration of Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 17. — In clause (1), for “Kashmir and Jammu University Act, 1969” substitute
“University of Ladakh Act, 2018”.

Section 19. — For “Code of Civil Procedure, Samvat 1977” substitute “Code of Civil
Procedure, 1908 (5 of 1908)”.

skosk skoskok ko

89. THE POLICE ACT, 1983

(IT of Samvat 1983)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for ‘Government’, ‘State’ and ‘Jammu and Kashmir
Government Gazette, substitute ‘Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh’, ‘Union territory of
Ladakh’ and ‘Official Gazette’, respectively.



196 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

Section 2. — For “of its third publication ”, substitute “its publication ”.

Section 4. — At the end, insert “All references in this Act to “Inspector General”,
“Deputy Inspector General”, “Assistant Inspector General”,
“Superintendent”, “Deputy Superintendent”, “Assistant

Superintendent”, or any other post in the police force shall, if such post
does not exist in the Union territory of Ladakh, be deemed to refer to an
equivalent post or to such post which has been notified for this purpose
by the Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh.”.

Section 8. — For “provisions of section 126 of the Constitution of Jammu and
Kashmir” substitute “provisions of article 311 of the Constitution of
India”.

Section 17. — In sub-section(1), for “section 386 and 387 of the Code of Criminal

Procedure” substitute “sections 421 and 422 of the Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 27. — In sub-section (2), for “section 525 of the Code of Criminal Procedure
1989 substitute “section 459 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973
(2 of 1974)”.
skoskoskoskokoskosk

90. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR ISLAMIC UNIVERSITY OF SCIENCE AND TECHNOLOGY
KASHMIR ACT, 2005
(XVIII of 2005)

Repeal as a whole.

skokskoskok skok

91. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR DELIVERY OF BOOKS AND NEWSPAPERS (PUBLIC
LIBRARIES) ACT, 1961
(XIII of 1961)

Repeal as a whole.

shskeoskoskoskokosk

92. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR HERITAGE CONSERVATION AND PRESERVATION ACT,
2010

(XV of 2010)

Throughout the Act, except as otherwise provided, for “Government” and “Government Gazette”, substitute
“Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh” and “Official Gazette”, respectively.

Throughout the Act, except in the preamble or as otherwise provided, for “Jammu and Kashmir” and “State”
substitute “Union territory of Ladakh” and “Union territory”, respectively.

Section 2. — (1) After clause (a), insert —

‘(aa) “Administration” means the Administration of Union territory of Ladakh’;
and



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 197

(i1) omit clause (h).

Section 15. - In sub-section (I) for “five thousand rupees” substitute “fifty thousand rupees”.

shskoskoskoskokosk

93. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR VACCINATION ACT, 1967
(XXI of 1967)

Repeal as a whole.

shskoskoskoskokosk

94. SHER-I-KASHMIR INSTITUTE OF MEDICAL SCIENCES (GRANT OF DEGREES) ACT,
1983

(XTII of 1983)
Repeal as a whole.
ok
95. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR CIVIC LAWS (SPECIAL PROVISIONS) ACT, 2014
(XIII of 2010)

Repeal as a whole.

sheskeoskoskoskokosk

96. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR FRUIT NURSERIES (LICENSING) ACT, 1987
(XXII of 1987)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for ‘Government’, and ‘Government Gazette, substitute
‘ Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh’, and ‘Official Gazette’, respectively.

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided for ‘Jammu and Kashmir” substitute ‘Union territory of
Ladakh’, except in the preamble.

Preamble.— For “State of Jammu and Kashmir” substitute ‘“Union territory of
Ladakh”.

Section 1. — In sub-section (2), for “State of Jammu and Kashmir” substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh”.

Section 7. — For “State”, wherever occurring, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 17. — For “Code of Criminal Procedure, Samvat, 1989 substitute “Code of

Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 18. — For “State Ranbir Penal Code” substitute “Indian Penal Code (45 of
1860)”.



198 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

Section 21. — Omit sub-section (3).

skok skoskok ko

97. THE AGRICULTURISTS RELIEF ACT, 1983
(1 OF SAMVAT 1983)

Repeal as a whole.

skskoskoskoskokosk

98. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR GOVERNMENT AID TO AGRICULTURISTS AND LAND
IMPROVEMENT ACT

(VII of Samvat 1993)

Repeal as a whole.

skokskoskok skok

99. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR PUBLIC SERVICES GUARANTEE ACT, 2011 (IX of 2011)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for ‘Government’, and ‘Government Gazette, substitute
‘ Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh’, and ‘Official Gazette’, respectively.

Throughout the Act, for ‘Jammu and Kashmir’ and ‘State’ substitute ‘Union territory of Ladakh’ except in the
preamble or as otherwise provided.

Preamble. — For ‘the State’ substitute ‘Union territory of Ladakh’.

Section 2. — (1) After clause (a), insert —
‘(ab) “Administration” means Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh.’ ;
and
(i) Omit clauses (e), (j) and (1).

Section 9. — For “Code of Civil Procedure” substitute “Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 (5 of
1908)”.

Section 15. — For “the Special Tribunal” substitute “the authority as may be designated by the

Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh”.

skskoskoskosk ok

100. THE LADAKH BUDDHISTS SUCCESSION TO PROPERTY ACT, 2000 (XVIII of

Samvat 2000)
Preamble. — For “Buddhist of Ladakh” substitute “Buddhist of the Union territory of
Ladakh”.
Section 1. — In the sub-section (2), for “Jammu and Kashmir State” substitute “Union

territory of Ladakh”.



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 199

Section 2. — In clause (b), for “means the District of Ladakh” substitute “means the Union
territory of Ladakh”.
skoskeosk skokosk sk
101. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR CIVIL SERVICES (SPECIAL PROVISIONS) ACT,
2010
(XIV of 2010)

Repeal as a whole.

sheskoskoskoskokosk

102. THE NATIONAL DEFENCE FUND DONATION OF IMMOVABLE PROPERTY
(EXEMPTION FROM STAMP DUTY AND REGISTRATION) ACT, 1963
(V of 1963)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for “Government”, substitute “Administration”.

Section 4. — In sub-section (1), for “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official
Gazette”.

skokoskoskok skok

103. THE STAMP ACT, SVT. 1977
(XL of Samvat 1977)

Repeal as a whole.

shseoskoskoskokosk

104. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR GOODS AND SERVICES TAX ACT, 2017
(V of 2017)

Repeal as a whole.

skosk skoskosk skok

105. THE KASHMIR SILK PROTECTION ACT, 1964
(Notification No. 14 of Samvat 1964)

Repeal as a whole.

skosk skoskok ko

106. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR SILK (DEVELOPMENT AND PROTECTION) ACT, 1988
(XXVIII of 1988)

Repeal as a whole.

skok skoskok skok



200 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

107. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR NAMDHA QUALITY CONTROL ACT, SVT. 2010
[VI of Samvat 2010 (1953 A.D)]

Repeal as a whole.

skok ks ok skok

108. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR OBSOLETE LAWS (REPEAL) ACT, 2010
(XXVII of 2010)

Preamble. — For ‘in the State’ substitute ‘in the Union territory of Ladakh”.

seskoskoskoskoskok

109. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR STATE FINANCE COMMISSION ACT, 2006
(XVIII of 2006)

Repeal as a whole.

skokskoskok skok

110. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR FISCAL RESPONSIBILITY AND BUDGET MANAGEMENT
ACT, 2006
(XII of 2006)

Repeal as a whole.

sheskeoskoskoskoksk

111. THE LEVY OF TOLLS ACT, SVT. 1995
(VIII of 1995)

Repeal as a whole.

skokskoskokoskok

112. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR PROFESSIONS, TRADES, CALLINGS AND
EMPLOYMENT TAX ACT, 2005
(IX of 2005)

Repeal as a whole.

shskeoskoskoskoksk

113. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR STATE EMERGENCY RELIEF FUND ACT, 1960 (XIII of 1960)

Repeal as a whole.

skosk skoskosk skok

114. THE USURIOUS LOANS ACT, SVT. 1977
(XLVII of Samvat 1977)

Repeal as a whole.

skosk skoskosk skok



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 201

115. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR PROTECTION OF INTERESTS OF DEPOSITORS (IN
FINANCIAL ESTABLISHMENTS) ACT, 2018

(XIII of 2018)

Repeal as a whole.

shoskoskokoskokosk

116. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR REGULATION OF ACCOUNTS ACT, SVT. 2001
(XIV of Samvat 2001)
Repeal as a whole.

skok skoskok skok

117. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR URBAN IMMOVABLE PROPERTY TAX (REPEAL AND
SAVING) ACT, 2002

(XXVIII of 2002)
Repeal as a whole.
skoskoskoskokoskosk
118. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR TENANCY ACT, 1980
(IT of Samvat 1980)

Repeal as a whole.

sheskeoskoskoskokosk

119. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR TENANCY (STAY OF EJECTMENT PROCEEDINGS) ACT,
1966

(XXXIII of 1966)

Repeal as a whole.
shskeoskoskoskoksk
120. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR RESTITUTION OF MORTGAGED PROPERTIES ACT, 1976
(XIV of 1976)

Repeal as a whole.

skosk skoskok ko

121. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR MULBERRY PROTECTION ACT, SVT. 2006 (X of 2006)

Repeal as a whole.

skskoskoskosk ok

122. THE INSPECTOR GENERAL OF PRISONS (CHANGE IN DESIGNATION) ACT, 2001
(XIII of 2001)

Repeal as a whole.

skosk skoskosk skok



202

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

123. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR SIKH GURDWARAS AND RELIGIOUS ENDOWMENT ACT,

1973

(XV of 1973)

Throughout the Act, for “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official Gazette”.

Throughout the Act, other than in clause (vi) of section 4, for “Government”, substitute

“Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh”.

Preamble. —

Section 1. —

Section 2. —

Section 2A. —

Section 4.

Section 6.

Section 7.

Section 8.

Section 12. —

For “in Jammu and Kashmir State”, substitute “Union territory of
Ladakh”.

(i) in sub-section (2), for “Jammu and Kashmir State”, substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh’”’; and

(il) in sub-section (2a), for “State”, substitute ‘“Union territory of
Ladakh”.

In clause (a), for “State”, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

For “Jammu and Kashmir Houses and Shops Rent Control Act, 19667,
substitute “Jammu and Kashmir Residential and Commercial Tenancy
Act, 2012”.

(i) In clause (v), for “Jammu and Kashmir State”, substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh”;

(i1) omit clause (vi).

Omit “by rotation at Srinagar and Jammu”.

For “offices in Jammu and Srinagar”, substitute “an office in Ladakh”.
Omit the proviso.

Omit clause (vi).

shskeoskoskoskoksk

124. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR GIFT GOODS (UNLAWFUL POSSESSION) ACT

Repeal as a whole.

(XL of 1963)

skokskoskokoskok

125. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR KAHCHARAI ACT, 2011

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for “Government”, “Jammu and Kashmir” or “State”, and
‘Government Gazette, substitute ‘Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh’, “Union territory of

(XVIII of 2011)

Ladakh” and ‘Official Gazette’, respectively.

Section 1.—

Section 3. —

In sub-section (2), for “Jammu and Kashmir State” substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh”.

(1) In sub-section (4) for “Jammu and Kashmir Forest Act, 1987 and
“Minister-in-charge of the Forest Department” substitute “Indian Forest
Act, 1927 (16 of 1927” and “Administration of the Union territory of
Ladakh”;

[PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 203

(i) in sub-section (9), omit “such that the territories comprising Kashmir

Valley and”

Section 12. — Omit clause (ii).

Section 22. — In sub-section (1), for “Minister-in-charge of the Forest Department”
substitute “Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 25. — For “Code of Criminal Procedure” substitute “Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 32. — For “Code of Criminal Procedure” substitute “Code of Criminal

Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

skok skoskok skok

126. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR VEGETABLE SEEDS ACT, SVT. 2009.
(XIV of 1973)

Repeal as a whole.

seskeoskoskoskoksk

127. THE ENEMY AGENTS ORDINANCE, 2005
(Ord. No. VIII of Samvat 2005)

Throughout the Ordinance, unless otherwise provided, for ‘Government’ and ‘State’, substitute
‘ Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh’, and ‘Union territory of Ladakh’, respectively.

Section 1.— In sub-section (2), for “Jammu and Kashmir State” occurring at both
places, substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

Section 9. — In sub-section (2), for “section 439 occurring at both places” substitute
“section 401 .

Section 12. — For “Evidence Act, 1977 substitute “Indian Evidence Act, 1872 (1 of
1872) .

Section 13. — In sub-section (4), for “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989 substitute

“Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 15. — For “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989” substitute “Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

For “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989 substitute “Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 16.

skskoskoskosk ok

128. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR CHOWKIDARI ACT, 1956.
(XXXVII of 1956)

Throughout the Act except as otherwise provided, for “Government” and “Government Gazette” substitute
“Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh”, and “Official Gazette” respectively.



204 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

Throughout the Act except in the preamble or as otherwise provided, for “Jammu and Kashmir” and “State”
substitute “Union territory of Ladakh” and “Union territory”, respectively.

Preamble. — For “in the Jammu and Kashmir State” substitute “in the Union territory of
Ladakh”
Section 1. — In sub-section (2), for “Jammu and Kashmir State” substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh”.
Section 11.— For “Ranbir Penal Code, 1989 substitute “Indian Penal Code (45 Of
1860)”.
skoskeosk skokosk sk

129. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR PLANT DISEASE AND PESTS ACT, 1973
(XIV of 1973)

Throughout the Act, except as otherwise provided, for “Government” and “Government Gazette”, substitute
“Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh” and “Official Gazette”, respectively.

Preamble. — For “State” substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.
Section 1. — In sub-section (2), for “State of Jammu and Kashmir”, substitute “Union
territory of Ladakh”.
Section 10. — In sub-section (3), for “five hundred rupees” substitute “five thousand rupees”.
Section 16. — Omit sub-section (4).
skskeoskoskokosk sk

130. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR SHRI AMARNATH JI SHRINE ACT, 2000
(XVIII of 2000)

Repeal as a whole.

shskeoskoskoskokosk

131. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR SHRI MATA SUKHRALA DEVI JI SHRINE AND SHRI
MATA BALA SUNDARI SHRINE ACT, 2013

(ITI of 2013)

Repeal as a whole.

skskoskoskosk ok

132. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR SHRI MATA VAISHNO DEVI SHRINE ACT, 1988
(XVI of 1988)

Repeal as a whole.

skosk skoskosk skok



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 205

133. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR SHRI SHIV KHORI SHRINE ACT, 2008
IV of 2008)
Repeal as a whole.
*okkok ko
134. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR GOVERNOR'S SPECIAL SECURITY FORCE ACT, 2018
(XLII of 2018)
Repeal as a whole.
*okkok ko
135. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR SPECIAL SECURITY GROUP ACT, 2000
(VI of 2000)
Repeal as a whole.
skoskoskoskokoskosk
136. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR SAFFRON ACT, 2007
(V of 2007)

Repeal as a whole.

seskeoskoskoskoksk

137. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR STATE VIGILANCE COMMISSION ACT, 2011 (I of 2011)

Repeal as a whole.

skokskoskok skok

138. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR HABITUAL OFFENDERS (CONTROL AND REFORM)
ACT, 1956
(X1 of 1956)

Repeal as a whole.

skosk skoskok ko

139. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR HOME GUARDS ACT, 2006
(III of Samvat 2006)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for ‘Government’, ‘State’ and ‘Government Gazette,
substitute ‘Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh’, ‘Union territory of Ladakh’ and ‘Official
Gazette’, respectively.



206 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

For Section 2
substitute —

Constitution of Home
Guards and
appointment of
Commandant
General and
Commandants.

“2. (1) The Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh shall
constitute a volunteer body called the Home Guards, the members of
which shall discharge such functions and duties in relation to the
protection of persons, the security of property and public order, public
safety and for such other functions as may be assigned to them in
accordance with the provisions of this Act and the rules made there
under.

(2) The Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh shall appoint an
officer of suitable seniority of the Home Guards in whom shall vest
general supervision and control of the Home Guards in the Union
territory of Ladakh.

3) The Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh may also
appoint such number of additional officers as may be required to whom
the officer referred to in sub-section (2) may delegate such of his powers
as he may consider necessary for supervision, control and training of the
Home Guards.

(4) The Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh shall also
appoint a Commandant for the Home Guards in each district.”.

Section 6-B. — (1) In sub-section (1), for “Ranbir Penal Code 1989” substitute “Indian
Penal Code (45 of 1860)”; and

(i1) Omit sub-section (2).

Section 6-C. — In sub-section (2), for “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989” substitute
“Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of Sa mvat 1974)”.

shskeoskoskoskokosk

140. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR FIRE FORCE ACT, 1967
(XII of 1967)

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for ‘Government’, and ‘Government Gazette, substitute
‘ Administration of the Union territory of Ladakh’ and ‘Official Gazette’, respectively.

Throughout the Act, unless otherwise provided, for ‘State’, substitute ‘Union territory of Ladakh’, except
in preamble.

Section 2. — In clause (d), for “Jammu and Kashmir State Fire Force” substitute
“Ladakh Fire and Rescue Service”.



[\ [I—E0E 3(ii)] HTLT T (ST ETLTI0T 207

Section 3. — For “Jammu and Kashmir State Fire Force” substitute “Ladakh Fire and
Rescue Service”.

Section 14. — For “Consolidated Fund of the State” substitute “Consolidated Fund of
India”.

Section 17. — In sub-section (2), in clause (f), for “Jammu and Kashmir Arbitration
Act, Samvat 2002” substitute “Arbitration and Conciliation Act, 1996
(26 of 1996)”.

Section 19. — For “The Code of Civil Procedure, Samvat, 1977, substitute “Code of
Civil Procedure, 1908 (5 of 1908)”.

Section 21. — For “Jammu and Kashmir State Ranbir Code, Samvat 1989” substitute

“Indian Penal Code (45 of 1860)”.

seskeoskoskoskoksk

141. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR STATE BOARD OF TECHNICAL EDUCATION ACT, 2002
(XXIV of 2002)
Throughout the Act except as otherwise provided, for “Government Gazette”, substitute “Official Gazette”.

Throughout the Act except in the preamble and section 4 or as otherwise provided, for “State”, substitute
“Union territory of Ladakh”.

Throughout the Act except in the preamble, sections 4 and 36 or as otherwise provided, for “Jammu and
Kashmir” substitute “Union territory of Ladakh”.

Throughout the Act except in the phrase ‘Government of India’ referred to in clause (o) of section 2, for
“Government” substitute “Administration”.

Preamble.— For ‘State board’ and ‘in the State’ substitute ‘Union territory Board’ and ‘in
the Union territory’.
Section 1.— In the sub-section (2), for ‘whole of the state of Jammu and Kashmir’

substitute ‘whole of the Union territory of Ladakh’.
Section 2.— (1) After clause (a) insert —
‘(ab) ‘Administration’ means Administration of Union territory of Ladakh’;
(i1) omit clause (n) ;
(iii) omit clause (w) ; and
(iv) after clause (x), insert —
‘(xa) ‘Union territory’ means Union territory of Ladakh’
Section 3.— After section 3, insert —

“Provided that the Administration may entrust job of the Board or affiliate to
such Board of any other State or any other Union territory or any other body
as may be notified for this purpose.”.

Section 5.— For “the following members ... (r) Member-Secretary, to be appointed by
the Government” substitute “such members as may be appointed by the
Administration”.

Section 18.— For ‘standard terms of deputation provided in the Jammu and Kashmir Civil
Services Regulations’ substitute ‘terms of deputation as may be prescribed
by the Administration’.

Section 19.— Omit “,after due appropriation made by the State Legislature by law in this
behalf”.



208 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

Section 22.— (i) In sub-section (2), for ‘section 226 of the Companies Act, 1956’
substitute ‘section 141 of the Companies Act, 2013 (18 of 20130 ; and

(i1) omit sub-section (5).

Section 30.— (i) For “Jammu and Kashmir State Ranbir Penal Code, Samvat, 1989,
wherever occurring, substitute “Indian Penal Code (45 of 1860)”; and

(i1) in sub-section (2), for “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1989” substitute
“Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974)”.

Section 32.— Omit sub-section (3).

e skeskoskoskosk

142. THE JAMMU AND KASHMIR PROHIBITION OF RAGGING ACT, 2011 (VI of 2011)

Throughout the Act except as otherwise provided, for “Government”, and “Government Gazette”, substitute
“Administration of Union territory of Ladakh” and “Official Gazette”, respectively.

Throughout the Act except in the preamble or as otherwise provided, for “Jammu and Kashmir” and “State”
substitute “Union territory of Ladakh” and “Union territory”, respectively.

Preamble. — For “in the State of Jammu and Kashmir” substitute “in the Union territory of
Ladakh”.
Section 2. — (i) After clause (a), insert —

‘(ab) “Administration” means the Administration of the Union territory of
Ladakh ;’;

(i1) omit clause (d); and

(iii) in clause (h), for “State means the State of Jammu and Kashmir” substitute
“Union territory means the Union territory of Ladakh”.

st sfeskoskeoskosk

[F. No. 11012/21/2020-SRA]
AJAY KUMAR BHALLA, Home Secy.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



