REGD. NO. D.L.-33004/99

ot g Ee Ter-33004/99

The Gazette

N I—|% 3—39-998 ()
PART I—Sectién 3—Sub-section (i)

TR | TR
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
q. 251] 7 faoe, TeERER, 93 9, 2005/ 19, 1927
No. 251] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, JUNE 9, 2005/JYAISTHA 19,1927

(3R e HR F94)
Ffag=T
% festt, 9 T, 2005
LR 385(3). —F TR, TRATT R SATHREE, 1885 (1885 F113) W U4 SR ¥ 7 BRI ¥e9 WS
TET T U, RGO SAR-GR it (FEmgee aan) e, 1978 =1 iR HeieR w0 ¥ fag, Prefatea frem 5w g,
~3?94r<1:-—
1 i e SR TR-(1) T B 7 S T R San-ar it (i A weive B, 2005 7
(2) F T THRH B ARG B FIW B
5. T AR T (ameie ) e, 1978 (R v v T S Fem s y), e 4 F e
R FrefeEa e @ S, S — '
Y4, sTTTEEl 3 wart « el & < ga B, S i —
(i) WA SAR-TR F% SFIara (HERm)
(ii) Tl SaR-ar = egwta (Fef) 17
3. == T & w5 9, —
(%) tﬂﬁzm(1)%?{@%1{“%‘%{aﬁ%ﬁ—z”wﬁhﬁﬁ%mm“?ﬁaﬁﬁ(ﬁﬁﬁﬁ)”weﬁi
TS T S | : '
() st (2) #, et (1) FErs’ ¥ We € we iR ¢ orge R wa €7 W B A s,
Frowi, saR 3R P % W T e T, S, STE @ S, S —

" ot (1)'%3@(@)&%%%?@@%%%12%13 o4 3 wem 1 ST F TrAtER FArTHa|
1 FETEE SRR e R STgE (FERen) 0 Yo SaR-ar = rqeta (Freifia) srge eTgew w W

2

€:771

1770 G1/2005 (1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [ParT II—SEC.3(1)]

4. mﬁéﬁ%ﬁwﬁ‘,—
(%) @ (@) ¥ =r R frefaten avs e s, s —
‘() Qﬂmﬁﬁﬁf‘aﬁaﬁmﬁmvﬁvﬁmw "

(i) Targee % FETer e (FHUH) — 100/~ T
(i) Srameet s werer aien (Frefe) — 100/~ FIY

(@) 7S (1) H @ S|
5. <= e 3 PR 8 3 SR (2) % T W Fefaled free T e, sEi -
‘(2 37 Fraet 3 SaER-2 § orgef % g SeH, Sifed we w1 aRe ¥ I T I S e T 5
s 1
6. =5 £ % Fraw 11 ¥ v W Freftan Fam T e, s i —
1. FefEr S sER—(1) T BEE F o orqen @i orgeT, STIETE W WO I i ¥ & 7
me#fmmmmmmeEWanwmmmwmn

e — v o e & o e 9% ¥ Sre e 1 80 a1 ST W Er ST ¥
(2) S WWH&WWW?W@HFWW&WW%’@WW 1059 %

fom frar fFr s T B 1
- <= B 3 FEm 12 % St (1) ¥ T R frefated SutTeE T e, S —

“(1)Wmmmmﬁwwwmﬁﬁmmamﬁvwmﬁmwa*
HTER FeA G = —

ST 1 T ' HE eI A
, 20 = S =
(i) T’ STR-TR 61 % Sgea (FERT) 1000 2000
(i) FarTeiel san-ar e s egeta (FrEtm) 1000 2000"

&3‘%?—?4?%%1{?14%3‘:1@(1)73:—
(%) et doae e v FEE R SE T = W@ W
(m) g () Fem R et @us T S, Fei —
) moowmmmm "
9. ¥=q 999 & Fa9 15 °,—
() St TR FEE R T T e T
(i) ‘o ean v & e W vy e T W,
‘s P 3 P 17 F e E o TN vl e R 5 e v T W
11. =0 Frae ¥ g 18 FSufam (1) #,—
() T (ii) F e | Fefafea @ves T s, s :—
“ (i) oTriees, TATTRIEN SAR-aR R STIFIa (HHRT) U g
(@) @@= (iii) ¥ 10 90’ TRl SR TR F TIH T “zoo)—wq” g iR oTF @ S -
12. 3=a Prm & e 20 FsafEm (2) §,—
() @ (i) F 10/~ 30 T oK TRl F wE W 100/~ ¥R S IR R @ |
(@) @ (i) § "5/~ o0’ oT oiR v F e ¢ 100/- 79T of SR e 1@ W |
[ €. TA.-14011/255/2004-TTH |

Frsyer ;e P WRa & TS, 96 11, S 3, w9-EE () H \*;m;:gam . vr'f: 1499/73 TG 25 FFIL,




[T [—TTS 3(1)] AR oI9S : STHERT

MINISTRY OF COMMUNICATIONS AND INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY
(Wireless Planning and Co-ordination)
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 9th June, 2005

G.S.R.385(E)— In exercise of the powers conferred by sections 4 and 7 of the Indian
Telegraph Act, 1885 (13 of 1885), the Central Government hereby makes the following
rules further to amend the Indian Wireless Telegraphs (Amateur Service) Rules, 1978,

namely:-

4. Short title and commencement- (1) These rules may be called the Indian Wireless -

Telegraphs (Amateur Service ) Amendment Rules, 2005.
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2, In the Indian Wireless Telegraphs (Amateur Service) Rules, 1978 (hereinafter
referred to as ‘the said rules’), for mle 4, the following rule shall be substituted, namely:-
“4_(Categories of licence: There shall be two categories of licences, namely;-

(1) Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station Licence (General)

(ii)  Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station Licence (Restricted).”

i In rule 3 of the said rules,-

(a) in sub-rule (1), in the proviso, for the words and figure © Station Licence
Grade- 117, the words and brackets “Station Licence (Restricted)” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-rule (2), for the portion beginning with the words * Notwithstanding
any thing contained” and ending with the words, Short Wave Listners” Amateur
Wireless Telegraph Station Licence:”, the following words, brackets and letters shall be
substituted, namely:- '

« Notwithstanding anything contained in clause (b) of sub-rule (1), the Central

Government may grant to bonafide experimenters between the age of 12 and 18 years,
Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station Licence (General) or Amateur Wireless Telegraph

Station Licence(Restricted):”.

4. In rule 7 of the said rules, -
(a) for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-
“(b) such person pays the fees on the following scale, namely :
(1) Amateur Station Operators’ Examination (General) - Rs. 100/-
(ii) Amateur Station Operators’ Examination ( Restricted) - Rs. 100/-7

{b) clause (¢) shall be omirted.

5 In rule 8 of the said rules, for sub-rule (2) the following sub-rule shall be

substituted, namely ;-
“ (2) An application for licence in Annexure-II to the rules shall be submitted not later

than one month before the date of desired examination.”

o. For rule 11 of the said rules, the following rule shall be substituted, namely:-
“11. Period of Validity- (1) A licence granted under these rules shall be issued for a

iod of 20 years or lifelong as the case may be commencing on the date of issue of the

licence and expiring on the last day of the month preceding the month of issue.

Fxplanation:- For the purposes of this rule, the expression “life long” means till

the licence holder attains the age of 80 years.



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [ParT I—SEc. 3(1)] ~

2) Validity of lifelong licence I-nay' be extended on spe01ﬁc i’edﬁéét—of the licence holder
for 10 years at a time without any additional payment.” '

7. In rule 12 of the said rules, for sub-rule(1), the following sub-rule shall be

substituted, namely : - :
“(1) A licence fee on the following scale shall be payable to the Central Government on

receipt of instructions from that Government and in the manner directed by it:-

Fees in Rupees
Category of licence

! 20 Years Life long
(i)  Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station 1000 2000
Licenee (General)
(i)  Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station 1000 2000
| Licence (Restricted)

8. In rule 14 of the said rules, in sub-rule (1);-
(a) for the words “two or five years, as the case may be,” the words “twenty

years,” shall be substituted;
(b) for clause (c), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

“(c) Pays a fee of Rs. 1000/-”

9. In rule 15 of the said rules,-
(i)for the words “two years”, the words “five years” shall be substituted;
(ii)for letters and figures “Rs10/-”, the letters and figures , “Rs100/-" shall be

substituted ©

10. In the said rules, in the proyiso of rule 17, for the words “rupees five” , “Rs.200/-"
shall be substituted . :

11. In the rule 18 of the said rules, in sub-rule (1),

(a) for clause (ii), the following clause shall be substituted namely:-

“(ii) the applicant'holds an Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station Licence (General)”
(b) in clause (iii), for the letters and figures “Rs. 10/-", the letter and figures “Rs. 200/-”
shall be substituted.

12. In the rule 20 of the said rules, in sub-rule (2), - '
(a) 1n clause (i), for the letters and figures “Rs. 10/-”, the letters and figures “Rs. 100/-"
shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (i1), for the letters and figures “Rs. 5/-”, the letters and figures “Rs. 100/~
shall be substituted. '

[F. No.L-14011/255/2004-AMT]
C. RAMA RAOQ, Assistant Wireless Adviser

Note : The Principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Part 1 Section 3, Sub-section (i) vide No. G.S.R.
1499/78 dated the 25th October, 1978 and amended vide No. G.S.R. 1225/84 dated 17th October, 1984.

Printed by the Manager, Govt. of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Dethi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



