
Tisrest He She WeP-33004/99 REGD. NO. D.L.-33004/99 

  

           
Gazette 

EXTRAORDINARY 

wT U—eEs 3 stars (i) 
PART —Sectién 3—Sub-section (i) 

wits @ wale 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

ae faeett, qeeaivan, wi 9, 2005/7 19, 1927 

NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, JUNE 9, 2005/JYAISTHA 19, 1927 Zz
 2
d
 

bo
 

t
r
 
f
h
 

S
e
 

(aan dat a aaa) 

at 

ag facet, 9 FA, 2005 

SLSR, 385(8). Sts ween, aes an safe, 1385 (1885 FT 13) ST INT 4 AR A 7 Se Aee Va 

Wan Sa SU, URS SARIN Siest (Targete Sat) FAH, 1978 aT at Sates HA fay, Prefered Fras sar &, 

aati 

4. Sfigrg ara atc wrts-(1) ga free aa df are acta Sao aie (Feaatiet Sat) Aetters Fram, 2005 T 

(2) 3 uss FS VSR ST Ne ST aT TT 

2. ada aaa sift (Fargeiet Sar) Fras, 1978 (fad sad se Wear sad Fras eT Ts"), Pe 4 a 

a frafaiad Fas TSI ET, SAT: 

“4 sqghadl a yet: oqatcal Sct wet eh, sad :— 

Gi) Daraeiet sar-aR FR sq (STANT) 

Gi) Saastet dan-an Sx orate (Pref) 1” 

3. waa faa & ras 5 A 

(=) sofa (1) sega Sy, tas agate af-2" weg oie oat ear See orga (Prefer) " wee SI 

ASH TE TTT | . 

(@) sofa (2) H, ‘safreas (1) eos S ares SF are aig orga Se Ga SS TAT SM Tet TE, 

areal, aad ak sisi wars wi Prafefad ves, Sse, Sa Tal TTT, SAT -— 

“Sutra (1) Saws (a) F feet ora & Sa we of, esta wee 12 S19 ad aes SH ong & areal aes 

a dagpict Fan-an Ser ax ogatta Caren) at Targeteh Soa Sex sapere (Praea) sagatea organ ee ae 

x 27) 

1770 Gl/2005 (1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY {Part I—Sec.3(@)] 
  

  

  

4. saa frase fre 7 

(m=) ws (a) Fear frafcfad aes Tal ITT, aah: 

“ Cg) OS ated Peafeitan arr RFT ST STs BE, aa: 

(i) Targgitet Gx eres Went (ATA) — 100/- waa 

(i) Wergettet arg wares Tet (Pref) _ 100/- FI 

(aq) wars (1) ar eo fee eT 

5 sax frosts fram 3 safes (2) Sew Pied as Te TT, BI: 

(2) 34 free & woe? B orate & fare ad aes, aif aden at ode SS ee ae & arava TT fet 

ore |”” 

6. sat faa fas 1 ee he ea Fa Te TT, SA 

(45. Safire St orafa—(1) 3a Brad & anes agen ad agate, gata & wes ot ate a oie ot aT 

sraaqes ao saa fae art fear ore ait unt fing a ore & yal are St cfs aS I ASA ETT 

sqsenen :—Fe fran eet & fare seria oe 8 orqaftauren a 80 oF ST ong ore era fT 

(2) serrate orgie at Parr orate Se fase orgie far Pret safes sere era 10H 5 

fae faean Peet ot Gea eo 1” 

5. saa fran fh fre 12.8 wore (1) ear feed So Ter eT, BT 

(04) ata ere & ogee wet ow atk va are Pre fane Ofa S ergata she se wee a Pfeied aT 

aan Fea ST -— 
  

  

  

SMT HT THT Hig Sag A 

, 20 a4 a a 

Gi) Saraeiet sana Sat es See (STITT) 4000 2000 

Gi) Sraeiet dan-de Sat es orate ( Prafat) 1000 2000” 
  

8. Sat Fran &h Pras 14 & soPta (1) Fs 

(a) ‘aenfteta, dacs ad” wei hear eas ae” reg TS TT; 

(a) dea) Sea we Pees Gre TST TT, SA: — 

aq) 1000/- WIE Fra Fars OT” 

9, saa Tras & Pra 15 4, — 

G) “dad we Sear a as ot eee te TE; 

Gi) ‘ea eae? wei Fo a eae" ee TS TT; 

“seq from fh Pras 17 qa Soha wae” wa SIH! ‘Sat waa”? wag TS TT |” 

11. sei fran Fras 18 & sah (1) F,— 

(=) Gs (ii) Sea B Pfafad Svs Tar TT, SAN — 

“Ci) andes, Target dar-an ex orgata Cara) area eT,” 

(@) Gr (iii) F 10 wae” Ha SN VAT S BINA R 200/- em" wes A aH TS TMT. 

12. sa fran & faa 20 & Saha (2) F— 

(s) GIS (i) 8 o/- wae” tei ot wee SIH 100/- BIE" sis SR UR WS | 

(a) Gre (i) F '5/- wae" aa i we Hea H 100/- a” stew SIN TTS TTT | 

[oA @. We-14011/255/2004-TaAT] 

Been es 7 Ty S, S75 =a = so Fr 44 9 erp yc 2mtee 

Tey: Fa Pe Md SIR, YT, Ges, Sas (i a shen wl. SLSR. 1499/78 GATS 25 Haat 

  

asia Tae 

 



fart ers 3(i)] ARE USA : SST 

MINISTRY OF COMMUNICATIONS AND INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY 

(Wireless Planning and Co-ordination) 

NOTIFICATION 

New Dethi, the 9th June, 2005 

G.S.R.385().— In exercise of the powers conferred by sections 4 and 7 of the Indian 

Telegraph Act, 1885 (13 of 1885), the Central Government hereby makes the following 

rules further to amend the Indian Wireless Telegraphs (Amateur Service) Rules,1978, 

namely:- 

i Short title and commencement- (1) These rules may be called the Indian Wireless - 

Telegraphs (Amateur Service ) Amendment Rules, 2005. 

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 

2, In the Indian Wireless Telegraphs (Amateur Service) Rules, 1978 (hereinafter 

referred to as ‘the said rules’), for mile 4, the following rule shall be substituted, namely:- 

“4 Categories of licence: There shall be two categories of licences, namely;- 

(i) Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station Licence (General) 

(ii) Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station Licence (Restricted).” 

3. In rule 5 of the said mules,- 

(a) in sub-rule (1), in the proviso, for the words and figure “ Station Licence 

Grade- II”, the words and brackets “Station Licence (Restricted)” shall be substituted; 

(b) in sub-rule (2), for the portion beginning with the words “ Notwithstanding 

any thing contained” and ending with the words, Short Wave Listners’ Amateur 

Wireless Telegraph Station Licence:”, the following words, brackets and letters shall be 

substituted, namely:- 

“ Notwithstanding anything contained in clause (b) of sub-rule (1), the Central 

“Government may grant to bonafide experimenters between the age of 12 and 18 years, 

Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station Licence (General) or Amateur Wireless Telegraph 

Station Licence(Restricted):”. 

4. In rule 7 of the said rules, - 

(a) for clause (b), the following clause shail be substituted, namely:- 

“(b) such person pays the fees on the following scale, namely : 

(i) Amateur Station Operators’ Examination (General) - Rs. 100/- 

(ii) Amateur Station Operators’ Examination ( Restricted) - Rs. 100/-” 

(b) clause (c) shall be omitted. 

5. In rule 8 of the said rules, for sub-rule (2) the following sub-rule shall be 

substituted, namely ;- 

“ (2) An application for licence in Annexure-II to the rules shall be submitted not later 

than one month before the date of desired examination.” 

6. For rule 11 of the said rules, the following rule shall be substituted, namely:- 

“11. Period of Validity- (1) A licence granted under these rules shall be issued for a 

    iod of 20 years or lifelong as the case may be commencing on the date of issue of the 

“ace and expiring on the last day of the month preceding the month of issue. 

Explanation:- For the purposes of this rule, the expression “life long” means till 

the licence holder attains the age of 80 years.



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [Part Sec. 3(i)} 7 
  

(2) Validity of lifelong licence may be extended on a specific request of the licence holder 
for 10 years at a time without any additional payment.” 

7. In rule 12 of the said rules, for sub- rule(1), the following sub-rule shall be 

substituted, namely : - 

“(1) A licence fee on the following scale shall be payable to the Central Government on 
receipt of instructions from that Government and in the manner directed by it:- 
  

Fees in Rupees 
Category of licence 
  

  

        

: 20 Years Life long 

(i) Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station 1000 2000 
Licence (General) 

(Gi) Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station 1000 2000 
| Licence (Restricted) 
  
  
8. In rule 14 of the said rules, in sub-rule (1);- 

(a) for the words “two or five years, as the case may be,” the words “twenty 
years,” shall be substituted; 

(b) for clause (c), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:- 

“(c) Pays a fee of Rs. 1000/-” 

9, In rule 15 of the said rules,- 

(a)for the words “two years”, the words “five years” shall be substituted: 

(ii)for letters and figures “Rsi0/-”, the letters and figures , “Rs100/-” shall be 
substituted “ 

10. In the said rules, in the proviso of rule 17, for the words “rupees five” , “Rs.200/-” 

shall be substituted . . 

11. In the rule 18-of the said rules, in sub-rule (1), 

(a) for clause (ii), the following clause shall be substituted namely:- 

“(i1) the applicant holds an Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station Licence (General)” 
(b) in clause (iii), for the letters and figures “Rs. 10/-”, the letter and figures “Rs. 200/-” 
shall be substituted. 

12. In the rule 20 of the said rules, in sub-rule (2) , - 
(a) in clause (i), for the letters and figures “Rs. 10/-”, the letters and figures “Rs. 100/-” 
shall be substituted; 
(b) in clause (ii), for the letters and figures “Rs. 5/-”, the letters and figures “Rs. 100/-” 
shall be substituted. 

[F. No. L-14011/255/2004-AMT] 

C. RAMA RAO, Assistant Wireless Adviser 

Note : The Principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Part IB Section 3, Sub-section (i) vide No. G.S.R. 

1499/78 dated the 25th October, 1978 and amended vide No. G.S.R. 1225/84 dated 17th October, 1984. 

Printed by the Manager, Govt. of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Dethi-110064 

and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.


