
REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

The Gazette of India
EXTRAORDINARY

PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 251] NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, MAY 31, 2002/JYAISTHA 10,1924

1765 GI/2002 0 )



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA: EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3 (i)]



I



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA: EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3 (i)]



5



6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA: EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3 (i)]



7



8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA: EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3 (i)]



9

I765&/CL-2



10 THE GAZETTEOF INDIA: EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3 (i)]



11



12 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA: EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3 (i)]



13

MINISTRY OF ROAD TRANSPORT AND HIGHWAYS

NOTIFICATION

New Delhi, the 31 st May, 2002

G.s.R400(E).- whereas the draft of certain rules further to amend the Central
Motor Vehicles Rules, 1989, were published as required by sub-section (1) of section
212 of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 (59 of 1988) In the Gazette of India,
Extraordinary, Part-II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), dated the 15th January, 2002 in the
notification of Government of India In the Ministry of Road Transport and Highways,
number G.S.R. 31 (E), dated the 15th January, 2002, Inviting objections or
suggestions from all persons likely to be affected thereby within a period of forty five
days from the date on which copies of the Gazette of India, in which the said
notification was published, were made available to the public;

And whereas the copies of the said Gazette of India were made available to
the public on the 16th January, 2002;

And whereas objections or suggestions received from the public in respect of
the said draft rules have been considered by the Central Government;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sections 27, 64, 110
and 137 of the said Act, the Central Government hereby makes the following rules
further to amend the Central Motor Vehicles Rules, 1989, namely:-

1. (1) These rules may be called the Central Motor Vehicles(Third Amendment)
Rules, 2002.

(2)They shall come Into force on the date of their final publication In the Official
Gazette, unless otherwise specified in these rules.

2. the Central Motor Vehicles Rules, 1989 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules),
in rule 2, after clause (h), the following shall be inserted, namely:-

'(i) "Category L I " means a motor cycle as defined in sub-section (27) of
section 2 of the Act, with maximum design speed not exceeding 45
km/hour and engine capacity not exceeding 50 cc, if fitted with a
thermic engine.

(j) "Category L2" means a motor cycle as defined In sub-section (27) of
section 2 of the Act, with maximum design speed exceeding 45
km/hour and engine capacity exceeding 50 cc, if fitted with a thermic
engine;

(k) "Category M" means a motor vehicle with at least four wheels used for
the carriage of passengers and their luggage;



1 4 T H E G A Z E T T E O F I N D I A • E X T R A O R D I N A R Y I P A R T I I — S h e . 3 ( i ) l

(I) "Category M l " means a motor vehicle used for the carriage of
passengers and their luggage and comprising no more than eight seats
in addition to the driver's seat;

(m) "Category M2" means a motor vehicle used for the carriage of
passengers and their luggage and comprising more than eight seats in
addition to the driver's seat and having a maximum mass not
exceeding 5 tonnes;

(n) "Category M3" means a motor vehicle used for the carriage of
passengers and their luggage and comprising more than eight seats in
addition to the driver's seat and having a maximum mass exceeding 5
tonnes;

(o) "Category N" means a motor vehicle with at least four wheels used for
the carriage of goods;

(p) "Category N l " means a motor vehicle used for the carriage of goods
and having a maximum mass not exceeding 3.5 tonnes;

(q) "Category N2" means a motor vehicle used for the carriage of goods
and having a maximum mass exceeding 3.5 tonnes but not exceeding
12 tonnes;

(r) "Category N3" means a motor vehicle used for the carriage of goods
and having a maximum mass exceeding 12 tonnes;

(s) "Smart Card" means a device capable of storing data and executing
commands, which Is a single chip microprocessor, mounted on a plastic
card and the dimensions of the card and chip are as specified in ISO-
7816 specifications, as may be amended from time to time;

3. In rule 10 of the said rules, iff clause (d), for the words "medium goods
vehicle, a medium passenger motor vehicle, a heavy goods vehicle, or
a heavy passenger motor vehicle", the words "transport vehicle" shall
be substituted.

4. In rule 16 of the said rules, in sub-rule (2), for the words "for the issue of a
laminated card type driving licence, such card type driving licence", the words
"for the Issue of a laminated card type or Smart Card type driving licence,
such card type or Smart card type driving licence, as may be specified in the
Notification issued by the concerned State Government or Union Territory
Administration," shall be substituted.

5. In rule 32 of the said rules, in the Table,-
(a)agalnst Serial No.3, In column(3), for the words "One hundred and fifty

rupees", the words "Two hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(b)agalnst Serial No.6, in column(3), for the words "Thirty rupees", the words
"fifty rupees shall be substituted;



15

(c)agalnst Serial No. 8, In column (3), for the words "One hundred and fifty
rupees", the words "Two hundred rupees" shall be substituted.

6. In rule 48 of the said rules, for the words and figures "certificate of
registration In Form 23", the words, figures and letter "certificate of
registration in Form 23 or Form 23A, as may be specified In the Notification
Issued by the concerned State Government or Union Territory Administration,"
shall be substituted.

7. In rule 81 of the said rules, In the Table, in the Note, the following proviso
shall be inserted at the end, namely:-

"Provlded that In case for any purpose referred to In Serial Nos. 4, 5, 6, 7, 8,
9 and 10 of this Table is Issued on any Smart Card, an additional amount of
fee of Rupees two hundred shall be charged for each such card.".

8. In rule 83 of the said rules, for sub-rule (2), the following shall be substituted,
namely:-

"(2) Every authorization shall be granted in Form 23A, In case the certificate
of registration is issued on Smart Card or shall be granted in Form 47, In case
the authorization is in paper document mode subject to the payment of taxes
or fees, if any, levied by the concerned State. The authority which grants the
authorization shall Issue to the permit holder separate receipts for such taxes
or fees In respect of each bank draft and such receipts shall be security
printed water-mark paper carrying such hologram as may be specified by the
concerned State/Union Territory:

Provided that the Bank Drafts received in respect of taxes or fees shall
invariably be forwarded by the authority which grants the authorisation to the
respective States;

Provided also that the use of such security printed water-mark paper carrying
such hologram shall come Into force on or before six months from the date of
commencement of the Central Motor Vehicles (Third Amendment) Rules,
2002".

9. In rule 87 of the said rules, for sub-rule (2), the following shall be
substituted, namely: -

"(2) Every authorization shall be granted in Form 23A,in case the certificate of
registration is issued on Smart Card or shall be granted in Form 47, in case
the authorization is in paper document mode, subject to the payment of taxes
or fees, if any, levied by the concerned State. The authority which grants the
authorization shall issue to the permit holder separate receipts for such taxes
or fees in respect of each bank draft and such receipts shall be security
printed water-mark paper carrying such hologram as may be specified by the
concerned State/union Territory:

Provided that the Bank Drafts received in respect of taxes or fees shall
invariably be forwarded by the authority who grants the authorisation to the
respective States;



16 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY I PART II—SI-:<\ 3Ci)l

Provided also that the use of such security printed water-mark paper carrying
such hologram shall come into force on or before six months from the date of
the Central Motor Vehicles (Third Amendment) Rules, 2002".

10. In rule 88 of the said rules, after sub-rule (4), the following shall be inserted,
namely:

"(5) A national permit shall be in such security printed water-mark paper and
shall carry such hologram as the State Government or the State Transport
Authority, as the case may be, issuing such permit, may specify:

Provided that the use of such security printed water-mark paper carrying
such hologram shall come into force on or before six months from the date of
commencement of the Central Motor Vehicles (Third Amendment) Rules,
2002".

11. In rule 95 of the said rules, after sub-rule (5), the following sub-rule shall be
inserted, namely:-

"(6) In the case of Indian manufactured vehicles and Imported vehicles (new
and old), the sizes of tyres if included in the International Standards namely,
ECE, JATMA, ETRTO and T&RA besides Bureau of Indian Standards may also
be accepted under this rule:

Provided that the following conditions shall be complied with.

(i) that testing agencies referrred to in rule 126 shall satisfy themselves
about the load and speed rating of the tyre with reference to the Indian
conditions;

(ii) that the test report/certificate issued by the testing agency of the
country of origin shall be verified for acceptance by the testing agency
referred to In rule 126;

(III) that for tubeless tyres fitted on imported vehicles confirming to
conditions (i) and (ii) shall also be allowed.",

12. After rule 96 of the said rules, the following rule shall be inserted, namely;

"96A. High Speed Braking Requirements.- For high speed braking, the
following test procedure shall be followed, namely:-,

(a) In the case of Category Ml , the P type, service brake test as
defined under IS: 11852-2001 - Part 3, shall be carried out in the engine
connected mode at a test speed of 120 km/h or at 80% of the design
maximum speed of the vehicle, whichever is lower.

(b)the stopping distance requirements shall be according to the following
formula, namely:-



17

S <; 0.1V + (V ' /130) :
where, S is the Stopping Distance in mtrs.
V is the test speed in km/h
and Control force F < 500 Newtons.

Provided that this sub-rule shall be applicable In case of new vehicles yet to
be type approved after six months, and in case of already type approved
vehicles, twelve months, from the date of the commencement of the Central
Motor Vehicle(Thlrd Amendment) Rules, 2002.".

13. In rule 98 of the said rules, for sub-rule(3), the following sub-rule shall be
substituted, namely:-

"(3) On and after 1s t Januaray, 2003, the steering effort of all motor vehicles
dther than three wheelers not fitted with steering wheel, motor cycles, invalid
carriages and agricultural tractors manufactured shall conform to the Indian
Standard IS: 11948-1999, as amended from time.

14. In rule 101 of the said rules, in sub-rule (2), for the portion beginning with
words "three wheelers" and ending with the words "wiping system" , the
following shall be substituted, namely:-

"all motor vehicles other than three wheelers,motor cycles and Invalid
carriages manufactured on and after 1s t January, 2003, having a wind screen
shall be fitted with a wind screen wiping system which shall conform to the
requrements laid down in the following standards, as amended from time to
time, till such time the corresponding Bureau of Indian Standards
specifications are notified:

(i) AIS 019/2001, in the case of Ml category of vehicles
(ii) AIS 011/2001, in the case of other vehicles.

15. For rule 108 of the said rules, the following shall be substituted, namely:-

"108. Use of red, white or blue light- (1) No motor vehicle shall show a
red light to the front or light other than red to rear:

Provided that the provisions of this rule shall not apply to --

(i) the Internal lighting of the vehicle; or

(ii) the amber light, if displayed by any direction indicator or top light or as
top light used on vehicle for operating within the premises like airports,
ports without going outside the said premises on to public roads;

(iii) a vehicle carrying high dignitaries as specified by the Central Government
or the State Government, as the case may be, from time to time;

17656,1(02.-3



18 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY PART II—SEC. 3(i)l

(Iv) the blinker type of red light with purple glass fitted to an ambulance van
used for carrying patients; or

(v) to a vehicle having a lamp fitted with an electrical bulb, if the power of
the bulb does not exceed seven watts and the lamp is fitted with frosted
glass or any other material which has the effect of diffusing the light;

(vl) white light illuminating the rear number plate;

(vll) white light used while reversing;

(viii) plough light provided in agricultural tractors of illuminating the
Implement's working area on the ground in agricultural field operations.

(2) Use of blue light with flasher shall be determined and notified by the State
Governments at their discretion;

(3) Use of blue light with or without flasher shall be permitted as top light on
vehicles escorting high dignitaries entitled to the use of red light;

(4) Use of multi-coloured red, blue and white light shall be permitted only on
vehicles specifically designated for emergency duties and shall be specifically
specified by State Governments;

(5) The State Government shall Inform the Central Government regarding
publication of notifications Issued by the concerned State Government under sub-
rule (2) and under clause (e) of the Notification No. S.O. 52 (E) dated 11 th January,
2002, published in the Gazette of India, Ministry of Road Transport and Highways,
regarding use of red light on top of vehicle being used by dignitaries;

(6) In case vehicle is not carrying dignitaries, red or blue light, as the case may
be, light shall not be used and be covered by black cover.".

16. In rule 115 of the said rules,

(A) in sub-rule (2), for clauses (a) and (b), the following clauses shall be
substituted, namely:-

n(a) Idling CO (Carbon Monoxide) emission limit for all vehicles other than
two wheelers and three wheelers operating on-

(i) Liquified Petroleum Gas (LPG), Petrol; or
(II) Compressed Natural Gas (CNG), Petrol,

shall not exceed 3.0 per cent by volume;

(b) Idling CO (Carbon Monoxide) emission limit for all two wheeler and three
wheeler vehicles operating on-

(i) Liquified Petroleum Gas (LPG), Petrol; or
(ii) Compressed Natural Gas (CNG), Petrol,

shall not exceed 4.5 per cent by volume;"



10

(B) in sub-rule (10),

(i) under heading "A. FOR PETROL DRIVEN VEHICLES", in the Table under heading
2-wheelers and 3-wheelers", in Notes, after last paragraph, the following shall be
inserted, namely:-

"For 2-wheelers and 3-wheelers fitted with catalytic converter, a deterioration factor
of 1.2 on Type Approval limits, will be applicable for durability:

Provided that the Vehicle manufacturers may opt for an ageing test of 30, 000 Kms
for evaluating deterioration factor, as per procedure that may be laid down by the
Central Government;"

(ii) under heading "B. FOR DIESEL VEHICLES (INCLUDING TWO AND THREE
WHEELERS)" IN PARA I I . under heading "Or Chassis Dynamometer Test", in Notes,
after last paragraph, the following shall be inserted, namely:-

"For 2-wheelers and 3-wheelers fitted with catalytic converter, the deterioration
factor shall be as follows:

CO = 1.1; HC + NOx = 1.0; PM = 1.2 :

Provided that the Vehicle manufacturers may opt for an ageing test of 30,000 kms
for evaluating deterioration factor, as per procedure that may be laid down by the
Central Government;

Provided further that the above provisions shall come into force after six months
from the publication of the notification."

17. In rule 118 of the said rules, in sub-rule (1), for the words "the Central
Government", the words "the State Government" shall be substituted.

18. In rule 119 of the said rules, In sub-rule (1), the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:-

"Provided that on and from 1st January, 2003, the horn Installation
requirements shall be as per AIS-014/2001 specifications, as may be
amended from time to time, till such time as corresponding Bureau of Indian
Standards specifications are notified.".

19. In rule 123 of the said rules, the following proviso shall be Inserted, namely:-

"Provided that on and from 1st January, 2003, the pillion hand holds shall be
governed by IS: 14495-1998 specifications, as may be amended from time to
time."

20. In rule 124 of the said rules, after sub-rule (1), the following sub-rule shall
be inserted, namely:-

"(1A) On and from 1s t January, 2003, the general requirements of vehicle rear
under run protecting device and the technical requirements of vehicle lateral



20 _____ THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [PAKI II—SEC. 3(i)1

protection side shall be as per IS: 14812-2000 specifications and as per IS: 14682-
1999, respectively, as may be amended from time to time."

21. In rule 125 of the said rules,-

(a) for sub-rule (1A), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

"(1A) The manufacturer of every motor vehicle of Ml category shall equip
every motor vehicle with a seat belt for a person occupying the front facing
rear seat:

Provided that the specifications of Safety Belt Assemblies and Safety Belt
Anchorages in motor vehicles shall conform to AIS:005-2000 and AIS:015-
2000 specifications, respectively, as may be amended from time to time, till
such time as corresponding Bureau of Indian Standards specifications are
notified:

Provided further that on and after 1s t October, 2002 the specification of Safety
Belt Assemblies and Safety Belt Anchorages in motor vehicles shall conform to
AIS:005-2000 and AIS:015-2000 specifications, respectively."

(b) in sub-rule (2), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

"Provided that on and from 1st January, 2003 the rear view mirror
specifications and installation requirements shall be as specified by AIS:001-
2001 and AIS:002-2001 respectively, as may be amended from time to time,
till such time as corresponding Bureau of Indian Standards specifications are
notified.".

(c) after sub-rule (4), the following shall be inserted, namely:-

"(5) On and after 1st January, 2003, the size and specfications on seats, their
Anchorages and Head Restraints (excluding luggage retention) on Ml vehicle
category shall conform to AIS:016-2000 specifications, as may be amended
from time to time, till such time as corresponding Bureau of Indian Standards
specifications are notified."

22. In rule 126 of the said rules, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

"Provided that the procedure for type approval and certification of motor
vehicles for compliance to these rules shall be in accordance with the AIS:
017- 2000, as amended from time to time."

23. In rule 126A of the said rules, the following provisos shall be inserted,
namely:-

"Provided that in case the number of vehicles sold in India for a given
base model and its variants (manufactured in India or imported to India)
are less than 250 in any consecutive period of six months in a year, then
such base model and its variants need not be subjected to the above test,
if at least one model or its variants manufactured or imported by that
manufacturer or importer, as the case may be, is subjected to such tests
at least once in a year;



21

Provided further that, in case the number of base models and Its variants
manufactured / imported is more than one and If the Individual base model
and its variants are less than 250 in any consecutive period of six months in a
year, then the testing agencies can pick up one of the vehicles but of such
models and their variants once In a year for carrying out such test".

24. In rule 138 of the said rules, in sub-rule(4), in clause (c ), the following proviso
shall be inserted, namely:

"Provided that in case of vehicles manufactured on and after 1st January,
2003, the triangles of size and specification shall conform to AIS:022-
2001, as may be amended from time to time, till such time as
corresponding Bureau of Indian Standards specifications are notified.".

25. For Form 7 of the said rules, the following Form shall be substituted, namely:-

"FORM 7
(See Rule 16 (2)]

FORM FOR DRIVING LICENCE (LAMINATED / SMART CARD TYPE)

VISUAL INSPECTION ZONE

Driving Licence No

Date of Issue
Photograph

Valid Till (Non Transport) Valid Till (Transport)

Name (Surname) (given name) (middle name)

Son/Daughter/Wife of

(surname) (given name) (middle name)

Address (Current)

Date of Birth (date) (month) (year)

Authorisation to drive the following vehicle class throughout India
i. Class of vehicle
ii. Issue Date (dd-mm-yyyy)

Badge Number



2 2 T H E G A Z E T T E O F I N D I A • E X T R A O R D I N A R Y I P A W I I — S n \ 3 ( I ) I

Blood Group and Rh Factor of the Driver

Specimen Signature/thumb impression of the licence holder

Signature of the Issuing Authority

Identification of Issuing Authority

Note: The provision for security features like the ghost image and /or the hologram
would be provided in the Visual Inspection Zone of the Licence by the concerned
State Government. Card Serial Number will be printed by card manufacturer ort the
back side upper left corner of the card.

Machine Readable Zone

The concerned State Governments will provide the following features in the licence,
in Machine Readable Zone.

Chip Serial Number

Driving Licence No

Date of Issue

Valid Till (Non Transport) Valid Till (Transport)

Name (Surname) (given name) (middle name)

Son/Daughter/Wife of

(surname) (given name) (middle name)

Date of Blrth(dd-mm-yyyy)

Class of vehicle
Respective Date of
Issue

Short Name of the
Authority Conducted Driving
Test for Respective Class of Vehicle as above

Designation of the
Auhority Conducted Driving
Test for Respective Class of Vehicle as above

Identification of Issuing Authority



23

Endorsment Details (Provision will be made to accommodate the details of 10
Endorsements with following details)

• Endorsement/Challan Number
• Endorsement/Challan Date
• ID Code of Authority of Endorsement
• Section/Rule/Proceeding No. (Provision for 10 Sections/Rules)
• Fine
• Disqualification Period From (dd-mm-yyyy) :
• Disqualification Period To (dd-mm-yyyy) ,
• Settlement/Review Date (dd-mm-yyyy)
• Settlement/Review Authority ID

Badge Details

• Badge Number
• Valid Till
• Authorisation Number
• Authorisation Date"

26. In Form 20 of the said rules, after item number 4 and entries relating thereto,
the following shall be inserted, namely:-

"4(a). The annual income and PAN / GIR number of the owner.".

27. After Form 23 of the said rules, the following Form shall be inserted, namely:-

"FORM 23-A

[See rule 48]

CERTIFICATE OR REGISTRATION (IN ELECTRONIC MEDIUM AS SMART CARD, ETC)

Particulars to be printed on the Visual Inspection Zone of Smart Card:

Contents of Visual Inspection Zone

Certificate of Registration

1. Name of State Transport Department

2. Card Serial Number

3. Vehicle Registration Number

4 p^o«stration Date (In dd-mm-yyyy)

5. Owner's Details:-



24 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY IP *u II—SH- Mu\

5.1 Name
5.2 Son/Wife/Daughter of
5.3 Address: Current Postal Address

6. Vehicle's Details:-

6.1 Name of Manufacturer with Make
6.2 Colour
6.3 Fuel
6.4 Vehicle Class
6.5 Body Type
6.6 Seating Capacity
6.7 Standing Capacity
6.8 Date of Manufacture (In mm-yyyy)
6.9 Unladen Weight
6.10 Cubic Capacity
6.11 Wheel Base
6.12 Number of Cylinders
6.13 Owner Serial (Optional)
6.14 Chassis Number
6.15 Engine Number

7. Tax Paid Upto (In dd-mm-yyyy)

8. Registration Validity (In dd-mm-yyyy)

9. Signature of Issuing Authority

10. Identification of Issuing Authority

Contents of Machine Readable Zone

11. Chip Serial Number

12. Owner Serial (No. of this the ownership has changed)

13. Tax Date (Date of Validity of Tax): dd-mm-yyyy

14. Registration Validity (In dd-mm-yyyy)

15. Hypothecation Details:-

15.1 Name of Financer
15.2 Address of Financer
15.3 Hypothecated From (In dd-mm-yyyy)
15.4 Hypothecated Upto (In dd-mm-yyyy)



25

16. NOC Details:- (Future Use)

16.1 NOC Number
16.2 State To (Code Only)
16.3 RTO To
16.4 NCRB Clearance Number
16.5 NOC Issue Date (In dd-mm-yyyy)

17. Insurance Details:- (Future Use)

17.1 Name of Company
17.2 Covernote/Pollcy Number
17.3 Type of Insurance
17.4 Validity Upto (In dd-mm-yyyy)

18. Pollution Under Control Details:- (Future Use)

18.1 Checking Centre (Code only)

18.2 Validity Upto (In dd-mm-yyyy)

19. Tax Payment Details:-

Amount
Fine
Exemption/Receipt Number
Payment Date (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Valid From (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Valid Upto (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Exemption (Y/N)

20. Fitness Details:-

Validlty (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Inspecting Officer
Location

21. Additional Information in respect of Transport Vehicle:-

Gross Vehicle Weight (In Kgs.)
Number, Description and Size of Tyres
Registered Axle Weight
Number of Semi Trailers

22. Challan Details:-

Challan Number
Accused Person (O-Owner, D-Driver, C-Conductor)
Section (Code Only)
Challaning Officer
Location

1765- /̂̂ -4



26 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

Date & Time (In dd-mm-yyyy/hh:mm)
Disposing Authority (R-RTO, C-Court)
Disposal Date (In dd-mm-yy)
Penalty
Receipt Number

23. Permit Details:-

Pemlt Number
Type of Permit
Validity From (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Validity Upto (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Area of Operation
Route From
Route Upto
Stage 1
Stage 2
Stage 3.-

24. Permit Actions:-

Action Code SUR/SUS/CAN
From Date (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Upto Date (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Reason

25. All India Tourist Permit Details:-

From Date (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Upto Date (In dd-mm-yyyy)

26. Authorization Details:-

State (Code Only)
Authorization Number
Validity From (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Validity Upto (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Bank Draft Amount
Bank Draft Number
Bank (Code Only)
Branch
Bank Draft Issue Date (In dd-mm-yyyy)

27. Counter Signature Details:-

Authorizing Office
Validity From (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Validity Upto (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Route From
Route Upto
Stage 1
Stage 2
Stage 3



27

28. In case of Auto Rlkshaw/Local Taxles:-

Meter Number

Note: (i) At the time of payment of next instalment of tax, the issuing autority
shall Issue a paper receipt stating that date of validty of tax paid has been
extended from so & so date to so & so date. The receipt shall be duly signed
by designated authority. Name of Issuing authority shall also be deary spelt out.
The receipt shall be security printed water mark paper carrying such hologram as
may be specified by the concerned State.

Note:(ii) In respect of articulated vehicle, additional information of trailer not
required.

28. In Form 47 of the said rules, the following Note shall be Inserted, namely:-

"Note: This Form shall be security printed water-mark paper and shall carry such hologram
emblem, as may be specified by the State Government.".

[F No RT-11036/38/2000-MVL1

ALOK RAWAT. Jl. Secy.

Note:- The principle rules were notified yjd£ GSR 590(E) dated 2nd June, 1989 and
were last amended yjdfi GSR 242 (E) dated 28* March, 2002.

Primed by the Manager, Govl of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapun, New Delhi-] 10064
.ind Published by the Controller of Publications. Pclhi-110054.




