et e S TEP-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

ShT
Che Gazette of India

EXTRAORDINARY e 1 'f_kj_‘}_t\t f,,\
. h —

W [[— W78 3—3T~AVE (i) . \,‘3" "

PART II—Scction 3—Sub-scction (i) - %Ul/\,p k4
. \ 4
g |/ e L '(”7\ T,

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY Ca thr SRR
|, 251] g ﬁ:wﬁ PeAR, 11{31 zoosz}'aw 1924

No. 251] NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, MAY 31, 2002/JYAISTHA 10, 1924

TG, gitae=t 3 TRt e

S
¢ feeed), 31 W8, 2002
WL 400(3). — %R Hrewar fram, 1989 ®1 3R Wil 01 % o i el 1 ey Few i,
1988 (1988 T 59) i ¥R 212 Tl ITUR (1) F STIHTTHR W TN & TG i@ 3 gommt e @ Afergen .
L F 31( 1) Ak 15 WEd, 2002 F wfi i o, fre 5 o el | fress s vt v # s o,
I AR 1, Foraeht e 2 Tovd= &t Wi, o o st wemfoa 1 78 o, Suetey 0 5 e o, Yot feq =t arafy
¥ vfax s o e | T 8
SR 3 OIS WY WA 16 ITAQ, 2002 I F SYEET FI G M o
3R 3o wrew Pt % day d, S @ e s o g e A A e o e
IT: 3, R TTRR, Iokd STHTTAT Y ¥R 27, 64, 1103ﬁ1137mmmﬁmﬁwwﬂmmﬁﬁﬁmﬂ2mmﬁm
1989 =1 AR T T ¥ fery Fetferfor fray st &, et —
1. (1) A Fremi e i A h=a W am (dvew weee) fem 2002, ®
(2) AfEm = o o 5 et o sregen Tl 51 o ven & o ® 599en Sifaw s 1 ailra =) wae B
2. FY A 9E, 1989 % (o 5o vod yeum 3w e e e ) w2 ¥ @w (91) % wwen, fefatan
Fa:eenfm i s, stufy

) et we!! ® sfufrm w5 2w swaRn (27) § 9itafia v H w6 O Ao sfita 3, for stfeeean
feme ifw 45 forciisierea & stfusn 1 B offt afE sad affe for T 0 € /M S5 9 s|m 50 T+ o
tfvem = e,

) Ywert ww 2" @ afufm a2 s (27) H ufeaite vy A 6 o ecastam sfyaa ¥ feae
stferrere femme 1ifa 45 freitetewsar # stfish €1 oiT oft sod afdf S o Ty &1 ot 9! $erT & 50 |
o A e e,

1765 G1/2002 (1)



=]

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [ParT II—S8EC. 3 (i)]

(2) vt un' @ il R I g % v % forg wga w9 e ur afd) aren sear s £

(3) "Wt uE 1" o nfiE ofr 3 W % e % e g e Hiewa sifin & ffed wers ) die 3 orfaft
3173 | 7Ty | ¥ | ‘

(®) "'vartaw 2" w9l s T % e 3 e s e Hieram srfisi & fra e w0 dte 3 sifvfor
1 B sfirm € w1 o foremr sifirme wom wie =7 @ stfer T 1

(%) "wertwA 3" & i ofi 3R T A et 3 T g W witeram sifini # fred smers w1 we ¥ wrfafo
118 ¥ Rt T #f o fawem ot srftrny oo o= =7 & srfimm )

(m) "yl A" | e % e & ferg TR Q%W 9R uiEal W Hew i ¥
(a) ‘wert @ 1" @ AT ¥ e ¥ forg W Qe Arewad s & forr atfirpm oo 3.5 =T @ aAfum et

(w) “'‘wart w2 @ A & Awa % fore e Y wream s & R sifemas w9 3.5 @9 @ arfir € fig
12 749 saferes Tt ¥ 1 -

(%) ot w37 R e 3 e A Ty v G Riewam it & fver i w12 <@ st

() "= wrE ¥ uE g arfuda & W s vosrr w0 e e Frefi we Y e ¥, i wnfies e W
gt g R o9 Aren N # ol e aen fag % wfimme omé wa ait-7816 faftdwl &, 49 wg-wwa W wifin feg g,
peard o

3. S T3l % famm 10 % s (0) |, ' I | A, B g HieE, e e @ vRE At gewr ! e
F o W e e e 7@ |

4. I Pl % g 16 Foufmr (2) A AR W fee it =eH oTwi Wil e % forg e % e
W' eftfes e o T e fRe W e st e w0 % fae v @ e

5. 3 Forami % fomm 32 % AR A, —

(%) FIE3FEHIRY(3)F " IR T FeE W D e e @
(@) FAE 6 H A WY (3) ¥ A e e & v W we w9y e W@ S,

(M) wAE g H AR (3) § ' ww e v wvn’ wesl ¥ ey ue R € wyn! e W@ s |

6. S Trs 3 e ag H, 'y 23 F TRweenT yHOT ! ree) ofR o7 % T W' WY 23 W WEd 23 HH
o sy ! It TR o TR A Y TR wITE g it fear o, wRE, sie oAt otaR T ST |

7. Sad Fre & Fraw 87 o6t W & feom 8 Frfafen oiqe o o i wnfa Re wimgm, stufy:—

i A T R WA 4, 5, 6,7, 8, 9 R 10 H Sfeafan et weiew 3 faw @ e g o e o ¥
R Wl WS & fern o wyn w sifrfem wie ) wew v wm et

8. I Praei & fororm 83 % wufmm (2) % =ym Fr=fefon wn smem, stk :—

“(2) e e wETOTT Ee wE ar AR faren s A weieh Wit N Wed 23 W ogee faRE s A
Ife SRR T T R, WeRR 1 # A o e Tod R TR S A e, At w2, & wor ¥ ordi wd gy e
47 A STIE TR ST | o Wiferhr < e Srest e ¥, WA uren o U8 w0 A T & Terg i W g ot arad
Qerer TS WL T o Ut T WA o wrh e R g w9 @ i v for W Y g 1 s des T g
fafafée fam ! |

TR o R A I gy W g i wRe i S8 Wi g, srifi o v, it s a6 nfien
I o w ¥

TR e W e TR gt = i e R gk e H wmere s Sy st e (frea wes) fram, 2002
& TR T TRIS W BT A6 T 39 T8 g J S



[ U7 3(i) ] YA 5T U979 ATHYRM 3

9. 3= Frdf % fraw 87 % sufrea (2) % wm w Freafafen @ owem, sefg -

“(2) e FereTm gEmeR T S 9 e st & o v wifte o wed 23% ¥ s e snem
It TR T TN CETE TR R W A S T g I w0 A1 R, i w6, % w9 & o el gu TRy
47 F S feran ST | AT IR i W T STe SO ¥, STF/IR U ) T W wr % ey o e
AT GO THIE W 0T A9 At Tt SR e Wik eRnron w i w9 & g e o w O e g o S T
o fafafts fenam” (=

T A T o T & e o e e wew wde e Wit g srif e wd, S st oo w e
TH WS

Wy e ot T TR e et e w @ fka we e Fet w5 swE St Hiew (de weiee) e,
2002 % WREY Y MAW B TE AH WA I T FuedT F S|

10. I5a Firrdt % e 88 % I9Fm (4) & wvam Frerfafen sienf fwa s, seby —

s, i e wet HE T gRfa w5y & gk € oit 3w W Y@ gdmm g i 1@ wiEe # s w0
AT U JCFR A1 W e sifvane fafafie ')

W A Tor T T e et e @ i et |k e o Sy e Heam (e dme) Fraw, 2002
¥F Y ) A A BT 4 WA SqF qF W | S

1. mﬁaﬁﬁvﬁm%ﬁwﬁm(s)#mﬁmﬁaﬁmwﬁmﬁmmﬁwﬁmmﬁh:—

“(6) wra T fafafs A ofR sy A (Y SR RH) F G H e W o, ufg A s A g F
Tafaaii % srhafian staQreTa i stat 6 2, Sy, $AemEel ik f ve o v F aftafem €, w Fram % ondim oft
TR foh o T

vy Fy=fefea wat & qu e smom—
(1) Faam 126 A Fafdee attem sfimo e genstt % wfa Fe & 2o s YR oiR i W & are d oo wee
w1
(2) ST ¥ Ry T ST GRI A g Rt g s e 126 F P wten st g st
%WWMW;
(3) TR (1) 3R (2) % %9 arnfa Al ¥ @ gu Tga Wew el A o orge R e
12. St Tt 3 Tt 96 % Ty FreAferfaa frem ot zenfim formm omm, svafq :—

“9em 3w TIfT FY WY o79eG —Iw g Y Wi ¥ fag Freatafan oite wiem o srgeer e e,
ST —

(%) Wl w1 ) T, s wE : 11852-2001 % T 3 F Femraitsifi i ergy, wifw e wiem 120 faeirde i der
1 e T W Yo FART A H a A % fevme wt syt iy % 80 Wi i =R €, fwa
S

(@) vy fedg srbamt frefefan g3 % smEr e, i —
™ < 0.1V + (V2/130)
i T e feera e | ¥
A farmirdrevafa 52§ wla wie ¥ ot frepr e Th < 500 HE E

R T S w5 A (A de) Fram, 2001 3 wvoe ek ardie 4 @0 e 6w e - owo
SR T & T R ¥ v o Tee @ 6 R srpifen il w12 W qvRe e g



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [ParT II—SEc. 3 ()]
13. I el & Frm 98 § Sufem (3) % o X Frafafas sufres wen s, stafg :—

“(3) fafafia W& faafiral R Srafon =i =& @ gen #, W anfee, stea ot mgdl ok o 3wt 4 fi=
it e AT T 1 SHEd, 2003 SR SEE IR § 99 9% SE-90Y W et Wi d g o T
11948-1998 ¥ STTET EIT, St ek Top et st o1é ww fafdw srfemgfe - # fg sman”

14, 351 T % F1am 101 & safm (2) F ¢ fofeal” wrsdl @ e 1 e of ¢ g et ) wHTE g9
A W wm W fafen e s, sl -

"1 I, 2003 SR TEE vy fafafia frofed, Sewmfe ot s A mid @ fre gt de e §
o fifs @A @it &, fiie SR aTefi ST TS ST, S WS T e wyif Prevfafen A srfet
e F STTET qF B 919 qF T AT A g0 % At fafty sifugfim T frr e € 7

(1) vt @ 1% A o § U e T 019/2001

(2) 3= =rH i <@ H, TIATE TH 011/2001

15. 3k Frm & ﬁmwsﬁamﬁwmr@m, i 1 —

**108. WA, AT A1 e AR N ITER

(1) ¢ oft Hiet A= I A RS A1 AR A 9 o= 0 mmﬁm
R 39 Frem & 3ey,—

(i) o w1 ST Ty @,

(ii) TR ge, A frst faon o g1 wai¥m =t St ¥ an 2o e o o g, T 98 ol s
e & e ardeiaes TEet T Iy fi wem Al 9 W SwaEn fe R

(iii) =enfearfa F=ta TR T ToF TR gRI, T w9 R AR st =il w1 S s amen 92 9
(iv) A R AT H fow yge @A o T Rue e el fees e w5 A e @

(v) Torgn wrew @ fire & aren 9, A aea =t wiyd wm oz @ sifue @ oi S A guen wiwrm Y@ sv
wred e gen ¥ faed Jert o yefe w0 9 via

(vi) i3 = e e e ey e v e
(vii) % FQ 9T YGH TS TN

- (viii) iy Rt ¥ wft A A Whrm S <o TEd O STl W yE e @ R o e e oe;
(2) AT R A L FITET T TR B ST Tt srauifia i sifergform ffe smem

(3) 2veEe & TUH R wfew o Wea et amge = svdm 7 o szﬁmﬁﬁnﬁmémﬁ
e Hfir S S o e W ST FA R FHIR T

(4) g o, ﬁaﬁrma@mwmﬁﬁﬁq w9 Y oI g ge W fag wmﬁmﬁmﬁr{
fafafée w9 @ Toa wni g faffEe foran smom;

(5) T TR, T SRl g STAT RRT S O 9 % 99 W oSl e W TN T B R W 9RA %
T H yeia T iR 3R qemnt W i e E, e, 52(37) arRg 11 e, 2002 F - safvEm (2) &R
GUE (T) s A Heifea U9 TR g ST 1 78 Afgesi & veyd s wn @ giem s

(6) Tw g | 16 I U SafE) W A€ & @ |, gen frofy, mmﬁa@zwmﬂﬁmmeﬁt
I A AT D THT S|



[ v I—@aws 3(i) ] T FT 99N @ AT 5
16. I Pl & Py 115 A—
(97) Tafam (2) & T (%) AR TS (W) F WM ) Frefafer o @ g, i —
(= 2 afeg iR firafru amt | fir= el ¥ fag o, —
(1) wfm dferm fa (qor <t oft), dger; =
(i) wfifen wrpfren e (5w s, de),
¥ wert ¥, Frewrd ot ofY, (i ATrES) SteetA we, s & SER 3.0 S & offues et e,
() & &t B ufew i Rrafe =i 3 femg i—
(i) " =it A g (wE b s, S
(i) Wi wepfrr fa (& @ o, ),
¥ et €, Frehrd ©F oft, (e WiemreTe) Tt W, A % AR 4.5 whvem § stfues T e
(=) gufrm (10) ®,—

(i) "= wfieen v Rrafiea vid & el wron o &, 32 @ S et et % Re ! saeitd 3 s feogont F oiftm
¥ % wyamy PreAfeafom sinwenfa fifa s, st —

! et e @ g o il 2 frafeel 3 femg fare oree e w1, 2 W Y 3 et 3 forg @y

B

TR g fafrtn g Y w1 e w0 ® e 30 ¥R e WMo sy wEd e ¥ fag 3w aiea w
HTER fohes o W & o FT AR g sifuswfim # oy

(1) "4 e SrEAEEe T v e wm 2§ e, S ami & oy (Re sirfa @ ik fRrafirn
Wi ) Tuvid & eredig feom | oiftm Y gremr Preferfam ofwwnfa faran o, st i —

" roemefem T § g B el of AW il & forg R srgee Srmsi W12 = wa Y Frefaten
T

HaN =1, 7@+ TN T~ 1.0; TTH = 1.2

R A fafmta g e w1 e w0 % fT 30 WO e Hiet % oy T whar % g s v w
FTER famreg o T & o R g erfireefm ot g

"Ry AE iR e I STeiy sifueer B W W TR @ o 9 B 99Em vy g o
17. 33 Fremi & Prag 118 % 3afrm (1) # VPR aen! v # e W aow R IRe T e |
18, S Frml & e 119 & 3wfmm (1) A Frefafen e stmwenfim foman o, et . —

Yy 1 IRTEd, 2003 B BT T ST FEA-ERG GO Hen i T oA T 01472001 fafEw % v w@ W
T 9w Py et T s B meuE fafy sifvrgfen e e g g

19. 3o Pl & frm 123 Fefafen oy oimwenftm o wmam, syaf :—

WA 1 I, 2003 R flrg o eed we-wwa Woquranifie o UE : 14495-1998 Myl g w ww
i € v e iR st wee gl & mewr fafet = srfugfe e e e g

20. 3= Pl % Frem 124 9 SuRmm (1) % gyemt Pty sufres stawefn fran omam, eyet —

“(1%) 1 S, 2003 | ¥ g B TR SR # A SRem gfi o A oriad. ofR A ared e giw i
AT ST HA: 31 TH : 14812-2000 Fafrdw ofR amd wm 14682-1999 fafr ® sgER 9 wEE-TEA WA
mm]ﬁ.rﬁln



6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAURDINARY [PArT IT-—8EC. 3 (i)]

21. 3 st % Fram 125 §,—

(=) sabmEm (1 %) ¥ cam R Prefafen v smem, s —

(1 ) v A et it fafrtm, weies Hiet am o A At w6 o e At we wded o) st % fag e
#oz T

‘i el A A dve e ol A dve GRSt ¥ fafrte e w omé wE: 005-2000 9l T o wE:
015-2000 fafire % ¥ Tog-woa v Evife fey o % STy 7 e w1 o e i et vl wre s e
srfirgfas weff = Ry om -

T A% S iR 1 ST, 2002 IR TwE TY=R A arl # St fee TEEEe o St aee TeENT 005-2000
st g amé w@: 015-2000 fafrdy & arqEa @i’

(o) sufire (2) ® Frafafon gigs s enfa fwem e, svafy . —

‘g 1 WY, 2003 | 6 e v for PP o ware oTded e @ e T 001-2001 ST ST ww: 002-2001
g fafafee artemstt It wrg-weg v deifin it omd 2 sty 1 ek B ST e i et wda wren s fafrbe
st T w

(1) zafram (4) ¥ oy frovfinfer sta: wenfim i s, st —

“5. 1 I, 2003 W i SER TveAm Worl U 1 9w @e w e of fefrdy, s den oi ¥ Wiea
(TR ST % BIgET) T Y U : 016-2000 fafrdell %, ¥ wwe-wwm 1 i fRT o, e weE ore i e
fis et srafra wreR = fafrdet o srfergfa et won )

22. 3% Trawl & faam 126  Frafafom g o wenf fea wmem, sty . —

i ¥t Preveil 3 rarer 3 P el 3 e sTgrre iR s A e T - s g T e
TH ; 017-2000 3 ATER BT (" |

23, 3= Fradi ¥ fraw 126% ¥ Prerfafes oigs o wnftm g g, ersfy . —

" v B g TTe e TreE % fawea fig o A e SR s afiod W e (v # Rt v
T amrifirr) weerd F Fpeht it v ww A w5 omafy F 250 | wH ¥ UR s aree ol s wfteat it swerr e
¥ el W Y amervEERm T ¥ wft wenfeafy 3w fafmto a strarmmat gro Rt o st e o swd ofemt § |
T W T TE T TR 90w g o ¥

o 7% iR for w0 T § e fafafy st smifn aree ofR swd oftet w5 v v @ sfien € olkoal wes
st \reE iR Suis ufed T o § we a5 i e erafy # 250 @ W # w wle s R TTee @ e
et & ¥ et T et U w4 g U od W e w1

24, v=a P 4 frew 138 % 3afrm (4) ¥ @S () W Fretafen iy o wafie far s, sty . —

a0y 1 T, 2ooaﬂ%aﬂtmﬂﬁmfhﬁﬁﬂﬁwﬁcﬁﬁmﬁm iR fafidy gug-wag W AR
TSI UT : 022-2001 & fafafde fafide & aa w orgecy ¥17 @ e fi e vt a0 fefde srfugfem et 4%
fegwm 'y

gy 7"
[P 16(2) ¥¥]
et sigafa w1 T (AfRfesem wid fe)
e Pritaor <ior
T R 1L L T
s ST



[ T I1--1vg 3(1) ] M ohT [T SRR 7

i mTﬂﬂTﬁ ﬂﬁﬂTﬂU (TTTﬂ'(!) """"""""""""" (‘qm_-qv‘f) ................................ seerrsrsasnatarann
H1- FHT- WTEH TR EE ST I TA gy ooveeeemmmmmessmnnenns
STl UReh % TRmER ShUSTET Fram @ Ay e

ferwm « qran fafirfed 4 forg I o fiw sty greimm 3 forg vty efn toa sl gro srefta % ghew frdao W=
# Ity farar o 1

Prreferfer faffieat orgefta & whftm T Rl 510 w1 ¥ T WP R I9Efim = g
25. 390 frdl % wey 7 % v W Frafefon v wn e, dgi -

g 7"
[Fremr 16(2) _H]
e ST w1 vy (RfnfeseE we fwern)
ghew frttor o
R L 1 R
WUTE
S Y
Ww,aﬂ%(ﬂ'(qﬁ'ﬂ'ﬁ) ......................... wm,ﬂu%(qﬁm) ........................
QI eeveres oo i (TR omeresseenessssnees e A RO (v )
gﬂ/ﬁm—ﬁ’-\- 'E'ﬂ' ..................................................
......................... () oeerreenssseosssns (Rl T AT oo (O )
T ('«‘ﬁf‘qﬂ) .........................
] ﬁlﬁl ('ﬂTﬁ'@) ......................... (TITFI) ......................... (ﬂ) .........................
ot s 3 ferePrr =t 3 A A A forg Wi
TR G T cesvees oottt commmmsmaratse s sttt
i '\?TR:T zm-?{ -qﬁ- m-a-g (-m—a—@ ......................... (-qm) ......................... (zm‘) .........................
h_m .........................
T W TR w Bﬂ'{ AR U= i‘ﬁm .........................

Wﬁw%mmﬁ?wﬁmﬁwm .........................



8 o THEGAZETTE_QF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

_ [ParrII—S5c 3 ()]

fereqm - e Pafirfierl & wren fiw Sfrvan el ¥ forg svdy e T wopR T srTwia % gies fram S A Re
ST | 1S i 3 en Hr8 frt gr # % 7o am s an s w gfia w et

et GRT ity i
Heftrr T wEwR sTgaia o viE g vesty WA o feafafe faffieai sweifn st —

"‘Ji?fmﬁ —q-H mfw -q-rf -‘q; m ....................................................................................................
HAEH T T 'l TRl =0 | g



[ T I 3(i) ] VIR BT TR ¢ STETHICT

wiftsr =t A -

26, I 7ol % wRT 20 F HE WO 4 it sa it wiafes! % gy frefafan o wnfim fra s, sverf . —
"4 (%) TTHY F1 wifle o o YA/t o e dwm

27. 3= Fael & yeq 23 % uyem Prefafen we simwenfi fomm v, averhy —

WY 23%
(Fram 48 2W)
et ST (¥R e | A R w5, onf)
v T i firtamr i T oy el Py
fiear Friar o =t sqrefy

6.1 fomafm = = ok O
6.2 T

6.3 ¥vm

6.4 M % AT

6.5 g =Y e

6.6 el W amwm

6.7 g e

6.12 Tamsll =t wam

6.13 Tt w1 3 (Aefoq)
6.14 Wfaw wEn

6.15 Y A

10. AR A X TSR TH=TH
176561 /c2 -2



10

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[ParT II—S8%c. 3 (i)]

1.
12.
13.
14.
15.
15.1
15.2
15.3
15.4
16.
16.1
16.2
16.3
16.4
16.5
17.
17.1
17.2
1723
17.4
18.
18.1
18.2
19.

20.°

21,

ol g veeta o W fre g
Tora e e
mﬁwm(mwﬁw%gm%aﬁmﬁm)
maﬁmﬁ-@(mf‘e{f‘mqﬁm) (ARG veveeeeee TR oeveeeee =)

st wEToTTs O ot o F wR— (et wah)

TR SHETOTTS Y WA

oY % e (e =)

&#ita aftaes sifumd & fag

T € 3R = =it F fag

AT WHTOTYS WG FT Tl @ (FTG ooeveven TG cveevreen 1)
AT & SN~ (Tt 7ET)

I H W

Fatre/ vt e

THT T THFR

E FF (FTA HE)

qfies 9= & ey o sifaft gem
g 9 9R (fe o /)
Fodiga ¥l Wm



[T —198 3(i) ) Y <1 AST9H ; STEIMRT

11

22.

23.

24,

PERER:

26.

a1d Terd W T

=TT % TR

N WA

srfirper e (e, -, =, -, it - i)
YT (3 HIT)

AT A W AR

T (%0 TS )

spvaroy/FeTa T



12 : THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[ParT II—S8EC. 3 ()]

T
¥ e W w w mlrer (el e TG +oereeiens o0 W)
27. ik wameR 3 T

T 3
28. o7 fown ety v o wm o . —
Hex §om -

foroquy ; (i) W WY TRl fimen W g e EsTt wrd we mTen Wit T W o g O Rt e wen i e
w7 Wt frfumre o Wi s i & T A ST W wen S T R | w i R st wiitme g
T 9 W WM T W | W A A wfbeeit % T e o e w9 @ sfeafon e ae w i g
Hikw otz A, T W YW ErovTT R Sy e g faffie fir o wd)

feoqer ¢ (i) s o i sy ¥ o o srfivfte e sfi e ¥

28. 35 framt wn wwew 47 ¥ frerfiaf w2 i zenfim Rear wrom, st —
" fraqur ; T wee G ik otk A9 RO AR 38 W) QEn sreram g R et o weeR o fiffie fear e

w3, grefrom feng ¥

[ W, 3 2-11036/38/2000-7H =t Y&
ST oY, €Y< e

feroqoy : ot fre W | WL H. 590 () 2 9, 1989 5 mew srfergfen firg e & offt 28 W, 2002 WY WL €. 242 (37)

¥ e Fifrm = @ sl fwg g &)



(o1 11—3% 3(31) ] VTR o] TR ¢ STEYRAW

13

MINISTRY OF ROAD TRANSPORT AND HIGHWAYS
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 3 Ist May, 2002

G.5.R.400(E)— Whereas the draft of certain rules further to amend the Central
Motor Vehicles Rules, 1989, were published as required by sub-section (1) of section
212 of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 (59 of 1988) In the Gazette of India,
Extraordinary, Part-II, Section 3, Sub-sectlon (i), dated the 15" January, 2002 in the
notification of Government of India In the Ministry of Road Transport and Highways,
number G.S.R. 31 (E), dated the 15" January, 2002, inviting objections or
suggestions from all persons likely to be affected thereby within a period of forty five
days from the date on which copies of the Gazette of India, in which the said
notification was published, were made available to the public;

And whereas the coples of the sald Gazette of India were made avallable to
the public on the 16™ January, 2002;

And whereas objections or suggestions received from the public in respect of
the said draft rules have been considered by the Central Government;

Now, therefore, in exerclse of the powers conferred by sections 27, 64, 110
and 137 of the said Act, the Central Government hereby makes the following rules
further to amend the Central Motor Vehicles Rules, 1989, namely:-

1. (1) These rules may be called the Central Motor Vehicles(Third Amendment)
Rules, 2002.

(2)They shall come Into force on the date of their final publication In the Official
Gazette, unless otherwise specified in these rules.

2. the Central Motor Vehicles Rules, 1989 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules),
inrule 2, after clause (h), the following shall be inserted, namely:-
'(i)  “"Category L1" means a motor cycle as defined in sub-section (27) of
section 2 of the Act, with maximum design speed not exceeding 45
km/hour and engine capacity not exceeding 50 cc, if fitted with a
thermic engine.

() "Category L2" means a motor cycle as defined In sub-section (27) of
section 2 of the Act, with maximum design speed exceeding 45
km/hour and engine capacity exceeding 50 cc, if fitted with a thermic
engine;

(k)  “Category M” means a motor vehicle with at least four wheels used for
the carriage of passengers and their luggage;



14

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA - EXTRAQRDINARY [ParT II—8rc. 3(1)]

(D  “Category M1” means a motor vehicle used for the carriage of
passengers and their luggage and comprising no more than eight seats
in addition to the driver’s seat;

(m) “Category M2” means a motor vehicle used for the carriage of
passengers and their luggage and comprising more than elght seats in
addition to the driver's seat and having a maximum mass not
exceeding 5 tonnes;

(n) “Category M3” means a motor vehicle used for the carriage of
passengers and their luggage and comprising more than eight seats in
addition to the driver's seat and having a maximum mass exceeding 5
tonnes;

(o) “Category N” means a motor vehicle with at least four wheels used for
the carrlage of goods;

(p) “Category N1” means a motor vehicle used for the carriage of goods
and having a maximum mass not exceeding 3.5 tonnes;

(@) “Category N2” means a motor vehicle used for the carrlage of goods
and having a maximum mass exceeding 3.5 tonnes but not exceeding
12 tonnes;

(r) “Category N3” means a motor vehicle used for the carriage of goods
and having a maximum mass exceeding 12 tonnes;

(s) “Smart Card” means a device capable of storing data and executing
commands, which is a single chip microprocessor, mounted on a plastic
card and the dimensions of the card and chip are as specified in ISO-
7816 specifications, as may be amended from time to time;

In rule 10 of the said rules, it clause (d), for the words "medium goods
vehicle, a medium passenger motor vehicle, a heavy goods vehicle, or
a heavy passenger motor vehicle”, the words “transport vehicle” shall
be substituted.

In rule 16 of the said rules, in sub-rule (2), for the words “for the issue of a
laminated card type driving licence, such card type driving licence”, the words
“for the Issue of a laminated card type or Smart Card type driving licence,
such card type or Smart card type driving licence, as may be specified in the
Notification issued by the concerned State Government or Union Territory
Administration,” shall be substituted.

In rule 32 of the said rules, In the Table,-
(a)against Serial No.3, In column(3), for the words “One hundred and fifty
rupees”, the words “Two hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(b)agalnst Serlal No.6, In column(3), for the words “Thirty rupees”, the words
“fifty rupees shall be substituted;



[y [1—aE 3(i)] NI T TS ; ST

15

(c)against Serial No. 8, in column (3), for the words “One hundred and fifty
rupees”, the words “Two hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

In rule 48 of the said rules, for the words and figures “certificate of
registration In Form 23", the words, figures and letter “certificate of
registration in Form 23 or Form 23A, as may be specified In the Notification
Issued by the concerned State Government or Union Territory Administration,”
shall be substituted.

In rule 81 of the sald rules, in the Table, in the Note, the following proviso
shall be inserted at the end, namely:-

“Provided that in case for any purpose referred to in Serial Nos. 4, 5, 6, 7, 8,
9 and 10 of this Table is Issued on any Smart Card, an additional amount of
fee of Rupees two hundred shall be charged for each such card.”.

In rule 83 of the said rules, for sub-rule (2), the following shall be substituted,
namely:-

“(2) Every authorization shall be granted in Form 23A, in case the certificate
of registration is issued on Smart Card or shall be granted in Form 47, In case
the authorization is in paper document mode subject to the payment of taxes
or fees, if any, levied by the concerned State. The authority which grants the
authorization shall issue to the permit holder separate receipts for such taxes
or fees In respect of each bank draft and such receipts shall be security
printed water-mark paper carrying such hologram as may be specified by the
concerned State/Union Territory:

Provided that the Bank Drafts recelved in respect of taxes or fees shall
invarlably be forwarded by the authority which grants the authorisation to the
respective States;

Provided also that the use of such security printed water-mark paper carrying
such hologram shall come Into force on or before six months from the date of
commencement of the Central Motor Vehicles (Third Amendment) Rules,
2002",

In rule 87 of the said rules, for sub-rule (2), the following shall be
substituted, namely: -

“(2) Every authorization shall be granted in Form 23A,in case the certificate of
registration is issued on Smart Card or shall be granted in Form 47, in case
the authorization Is in paper document mode, subject to the payment of taxes
or fees, if any, levied by the concerned State. The authority which grants the
authorlzation shall issue to the permit holder separate recelpts for such taxes
or fees in respect of each bank draft and such receipts shall be security
printed water-mark paper carrying such hologram as may be specified by the
concerned State/union Territory:

Provided that the Bank Drafts received in respect of taxes or fees shall
invariably be forwarded by the authority who grants the authorisation to the
respective States;



16

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [Parr U—Src. 31)]

10.

11,

12.

Provided also that the use of such security printed water-mark paper carrying
such hologram shall come into force on or before six months from the date of
the Central Motor Vehicles (Third Amendment) Rules, 2002”,

In rule 88 of the said rules, after sub-rule (4), the following shall be inserted,
namely:

“(5) A national permit shall be in such security printed water-mark paper and
shall carry such hologram as the State Government or the State Transport
Authority, as the case may be, Issuing such permit, may specify:

Provided that the use of such security printed water-mark paper carrying
such hologram shall come into force on or before six months from the date of
commencement of the Central Motor Vehicles (Third Amendment) Rules,
2002".

In rule 95 of the sald rules, after sub-rule (5), the following sub-rule shall be
inserted, namely:-

“(6) In the case of Indian manufactured vehicles and imported vehicles (new
and old), the sizes of tyres if included in the International Standards namely,
ECE, JATMA, ETRTO and T&RA besides Bureau of Indian Standards may also
be accepted under this rule:

Provided that the following conditions shall be complied with.

(i) that testing agencies referrred to in rule 126 shall satisfy themselves
about the load and speed rating of the tyre with reference to the Indian
conditions;

(i) that the test report/certificate issued by the testing agency of the
country of origin shall be verifled for acceptance by the testing agency
referred to in rule 126;

() that for tubeless tyres fitted on imported vehicles confirming to
conditions (i) and (i) shall also be allowed.”.

After rule 96 of the sald rules, the following rule shall be inserted, namely;

"96A. High Speed Braking Requirements.- For high speed braking, the
following test procedure shall be followed, namely:-,

(@) In the case of Category M1, the P type, service brake test as
defined under 15:11852-2001 - Part 3, shall be carried out in the engine
connected mode at a test speed of 120 km/h or at 80% of the design
maximum speed of the vehicle, whichever is lower.

(b)the stopping distance requirements shall be according to the following
formula, namely:-



(um =375 3(1)] WA R T9TTT : STHIYR

S < 0.1V +(V¥/130):

where, S is the Stopping Distance in mtrs,
V is the test speed in km/h

and Control force F < 500 Newtons.

Provided that this sub-rule shall be applicable In case of new vehicles yet to
be type approved after six months, and in case of already type approved
vehicles, twelve months, from the date of the commencement of the Central
Motor Vehicle(Third Amendment) Rules, 2002.".

13. In rule 98 of the said rules, for sub-rule(3), the following sub-rule shall be
substituted, namely:-

“(3) On and after 1%t Januaray, 2003, the steering effort of all motor vehicles
other than three wheelers not fitted with steering wheel, motor cycles, invalid
carriages and agricultural tractors manufactured shall conform to the Indian
Standard 15:11948-1999, as amended from time.

14. In rule 101 of the said rules, in sub-rule (2), for the portion beginning with
words “three wheelers” and ending with the words “wiping system” , the
following shall be substituted, namely:-

"all motor vehicles other than three wheelers,motor cycles and Invalid
carrlages manufactured on and after 1% January, 2003, having a wind screen
shall be fitted with a wind screen wiping system which shall conform to the
requrements laid down in the following standards, as amended from time to
time, till such time the corresponding Bureau of Indian Standards
specifications are notified:

Q) AIS 019/2001, in the case of M1 category of vehicles
(i)  AIS 011/2001, in the case of other vehicles.

15.  For rule 108 of the said rules, the following shall be substituted, namely:-

"108. Use of red, white or blue light.- (1) No motor vehicle shall show a
red light to the front or light other than red to rear:

Provided that the provisions of this rule shall not apply to --
(i) the Internal lighting of the vehicle; or
(i) the amber light, if displayed by any direction indicator or top light or as
top light used on vehicle for operating within the premises like airports,

ports without going outside the said premises on to public roads;

(iii) a vehicle carrying high dignitaries as specified by the Central Government
- or the State Government, as the case may be, from time to time;

1765G(/02—3



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [Pagt II—SEc. 3(i)]

(iv) the blinker type of red light with purple glass fitted to an ambulance van
used for carrying patients; or

(v) to a vehicle having a lamp fitted with an electrical bulb, if the power of
the bulb does not exceed seven watts and the lamp is fitted with frosted
glass or any other material which has the effect of diffusing the light;

(vi) white light illuminating the rear number plate;
(vil) white light used while reversing;

(viii) plough light provided in agricultural tractors of illuminating the
implement's working area on the ground in agricultural field operations.

(2) Use of blue light with flasher shall be determined and notifled by the State
Governments at thelr discretion;

(3) Use of blue light with or without flasher shall be permitted as top light on
vehicles escorting high dignitaries entitled to the use of red light;

(4) Use of muilti-coloured red, blue and white light shall be permitted only on
vehicles specifically designated for emergency duties and shall be specifically
specified by State Governments;

(5) The State Government shall Inform the Central Government regarding
publication of notifications issued by the concerned State Government under sub-
rule (2) and under clause (e) of the Notification No. 5.0. 52 (E) dated 11% January,
2002, published In the Gazette of India, Ministry of Road Transport and Highways,
regarding use of red light on top of vehicle being used by dignitaries;

(6) In case vehicle is not carrying dignitaries, red or blue light, as the case may
be, light shall not be used and be covered by black cover.".

16. In rule 115 of the sald rules,

(A) in sub-rule (2), for clauses (a) and (b), the following clauses shall be
substituted, namely:-

*(a) Idling CO (Carbon Monoxide) emission limit for all vehicles other than
two wheelers and three wheelers operating on-

(i) Uquified Petroleum Gas (LPG), Petrol; or
(i) Compressed Natural Gas (CNG), Petrol,

shall not exceed 3.0 per cent by volume;

(b) Idling CO (Carbon Monoxide) emisslon limit for all two wheeler and three
wheeler vehicles operating on-

(i) Liquified Petroleum Gas (LPG), Petrol; or
(i) Compressed Natural Gas (CNG), Petrol,

shall not exceed 4.5 per cent by volume;”



[ T—@7s 3(1)] I T TS ;. ST

19

(B) in sub-rule (10),

(i) under heading “A. FOR PETROL DRIVEN VEHICLES”, in the Table under heading
2-wheelers and 3-wheelers”, in Notes, after last paragraph, the following shall be
inserted, namely:-

"For 2-wheelers and 3-wheelers fitted with catalytic converter, a deterioration factor
of 1.2 on Type Approval limits, will be applicable for durability:

Provided that the Vehicle manufacturers may opt for an ageing test of 30, 000 Kms
for evaluating deterioration factor, as per procedure that may be laid down by the
Central Government;"

(i) under heading “B. FOR DIESEL VEHICLES (INCLUDING TWO AND THREE
WHEELERS)” IN PARA II. under heading "Or Chassis Dynamometer Test”, in Notes,
after last paragraph, the following shall be inserted, namely:-

"For 2-wheelers and 3-wheelers fitted with catalytic converter, the deterioration
factor shall be as follows:

CO=11 HC+NOx=10, PM=12:

Provided that the Vehicle manufacturers may opt for an ageing test of 30,000 kms
for evaluating deterioration factor, as per procedure that may be laild down by the
Central Government;

Provided further that the above provisions shall come into force after six months
from the publication of the notification.”

17. In rule 118 of the said rules, in sub-rule (1), for the words “the Central
Government”, the words “the State Government” shall be substituted.

18. . In rule 119 of the said rules, In sub-rule (1), the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:-

“Provided that on and from 1% January, 2003, the horn Installation
requirements shall be as per AIS-014/2001 specifications, as may be
amended from time to time, till such time as corresponding Bureau of Indian
Standards specifications are notified.”.

19. Inrule 123 of the said rules, the following proviso shall be Inserted, namely:-

“Provided that on and from 1% January, 2003, the plllion hand holds shall be
governed by I1S:14495-1998 specifications, as may be amended from time to
time."

20. In rule 124 of the said rules, after sub-rule (1), the following sub-rule shall
be inserted, namely:-

“(1A) On and from 1% January, 2003, the general requirements of vehicle rear
under run protecting device and the technical requirements of vehicle lateral



20 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [Pakr II—SEc. 3(1)]

protection side shall be as per IS: 14812-2000 specifications and as per 15:14682-
1999, respectively, as may be amended from time to time." '

21. Inrule 125 of the said rules,--
(a)  for sub-rule (1A), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(1A) The manufacturer of every motor vehicle of M1 category shall equip
every motor vehicle with a seat belt for a person occupying the front facing
rear seat:

Provided that the specifications of Safety Belt Assemblies and Safety Belt
Anchorages in motor vehicles shall conform to AIS:005-2000 and AIS:015-
2000 specifications, respectively, as may be amended from time to time, till
such time as corresponding Bureau of Indian Standards specifications are
notified:

Provided further that on and after 1% October, 2002 the specification of Safety
Belt Assemblles and Safety Belt Anchorages in motor vehicles shall conform to
AIS:005-2000 and AIS:015-2000 specifications, respectively.”

(b)  in sub-rule (2), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided that on and from 1% January, 2003 the rear view mirror
specifications and installation requirements shall be as specified by AIS:001-
2001 and AIS:002-2001 respectively, as may be amended from time to time,
till such time as corresponding Bureau of Indian Standards specifications are
notified.”. ‘

(c) after sub-rule (4), the following shall be inserted, namely:-

"(5) On and after 1% January, 2003, the size and specfications on seats, their
Anchorages and Head Restraints (excluding luggage retention) on M1 vehicle
category shall conform to AIS:016-2000 specifications, as may be amended
from time to time, till such time as corresponding Bureau of Indian Standards
specifications are notified."

22.  In rule 126 of the sald rules, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Prbvided that the procedure for type approval and certification of motor
vehicles for compliance Yo these rules shall be in accordance with the AIS:
017- 2000, as amended from time to time.”

23. In rule 126A of the said rules, the following provisos shall be inserted,
namely:-

“Provided that in case the number of vehicles sold in India for a given
base model and its variants (manufactured in India or imported to India)
are less than 250 in any consecutive period of six months in a year, then
such base model and its variants need not be subjected to the above test,
if at least one model or its variants manufactured or imported by that
manufacturer or importer, as the case may be, is subjected to such tests
at least once in a year;



[T [[—37E 3(1) ] WITA T TTTH ;. STETHROT 21

Provided further that, in case the number of base models and Its variants
manufactured / imported is more than one and if the individual base model
and its variants are less than 250 in any consecutive period of six months in a
year, then the testing agencies can pick up one of the vehicles ‘out of such
models and their variants once In a year for carrying out such test".

24. Inrule 138 of the said rules, in sub-rule(4), in clause (c ), the following proviso
shall be inserted, namely:

“Provided that In case of vehicles manufactured on and after 1% January,
2003, the triangles of size and specification shall conform to AIS:022-
2001, as may be amended from time to time, till such time as
corresponding Bureau of Indian Standards specifications are notified.”.
25. For Form 7 of the said rules, the following Form shall be substituted, namely:-

"FORM 7
(See Rule 16 (2)]

FORM FOR DRIVING LICENCE (LAMINATED / SMART CARD TYPE)

VISUAL INSPECTION ZONE

Driving Licence NO.......c...cccccvvvrns

Date of IssU€........oooovmeeeeeii i,

Photograph
Valid Till (Non Transport)......cereniinnne. Valid Till (Transport).........ccevvveeen...
Name.............. (Surname).............. (given name)........... (middle name)...............
Son/Daughter/Wife of........ccoviviiiiinniniiinnnnnn.
(surname) .......cccceenes (given name).....coeevueee (middle name)...............
ADAress (CUITENT). .. vuveeiri i et r i e re s s eans s entn e rennnssenbannss
Date of Birth.......c....c.ceeinn. (date)............ (month).............. (Year)......cceevverivnnens

Authorisation to drive the following vehicle class throughout India
i. Class of vehicle s i e e
il Issue Date (dd-MM-YYYY )i cirriiiiieiiin cirrrriierreires cersnseeersneeeennn.



22

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

Blood Group and Rh Factor of the Driver

Specimen Signature/thumb impresslon of the licence holder.........cccocevvviiiinninnnnn.

Signature of the Issuing AUthority.......ccccinm
Identification of Issuing Authority....cooeovviiccveiiiin e,
Note: The provision for security features like the ghost image and /or the hologram
would be provided in the Visual Inspection Zone of the Licence by the concerned
State Government. Card Serial Number will be printed by card manufacturer on the
back side upper left corner of the card.

Ma Read ne

The concerned State Governments will provide the following features In the licence,
in Machine Readable Zone.

Chip Serial Number........ooooeinveniiniiinnen.
Driving Licence NO.....ccccorinn e,

Date Of ISSURC..cvvereeenriririernennrnnrnsrnssrseenseemsares

(SUrname) ....cccovveeeen. (given name)........coues (middle name)..............
Date of Blrth(dd-mm-yyyy)......coouvrmmimiiiinmii

Class Of VENICIE ceeeiiiivrrrrreis srereesriienne snresiir b e
Respective Date Of  .ociiiiieriiins v s
Issue

Short Name Of the coiiiees errrrviisiiines utsrressnnrrens s
Authority Conducted Driving
Test for Respective Class of Vehicle as above

Designation 0f the e i i
Auhority Conducted Driving
Test for Respective Class of Vehicle as above

Identification of Issuing AUthOrity......cceeiiiiii

[Part II—Ske, 3(1)]



L [—717s 3(i) ] _ AR 31 TR« STAT

23

Endorsment Details (Provision will be made to accommodate the details of 10
Endorsements with following details)

Endorsement/Challan NUMDET........ccovi it et ee s raa e e
Endorsement/Challan Date  ...viiiceii ittt

Disqualification Period From (dd-mm-yyyy)....coooviieiiriiniimni i e

Disqualification Period To  (dd-Mmm-yyyy)...cccccoiviverircnniiminniiinnnnnnnn, reeeenes
Settlement/Review Date  (dd=-mm-yyyy)....coooeeeeiiiriiiii e ennianne
Settlement/Review Authority ID ......cccet i e

Badge Details

26.

27.

Badge Number

Valid Till
Authorisation Number
Authorisation Date"

In Form 20 of the said rules, after item number 4 and entries relating thereto,
the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“4(a). The annual income and PAN / GIR number of the owner.”.
After Form 23 of the said rules, the following Form shall be inserted, namely:-
"FORM 23-A

[See rule 48]

CERTIFICATE OR REGISTRATION (IN ELECTRONIC MEDIUM AS SMART CARD, ETC)

Particulars to be printed on the Visual Inspection Zone of Smart Card:

Contents of Visug| Inspection Zope

Certificate of Registration

Name of State Transport Department
Card Serial Number

Vehicle Registration Number
Prnistration Date (In dd-mm-yyyy)

Owner's Details:-



24

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

[Pt ll-—&r_‘_?(l)_[

10.

11.

12.

13.

14,

15.

5.1 Name
5.2  Son/Wife/Daughter of
5.3  Address: Current Postal Address

Vehicle's Details:-

6.1 Name of Manufacturer with Make
6.2 Colour

6.3 Fuel

6.4 Vehicle Class

6.5 Body Type

6.6 Seating Capacity

6.7 Standing Capacity

6.8 Date of Manufacture (In mm-yyyy)
6.9 Unladen Weight

6.10 Cubic Capacity

6.11 Wheel Base

6.12 Number of Cylinders

6.13 Owner Serial (Optional)

6.14 Chassis Number

6.15 Engine Number

Tax Paid Upto (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Registration Validity (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Signature of Issuing Authority

Identification of Issuing Authority
Contents of Machine Readable Zone

Chlip Serial Number
Owner Serial (No. of this the ownership has changed)
Tax Date (Date of Validity of Tax): dd-mm-yyyy

Registration Validity (In dd-mm-yyyy)

‘Hypothecation Details:-

15.1 Name of Financer

15.2 Address of Financer

15.3 Hypothecated From (In dd-mm-yyyy)
15.4 Hypothecated Upto (In dd-mm-yyyy)



[ ST [1—vS 3(1)] A T TTS ;. STHTERT

16.  NOC Details:- (Future Use)

16.1 NOC Number

16.2 State To (Code Only)

16.3 RTO To

16.4 NCRB Clearance Number

16.5 NOC Issue Date (In dd-mm-yyyy)

17.  Insurance Details:- (Future Use)

17.1 Name of Company

17.2 Covernote/Policy Number
17.3 Type of Insurance

17.4 Validity Upto (In dd-mm-yyyy)

18.  Pollution Under Control Details:- (Future Use)

18.1 Checking Centre (Code only)
18.2 Validity Upto (In dd-mm-yyyy)

19. Tax Payment Details:-

Amount

Fine

Exemption/Receipt Number
Payment Date (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Valid From  (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Valid Upto  (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Exemption (Y/N)

20.  Fitness Details:-

Validity (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Inspecting Officer
Location

21.  Additional Information in respect of Transport Vehicle:-

Gross Vehicle Weight (In Kgs.)
Number, Description and Size of Tyres
Registered Axle Weight

Number of Semi Trailers

22, Challan Details:-

Challan Number

Accused Person (O-Owner, D-Driver, C-Conductor)
Section (Code Only)

Challaning Officer

Location

17656102~ 4



26

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[Part II—S8Ec. 3(i)]

23,

24,

25.

26.

27.

Date & Time (In dd-mm-yyyy/hh:mm)
Disposing Authority (R-RTO, C-Court)
Disposal Date (In dd-mm-yy)

Penalty

Receipt Number

Permit Details:-

Pemit Number

Type of Permit

Validity From (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Validity Upto (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Area of Operation

Route From

Route Upto

Stage 1

Stage 2

Stage 3.

Permit Actions:-

Action Code SUR/SUS/CAN
From Date (In dd-mm-yyyy)

Upto Date (In dd-mm-yyyy)

Reason

All India Tourist Permit Details:-

From Date (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Upto Date (In dd-mm-yyyy)

Authorization Details:-

State (Code Only)

Authorization Number

Validity From (In dd-mm-yyyy)

Validity Upto (In dd-mm-yyyy)

Bank Draft Amount

Bank Draft Number

Bank (Code Only)

Branch

Bank Draft Issue Date (In dd-mm-yyyy)

Counter Signature Details:-

Authorizing Office

Validity From (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Validity Upto (In dd-mm-yyyy)
Route From

Route Upto

Stage 1

Stage 2

Stage 3



[ 11--@7% 3(i) ] YA W IS 0 HEYRT 27

28. In case of Auto Rikshaw/Local Taxles:-
Meter Number

Note: (i) At the time of payment of next instalment of tax, the issuing autority
shall Issue a paper receipt stating that date of validty of tax paid has been
extended from so & so date to so & so date. The receipt shall be duly signed
by designated authority. Name of Issuing authority shall also be cleary spelt out.
The receipt shall be security printed water mark paper carrying such hologram as
may be specified by the concerned State.

Note:(ii) In respect of articulated vehicle, additional information of trailer not
required.
28.  In Form 47 of the said rules, the following Note shall be Inserted, namely:-

“Note: This Form shall be security printed water-mark paper and shall carry such hologram
emblem, as may be specified by the State Government.”.

[F No RT-11036/38/2000-MVL]

ALOK RAWAT. Jt. Secy.

Note:- The principle rules were notified vide GSR 590(E) dated 2" June, 1989 and
were last amended vide GSR 242 (E) dated 28™ March, 2002.

Printed by the Manager, Govt of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapun, New Delhi-110064
and  Published by the Controller of Dlublications. 1I¢lhi-110054.






