T |, S1.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

Y.5M.-8).0e.-31.-18122020-223776
CG-DL-E-18122020-223776

ETITIOT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT | |—E7e 3—=7-97% (i)
PART I1—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

TR & THTIT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 642] 7% faeett, AT, fREw=T 18, 2020/3M I8 27, 1942
No. 642] NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, DECEMBER 18, 2020/AGRAHAYANA 27, 1942
FIAIRE FA HATAL

% feeety, 18 fewwaw, 2020

ALFLF. 774(30).—F<0T G, FOAT Afa=aw, 2013 (2013 F7 18) T &1 469 F AT If5d
T 149 FRT Y& oThAl T TART F2d gu, Fa1 (et it Fafe & sgan) [Faw, 2014 77 &
LT FXA gq MAfad =aq Fat 8, -

1. (1) = Rt #7 |@ferg am Fu«r (et i FgRe o7 sgar) 9i=at gengs 7=, 2020 21
(2) T TSI ek THTAH shl ATLE T T gl
2. #uer (et &t AgRE v srgan) =w, 2014 % {97 6 #,
(F) sS9-FaT (4) F.-
() “& UF T Teal F T UL “F <A a0 orex Tiaearioq fohu ST,
(i) T ST THY TqF w1 9T, el w&igs @ S, 69iq -

‘i g T TRt =TS FT AiAeTeT YEordT T-gedied Tt ST FAT Suterd Agl
ZT ATE I STET 9o H (O ATH F THIAIA Hl a0 & F 19 a1 Al At aF qar
&1 2l,-

6177 G1/2020 1)




2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(F) TTET 9% § A9 AT & GHTEAAT H aE F [Iee 0@r IE TEghiT #1HE F ' 7§
Referiad & & & srrar fee | w13 67 &, 30 —

(F) FHEZ ATASAH HIAT; TET

(@) TH FUS TTT AAAT I ATAF T T AITISAT T ATAT FATG AT HoeT;
HAIAT

(1) THRET AT Tl UFE ST AT 9 § gHag e ot ST 9 oved & g9y |
ot FaTe e F7 9297 ST gl 3T UH 9aeT 1T # AT are &7 AfFames
TATHIT FHIAT F AT FISH T TEET gl 32T

() 2 Tferas | TiaT oTIar U9 Afga® Al daq ISl T@d ard Ad & age
T e e srera

(¥) #W= F AT T T i el & atafaem & e ateq arforSas Gramsa w3
AT Fitatess A, st

(@) FEANE FTF TAT A9aT & AT STqaT AT 3T IUNT HATAT AT IR AN TH
A ITH AT | L9 S0aT ST FUT & AqqdTT § o FRANe [ATeT srrar T
fafert steram steier AET & Haterd ATl S G HId H A9,

(M) AT R AAET JE @ aRaE ReE §9F J9ar adg SH7 [AAEmEE 7 @
STTEEReoT SroraT dere fAfer fEfaamae sfiv B wiesor § qeg agmiees oT9ar a9 F9< &
FATHAT ¥, ¥ Fare et srorar seargfa et sraar st @t & watera qaraar wr
AT e T AT

g Ig T o o wigE H Ha9q o a9 r AATe i ST 6 AT T UHT st
Sreres <1 =< ° &7 AT &1 | AT FAIT TTaT FEANe MR o247 gitafas At § v g awg §
3o SToraT @ T FIHE 6 &9 | Hd 697 21, IH TF &l F14 % &9 # {7 S0,

(@) TSRO H, 7S (@) H, “A1S TA9qq” &l & T 9T, “TATE Taerd” o768 T AT |
[T, &. 8/4/2018-8U=-1, TTE-1]
. . o, g, 9 9=

feroqur : o 9= 9T & TSI, STETE, AN, @2-3, 39T (i) § ATeRET SeArs a1.F .M. 259(3)
A 31 AT, 2014 FIRT TR 70 T0 o 7 2890 Afeeg=aT qedqi ar.#1.4. 589(3) are
28 e, 2020 T sifaw gerrege far = =m

MINISTRY OF CORPORATE AFFAIRS
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 18th December, 2020

G.S.R. 774(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 149 read with section 469 of the
Companies Act, 2013 (18 of 2013), the Central Government hereby makes the following rules further to
amend the Companies (Appointment and Qualification of Directors) Rules, 2014, namely:-

1. (1) These rules may be called the Companies (Appointment and Qualification of Directors) Fifth
Amendment Rules, 2020.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.



[¢TRT Hl—=ve 3(i)] T T TSI © T 3

2. Inthe Companies (Appointment and Qualification of Directors) Rules, 2014, in rule 6,-
(@) insub-rule (4),-
(i) for the words “one year from” the words “two years from” shall be substituted;
(ii) for the first and second proviso, the following provisos shall be substituted, namely :-

“Provided that an individual shall not be required to pass the online proficiency
self-assessment test when he has served for a total period of not less than three years as on
the date of inclusion of his name in the data bank,-

(A) as a director or key managerial personnel, as on the date of inclusion of his name in the
databank, in one or more of the following, namely:-

(@) listed public company; or
(b) unlisted public company having a paid-up share capital of rupees ten crore or more; or

(c) body corporate listed on any recognized stock exchange or in a country which is a member
State of the Financial Action Task Force on Money Laundering and the regulator of the
securities market in such member State is a member of the International Organization of
Securities Commissions; or

(d) bodies corporate incorporated outside India having a paid-up share capital of US$ 2 million
or more; or

(e) statutory corporations set up under an Act of Parliament or any State Legislature carrying
on commercial activities; or

(B) in the pay scale of Director or above in the Ministry of Corporate Affairs or the Ministry of
Finance or Ministry of Commerce and Industry or the Ministry of Heavy Industries and Public
Enterprises and having experience in handling the matters relating to corporate laws or securities
laws or economic laws; or

(C) inthe pay scale of Chief General Manager or above in the Securities and Exchange Board or the
Reserve Bank of India or the Insurance Regulatory and Development Authority of India or the
Pension Fund Regulatory and Development Authority and having experience in handling the
matters relating to corporate laws or securities laws or economic laws :

Provided further that for the purpose of calculation of the period of three years referred to
in the first proviso, any period during which an individual was acting as a director or as a key
managerial personnel in two or more companies or bodies corporate or statutory corporations at
the same time shall be counted only once.”;

(b) in the Explanation, in item (b), for the words “sixty percent”, the words “fifty percent” shall be
substituted.

[F. No. 8/4/2018-CL-I- Part I]
K.V.R. MURTY, Jt. Secy.

Note : The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part Il, Section 3,
Sub-section (i) vide notification number G.S.R. 259(E), dated the 31* March, 2014 and were last
amended vide notification number G.S.R. 589 (E), dated the 28™ September, 2020.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi- 110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.  wanoskums i




		2020-12-18T23:01:28+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




