T €. S1.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

TY.SM.-21.TeA.-31.-07092020-221594
CG-DL-E-07092020-221594

ETETIT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT | —E1e 3—39-97< (i)
PART Il1—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

IR & THIfAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 442] T2 fIeelY, TrraTe, R 7, 2020/+Ts 16, 1942
No. 442] NEW DELHI, MONDAY, SEPTEMBER 7, 2020/BHADRA 16, 1942

FTTIRE F HATAH

EICERE]

T2 foeett, 7 fawaw, 2020

ar.&1.17. 548(37).—F < AT, FOAT srfarfaw, 2013 (2013 T 18) Fir &1 469 FT ST
(1) 3T STLRT (2) & AT I(5q & 73 T T& ARAT T TN Fd T AT 5d 5 & 911
TR e AT (AT T T i) R, 2014 § &iw gerrae w27 gq Fuferiag e aard g,
AT~
1. (1) =7 =T &7 FferT AT FOAT (SHTAT F¥ T i) Ferree =, 2020 2

(2) T FRTw TSTOT H THF THT9 T AR F TG g
2. FHOAT (SHTST T TAF) FEw, 2014 (B9 =899 0 78Tq S Fa9 #F=r T g), Faw 2 H,
U (1) ¥, @2 (1) ¥, 3T (xvii) ¥,-
(i) “OT=r T Teal F foTT “a A" oreq T SATUT;
(i) TTERTor ®, g |, ‘st A oY "@9de Famn, arftsT siv 39T #AreT gy
T FT..180(31) arE 17 ®¥at, 20167 &AL, i, FIFH AT el & {77 “SNT [T A
FITITE {49 foramT g ST an.#1.19.127(31) ari@ 19 w2a<r, 2019 &A%, 3, FHIYF AT 958 @
ST

4134 G1/2020 @)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1—SEC. 3(i)]

3. <6 Rt #, 9w 3 #, 3u-Faw (3) #, B3 s H, @< (i) §, ‘97 U Mal & o I9q
T 9Tex T STUA|

[T.5.1/8/2013-FHUe1.V F=iue V]
.31, qId, 9k araa

feroqor ; gor A | . e 256(31) e 31 979, 2014 T W & TS99 STETETT, 9T 1,
@< 3, ITET (i) H THIT U o e sifaw o< |eitee sfag=er dear ar.#1.. 341(37)
e 30 78, 2019 g =T 1T

MINISTRY OF CORPORATE AFFAIRS
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 7th September, 2020

G.S.R. 548 (E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 73 read with sub-sections (1)
and (2) of section 469 of the Companies Act, 2013 (18 of 2013), the Central Government in consultation with the
Reserve Bank of India, hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Companies (Acceptance of
Deposits) Rules, 2014, namely:-

1. (1) These rules may be called the Companies (Acceptance of Deposits) Amendment Rules, 2020.
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Companies (Acceptance of Deposits) Rules, 2014 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules), in rule 2,
in sub-rule (1), in clause (c), in sub-clause (xvii), -

(i) for the words “five years”, the words “ ten years” shall be substituted,

(i) in the Explanation, in clause I, for the letters, figures, brackets and words “G.S.R. 180 (E) dated 17th
February, 2016 issued by the Department of Industrial Policy and Promotion, Ministry of Commerce and
Industry”, the letters, figures, brackets and words “G.S.R. 127 (E), dated the 19th February, 2019 issued by the
Department for Promotion of Industry and Internal Trade  shall be substituted.

3. In the said rules, in rule 3, in sub-rule (3), in the second proviso, in clause (i), for the words “five years”,
the words, “ten years” shall be substituted.

[F. No. 1/8/2013- CL-V Vol VI]
K.V.R. MURTY, Jt. Secy.

Note. - The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part Il, Section 3, Sub-section
(i) vide number G.S.R. 256(E), dated the 31% March, 2014 and were last amended vide notification
number G.S.R. 341(E), dated the 30" April, 2019.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi- 110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. e ™"




		2020-09-07T22:33:34+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




