
5116 GI/2020 (1) 

रजिस्ट्री स.ं डी.एल.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99 

  
 

 

xxxGIDHxxx 
xxxGIDExxx 

असाधारण  

EXTRAORDINARY 

भाग II—खण् ड 3—उप-खण् ड (ii)  

PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (ii) 

प्राजधकार स ेप्रकाजित 

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

 

पयाावरण, वन और िलवाय ुपररवतान मंत्रालय 

अजधसचूना 

नई दिल्ली, 20 अक् तूबर, 2020 

—dasnzh; ljdkj] rRdkyhu i;kZoj.k vkSj ou ea=ky;] i;kZoj.k ¼laj{k.k½ vf/kfu;e] 

1986 dh /kkjk ¼3½ dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ vkSj mi/kkjk ¼2½ ds [kaM ¼V½ ds v/khu bldks iznRr “kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx djrs 

gq, rRdkyhu i;kZoj.k vkSj ou ea=ky; esa vuqlwph ds izoxZ ^d* ds varxZr vkus okys fo’k;ksa ds fy, dsUnzh; 

ljdkj esa i;kZoj.k vkSj ou ea=ky; ls vkSj mDr vuqlwph ds izoxZ ^[k* ds varxZr vkus okys fo’k;ksa ds fy, jkT; 

Lrj ij] jkT; i;kZoj.k lek?kkr fu/kkZj.k izkf/kdj.k ls iwoZ i;kZoj.kh; vukifRr vkKkid cukrs gq, dk-vk- 

1533¼v½ rkjh[k 14 flracj] 2006 ds }kjk i;kZoj.kh; lek?kkr fu/kkZj.k vf/klwpuk] 2006 ¼blesa blds i'pkr~ bZ 

vkbZ , vf/klwpuk] 2006 dgk x;k gS½ izdkf“kr fd;k gS( 

 vkSj i;kZoj.k ¼laj{k.k½ vf/kfu;e] 1986 dh /kkjk 3 dh mi/kkjk ¼3½ ds varxZr dsanzh; ljdkj }kjk jkT; 

i;kZoj.k lek?kkr fu/kkZj.k izkf/kj.k vkSj jkT; Lrj fo“ks’kK vkadyu lfefr;ka xfBr dh tk,axh ftldk rhu o’kZ 

ds fu;r dk;Z vof/k gksxhA 

 vkSj i;kZoj.k] ou vkSj tyok;q ifjorZu ea=ky; dks izoxZ ^^[k** izLrkoksa ds varxZr fo’k;ksa ds fuckZ/k 

O;kSgkj ds fy, egkekjh dksfoM 19 tSlh dfri; fLFkfr esa jkT; i;kZoj.k lek?kkr fu/kkZj.k izkf/kdj.k vkSj jkT; 

Lrj fo“ks’kK vkadyu lfefr;ksa dk rhu o’kZ ds i'pkr~ dk;Z vof/k ds foLrkj ds fy, vH;kosnu izkIr gq, gS( 

 vkSj] dsanzh; ljdkj vkiokfnd ifjfLFkfr;ksa esa ekStwnk jkT; i;kZoj.k lek?kkr fu/kkZj.k izkf/kdj.k vkSj 

jkT; Lrj fo“ks’kK vkadyu lfefr;ksa ds vof/k esa foLrkj djuk vko“;d le>k gS( 

 vr% vc] dsUnzh; ljdkj] i;kZoj.k ¼laj{k.k½ fu;e] 1986 ds fu;e 5 ds mifu;e ¼4½ ds lkFk ifBr  

i;kZoj.k ¼laj{k.k½ vf/kfu;e] 1986 ¼1986 dk 29½ dh /kkjk 3 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ vkSj mi/kkjk ¼2½ ds [kaM ¼V½ }kjk 

iznRr “kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx djrs gq,] yksd fgr esa] mDr fu;eksa ds fu;e 5 ds mifu;e ¼3½ ds [kaM ¼d½ ds v/khu 

स.ं  3325] नई दिल्ली, बृहस्ट् पजतवार, अक् तबूर 22, 2020/आज‍ वन 30, 1942  

No.  3325] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, OCTOBER 22, 2020/ASVINA  30, 1942  

सी.जी.-डी.एल.-अ.-23102020-222661
CG-DL-E-23102020-222661



2  THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY    [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)] 

lwpuk dh vis{kk ls vfHkeqfDr ds i“pkr~] bl bZ vkbZ , vf/klwpuk] 2006 esa fuEufyf[kr vkSj la“kks/ku djrh gS] 

vFkkZr %& 

mDr vf/klwpuk esa]& 

¼i½ iSjk 3 esa] mi&iSjk ¼6½ es] ijarqd esa] “kCnksa esa ^^Ng eghus** ds LFkku ij] ^^ckjg eghus** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 

 ¼ii½ iSjk 5 esa] mi&iSjk ¼x½ es] ijarqd esa] “kCn esa ^^Ng eghus** ds LFkku ij] ^^ckjg eghus** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 

¼ii½ ifjf“k’V VI esa] en 7 esa] ijarqd esa] “kCn esa ^^Ng eghus** ds LFkku ij] ^^ckjg eghus** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 

[फा. सं.  II(I)] 

vjfoan dqekj ukSfV;ky] la;qDr lfpo 

 ewy vf/klwpuk Hkkjr ds jkti=] vlk/kkj.k] Hkkx II, [k.M 3] mi [k.M ¼ii½ esa dk-vk- 1533 ¼v½ rkjh[k 

14 flracj] 2006 }kjk izdkf“kr dh xbZ Fkh vkSj rRi“pkr~ rkjh[k  15 vDrwcj] 2020 ds dk-vk- 3636 ¼v½ }kjk 

bls vafre ckj la“kksf/kr fd;k x;k FkkA 

 

MINISTRY OF ENVIRONMENT, FOREST AND CLIMATE CHANGE 

 NOTIFICATION 

New Delhi, the 20th October, 2020 

S.O. 3752(E).—WHEREAS, the Central Government in the erstwhile Ministry of Environment 

and Forests, in exercise of its powers under sub-section (1) and clause (v) of sub-section (2) of section (3) 

of the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 has published the Environment Impact Assessment Notification, 

2006 (hereinafter referred to as the said notification) vide number S.O.1533 (E), dated the 14th September, 

2006, mandating prior Environmental Clearance from the Central Government in the Ministry of 

Environment and Forests for matters falling under Category „A‟ in the Schedule and at State level the State 

Environment Impact Assessment Authority for matters falling under Category „B‟ in the said Schedule; 

AND WHEREAS, the State Environment Impact Assessment Authority and State Level Expert 

Appraisal Committees shall be constituted by the Central Government under sub-section (3) of section 3 of 

the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 for a fixed term of three years; 

AND WHEREAS, the Ministry of Environment, Forest and Climate Change is in the receipt of 

representations for extension of tenure of the State Environment Impact Assessment Authority and State 

Level Expert Appraisal Committees, beyond three years in certain situation like pandemic COVID 19, for 

uninterrupted dealing the matters under Category “B” proposals; 

AND WHEREAS, the Central Government deems it necessary to extend the tenure of the existing 

State Environment Impact Assessment Authority and State Level Expert Appraisal Committees, in 

exceptional circumstances; 

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) and clause (v) of sub-section 

(2) of section 3 of the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 (29 of 1986), read with sub-rule (4) of rule 5 of 

the Environment (Protection) Rules, 1986, the Central Government after having dispensed with the 

requirement of notice under clause (a) of sub-rule (3) of rule 5 of the said rules, in public interest, hereby 

makes the following further amendments in the EIA Notification, 2006, namely:- 

In the said notification, - 

(i) in paragraph 3, in sub-paragraph (6), in the proviso, for the words “six months”, the words 

“twelve months” shall be substituted. 



[भाग II—खण् ड 3(ii)] भारत का रािपत्र : असाधारण 3 

 

(ii) in paragraph 5, in sub-paragraph (c), in the proviso, for the words “six months”, the words 

“twelve months” shall be substituted. 

(iii) in the APPENDIX VI, in item 7, in the proviso, for the words “six months”, the words “twelve 

months” shall be substituted. 

[F. No. J-11013/30/2007-IA. II(I)] 

ARVIND KUMAR NAUTIYAL, Jt. Secy. 

 

Note: The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, 

Section 3, Sub-section (ii), vide number S.O. 1533 (E), dated the 14th September, 2006 and was last 

amended vide notification number S.O. 3636(E), dated the 15th October, 2020. 

 

अजधसचूना 

नई दिल्ली, 22 अक् तूबर, 2020 

 —dsUnzh; ljdkj ds i;kZoj.k ¼laj{k.k½ vf/kfu;e 1986 ¼1986 dk 29½ dh /kkjk 3 dh 

mi&/kkjk ¼3½ }kjk iznRr “kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx djrs gq, vkSj Hkkjr ljdkj ds rRdkyhu] i;kZoj.k vkSj ou ea=ky; 

dh vf/klwpuk la[;k dk-vk- 1533¼v½ rkjh[k 14 flrEcj] 2006 ds vuqlj.k esa] Hkkjr ds jkti=] vlk/kkj.k] Hkkx 

II] [k.M 3] mi [k.M ¼ii½ esa rkjh[k 17 ekpZ] 2017 ds dk-vk- 850¼v½ }kjk izdkf“kr i;kZoj.k] ou vkSj tyok;q 

ifjorZu ea=ky;] Hkkjr ljdkj dh vf/klwpuk esa fuEufyf[kr la“kks/ku djrh gS] vFkkZr~% 

mDr vf/klwpuk esa] 

 

¼i½ iSjk 2 d es] vad] v{kj vkSj “kCn ^^16 flrEcj 2020** ds LFkku ij vad] v{kj vkSj “kCn ^^16 ekpZ 2021 

;k u, izkf/kdj.k ds xBu rd] egkjk’Vª] tks Hkh igys gks** j[ksa tk,axs A  

 

¼ii½ iSjk 8 d es] vad] v{kj vkSj “kCn ^^16 flrEcj 2020** ds LFkku ij vad] v{kj vkSj “kCn ^^16 ekpZ 2021 

;k u, jkT; Lrjh; fo'ks’kK vkadyu lfefr;ksa] egkjk’Vª ds xBu rd tks Hkh igys gks** j[kas tk,axs A  

[फा. सं. ts&11013@30@2007-vkbZ,& II(I)] 

vjfoan ukSfV;ky]la;qDr lfpo 

 

 ewy vf/klwpuk Hkkjr ds jkti=] vlk/kkj.k] Hkkx II, [k.M 3] mi [k.M ¼ii½ esa dk-vk- 850 ¼v½ rkjh[k 17 

ekpZ] 2017 }kjk izdkf“kr dh xbZ Fkh vkSj rRi“pkr~ rkjh[k 12 ekpZ] 2017 ds dk-vk- 4040 ¼v½ rFkk rkjh[k 8 

twu] 2020 ds dk-vk- 1788¼v½ }kjk bls la“kksf/kr fd;k x;k FkkA   

 

स्‍पष्‍टीकारक‍  ^^16 ekpZ] 2021** ds :i esa ^^16 ekpZ] 2021** dks izfrLFkkfir djds iSjk 2d vkSj iSjk 8d esa 

la“kks/ku djds] fdlh Hkh O;fDr ds fgr ij izfrdwy izHkko ugha iMs+xkA   

 

NOTIFICATION 

New Delhi, the 22nd October, 2020 

S.O. 3753(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (3) of section 3 of the Environment 

(Protection)  Act, 1986 (29 of 1986) and in pursuance of the notification of the Government of India in the erstwhile 

Ministry of Environment and Forests, number S.O. 1533(E), dated the 14th September, 2006, the Central Government 

hereby makes the following further amendments in the notification of the Government of India in the Ministry of 

Environment, Forest and Climate Change, published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, section 3, sub-

section (ii), vide number S.O. 850(E), dated the 17th March, 2017, namely:- 

 

 



4  THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY    [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)] 

In the said notification, -  

(i) in paragraph 2A, for the figures, letters and word “16th September, 2020”, the figures, letters and word “16th 

March, 2021 or till the constitution of new Authority, Maharashtra, whichever is earlier.”, shall be 

substituted. 

(ii) in paragraph 8A, for the figures, letters and word “16th September, 2020”, the figures, letters and word “16th 

March, 2021 or till the constitution of new SEACs, Maharashtra, whichever is earlier.”, shall be substituted. 

[F.No. J-11013/30/2007-IA.II(I)] 

ARVIND NAUTIYAL, Jt. Secy. 

Note:- The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section 

(ii), vide number S.O. 850 (E), dated the 17th March, 2017 and subsequently amended vide number S.O. 4040(E), 

dated the 12th December, 2017 and vide number S.O. 1788(E), dated the 8th June, 2020.    

Explanatory Memorandum: By making amendments in paragraph 2A and paragraph 8A by substituting “16th 

September, 2020” as the “16th March, 2021”, the interest of no person shall be adversely affected. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064 

and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. 


		2020-10-23T12:35:08+0530
	SURENDER MAHADASAM




