
<Rt & $.uwr.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99 

JISiu4d 
Che Gazette of India 

Hr.3f.-3rTe.-37.-23102020-222661 
CG-DL-E-23102020-222661 

F|TETT 

EXTRAORDINARY 

T [—GvE 3—J9-TUE (i) 
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (ii) 

TR &y 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

. 3325] 7% Reeft, qEeafiam, srqEw 22, 2020/50fRaw 30, 1942 
No. 3325] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, OCTOBER 22, 2020/ASVINA 30, 1942 

warterr, a9 i SraaTy afads A 

7% faeeft, 20 s, 2020 

BN 3752().—DE VPR, Thleld GATERY AR a7 Fa1er, gafaRer (wRemwr) s, 

1986 B HIRT (3) BT SUERT (1) iR SUERT (2) & Ws (V) & A 30! aed WAkl &1 GANT H=el 
BU ThTel TAfaReT ofR 99 e H OggAl & U F @ i o arel vt & forw s 
WRHR F G AR a9 FA § AR Iad JgA b U @ B AR o arel vt & fo <o 
TR W, [T QR AT FERoT oo @ qd waiaRoiE oFaicd ofeye 9T §U BT 
1533(27) TR 14 fcdaR, 2006 & ERT gAfReNT FHEG uRr SfgEen, 2006 (599 569G UwE § 
A T IR, 2006 BT TAT B) HHI fHam & 

IR gaAfaRoT (WReToT) I, 1986 W ORT 3 B ISUURT (3) & fHIT HAlT WRBR ERT I 
TATERYT FATET FERer gitRer iR Ied wR s aiwer wfifor wfed w1 e s 79 ad 
& Faa Frl eafy Brf | 

SR afaRer, 99 AR Seary uRedd #Are™d @1 ga w0 uwdEl @ ofdid fawdr & ety 
@ABR & U ABMR Difas 19 S Higa Reafer # rsa wafaRer gavem FaRe wft@er ok 1o 
R fems onmerd wffEl & i af @ vErg e oy @ fawaR & forg enareT uTe gU R 

AR, B WHR uarfes aRRfaE # HiEr s wafeRer FaEE faRer mfieRer ok 
T WR R iide |fRfoRll & oy # AR HRAT sTavad wHe 8, 

AT IE, DRI WRGHR, TAEReT (Axew) g9, 1986 & AW 5 & Sutd (4) & @rer ufed 

qafaRoT (WReTeT) A, 1986 (1986 T 29) B TRT 3 HI SU—EIRT (1) I’R IULRT (2) & @s (V) &R 
e ARl 61 TN @R §Y, e f2d #, S FREr & a5 & sufad (3) & @ (@) & o 

5116 GI)2020 (1)



z 1HE UALELLE UF INUIA | EALKAUKUINAK Y LFART L—DEC. 3111)] 

A BT AU ANY(RT B gvEd, 39 3 oS U SAEREEA, 2006 H FreAfeiad ofk wulleE vl &, 
e — 

S AT H— 

0] W1 3 #, SR (6) A, WS ¥, ¥l § B8 AN’ & W R, "IRE Aol IR I MG | 

(i) W75 H SURT (M) A, WIS A, TR A VS WM D W R, IRE qSH A= W A | 

(i) wRRme VI H w2 74 w=ge A 9= § B8 9N @ WN R, "IRE Ao A& W AN | 

[, & ®—11013 / 30 / 2007 3T 11(1)] 

aRfde AR HAifeara, vy afa 

feaor: gt AT 9Ra & o=, sramERer, 9 |, @ve 3, Su wvs (i) 7 @rem 1533 (3) AR 

14 AR, 2006 FRT THIRG @I T2 off R TUTAN ARG 15 SFHRER, 2020 & HLAATL 3636 (o) BRI 

39 sifcm IR Fefda forar T e 

MINISTRY OF ENVIRONMENT, FOREST AND CLIMATE CHANGE 

NOTIFICATION 

New Delhi, the 20th October, 2020 

S.0. 3752(E).—WHEREAS, the Central Government in the erstwhile Ministry of Environment 

and Forests, in exercise of its powers under sub-section (1) and clause (v) of sub-section (2) of section (3) 

of the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 has published the Environment Impact Assessment Notification, 

2006 (hereinafter referred to as the said notification) vide number S.0.1533 (E), dated the 14th September, 

2006, mandating prior Environmental Clearance from the Central Government in the Ministry of 

Environment and Forests for matters falling under Category ‘A’ in the Schedule and at State level the State 

Environment Impact Assessment Authority for matters falling under Category ‘B’ in the said Schedule; 

AND WHEREAS, the State Environment Impact Assessment Authority and State Level Expert 

Appraisal Committees shall be constituted by the Central Government under sub-section (3) of section 3 of 

the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 for a fixed term of three years; 

AND WHEREAS, the Ministry of Environment, Forest and Climate Change is in the receipt of 

representations for extension of tenure of the State Environment Impact Assessment Authority and State 

Level Expert Appraisal Committees, beyond three years in certain situation like pandemic COVID 19, for 

uninterrupted dealing the matters under Category “B” proposals; 

AND WHEREAS, the Central Government deems it necessary to extend the tenure of the existing 

State Environment Impact Assessment Authority and State Level Expert Appraisal Committees, in 

exceptional circumstances; 

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) and clause (V) of sub-section 

(2) of section 3 of the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 (29 of 1986), read with sub-rule (4) of rule 5 of 

the Environment (Protection) Rules, 1986, the Central Government after having dispensed with the 

requirement of notice under clause (a) of sub-rule (3) of rule 5 of the said rules, in public interest, hereby 

makes the following further amendments in the EIA Notification, 2006, namely:- 

In the said notification, - 

(i) in paragraph 3, in sub-paragraph (6), in the proviso, for the words “six months”, the words 

“twelve months” shall be substituted.



LM L—9vs 5()) HILA DA S > 

(ii) in paragraph 5, in sub-paragraph (c), in the proviso, for the words “six months”, the words 

“twelve months” shall be substituted. 

(iii) in the APPENDIX VI, in item 7, in the proviso, for the words “six months”, the words “twelve 

months” shall be substituted. 

[F. No. J-11013/30/2007-IA. T(1)] 
ARVIND KUMAR NAUTIYAL, Jt. Secy. 

Note: The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, 

Section 3, Sub-section (ii), vide number S.O. 1533 (E), dated the 14th September, 2006 and was last 

amended vide notification number S.O. 3636(E), dated the 15th October, 2020. 

wftrEaT 

% feeft, 22 s, 2020 

BT AT 3753(31)—D=1I TSR & gATIRe (Reror) s 1986 (1986 &7 20) &I aRT 3 HY 
SU-YRT (3) BRI Uac el &1 TN SR U iR R WRBR & deableid, qafaRer 3R a7 Fared 
BT ARG FAT FLAT. 1533(37) TG 14 RITRR, 2006 & IFTAR H, ARA & 919, AR, AT 
Il, @vs 3, I WU (i) ¥ ARII 17 A, 2017 S D1 850(%) ART THINNG TAfaR, a7 AR Saarg 
RET FAICr, R ARBR B AfRge ¥ Frfeiad weler @Rl 8, i 
S AR H, 

0] WI 2 & 3, ofd, =R AR I 16 TR 2020 & I TR e, AeR AR T& 16 AT 2021 
T T AIRIHRT & ST T, HERTS, T Al ggel 81" I QT | 

(ii) IRT 8 & #, o, A¢@R AR I “16 RITFER 2020 & WM W Ad, MR MR Iea 16 A 2021 

AT U Y WA faest o AR, 7ERTE & Mo d@ off «ff usd 81 W S | 

[, . S—11013 /30 / 2007 ST 11(1)] 

Rfde Hifearewgad |faa 

fewor: 91 AfgET 9RA & IS, SR, AN |, WUe 3, IU @S (i) § H1IM. 850 (31) AR 17 
AME, 2017 BRI GG H1 T2 off 3R qeOwaiq IR 12 919, 2017 & HIIM. 4040 (31) TN ARRT 8 
ST, 2020 % HIAT 1788(31) BRI SH WG fpam a7 o) 

TGRS SIU: 16 AT, 20217 & U § “16 A, 20217 BT ARRAIT B U7 2 iR T 8 # 
o B, Bl ol @afed & f&d w ufiager g T8 as 

NOTIFICATION 

New Delhi, the 22nd October, 2020 

S.0. 3753(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (3) of section 3 of the Environment 

(Protection) Act, 1986 (29 of 1986) and in pursuance of the notification of the Government of India in the erstwhile 

Ministry of Environment and Forests, number S.O. 1533(E), dated the 14th September, 2006, the Central Government 

hereby makes the following further amendments in the notification of the Government of India in the Ministry of 

Environment, Forest and Climate Change, published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, section 3, sub- 

section (ii), vide number S.O. 850(E), dated the 17th March, 2017, namely:-



“ 1HE UALELLE UF INUIA | EALKAUKUINAK Y LFART L—DEC. 3111)] 

In the said notification, - 

@) in paragraph 2A, for the figures, letters and word “16th September, 2020™, the figures, letters and word “16th 

March, 2021 or till the constitution of new Authority, Maharashtra, whichever is earlier.”, shall be 

substituted. 

(ii) in paragraph 8A, for the figures, letters and word “16th September, 2020”, the figures, letters and word “16th 

March, 2021 or till the constitution of new SEACs, Maharashtra, whichever is earlier.”, shall be substituted. 

[F.No. J-11013/30/2007-IA.1I(1)] 

ARVIND NAUTIYAL, Jt. Secy. 

Note:- The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section 

(ii), vide number S.O. 850 (E), dated the 17th March, 2017 and subsequently amended vide number S.O. 4040(E), 

dated the 12th December, 2017 and vide number S.O. 1788(E), dated the Sth June, 2020. 

Explanatory Memorandum: By making amendments in paragraph 2A and paragraph 8A by substituting “16th 

September, 2020 as the “16th March, 2021, the interest of no person shall be adversely affected. 

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064 
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.


