el ©. Stoue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

Hr.Sr -3 Ue.-37.-23102020-22266 1
CG-DL-E-23102020-222661

HATYTIoT
EXTRAORDINARY
T [I—9'8 3—39-90% (ii)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (ii)

TTTETT & TahTera
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

¥, 3325] 72 Tieett, gEeafaars, srqeT 22, 2020/snfaw 30, 1942
No. 3325] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, OCTOBER 22, 2020/ASVINA 30, 1942
TATTIT, I ST TAGTY qFeaa= AT

7% Reeft, 20 @, 2020

P13, 3752(3).—DEI EIGR, deblcl= JATIRY R = HATerd, YATaRoT (EReon) A,
1986 DI GRT (3) DI IUYRT (1) IR SUURT (2) & @S (V) B oEfH U Uecq wfdadl T YN &
gU dhleld YARYT &R a9 #Aed H ogEl @ Udd H & ofadid o drel fawat & forw e
WRHR H gAERo] 3R a9 #aTerd ¥ iR Iad A9l & UG @ & Aqid o+ drel fvat o forw s
R R, NS AR g (ReiRer uifgerer @ qd gdiaReiy i sy §9id BU AT
1533(21) IRIG 14 RyAaR, 2006 @ BRT yAERe FATET RO AQG=1, 2006 (3HH 3HG U9
ATS U SAMGEAT, 2006 HET AT &) UHI I (HAT &,

SR gATaRoT (GRefv) AT, 1986 @I ORI 3 & IULRT (3) & AT duld WRBHR ERT Y
UGTaROT FHTETT RERT UfeReT SR Yog wR s sfiderd wiAfaal Tfed &1 SdEl S o ad
& 9d FRd or@fy 8RN |

AR UFRYT, 99 3R Sieldy URads HATel”™ &1 YdR @ gl & ofdid gl & ey
ZBR & oY AEMRI difds 19 Sl Hidug R H 197 ydaReT |HE| FeiRer giigeaRer R 15
wR faems e Afafoat &1 39 9¥ & uvarg a1 oaf & AR & fory eraded uid §u ®:
T TR fA9s oo |fifcdl @ <rafd § AR AT Mavad st B:

AT 3, DHald WRPR, YAERUT (ER&AV) 7949, 1986 & 199 5 & SUMIA (4) & AT uled
TATERYT (GReEI0T) A=A, 1986 (1986 &1 29) &I URT 3 HI IU—RT (1) AR IUART (2) & @ (V) &RT
Y widdl & YART R 8Y, ol & H, Sad Al & M9 5 & Sufvg| (3) & @s (%) & b=

5116 GI/2020 (1)




L 1A agAZRL LD UE INLMA { PALRKAURIJIINARKY | FARL 11I—>3BC. 3(11)]

AT BY AT H AT § gvEd, 39 § A U ARRgE, 2006 # fAEfRed AR HOeT #xel B,
areffd —

S ARG H—

() tR1 3 #H, IU—URT (6) A, s ¥, 3eal H BT HBl' & W©IF W, “IRE Al @ IW ST |

(i) RT5 ¥ SU—IRT (1) H, WIS 4, ¥ H "BF A8 & WM R, GRS A" e G ATG |

(i)  uRBre VI 4 72 7 4, Wqs 4, o< H B8 Ao’ & WM R, "gRe Jal’ I I SN |

[, 7. 5i—11013 /30 / 2007 35 U— 1I(1)]

fewor: e sfdgar ara & o=, srEERer, 9 |, @vs 3, Su wvs (i) # @rem 1533 (@) AR’
14 T¥daR, 2006 BRT UHIEA oI T8 off 2R TUe=d ARG 15 AFJaR, 2020 B HIAT 3636 (31) BRI
39 JAfcH IR \Iea fhar 3 o |

MINISTRY OF ENVIRONMENT, FOREST AND CLIMATE CHANGE

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 20th October, 2020

S.0. 3752(E).—WHEREAS, the Central Government in the erstwhile Ministry of Environment
and Forests, in exercise of its powers under sub-section (1) and clause (v) of sub-section (2) of section (3)
of the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 has published the Environment Impact Assessment Notification,
2006 (hereinafter referred to as the said notification) vide number S.0.1533 (E), dated the 14th September,
2006, mandating prior Environmental Clearance from the Central Govermnment in the Ministry of
Environment and Forests for matters falling under Category ‘A’ in the Schedule and at State level the State
Environment Impact Assessment Authority for matters falling under Category ‘B’ in the said Schedule;

AND WHEREAS, the State Environment Impact Assessment Authority and State Level Expert
Appraisal Committees shall be constituted by the Central Government under sub-section (3) of section 3 of
the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 for a fixed term of three years;

AND WHEREAS, the Ministry of Environment, Forest and Climate Change is in the receipt of
representations for extension of tenure of the State Environment Impact Assessment Authority and State
Level Expert Appraisal Committees, beyond three years in certain situation like pandemic COVID 19, for
uninterrupted dealing the matters under Category “B” proposals;

AND WHEREAS, the Central Government deems it necessary to extend the tenure of the existing

State Environment Impact Assessment Authority and State Level Expert Appraisal Committees, in
exceptional circumstances;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) and clause (v) of sub-section
(2) of section 3 of the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 (29 of 1986), read with sub-rule (4) of rule 5 of
the Environment (Protection) Rules, 1986, the Central Government after having dispensed with the
requirement of notice under clause (a) of sub-rule (3) of rule 5 of the said rules, in public interest, hereby
makes the following further amendments in the EIA Notification, 2006, namely:-

In the said notification, -

(i) in paragraph 3, in sub-paragraph (6), in the proviso, for the words “six months”, the words
“twelve months” shall be substituted.



LHH LI—4YS 5(11)] HILA Tl A=A A S LY 2

(i) in paragraph 5, in sub-paragraph (c), in the proviso, for the words “six months”, the words
“twelve months” shall be substituted.

(iii) in the APPENDIX VI, in item 7, in the proviso, for the words “six months”, the words “twelve
months” shall be substituted.

[F. No. J-11013/30/2007-IA. TI(I)]
ARVIND KUMAR NAUTIYAL, Jt. Secy.

Note: The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II,
Section 3, Sub-section (ii), vide number S.0. 1533 (E), dated the 14th September, 2006 and was last
amended vide notification number S.0. 3636(E), dated the 15th October, 2020.

EIPGEEL
7% Reeft, 22 wFgET, 2020

P1. I 3753(31) —D=1d EBR & YATARY (EReTon) AfeIf-1a9 1986 (1986 I 29) Dl ORI 3 DI
SU—4RT (3) BRI Uacd AfGIAT BT TR B BU AR 9RA ARBR D debleio, GATERT AR a1 HATCT
D1 SO HEAT BT 1533(3) TRIG 14 THTHR, 2006 & ATERY H, HIRA & (o0, FARIRCT, AT
I, @vs 3, TU WUE (i) H ARG 17 A€, 2017 & HI37. 850(31) ERT DI UFERY, a- iR oy
TR HATC, ARG ERBR @l AFfaga= H fFrferiad e sl &, s

ST ARG H,

() IRT 2 & H, 3, AR IR Ieg 16 RITHER 2020 & WIH TR 2Ad, &R AR I “16 A1 2021
T AT UIEHROT & TS b, BRI, S ¥l Ugel 81" I WG |

(ii) IRT 8 & #, 3, ARR 3R g 16 HdRR 2020 & WM WX 3fdh, MR AR Ied “16 A 2021
AT AU I WX fq9NE efided Afffidl, AERG & Ted dd Sl ¥l gl 817 @ S |
[T, 7. 511013 /30 / 2007 350~ I(1)]

fewor: o1 AfSgaT ART & U, F[ER, 9 ||, ©og 3, IU @oe (i) H wram 850 (1) ANRG 17
AT, 2017 &R YHIPE HI T3 ol R TUeard dRG 12 AT, 2017 & HIAL 4040 (1) 9T IR 8
ST, 2020 @ BIAT 1788(31) BRT $H HIMAT fhaT TAT o7 |

WSPRP SIMUE: 16 A1, 20217 & ©U H 16 A, 2021”7 b Gfeenfid &xa U1 26 iR ORT 8% &
HIEA b, fhdl 41 aafdd & f&d W ufcrael g9rd 181 US|

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 22nd October, 2020

S.0. 3753(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (3) of section 3 of the Environment
(Protection) Act, 1986 (29 of 1986) and in pursuance of the notification of the Government of India in the erstwhile
Ministry of Environment and Forests, number S.0O. 1533(E), dated the 14th September, 2006, the Central Government
hereby makes the following further amendments in the notification of the Government of India in the Ministry of
Environment, Forest and Climate Change, published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, section 3, sub-
section (ii), vide number S.O. 850(E), dated the 17th March, 2017, namely: -



“4 1op ALl LR OUF INIIA I EALTKAURKIJINAKY [FARL L—>EC. 3(11)]

In the said notification, -

(i) in paragraph 2A, for the figures, letters and word “16th September, 20207, the figures, letters and word “16th
March, 2021 or ftill the constitution of new Authority, Maharashtra, whichever is earlier.”, shall be
substituted.

(ii) in paragraph 8 A, for the figures, letters and word “16th September, 20207, the figures, letters and word “16th
March, 2021 or till the constitution of new SEACs, Maharashtra, whichever is earlier.”, shall be substituted.

[F.No. J-11013/30/2007-IA.I(T)]

ARVIND NAUTIYAL, Jt. Secy.

Note:- The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section
(i), vide number S.0O. 850 (E), dated the 17th March, 2017 and subsequently amended vide number S.O. 4040(E),
dated the 12th December, 2017 and vide number S.O. 1788(E), dated the 8th June, 2020.

Explanatory Memorandum: By making amendments in paragraph 2A and paragraph 8A by substituting “16th
September, 2020 as the “16th March, 20217, the interest of no person shall be adversely affected.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



