1042 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : JUNE 19, 1993/JYAISTHA 29, 1915

[PART II—-SEC. 3(i)]

12

Group ‘C’ Departmental Promotion Committee consisting of :—

13

—— ot = e A wm mim ot et Y ——— — i —

Not Applicable

1. Dircctor (Administration/Establishment)/Secretary, Central Water Commission

— Chairman

2. Dircctor/Supetintending Cngineer, Central Water Commission (co-opted) — Member

3. Director/Under Secretary, Central Electricity Authority

4, Under Secretaty, concerncd, Central Water Commission

— Member
— Mcmber

Foot note : The principal rules were published vide No. GSR 683, dated the 10th June, 1972 and subsequently amended vide
No. GSR 1346, dated the 14th December, 1974, The Central Water and Power Research Station, Poona, Auxiliaty
Technical Servicees (Laboratory Staff) Recroitment Rules, 1983 dated the 14th December, 1983, (inso far as thepost
of Computer ‘A’ and 'B’ is concerned) which is now redesignated/merged with the post of Laboratory Assistant
Grade II and Grade-!II respectively in Central Water and Power Research Station, Poona, were published in
the Gazette of India, Part-II Section 3(i) under No. GSR 55 21st January, 1984

[No. 16/93/F.No. 39/3/92 Estt, Ij

MEENAKSHI ARORA, Under Secy,

aifusg AgaTEn

a5 faeefy, 31 wk, 1993

ar.wr.fr. 31 —-Far @y, farfa (srefae)
frdgw T fadieror) wififaaw, 1963 (1963 #T
22) ® G0 17 AT NI @lEAai & ganr HE
gy, frafa fadtaor afvag sd=d (Fffao, fadaor
agr wdrer) faaw, 1978 § HWwT W F  fayg
gy freafafas fraw aardt &, salq —

1. (1) & frasi #1 am fRata fderor afoy
saardy (Fftwaor, fadaw ar gdw) faaw, 1993
4

(2) @ o ¥ 5w A @@ wY 9w
glit 1

2. frats fdwor afesg ®Rard (wsite,
fadgor gar Afier) faaw, 1978 ¥,—

(1) fraw 5 & ooy, famfafaa fog
wiaearfra far s, waiq ——

“5. g7 fAumi & walww @ fau, sAafay w5

fre =< Afwrdt § wifgr fear sro, iy

qqq e wg 9t frdr daT a1 g A
4000/- ®, T waq wfus &

qa ¥z ot fywwr daw a1 FaTAA A
2900/~ &, 9T wiusad 4000/ W
] &7 g

g ag 9% frasr a7 av FTTRE 1150 -

¥, & wigs 9%y 2900- 3. 8 Wi
T

LR ag 9% foger I 41 FAARTT HigwAw
1150[- &, T TA& A |

Tod fF agam & § faRe @ ogw &
1 999, 1986 ®Y AT IEF FTT AT AT TE] FT
afy qitgwr gz g faad & sE o am g
Nz (=~F7 faadi & garaa F fag —-—

(i) aaa & wufawa ag wfr § o1 ofwy
FHAVT o daq(fanw dqT a1 9F Frfaw
wgarst & fae faw wg daq & garar (aaz
TR dqw, fadiy dga o dafEw dTT)
gar g 1% afewfagal & 7 & gfqamn
8 S i W AT aRT-aAY 9T
fasiy ®q § FiffEa 34 9 @1

(i1) feell a7 & Iqm av Fqaww § wiaww
SE Awfen gar (dmfyg daw) Ao
19868 ¥ sl fruifea 3qw & FawarT
g st gurgag 9T afvey wAAMG @)

w E

(2) fraa 8 ¥,

(i) & (i) & (iv) % =g & faq “arga<
yree)” wer A Wy (v) & (ix) aF
& fisF ¥ fag “Tac dawdy’’ weE wes
warfyy fea wTdd;

(if) &= (ix) & owaq T “erdiwmwm” §
ogy  faefafas  wAow el
HIGT, iy —

“qud fF wdw oF gwer §  fowd fafe
grffits & worrar, firdr o afeqdon & =iy

@ iz ariw fedr ot s wiufaor &
F ar wr ¥ AU 4gA wY £ gdvg Ay



[wrr I1--gmw 5(i)]

gfedifos & w1 ¥ worfer §, waww (viil) ar
wged (ix) & fafase  gmtar wfadfe fea
ST ;

e W) A e feefr fr frfrse
A fafas wmet o wfwafes feg o a®r
fats ot & faw w5 wia  Tow wliv-
Ttag fwar @1 @&,

(3) faow, 11 & wafrow (8) & &A@ 9%
freafafaa sftearfea foar smoa, wafy —

“(8) afwg Ty 9w woETd HRAE
§ WFEAT W qEET § A HATF W AT 99 €0
q¥ fager & gt wawy T & A F wfqArg
& for o9 qrarer W El @ wfEE sw wavea
& fag qa aw argE G g O awAr g
s % fF wamafes wfierd g Ay
weydr wfrwry weE duaT 9 @Y, AT wymEi
sfgardy w7 wrer sy gfcfeafad #v STy,
A sl gy

gy wfcag wAr ey WY e e
T Friw f6dl svr gORTd HEETO FT qgEar
T gy § afy ot ggar  wigsrd AT &Y
gfefeafaai 1 srasrdy wgar § T fafer &
ofwafag fFe o aer Fron & fag, s
P g

Az ——afeag FHad 99 T FAAN G

wgraar a8 gwa Grad o {1 afe wqwate
ard ¢ foad 9@ agraer & )

(4) fram 12 &, fram 4 & owenq, freafafa
wraaTA e savfer fear g, sy —

‘g fF gt frm 8 & wew (v) ¥
(ix) # fafzee fedy WY RO & forg w11
& WTTgEAT koI ofT A w1 T,
gymafts  wfags, afz @i ggarer wfgsey
& freq g G gor qrifier & & sfiqe aiw
A q aga o yearer Feid &7 uw safa gafag
ofery  wiwd B & qifs S§ wwrafaw
afg®FTdr & s ar fafag & s
T #T gFa fra a0’

(5) fraw 13 ®, safrw (1) &  9w=m,
freafariga weqeafag fear sroa, waiq —

“(1w) sufmw (1) ® fw (@) #
fedy a7 & 7 £ g feshy wmrer ¥ afony
FRATA U 0 ITAA & &qew () & sty
fag . wrrgidas afs w1 @ 9T fawe fauw
& o daT ¥ gfaat ® AF F7 gwry

WITH %1 TANR 97 19, 199 3FACE 20, 1915

1043

ST § s el B g8 T TFAT oY wErdy
¥ &7 A wfw 9T gax T ar i aw
¥ wfus 71 waty & fau Fa7 giesi ey dear
ar fray ot safa & faq aaw afzat € ¢F
arq A&, afEy STA 9% 5" TETCRT IR
T T HT wrE Y v wigdfg §@ § agw
frqm 11 & (23) % Safaw (3) § wirsfag
G FIT qEAaTE QF &1 OSATAT

(6) froa 16 & wur o< frwfafas aftearfya
fipqr ST, wat -
“1g. frad 11§ @A 15 @ Bl a@ & A T T
(1) gt oF ofeds FAAK 9 wERw ¥
wTYrE 9 gvg wrgifaa fear At ¢ faee
sa% faam & At @i a3 agar faar
3, ar
Qr

(i) wgr sqmetw afrerd @ oo fafae
v ¥ wfadfas feg o@ q swToN %
fag «gee & ¥ frawi § g @0 @&
AT qETIE FET QAT /L TG E, AT

(iii) wrgf aferg ar meaw 63 § fF @z =
go ¥ f5 ¥ va fgdi ¥ fkgag aw
T TgTE FET GATET T8 2,

o wEmefad wiuwtd arrer & afdeafadt g
e T @Ear § R I ux war ST any
Ty AW I qHAT §

grd f5 ofag w0 B oww w afudfe
f¥T I qEr weATfad 20T FT w1 wRT ST W
¥ gy FY (1) F W AWEIT FIA BT WA
faar sraT =igw )

(7) fraw 19 %, Iafmamw (1) ¥ 2000/~ To
& @ 9T 50000~ G Afqeerfud fwar smoar

(8) faaw 20 ¥,

() swaz (1i) & o= ax frafafas afy-
warfae fam som waie —

(iv) frgr 8 & fafwlase aoei & ¥ fodt %) ot
afqafid F@ AT ARW WE 9 A
nfeFrd ar fed@r sefetas a1 gFdmor
FTUFT GT T7AT T47 8 |

(w) & (v) § o w@ww (@) & awEmy
famfafas aea-vafe frar smom, wrafe

() A FET AT W QwAT AT [y
famt ¥ srain efwrd wfawow §vw X ¥
EFIC T |



1044 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA JUNE 19, 1993/JYAISTHA 29, 1915

[PART II--SEG. 3(i)]

o NI, K, i e .

T e 1 e e s

(7) == (v) ¥ wﬁrw (s') ih‘ qEIIT
freifafas seacufya fgar snpmn, srafy -

“(F) % fewm @ oadw & @ 99E
Ty, frvem, wftae FEm fafi
wr e & @ faeg dar, Ao, W &
3 ¥, S@Fr  Far, % A 9 9T I
AT ar ¥ fAafa A ade & owww
99 ¥ a7 @99 & dquuE # @ Ty uuty
1 freww F #g a1 T F@ gU Wl T
watsrq & fao yady o faard wd safi
T TG [T ST |

(o) wedmor ¥, & (1) R gwaw fre-
fafes o enfam fear g, wiy —

‘(i) 9w v & mfafor dww, s o e
T fgfa ww affas &0
(9) faw 21 ¥ —

() wufrrw (2) & ww (1) F wEg
frefataa sraw weaearfys fwar soro,
YT,

“awd fF wm wr wUFd I@ qforg
FHA ® ddw §F faad fao gsqa o fns
gafe (1) & woE W STl @
neey A1 fRas & wefiAer §, st weger ar
fms oY gwgT € Sy, Sar o mwargrn”

(w) Sufram (3) ¥ To 2000/~ WY qur
- W F TWIT 9T To 5000/~ WET AT WHF
streafm g g o
(10) frm 25 & qwmrg “wrr VIII 7: Pra=a”
wes & T oax “wwr VI wga e @
fad=q” wirds wfrearfag fear srgar)

(11) fraw 26 & o ox freafafaa frow wfi-
Tif fFaT @ sl —

26. (i) ¥ fraa} & frt a & 7 13 g —
(i) #=ha e ar
(if) wfwg; ar

(iii) =riefm sefamrdr gmifia G & wertfr
aE ¥ Bg wE & Wiae P s gag
q ol waT AT 9w AT 93 weaar fRdy
W Yo & wfqtral ® wiv awar 3
AT ¥ fagdl & wRawd gAw T PR
Wt mRw Y dWfys w7 gwar @ wfe
fad & =1 ot ooty At &7 o & o
frat & 15 wiw wige 7 & ok

(%) wiw ® P —
wC GHAT &, AT

(@) ww ara wigOf qow fafia wom, oW
HYAT, T AT AT &N a1 gt wrk
A &g wfudfer a@t ¥ aw afrdfor w7
qFEAT §; qar

() AT 99 wfgwrd w5 ¥ & fame wnidw
fgu a1 et 0% witwra w1 fHEw 2
arr f&Er s wifimrd | utT #r o
WA FA ¥ fay Iy omg wwE w:
aftfeafral & wqewe 3f@ ww@; @

(7 ) @ @ oW O $T @ §, S| I
i, Tma e (1) g gmes i
T w1 W AW gow wfydfis wH ar
TG ATAT AR AT A% TE AT T &G
& ddfuq afory wdad &) sweafa
IE & ey wvTdan I a7 ST wEme
Fal o s st St fraR o8 ¥ wrew
(V) & (ix) o ¥ fafafesz xof & g
W 80 afuAfE & w1 yem § AT 9
wedl § fafalqez gromt & & fedy wY
Wt g7 dmifed @ F fac gqg wg
e g wfadfrs v § apry £ fag
AT w9 AW A afy fraw 11 % weade
TEX ¥ W ofT gTard A wr wf §oay
tar w1 zox wiadfts T fear smoar
foama fraw 16 & wrearal & merr fraw
11 % wfusfga &7 ¥ siq qoamer &

TEATY, i
(i) dwra & €1 wfer s a0
STET 9y ww fF
(i) wfesrd, faay adte & wRw a9
e, ar

(i) wfasry fomy - wdvd ot @,
wgi wxf whe T wr of & weh
WA 1
(2) swwT & fag #1E sl ox aw srow
TEF B JOIAY —
(i) ofta & fac fasifa wafs & gqwfa
% 9EETy, ar
(ii) o & fraem & vy @ odr wig
yfrer o T &

(3) g & fag wder 36y &7 ¥ “faare

fear s st BFoag e Rt 3wk Wi
o §1;



[ gz 3 (1))

TIRE &7 AT IF 19, 1993/7465 29 1915

1045

(12) fraw 27 % wm qv faeafafes afy-
wfar faar sown, sl -
Yo7 grfaFr faw grRw aorfw feam @
T 1 g9 At a1 wuEr TSer g 9T wer
77 fagai & s wfa fFET oRa w1 g
faa=s g=d s F1E A gUO Ar oy S
gega g0 fFU o wwd v o faEET F ol
TRE 9T & qAg gadsy AE ¥ o fyay
TR FT AGAT A AT, WO F AT IEAY
AR B AR T E; '

Fmg 5 gafag sifasrr gra B o o

1 wigafea &9 97 399 #r w15 W wEw
A9 4% W&l Al W w9 v 5 gyfaa
SOETY &1 gEfad 29 & faeg myoraEed s
IEa gaaT 7 for w g oar fraw g ®
fafafese ag el & &1 o wfaafee <3 v
weE fFar & oar gv fagws froosy ardr mRw
2l Afgafm e sy Bl off a8 s ¥
faw ez =fy e ¥ fraw 11 &

wARY FE W WM 9Tdm 9gd & 9t T
W g oar wrd aez gfadfim 9@ fear som
A (Had 16 & gl & wedta fagw 10 §

¥
FERET A T Gl 93T ¥ gt )

o

&

kY

(13) fram 27 & gy “wrr IX fafay”
AT U A FRAT SITuT ) -

- [wreEs  3f27/so-Emriove £41)
Fo Fuar gagoyy, foxmw

AT Ho WowTe 42 HTdE
5177 91 TE T Ho FomTo
5 %5 1979, . aTewo 1020
;1980 AT fo Fe o 556 ATIE
5 FIAY, 1982 oo oo 2831 TN 14

mpmmins % (v €3 g e AT o
TFEAT, 1989 ZTV I

T

e frar

MINISTRY OF COMMERCE
New Delhi, the 31st May; 1993

GESR. 311—~In exercise of the powers corniferred by section
17 of the Export (Quality Control and Inspection) Act, 1963
(22-of 1963), the Central Government hereby makes  the
fgiiox\vi;}g rules to amend the Export Inspection Council Smp-
Joyees (Classification, Control and' Appeal) = Rules, 1978,
namely

1. 41} Whese rules may be called ‘the Export Inspection
Councit Employees” (Classification, Control and ~ Appeal)
(Amendment) Rules, 1993,

(2) They shall come into force on their publication in
the Official Gazette.
247 G1/93—3

2, In the Export Inspection Council Employees (Classifica~

tion Control and Appeal) Rules; 1978,—~

(1) for the rule 5, the following rule shall be substitut-
ed namely - }

“5 For. the purpose of these rules, the emplovees shall
be classified into the following four groups, name-

ly —

Group A @ A post carrying a pay or d-scale of pay with
a maximum of not less than Rs. 4,000, -

Group B : A post carrying a pay or a scale of pay with a
maximum. of not less than Rs. 2,900 but less than
Rs. 4,000,

Group C : A post carrying a pay -or a scale of pay with
o maximum of over Rs. 1,150 but  less :than
Rs. 2,900. .

Group D : A post carrying a pay or a scale of pay with
a maximum of which is Rs. 1,150 or less:

Provided that posts created on or after 1st January, 1986
as specific additions to- existing cadres shall have ‘ths same
classification of posts in. the cadre to which they are added.

Note :—For the purpose of this rule :~—

(i) ‘Pay means the¢ amount drawn monthly by = the
Council employee. as the Pay (other than-special
Pay or pay granted in view: of his personal Qualifica-
tions),  Overseas Pay, Special Pay and Personal Pay
and any other emoluments which may be specially
classed  as pay by -the Central Government from

iime to time.

(i) The pay or scale of pay of.a post means . the pay
of scale of pay prescribed under the Central Civil
Services (Revised Pay) Rules, 1986 as applicable to
Council empioyees from time to time.

(2) In rule 8,—

(i) the words “Minor Penalties™ shall -be inserted as the
heading for clauses (i) to (iv) and the words
“Major Penalties”” shall be inserted as the heading

for claunses (v) to (ix);

(i) “after clause (ix) and beiore “Explanation™, the fol
lowing proviso shall be inserted; namely r—-

“provided that in every case in which the charges of
acceptance from  any person of any gratification,
other © than legal remumeration, as a molive of
reward for doing or for bearing to do any official
act is. established, the penalty mentioned in clause
(viii} or clause (ix) shall be imposed:

Provided further that in any exceptional case and. for
special reasons 1o be recordad in weriting, any other
penalty may be imposed”;

(3} in rule 11, for sub-rule (8), the following shail be subs-
titnted, nemely —

“(8) The Council employees may take the assistance of
any Government servant posted in any office either
ot his  headquarters or at the place where the in-
guiry is held to defend the case on his behalf but may
not engage a legal practitioner for the purpose un-
less the Presenting Officer. appointed by the discip-
linary authority is a legal practitioner, or, the Gis-
ciplinary authority having vegard to the circomstan-
ces of the case, sO permifs

Provided that the Council employees may take the
assistance of any other Government servant posted
at any other station, if the inguiring authority
‘having regard to. the circumstances of the case,
and for reasons to be recorded in writing, so
permits. -

Note —*The Council employees shall not take the assis-

tance of a Government servant who has {wo panding discip-.



1046

lipary cases in hand in which he had to give assistunce.”

(4) in rule 12, after sub-rule (4), the following proviso shall
be inserted, namely —

“provided that where an enquiry has been held in ac-

curdance with the provisions of vule 11 for any of

the penalties specified in clause (v) to (ix) of rule 8,

the Bisciplinary Authority, if it is diferent from the
Inquiring Authority, shall before making any final
oider of imposing such penally. forward a copy of
tne inquiry report to the Council employes concer-
ned giving him an opportunity of making any re-
Frcacntation or submission in writing ta the Discip-
ingry Authority.”;

(5) in rule 13, after sub-rule (1), the following shall be
Ingerted napely -—

“(1A) Notwithstanding anything contained in clause (b)
of sub-rule (1), if in a case it is prupused after con-
siqcrlnf the representation, if uny, made by the
Couyncil employee under clavse (a) of thit sub-rule
10 withhold increments is pay and such withhold-
ing of increments is likely o aflect adverscly the
ampunt of pension payable to the employee or to
withhold increments of pay for a period exceeding
three years or to withhold jncrements of pay with
cumulative effect for any perjod, the inquiry shall
be held in the manner laid down in sub-rule (3) to
(23) of rule 11, before making any order imposing
on the Council emplayee uny such penalty.”;

(6) for the rule 16,

the following
npracly —

shall be substituted,

“16. Nolwithstunding anything contained in Rule 11 to
Rule 15

u) where any penalty js imposed on a Council employee
an the round of conduct which has led to his con-
viction on g criminal charge, or

(ii) where the disciplinary authority is satisficd for reu-

sons to be recorded by it in writing is nom reasonubly

praclicable {0 hold an inquiry in the manner provi-
ded in these rules, or

(iii) where the Council or Chairman is satisfied that in

the interest of the security of the Stlate, it is not

expedient (o hold any inguiry in the mannar provi-
ded in these rules,

The disciplinary authority may consider (he circumstanrces
of the case and make such order thereon at it deers fit:

Frovided that the Council employee may be given an op-
portunity of making representation on the penalty proposed
to be imposed before any order is made in a cise under
clause (i)”,

(7) in 1ule 19, in sub-rule (1), for “Rs. 2,000/-", the figure
“Rs. 5.000/-" shall be substituted,

(8) in rale 20,

(s) For the sub-clause (i), the following shall be substitu-
fed, namely :—

(i) en order imposing any of the penaltiss specified in
ruie 8 whether made by the disciplinury authority or
by avy appellate or revising authbrity.”;

(b) 1 clause (v), after sub-clause (b), the following shall be
inserted namely —

“(bb) reducing or withholding the pension or denying
lh? maximum pension admissible 10 him under the
ruleg’,

(c) in clayse (v), after sub-rule (e). the following shall he
Inserted, namely —

“(f) determining whether or not the period from {he
datc of his suspension or from the date of his dis-
missal, removal, compulsory retirement or reduction
to a lower service, grade, post. time-scale of pay or
stage in a time-scale of pay to the date of his rein-
slutement or restoration to his service, grade or post

shall be treated as a period spent gn duty for any
purpose”.;

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : JUNE 19, 1993/JYAISTHA 29, 1915

[PART 1HI—5EC, M1)]

(d) in the Nxplanation, after clause (1, the f{ollowing chatl
be inserted, namely :—

“(ii) the expression ‘Pension’ includes addilional pzasion,
gratuity and any other retirement benelit”.
(9) in rule 21,—

(a) in sub-rule (2), after clause (i), the following provisy
shall be inserted, naumely :—

“Provided that whether such Authority is subordinate
1o the Chairman or Director in respect of conocil
employee for whom Chairman or Director s the
uppellate nuthority in terms of sub-rule (i), the wp-
peal shal) lie to the Chairman or Director, as the
case may be.";

(b) in sub-rule (3), for the word and figure “Rs. 2,0007-"
the word and figure “Rs. 5,000/-" shall be substitutz 1.

(10) after rule 25, for the heading “Part VIII-REVTLwW™,
heading “PART VIL-REVISION AND REVIESV” shall b2
substifuted.

(11) for rule 26 the following rule shall bhe subs.titutad,
namely ~—
*26, (1) Notwithstanding contained in these
rules (—

anything
tiy  the Ceantral Govarnment; or

(ii)
(iii)

the Council; or

the appellate authority, within six months of tho
date of the order proposed to be revised. may at
any time, either on its or his own motion or vther-
wise call for the records of any inquiry und re-
vise any order made under thes2 rules but {rom
which no appeal has been preferred or trom which
no appeal 15 allowed. and may :

(a) confirm, modify or set aside the order; or

(b) confirm, reduce, onhance or set aside the pens'ty
imposed by the order or impose penalty whers oo
penulty has been imposed; or

(c) remit the case to the authority which made the order
or to any other authority directing such autho.iry
to make such further enguiry as it may cioa-idoe
ptoper in the circumstances of the case; or

(d) pass such other orders as it may deem f( :
Provided that :

(i) no order imposing or enhancing any penalty shall
be made by any revising authorty unless the
Council employee concerned has been given a
reasonable opportunity of muking a representation
ugainst the penalty proposed and, where it is pr.-
posed to impose mny of ihe penalties specificd n
clauses (v) to (ix) of rule 8 to enhaace the pupaity
imposed by the order sought to he revised to anv
of the penalties specified in thuse clauses and if
an enquiry under rule 11 has not already bozn
held in the case no such penalty shall be imposed
except after an inquiry in the manner laid down
in rule 11 subject to the provistons of rule 16,

(i) no power of revision shall be exercised unless
(it the authorily which made the ordzr in appeal or
(i) the authority to which an uappeal would Lie,

where no appeasl has been preferred, is subordi-

nate to him.

(2) No proceeding for revision shall be commenced until
after-—

(i) the expiry of the period of himitation lor an oppzal;
ar

(ii) the disposal of the appeal, where any such uppesl

has been preferred.



[w‘m II—-mrr 3 (1)] WTCT I AT T 19, 199'c/wca 29, 1915 1047

3) An npphcatmn for revision shall be dealt with m the
same manner as if it were an uppeal under these rules.”

(12) for the vule 27, the following shall be sul)slltuled
pamely (—

“27. the authority who has passed any order may, al any
time, either on its own motion o otherwise, review,
any order passed under these rules, when any new
material or evidence which could not be produced
or was not available at the time of passing the ordet
under review and which has the effect of changing
the nature of the case, has come. or has been
brought, to his notice :

Provided that no order imposing or enhancing any
penalty shall be made by the concerned authority
unless the employee concerned has been given a
reasonable opportunity of makinz a representation
against the penally proposed or where it is pro-

poscd to impose any of the major penultlcs speci-
fied in tule 8 or to cnhaoce the minor penally
imposed by the ovder sought to be reviewed to any
of the major penalties and if any enguiry under
rule 11 has not already been held in the case, no
such penalty shall be imposed e:cept after inquir-
ing a the manner laid down in rule 11 subject to
the provisions of rule 167,

(13) after rule 27, the hcading “Part 1X-Miscellaneous”

shail be inserted.

Footnoie

[F. No. 3(27)/89.EI&EP]
KUM, SUMA SUEBBANNA, Director

: Principul Notification was published by No.

5.0. 42 of 7th January, 1978 and amendment by No. 5.0.
1442 of 5th May, 1979 No. 8.0. 1020 of 19th April, 1980
and No. 5.0. 556 of 61h February, 1982, Neo. 5.0, 2631 ot
14th Qctober, 1989,

Printed by the Menager, Govt. of India Press, Ring Road, Maya Puri, New Delki-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054, 1393,



