
Tf^f Jfo ^fo TT^TO-33004/99 RI-.GD.NO.D.I..-33004/99 

(The (Baxette of ^ u d i a 
EXTRAORDINARY 

*FFT II—^n»5 3—"&f-1gvg (i) 
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i) 

UlHtahH ^ Wcblfvid 

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

"H. 402J ^ f ^ f t , ^rraTT, 3FTW 12, 2013/«imnT 2 1 , 1935 

No. 402] NEW DELHI, MONDAY, AUGUST 12, 2013/SHRAVANA 21, 1935 

cJ l fu i ^ 3^T^SlbT MsllcHI 

( e n f o l d fEHTFT) 

^ r f f ^ f t , 12 sm^r, 2013 
W.̂ 5T.f%. 540( 3T) .—^Sfa ^ F R , fa?fa 3TTfer # T 3 ? W m , 2005 (2005 ^T 28) ?& VW 55 SRT 

y^ r f̂R+d̂ T ^ T "SPTFT ^ fq; fa?ta s r r f e # ^ f m , 2006 ̂ 7 3?R ^ f f * H wtf •£ f ^ rHHfdftsid 

1. (1) ^T ftzpft ^T YtteRPT M ^ STTfei ufpf (^EFT) f^RR" 2013 t I 

(2) r̂ *\v\m 3 w & H* I*H ^ t m t o ^r Ĥ TT FTA I 

2. M 1 ? arrffe ufm f ^m, 2006 ( f ^ r ^ F T ^TCF> TT^TKT TJCT f̂ RFr <m TOT t ) cfr F W T 2 ^ 

vJMpiiJ-H (1) ^ 13*5 (X) *f f^HfciRdd M ^ * 3TcT: ŜSTTpRf f^TT yTTW, 3TSjftf:-

3 m % *R$fcT aii^'Rich ^mnj afft ^ F S Y g>t SFKJSTR afft f ^ m ^mnj ?TSTT ^ £ gra -ow 3r^ftf^r 
P̂TFT m 3 T ^ q W^ffT ^ \Jc*TT̂  3TN ̂ TcTTaff cf>T ST^rt^T ^ p P ? -dHlf^^ #, ^ T ^ j ^ ^cfSY ^ T T ^ I 

fzfF^ ^ ffc Y t ^ t o 31^ J f l ^faTsft T̂f%cT ^ - ^ R ^ ^FTH 3McfT ^FRf 3T^T-3T^ vkMleJf ?TT 

^rareff cf̂ r Pi cliche ^ f t fcrPr^r tiftroi 3frc ^ r ^ 5 ? gft 3rg^roFr ^ ft^m ^cmj WSJT 3^*ficw «fr£ 
grcr w a ^ R d ^TFT ?rr YFRT snj>fcr s>t ^ m j W C * ^CRY «HH»11 1 

3. ^ FFRT ĉ  f̂ RRT 5 3>, ^trf^RR (2) ^ -

(an) T ^ M^ch i j , '^r # ^ ^ ' ?R4T C^ YSTR w ' ^ p ^ft f g ^ R ' ?r^ ^ 1 ^ m ^ ; 

(li) IS^S (?3) ^ W H T? PlHfclRdd ^ ^ S Y# ^nvT 3T2lfe -

3488 GI/2013 (11 



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY 
[PART II—SET. 3(i)J 

'(*3) (i) f ^ f t M ^ S ^TcF^ T̂T TJcfj ITT 3jfag> ĉTT3ff cf> foH? 3T2JcTT fcFRft ^TFT 3T3TCTT ft^HMTH 

# f c T ^ 3TTfe> \jjfa cPT i^RT t ^ R ?TT ^ R t 3 T ^ M T ^ ^pftrRgT £T=T ^TT= 

3TTte) u fa 3RT*T, ^TTcPT, HMloU, 3(*>u||t|<H X&\, M w , H f& l ^ f^RT, I^HNd 5f^T, ^rRR^g, 

(ii) ^RTT wldlPlcfcl 7TT ̂ R T 5ftlfff*ra5t 3TMTRcT . ^ T cf> fefTf feT^T 3TTffe ^ T ^ t ^TTW c£ feHJ 

c f ^ ^HdH Sfa 3T^ te ^ T ^TT, f ^ ?T^t ^ t JTcpf cf> 3TrcIR *R ^ £ T ? R PP^d W^-W^l ST3 ^ t 3T̂ SP 

sppsr I V ^ ^ 3 T ^ R ?r?3f 

STcpf ' V 

srcpf ' ^ ' 

3^-jf '7T' 

^HdH y^Tte Plffid ST=T 

1,00,000 cpf *ft. 

50,000 cpt 5ft. 

25,000 nA 5ft. 

TR^J t^T t^Rft fcT^T 3IT^cfi ufpT ^ fcTq fwR> 3Pf^T ^ T ^ $<r)(t^|pto B T ^ R 3fa ^ ^ i N 

^ fePJ ftRRF> SRT4?r, ^xRT Ul^RlcfSl 3TmTR?T ^ T ift f ^ITf^T W& ?m ^?TR 1% T̂ f̂RTT %, ^ T 

%^?R ĴT -^RT STf^J ^ 3̂cRT ^R^ft f̂ ftf^ ^ T ^ Mcpt ^ 3TMR W ^FTT Midi Pi c^ ^ ^ T T 

yldl Pi chl 3mnR?i ^rT3ft %^ fcTRft fc^ra 3TTMCF ^m ^ fon? r̂ajT crr^ ^ j w r P r f e SRR^RUT ^ T ^ t 

^ R ^ ?l? 3fR f ^ r̂fcT f ^ ^T 3TTfe7 ^fFT 3PT^J ^ T T̂ ^•Wl̂ leM £ ^ ĉ  teR ^TTf^T fcp Ĵ ̂ n ^ 

WF§ ^ ift f^f g f t r M ^ 3TTffe ofR- cf5T ST^RT ^?T ^ ^cT-MldlPlcfil, % ^RWRHId W r 

fvRT^ 3TcT^r, ^fR ^sd ^Rc fR ?TT ^ T ^ % 3T9TcTT ̂ T ^ STPT̂ RT ^ , ^ SmiTRcT ^3m ^RR<fROT $ 

fcT? ^n f ^T f c ^ uTT̂T cf5T 5R^TR t ?ft ^5f ^ T fcF^R ^T g^R> 3T%cF ^TT 3(k ^ 1 ^ PlHfelRdd ^^RFT 

(i) 3H^ I ^?T ̂ T ̂ tcT MldlPicI>l 3fR ^R M^^MId Wift &3 f^RT^ 3TcRt?T ^juft ^R^FR ~W ^cT 'ft | , 

l̂lcfl>H fwTR cpf iftcR ?Trn f c j ^ W ^ ^R-M^H]^|J|d ^uft v i r t l ^ d"2TT R P H I ^ I C^ f^pr f^P? 3TTffe ̂ TFf 

^Hf l̂PHd ^ f ^TT I 

(ii) "^r ^cf arpj^r £fa ^ fcr^ SPHT "^T ^r ^iTf^rd fcfry ̂ r ^ fen? w-wifcid fcJRft fcrfw 3rrte) 

wfr^ c# TTPTeT ̂ f ^TRT ?^TR c^t ^ft. f : 

file:///jjfa


[W\ I I—^3^ 3{i)] *TTTcT ^ T < N 4 ^ ; 3 ^ 1 ^ ^ 3 

TR^ *TF tft ffc ^ M RlPiRte ^ r ^ f ^ ^ f f fota 3nfc> ^TR 3RFr, imrcRT, HHiick 
3R^TTW ST^F, f^fRiT, TTf&T̂ T, f^RT, fen Mel 5R4?T, ^ T R R ! ^ , R f e n , W ^ ^ ^ %TT *n f ^ t * fa 

^ r e m if f̂enffcr K K «n% cm TT̂CTTCT st eft ^ r , ^ R 3iR # ^ wz^& 4 ^ 3n^ crier fr?m 3TTfej 
^TPft ^ fen? $Rr M-ccfl̂ H % ^ R ^ T \3*T3T 3 ? f ^ R̂TT I 

* R ^ *?F tft ft> ^W*T 4 ^ ^raf^cT cpffcfRoT <£ 3R^TR W?f if ^ R ^ f ^ W 3Tffei vftff 

(^RfT H V I M "JIT ^ R T MldlRlc^ ^ T f e R̂TT fcp?m 3TTfe ^ cfc 3TeTTcTT) cfc m® if ^ R R R R H 

^ ^ R R R f e : $m cm 50% R̂TT 3ffc ^ T O 4 if ^ ^R^RT ^ 2 M ^ ?F^f if 3RTR̂ RT 

3rrfe) wfNt cr> ^ t o ir ^ R P T Rf% &?r 3?R Rftffoe sm cm ^r^fm srftrcR ?RTT: 

^ ^ i f t % ^ ? f ^RRR 3T^RT \fr% ^fT %cF&R ^[ ^ j 3FFfTcR ^ gRT ^ T STcR if 

SlfdRckf ^Fc^f <& 3T^fR 3t uTT ̂ RFKft f : 

TOJ *T? tft 1% ^ T fr=J c£ cFT ^ cfFT TRTRT TJR?RT Sf3 f%^RT M*R<ftWI # 3 eft far? ftf&ld 

( i i i ) ^ * S (TT) if ° W ^TR" ^ f ^ W ^ *R " W ^fV ^ ^ v R ^ | 

4. JJcf R?m c£ R*R 11 cfc ^ R R (11) if f l t f ta W ^ > c£ W R RH^Rs Id ^ R ^ 

* R ^ -^ *ft % f c ^ T R fc^R 3TTMcF> vifa if ^ f^Eft M ^ ^ 1 flHI^H *TT f̂cT£R ^T, uT# 

M ^ T i f cFjtf tRTT ^ T R , f ^ r f m f c ^ ŜTcTJ ^ R T 3R l f f e ^T, fvR^if c ^ c||fi)|f^cb, 3l1WlPl» 

3Tsmr 3nfej T̂fcTf̂ f̂ r T̂ ̂ rcf ^ t ?T eft ^ t fcf?m arr̂ cr? yf̂ r ^ ^ r̂ fempt ^f^pn ĉ  ^hra if f ^ f t 
^cfiR ĉ  ^ cfr i f jRlt ^ TTT̂T ^ f # i r ^f?FR ^ f^t1^ 3TTf^ \ M ^ flHI^H ÎT ^ t ^ T ĉ  T^rTU 

terTFT qrpff, WmW ^fiT^fr 3TamT ^R^rraft ^ f ^ n ^̂ 11 c r̂f ^r*fr 3T̂CTT ^^RFT ^ ^ r FMRT 

«vi«ii6i cF?r TTT̂T F W ^ft f%tfr M ^ an f ^ vfH if ft>tft ^ arg^̂ FTT ^R CTFJ ^Rft f afk M 

^R%r Tpnî f ^ fcr?m^ #̂ T 1 

5. ijef f^FT ĉ  f^RR 19 ĉ  vmftHH (2) ^ ?fRR ^R^cP if, " ^ ^ ^ ^ f^", 7R# ^ ^TR W 

"^R^ ^ ^ t % f̂ RPT 74cfi ^ ^l^eff ĉ  3Teq^T" ^T^ ^ T ^\^\ I 

6. 1J5T f$m $ f^RR 74 ĉ  TOTM, HHfc l fed f̂ RFT 3tcT:^n%T f^TT W W , 3T2fcr-

7 4 ^ M^T 3TTfe> ^TR ^cbl^^l ^RT ^ ^ 3TR^RtT if 3TR W 3TTR%jff cfiT 3TcRW ^ f ^ , fcT?R 

STT^^^ fR <£t ^chl^ijf gSt %>t ^Tftcf 3Hrit 3HPft 3TTf̂ Rft cMT <lRi^ i cfTT 1^Rft 3P?T oITF̂ T ^ t 3*T^T 

^ ^ PlHfolRdd ?Rff ĉ  31"Sqi#T f?T?t̂  3TTffe ^ f n ^ 3TcR ? R cfiT RcheM 3^RT Wf^\ % I 

( i ) ^ m ^ cfc ^RT 3RRHT cfit ?Tlit^ ^ t cĴ T ^ cfiH ^ ^ cf?t 3Tcrf§ c^ fcT^ ĉf> ^ g SR/fFR ^ ^ 

cTSTT i^T cf̂T TTcTST Bt; 

( i i ) FfJT^ afcRUT cm ?TR^I cm vicMKH ^ ^ R ^ T̂̂ m T̂ ^TcTR ^r ^ ^ 3Tcrfet ĉ  forr f ^ j j i ^ d ' 

^ ?t; 

(iii) 5*r 5m̂ R ^ f^a^r 3^Rn SR^T 5̂t cm4^t 3R/TTĈ T ^ R T Ĉ  3T̂ fTcR ^ 3?KT#T #f t ; 
( i v ) 3f?TR^, ^cfjlt ^ t W\ TTT̂cTT ̂ e f t ^T»ft HM^-dl ^ ^ f ^^TT ?T; cTSTT 

(V) R^T 74 ĉ  aT#^f ?T2TT MRchfeld cfFJ f ^ p ^ <^RcT, ^ cRtf # , cTSIT 3icN"l<frd ^ m f , ^ 

fW?T ^lejdlM ĴRT 7f7t$ H, mf$ft f ^ ^T 3RRcT f fR T̂FTTf, vift a i d ^ l ^ d f fem^ ^ ^TPT ^t M 

# ?RI? Ttf f^WERf ^ 3R^T M F f C I IRM! C^ Rcl^T %^ ^ZT ^TT I' 



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA: EXTRAORDINARY [PART II - SEC. 3(i)| 

7. *TcT t̂ RFT 3, ^R£I IV c£ ^^TcT PlHfolRsId WWl 3tcT:^ITte t%^T T̂T̂ Tr, 3Tajfa:-

[ f^W 5 ^[ ^T-TWT 2 ( TsT ^ ) ^ lf ] 

1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

\- rf 

y i ^ l tfl 4*]\<&iV\ 
^ j f t % ' 
J)cM ^ ^ 

fceoft i i H ^ K 

cbMcbldl 
^F f# 

3' lcJ^ 

g^WK 

T* 
^tv *l" 
<H^Hci|e||c{ 

' ^c |^c |^ 

ti«£lJ|ci 

<M±U«|<£* 

1 ^ 

^ ^ 
c f ^ 

d^Hvi) 

^ 
*\ HJMK 

HMI^ 

I d ^ H ^ ^ H 
fplRl^lMc^l 

d-Slĉ JI 

^̂  I^II^N-dHH 
«Mt" V 
^ 3T̂ T ^ T ^ 

OT. U #-2/1/2013-#5T] 

^ft^ arte, ̂ T^f ^f^ 

ffccquft:-^ ftm <Tlfol 10 *fi^t, 2006 $ ^T.^T.ft. (54) fa) cf> 3TCT ITKCT ^ ^TC^, 3HTT?irM $ 

H<ft|f3ld t%^ ^ $ 3fa ^ 3 ?TT$fer 16 f^T^R, 2010 cfc W.^ .R^T 982(31) 5RT 3Tt̂ FT 3R f̂TSPT 

f^TT^IT SIT I 



[**FT II—T3n5 3(i) ] ^R?T F̂T TRH^ : S^TT^R^T 5 

MINISTRY OF COMMERCE AND INDUSTRY 

(Department of Commerce) 

NOTIFICATION 

New Delhi, thel 2th August, 2013 

G.S.R. 540(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 55 of the Special Fxonomic 

Zones Act, 2005 (28 of 2005), the Central Government hereby makes the following rules further 

to amend the Special Economic Zones Rules, 2006, namely :— 

1. (1) These rules may be called the Special Economic Zones (Amendment) Rules, 2013. 

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 

2. In the Special Economic Zones Rules, 2006 (herein after referred to as the principal 
rules), in rule 2, in sub-rule (1), in clause (x), the following proviso shall be inserted, 
namely:-

"Provided that various categories comprising their respective products or services, 
similar or compatible with each other, including related ancillary services and Research and 
Development services of the sector and additional combination of products and services of a 
similar or compatible nature as approved by the Board of Approval shall constitute a single 
sector;" 

3. In rule 5 of principal rules, in sub-rule (2),-

(i) in clause (a),-

(A) for the words "one thousand hectares", the words "five hundred hectares" shall be 
substituted; 

( (B) in the first proviso, for the words "two hundred hectares", the words "one hundred 
hectares" shall be substituted; 

(ii) for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-
"(b)(i) A Special Economic Zone for a specific sector or for one or more 
services or in a port or airport, shall have a contiguous area of fifty hectares 
or more: 

Provided that for each contiguous fifty hectare land,-

(A) in a Special Economic Zone; or 
(B) which is added to the Special Economic Zone, 
an additional sector may be allowed: 



6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTOAORDINARY [PARI- II Si-r. 3(i)| 

Provided that the additional land requirement for an additional 
sector in a Special Economic Zone for a specific sector or for one or more 
services as per first proviso will be twenty five hectares when the Special 
Economic Zone is proposed to be set up in Assam, Meghalaya, Nagaland, 
Arunachal Pradesh, Mizoram, Manipur, Tripura, Himachal Pradesh, 
Uttarakhand, Sikkim, Jammu and Kashmir, Goa or in a Union territory. 

(ii) There shall be no minimum area requirement for setting up a Special 
Economic Zone for Information Technology or Information Technology 
Enabled Services, but a minimum built up processing area requirement 
shall be applicable, based on the category of cities, as follows:-

TABLE 

Category of cities as per 
Annexure IVA 
Category 'A' 
Category 'B' 
Category ' C 

Minimum built up area 
requirement 

1,00,000 sqmts 
50,000 sq mts 
25,000 sq mts 

Provided that for a Special Economic Zone proposed to be set up 
exclusively for electronics hardware and software (including information 
technology enabled services) the area shall be ten hectares or more as well 
as a minimum built up processing area requirement as applicable for a 
Special Economic Zone for Information Technology or Information 
Technology Enabled Services, based on the category of cities, referred to 
in the Table: 

J Provided further that in case a Special Economic Zone is proposed 
to be set up exclusively for handicrafts, the area shall be ten hectares or 
more: 

Provided also that in case a Special Economic Zone is proposed to 
be set up exclusively for bio-technology, non-conventional energy, 
including solar energy equipments or cell, or gems and jewellery sectors, 
agro-based food processing, the area shall be ten hectares or more with a 
minimum built up area as under: 

(i) forty thousand square meters in case of a Special Economic Zone 
proposed to be set up exclusively for bio-technology and non-
conventional energy sectors, including solar energy equipments or 
cells and agro-based food processing sector but excluding a Special 
Economic Zone set up for non-conventional energy production and 
manufacturing; 



[%m u--wj^ 3(i)] ^̂ Krf ^T T F T O : 3TOTWT 

(ii) fifty thousand square meters in case of a Special Economic Zone 
proposed to be set up exclusively for the gems and jewellery sector: 

Provided also that in case a Special Economic Zone for a specific 
sector is proposed to be set up in Assam, Meghalaya, Nagaland, 
Arunachal Pradesh, Mizoram, Manipur, Tripura, Himachal Pradesh, 
Uttarakhand, Sikkim, Jammu and Kashmir, Goa or in a Union territory, 
the area shall be twenty five hectares or more for the Special Economic 
Zones not covered under the first, second and third provisos: 

Provided also that in respect of Special Economic Zones (other than 
Information Technology or Information Technology Enabled Services 
Special Economic Zones) located in Bl category cities as per 
classification indicated in Annexure-IV, the minimum built up area shall 
be fifty per cent of the area specified above and in respect of Special 
Economic Zones located in B2 category cities as indicated in Annexure 
IV, the minimum built up area shall be twenty five per cent of such area 
specified above: 

Provided also that Board of Approval may allow additional sectors in 
the category where the minimum land area requirement is ten hectares: 

Provided also that not less than fifty per cent of such area shall be 
earmarked for developing processing area. 

(iii) in clause (c), for the words "one thousand" the words "five hundred" shall be 
substituted. 

4. In rule 11 of the principal rules, in sub-rule (11), after second proviso, the following 
proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

"Provided also that addition or inclusion of any land to an existing Special 
Economic Zone , where such land contains a port, manufacturing unit, or structures 
in which no commercial, industrial or economic activity is in progress, then such 
Special Economic Zone shall not be eligible for any duty benefits in respect of the 
pre-existing structures but any additions or up-gradations to such existing ports, 
manufacturing units, or structures after their addition or inclusion in a Special 
Economic Zone shall be eligible for the fiscal incentives as applicable for a new 
infrastructure in a Special Economic Zone and also the authorised operations being 
carried on in such infrastructure shall be eligible for benefits as provided for under 
the Special Economic Zone Act and rules." 

5. In rule 19 of principal rules, in sub-rule (2), in the third proviso, for the words, 
"provided also that", the words "provided also that, subject to the provisions of rule 74A," 
shall be substituted. 



8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i )| 

6. After rule 74 of principal rules,, the following rule shall be inserted, namely:-

"74A.Transfer of Assets by Special Economic Zone Units upon their exit.- The Unit 
may opt out of Special Economic Zone by transferring its assets and liabilities to another 
person by way of transfer of ownership including sale of Special Economic Zone units 
subject to the following conditions:-

(i) the Unit has held a valid Letter of Approval as well as lease of land for not less 
than a period of five years on the date of transfer; 

(ii) the unit has been operational for a minimum period of two years after the 
commencement of production as on the date of transfer ; 

(iii) such sale or transfer transactions shall be subject to the approval of the Approval 
Committee; 

(iv) the transferee fulfils all eligibility criteria applicable to a Unit; and 
(v) the applicable duties and liabilities, if any, as calculated under rule 74, as well as 

export obligations of the transferor Unit, if any, shall stand transferred to the 
transferee Unit which shall be under obligation to discharge the same on the same 
terms and conditions as the transferor Unit.". 

7. In the principal rules, after Annexure IV, the following Annexure shall be inserted, 
namely :-

"ANNEXURE IVA 

[Refer sub-rule 2 (ba) of rule 5| 

CLASSIFICATION OF CITIES 

1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

1 

2 

City classification 

Category 'A' 

Greater Mumbai 

Delhi NCR 

Kolkata 

Chennai 

Bengaluru 

Hyderabad 

Pune 

Category 'B' 

Ahmedabad 

Bhubaneswar 



[*?PT II—W^3(\ )] T̂̂ T cFT <Mm : ^mT̂ RnT 9 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

Chandigarh 

Coimbatore 

Indore 

Jaipur 

Kochi 

Lucknow 

Madurai 

Mangalore 

Nagpur 

Thiruvananthapuram 

Tiruchirappali 

Vadodara 

Visakhapatnam 

Category ' C 

All other cities 

[E No. C.2/1/2013-SEZ] 

RAJEHV ARORA, Jt. Secy. 

Note:— The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary vide 
number G.S.R. 54 (E), dated the 10th February, 2006 and last amended vide G.S.R. 
982 (E) dated the 16th December, 2010. 

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-1 10064 

and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. 


