REGD.NO.D.1.-33004/99

Che Gazette of Judia

EXTRAORDINARY
AN [I—Wvs 3—39-9Us (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i}
wifrT | wERIE
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

o 402] =% fareelt, WA, SR 12, 2013 /877907 21, 1935
No. 402] NEW DELHI, MONDAY, AUGUST 12, 2013/SHRAVANA 21, 1935

ot ofiT I HaTe
( oo fasmr)
atfrgs
72 f&esh, 12 a7, 2013
AH, 540( 37 ) —F=4 TR, v anfier s sifafam, 2005 (2005 7 28) +1 YW 55 g9

Ve Al F1 YA T g e anfé 919 1w, 2006 1 AR @A w0 % fag fefafe
fram st 2, stefq -

1. (1) Eﬁﬁﬂﬁﬁmﬂmﬁﬁﬂﬂaﬂﬁﬁﬁﬁ?m)ﬁmzow%l
@ A I99F ¥ 9% yHEE W a9 P e 8 |

2. o anféfe @1 Frgw, 2006 PRI T e e W v s mne) s Fav 2 &
JufEm (1) @ @vs (X) 9 Ffafes wgs sia: w=nfle s, sefae-

g faft e, Y e e & W W oER oo wefde smr ol dad, R
WA W AT TPT & SR AR 3l w1 Afofed ae wHiaR 3, v ved daee a e |
fog 7% for Wafa el Jael WiEdq UE-guY @ WHM HUET G AUH-OM 9 91
Yl B Pramee TN R A e Sw Jger @ ARy 1@ R AT @ seHReT 9l
ZN JRBTAfed W 21 Td wopfa @t dard Twe Jgew I |
3. T & w5 &, 9l (2) 4 -
{) ToS (%) #,-

@ ve TR IR vE @ ©n R o 9t g ™ o
Gm  wEd TogE §, 9 W e v P oem Wi @ fRw ww @ an;

Gi) |ve @ & WM W FrEtaRe gre v 9gh s -

3488 G1/2013 (1}




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[Part T -SEe., 3Gy

@) O et famfde Yoex o1 & @1 aiftrs Saelt & fog s et oo srerar oo
# Y e WM &7 vaTw IR O1 9UY RE B US AmIe AT 8

T JE FHTR TE SRm Y & fag-

(@) R arie S @
@ o Ry ot &5 ¥ Srer e & |
v sifeRea JFex ergam fvar s wam:

T WA RE @ a5 R 43 @ U oo a1 aftw danslf @ fag e
fde anffis Wi & Rl sfoRes Jwer @ g onifae sfiRew 4fy =hw o @it o7 fRw
Rfden, S-wair, m @ R 9w a7 & § Wl fvg 9 @1 gwama B

iy o denfeEt @ gEe st smfRa a1 @ fog ey snf¥e i B e @ frg
o1 T &9 fET T dm, g ol B v & emR W wew i gxiveve da 3 eten
v Bt S FegeR g

Lt
sy IV © @ srpa@R wed | ~piow e fafie &=
T T
0w 1,00,000 % H.
T @ 50,000 T I,
y T 25,000 T A,

wReg Y0 Rpell fadry s it @ ferg AR e wa @ sdaife ErsaeR ok wivedR
& fau Reab giava, yam deifed smaRa d@ A ¢ wfie o o= wwira s wen © =@
FFCIR W Bu S 3 o Wl § Fiffe o’ @ wo & R wx o SN @ gme
seNfira smeRa Jawet 3y ol Ry e &3 @ Ry 7o ar e B et & @)
e Bl

e I8 I fo Ifd fouw anffe S o w0 ¥ swfter @9 o fag wifta fey ol
T § A &7 o9 R W I8y @

w8 W fe Ay fAdw anfdie o9 o == W W SN, I s 9w
R ardvid, TR 99 SuEee W A § e T Ud nuY 9, Py onia @ pRiae &
fag wnfia fey o &7 yead 3 91 4 39 FRW U1 9EY A g ok S freefafea <
Fifia & 5% R Em-

) T T H g PNl siv R wera et g e siwla ol auwny @ &9 o g
R PRy smefRa @ wwwRw & & fag i anffie S wnfie g o &1 s & @
T s 3 Hie B G sER SR-mReReT S S den Rt & e R anfde S
wfvfam @& 8 )

(i) ¥ qF 3N &7 B IV I W A W by o @ g wfda 5 R anfée
T S WA A T SR e W §


file:///jjfa

[T [I—&VE 3(i) ] AT T T ;ST

T T R B afe feedt Riffde 49 & R 21 A enfifes < amm, dorae, smmels,
oA yow, fele, Ay, firqw, R wiw, s, fifden, o ewi) ey @ e 9w
Togds ¥ il fRy o @ v © @ e, o i A wmgw ¥ 7 o il few e
Sl @ foe & TEfi saar a1 SR e B |

g TF R B Svr 4 A SRR e @ eger AR ¥ Svew R e S
(R AN 1 gE et il o il aniie 8w @ s @ Wy ¥ wpam P
& ok Rffde &3 @1 500 8 o Iwe 4 4 7oy sweffm & 2 A @ wed A smfRm
e ST & WY A e T 4 o Rffie a3 @ veliv sfek @

Wﬁﬂgﬂﬂﬁswwaﬁﬁmgﬂaw%ﬁmawma\émwm#
s Jaed T g & =1 v &

T T8 5 U & B 9§ T yEw wRma iy fierr  weivesw & @ fae iR
& s

(i) @ve (M) 4" e R’ TR B W W gy W@ = @ ey |

4. @ e fgm 11 @ e (1) § R wge @ vww et W e
sig-RTfia e o aragfe-

g e 4 5 faerma fdw e i & afe fd W wft o wee @ weds @, o
e i Il 7 9ar & & o W RN sf¥e <M ¥ g O e O)ET @ gdy § e
TER & Tow D BIS B UH T8 B Al 0 i safdie st e O <deda & veama
faemm o, RAfmivr gl semr Tl § Rear B8 el o S @ W R
MeATET W are gl oh feelt fw onfiE W ¥ Rew T wmeier w A 2t € o O
iR § fey o w e yEed @ Ry e o et G fmt @ s @
IR T @ fg o= 2@

5. e Frem & Prm 190 o SuRw (2) @ TR TR § 'wg T A B vl B we W
WY TR 74T D oude! B snaed e W o |

8. A ffam & w74 & wvam, Preafafea Praw sfawenfia fean wrem, st
74T RN anfiie W ST g 9F offdra # AT W ol @ deRm W gwrE, fv
e o A sogdl @ RE AfRd oo et st e Tt @ Ree o @fdy @) aneeH
T FefaRe ool & eradi= fad o o @ s 89 o1 Rider awn oodt £ |

(1) sm@%wmmmaﬂmaﬁmﬁmwaéaﬁma%mwﬁﬂwiﬂw
e qfY &1 TeEr

(i) IS siavul B ARG B TR TH BN & Tva <[AaR 2 a9 @ ol @ e et
& 8

(i) T UBR B fapa e SrRor i FREATE srgAed Wiy & erEeT & swmdia o

(iv) sieRd, gy = ooy wrar w9 o aeeel @ g @var | aen

(v) fram 74 & sef9 o oRefam 97 Yoo @ i, a2 B 8, 997 siruedt 3o, B
rata area] afE o &, RA sE B siRa W W, St siaoreat s B T & A
& ot v Fdemt & e T aifet @ frads &g e a0



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [Parr I1—Suc. 3(i)]

aa Prgn 9, 9udy IV @ wee Prefafea swey sio-wenfia fear o, s

ICEY 4 &

[frm 5 & su-frrem 2 (@ =) 2&']
el wr aefiETor
TR @ qH
aoft "&"

1 AR s

2 oot TR

3 BTG

4 a5

5 UGS

6 TERIEIE

7 o
ot @’

1 S LEGIEIC

2 RRECH

3 qdehg

4 DT

5 TR

6 SR

7 Pifea

8 TS,

9 AR

10 HIAR

1 AR

12 fore=aged

13 AfRmeett

14 TR

15 R
Softt '
il o/ TR

[FL € H-2/1/2013-84]
ISia e, S wie

Ruuht-@ frem 8@ 10 s, 2006 & WLHLEL (54){a0) B ENW YR D IO, IRy F
eI fpe T O o o avdg 16 fEeReR 2010 @ WLELRLE 982(3) BT AR IR wHwH
fomay wram o |

Yo



[ TI-—=7= 3(i)] ARG H1 WU ¢ AR

MINISTRY OF COMMERCE AND INDUSTRY
(Department of Commerce)
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, thel2th August, 2013
G.S.R. 540(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 55 of the Special LEconomic

Zones Act, 2005 (28 of 2005), the Central Government hereby makes the following rules further
to amend the Special Economic Zones Rules, 2006, namely -~

1. (1) These rules may be called the Special Economic Zones (Amendment) Rules, 2013.
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. In the Special Economic Zones Rules, 2006 (herein after referred to as the principal

rules), in rule 2, in sub-rule (1), in clause (x), the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely:-

“Provided that various categories comprising their respective products or services,
similar or compatible with each other, including related ancillary services and Research and
Development services of the sector and additional combination of products and services of a
similar or compatible nature as approved by the Board of Approval shall constitute a single
sector;”

3 In rule 5 of principal rules, in sub-rule (2),—
(i) in clause (a),-

(A) for the words “one thousand hectares”, the words “five hundred hectares™ shall be
substituted;

{ (B) in the first proviso, for the words “two hundred hectares”, the words “one hundred
hectares” shall be substituted;

(ii) for clanse (b), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—
“(b)(i) A Special Economic Zone for a specific sector or for one or more

services or in a port or airport, shall have a contiguous area of fifty hectares
or more:

Provided that for each contiguous fifty hectare land,-

(A) in a Special Economic Zone; or
(B) which is added to the Special Economic Zone,
an additional sector may be allowed:




I'HE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY {Panc T Sue. 3(i))

Provided that the additional land requirement for an additional
sector in a Special Economic Zone for a specific sector or for ong or more
services as per first proviso will be twenty five hectares when the Special
Economic Zone is proposed to be set up in Assam, Meghalaya, Nagaland,
Arunachal Pradesh, Mizoram, Manipur, Tripura, Himachal Pradesh,
Uttarakhand, Sikkim, Jammu and Kashmir, Goa or in a Union territory.

(ii) There shall be no minimum area requirement for setting up a Special
Economic Zone for Information Technology or Information Technology
Enabled Services, but a minimum built up processing arca requirement
shall be applicable, based on the category of cities, as follows:—

TABLE
Category of cities as per Minimum built up area
Annexure TVA requirement
Category ‘A’ 1,00,000 sq mts
Category ‘B’ 50,000 sq mis
Category ‘C’ 25,000 sq mts

Provided that for a Special Economic Zone proposed to be set up
exclusively for electronics hardware and software (including information
technology enabled services) the area shall be ten hectares or more as well
as a minimum built up processing arca requirement as applicable for a
Special Economic Zone for Information Technology or Information
Technology Enabled Services, based on the category of cities, referred to
in the Table:

Provided further that in case a Special Economic Zone is proposed
to be set up exclusively for handicrafts, the area shall be ten hectares or
more:

Provided also that in case a Special Economic Zone is proposed to
be set up exclusively for bio-technology, non-conventional energy,
including solar energy equipments or cell, or gems and jewellery sectors,
agro-based food processing, the area shall be ten hectares or more with a
minimum built up area as under:

(i) forty thousand square meters in case of a Special Economic Zone
proposed to be set up exclusively for bio-technology and non-
conventional energy sectors, including solar energy equipments or
cells and agro-based food processing sector but excluding a Special
Economic Zone set up for non-conventional energy production and
manufacturing;



[ [I--@vE 3(i)]

R =1 TSTA : AFERT

(ii) fifty thousand square meters in case of a Special Economic Zone
proposed to be set up exclusively for the gems and jewellery sector:

Provided also that in case a Special Economic Zone for a specific
sector is proposed to be set up in Assam, Meghalaya, Nagaland,
Arunachal Pradesh, Mizoram, Manipur, Tripura, Himachal Pradesh,
Uttarakhand, Sikkim, Jammu and Kashmir, Goa or in a Union territory,
the area shall be twenty five hectares or more for the Special Economic
Zones not covered under the first, second and third provisos:

Provided also that in respect of Special Economic Zones (other than
Information Technology or Information Technology Enabled Services
Special Economic Zones) located in B1 category cities as per
classification indicated in Annexure-IV, the minimum built up arca shall
be fifty per cent of the area specified above and in respect of Special
Economic Zones located in B2 category cities as indicated in Annexure
IV, the minimum built up area shall be twenty five per cent of such area
specified above:

Provided also that Board of Approval may allow additional sectors in
the category where the minimum land area requirement is ten hectares:

Provided also that not less than fifty per cent of such area shall be
earmarked for developing processing area.

(i) in clause (c), for the words “one thousand” the words “five hundred” shall be
substituted.

4. In rule 11 of the principal rules, in sub-rule (1), after second proviso, the following
proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided also that addition or inclusion of any land to an existing Special
Economic Zone , where such land contains a port, manufacturing unit, or structures
in which no commercial, industrial or economic activity is in progress, then such
Special Economic Zone shall not be eligible for any duty benefits in respect of the
pre-existing structures but any additions or up-gradations to such existing ports,
manufacturing units, or structures after their addition or inclusion in a Special
Economic Zone shall be eligible for the fiscal incentives as applicable for a new
infrastructure in a Special Economic Zone and also the authorised operations being
carried on in such infrastructure shall be eligible for benefits as provided for under
the Special Economic Zone Act and rules.”

5. In rule 19 of principal rules, in sub-rule (2), in the third proviso, for the words,
“provided also that”, the words “provided also that, subject to the provisions of rule 74A,”’
shall be substituted,



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRACRDINARY [Parr E-—Sec. 31}

6. After rule 74 of principal rules, , the following rule shall be inserted, namely:—

“74A. Transfer of Assets by Special Economic Zone Units upon their exit.— The Unit
may opt out of Special Economic Zone by transferring its assets and liabilities to another
person by way of transfer of ownership including sale of Special Economic Zone units
subject to the following conditions:—

(i) the Unit has held a valid Letter of Approval as well as lease of land for not less
than a period of five years on the date of transfer;

{ii) the unit has been operational for a minimum period of two years after the
commencement of production as on the date of transfer ;

(iii) such sale or transfer transactions shall be subject to the approval of the Approval
Committee;

(iv) the transferee fulfils all eligibility criteria applicable to a Unit; and

(v) the applicable duties and liabilities, if any, as calculated under rule 74, as well as
export obligations of the transferor Unit, if any, shall stand transferred to the
transferee Unit which shall be under obligation to discharge the same on the same
terms and conditions as the transferor Unit.”.

7. In the principal rules, after Annexure 1V, the following Annexure shall be inserted,
namely:-

“ANNEXURE IVA
( [Refer sub-rule 2 (ba) of rule 5]
CLASSIFICATION OF CITIES

City classification
Category ‘A’

1 Greater Mumbai

2 Delhi NCR

3 Kolkata

4 Chennai

5 Bengaluru

6 Hyderabad

7 Pune

Category ‘B’
1 Ahmedabad

2 Bhubaneswar




[|FT 1T—@7% 3(i )] HRE W1 UYL

3 | Chandigarh

4 Coimbatore
5 Indore

6 Jaipur

7 Kochi

8 Lucknow

9 Madurai

10 Mangalore

11 Nagpur

12 Thiruvananthapuram

13 Tiruchirappali

14 Vadodara

15 Visakhapatnam

Category ‘C’

All other cities

[F. No. C.2/1/2013-857]
RAJELEV ARORA, Jt. Scey.
Note:— The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary vide

number G.S.R. 54 (E), dated the 10™ February, 2006 and last amended vide G.S.R.
982 (E) dated the 16™ December, 2010.

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.




