fAaua g&ar Wodio-40

5 HATH 1939 (RM0)
(HO UcAT 69) UTHAT, JErdiddiR, 25 I7dad 2018

25 SNl 2018
FRgTa §Ear 2/72018- TS o (&)

THodMo 130, &I 25 SR 2018—Tg¥ Wt 3T |47 &< Afg=aw, 2017 (2017 #7 fogw
arferfaae 12) &t amr 11 &t 3T &7 (1) F Tgd Tecd aihdl F TIRT Fed gu, &R a3, 39 9 |
Tqee g gu T TAT a1 Safed | sraeds g o afvus # e & argw o7, uas gy, arfosg w7
o &t sferg=eT J=ar 12/2017-7s7 #2 (37), f&qi 29 97, 2017 f5& gw=ar 555 @ 29 99,
2017  T&d 9T TS9O, AT 30, | THTird Fohar 77 o1, 7 o7 oy o Aeaferfaa s w3 €,
T ;-
3T ATIG=AT H, AR H, -

() FF TEAT 3 % THE FAH (3) il TEATE §, “TLHILT TR &l F TLATT “AT TLRILT

T sreat i s e BT ST, -

(@) %7 §E&AT 3 ¥ 399 Hatdd WAl & 9997q Aetoiad w8 §edr i qatedr fiv

s zorfue BT ST, a9:-



2 foeR 961 (3FATUR0T) , 25 STAdT 2018

(M (2) (3) (4) (5)

“3% | FATM 99 | €A F ATTR 2437 F A@q GRET dEmET w7 oA | O I
YT F Ad=ee 243T % siavd et T Ao &0 &
o T w | Hetda BT e F At 1 e
HTHTT, T AR AT 99 ST &5 AT TITHT TTIEHT0T AT
LRI TTTEHLOT AT AT (9T T &% A9 ATl AT U
AT T HAFT Y OTEH ATA AT IFT HLFT AT AT
o UHY rqfd F goa § 25 giaad & AfaF T 2v 1

(IT) FH GEAT 16 F AU, FaAq (3) T IR §, “UF a9 g=1i F ¥ <P W 9reat
EARIRESNECRERIES IR

(F) *F F&AT 19 Y 399 Fafeq wfatsat & geana Fwfateaa #0 d@eqr siw gfafegy @i
s eariue T ST, T -

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5)
“19% | ot ad # fouq foft Feerg Feilig 2w | g7 | =9 wiate § A e oft am
9965 & AT o arey g foret v 0w 30 firdvaw, 2018 ¥ ame @[
FATIATH  FIT AIA T TRAGT FLeA 6 .
e & 4 A A T |
199 | 4fid qad § Rua B fecmm woioig | 7 | R A # sfam
9965 T o AT o AT foaq foreft e 30 fRqway, 2018 % arg @mp
qT AT F G WA HT AR T 2T |
T o HTLAH F &I S aret 9ar

(3) +F G=AT 22 % WA, HAH (3) H WEAE H, 9T (@) F q9A@, WEfatagq 98 &
s zerfua BT ST, T -

“(T) T el safe i ety srearaet siv w=hat F afagd F forg e aree o

TRy SrerforR deerme a7 et srearwent sfiw =Rt o afiag i Jar yae war v s

o o= 4@ T 2T i Jreataes &% 7 GHEE T i (90647 % JTEdH F a1 Jaru Jard

FLATE;”;

(T) FF TEAT 29 F TH AT ITY T Terd TS F TIATT AT Ed FH HEAT AT TAfeTi &
s eTiaa e ST, e -

(1 (2) (3) (4) (5)

«ogF | offt g TILHIT ol AT STHT ATSATAN o FANT T2 &l T
9971 =77 | FHATAT T 9ae YT F9TNH S 6 HTEAH & YT A AT
FATAT T YT o0 1 % forg sgafa a1 12 sfaw




IR 9191 (TR, 25 STAdLY 2018

ofid
9991

AT |

() FH ACAT 36 & G0, HAT (3) & &GS §, 75 (1) § “U=ATE AL 9T&&l % T T I

AT QTeal T FTaeTad oA SITua;
(ST) +9 &A1 36 T IO "afeq wAPAT F qe=ng Awforfaa w0 e siw gfafeat =
AT AT SO, J9T: -

(1

(2)

(3)

(4)

(5)

“36%

ofre
9971
ofte
9991

T

FH HEAT 35 A7 36 # fAfAface fiwT Frsaret & g fi\T
& ATEAH & & AT aTed! qaT0

T

L7

(37) #® &7 39 307 399 A<t g=feay F vemmg, el w9 gear siv g= gy #r
gfaeetioa BT ST, F9m: -

(1

(2)

(3)

(4)

(5)

“39%

ofid
9971

T ag FaT arer fAer et s # fRura Rt damsi &
ATege AT SaEAd WEAREd "itads g}

(ATEUFUEHT) TEH BN, F T TG F arge Rug G
T &l Aareed A Fare & forw g =90+
fore forelT o e & & 7 FaTg

T o~ T WA % Sged & fou, smuwuedr &
e Traeit 3 ATeesr F St U SAtr 7 g,

(1) Frr wra avme ¥ = fafieq srqafar o wrerar & &
77 fReft fafeame srfesreer & =0 i smfa & g ar s
arsuwuaH! F AT % oo w5 s & %

®qH qTeAAr AT g, AT

(1) B Bl @ wdam G BT 3= =)
fafiermmadt, 2015 % siavta s ¥ are? # Fr5 Frart
Z{<h |ET 47 &1, a7

(i) < fF el oy Afams vd R s
(sraearedty faedta "4 Few) & fRom-fAger, 2015 =+
AT ASURTEHT AT ATAFET F w7 H GofiFa 2, AT
(1) B awda shef o Afw 98, @

qA

T7;




4 fIeR 91sie (3r@TUROT), 25 ST 2018
Tl R A AvE (srei, fref
Fvg) fRem-fagdear, 2015 F siwiq =@ Afea aqufa ==
|
(1) ¥ HEAT 45 % q9e1, Ftaw (3) it gfafe 4 -
() 72 (F), 37 92 (i) ¥ o=, FefRE s g2 Fr dq.enfa B s,
TT: -
“(iii) Fex TLHIE, ToT GCHIE, OF ST G, T TR0, TR TR AT
ECARIREEAR I
(1) 72 @), 5792 (i) ¥ vo=ma, A=t 5T a8 1 siqenfg B s,
TAT: -
“(iV) vz TTHN, ST GOEN, §9 T &, T IR, TRl STresnor a1
GECARAEEIR A
(1) 7= @), 37 72 (i) ¥ Teama, =l s g 1 saenfia B o,
TAT: -
“(iii) Fx LA, ST GLHIL, HF ST G, T TTEHOT, LAl TR AT
LRI A 17
(T) *F &A1 53 ¥ I Hafeq WABAT F Te=q Aeforfaa w7 deqr sfiw gfafeay i
s zorfua BT ST, T -
(1) (2) (3) 4) | (5)

«53x | ofrd T TR F FALEISHT H AT 6 HILAH | &1 S aqredt | LT T

9985 ATy

(3)

3)

(@)

FH HEAT 54 % §HeA, ®AH (3) H IR@AE # 7 (F), ® TAQ@ AAfofEaa 98 #;
AT (AT STTOSTT, 79T -

“(ST) FiT ITATET F SITEISHT | AT o ATEAH | & S ATeAT garg, |7

FH HEAT 60 % G, HiaH (3) Fi IS # oz “faer A« & A« &7 Mo B
STUSTT, J9IT:

FH TEAT 65 Y 99 gafya wfAfeat ¥ wemmg fMwforfea 7w e sz wfafeat
s eariue T ST, T 9T -

(1

(2) (3) 4) | (5)

“65%

ot 9991 | F==T &1 srfeane srfafeasr, 2005 (2005 #722) Faia | LT | =77
FATAFTIT TSTH FF F ATLAT & &7 19 a1t 9970




fIER a5ie (3rTYURTT), 25 STAALY 2018 5

(OT) #® H&AT 66 F 9HL, Hiad (3) Hryfafe -
(1) 5= () ¥ wosma, Freffd ge w1 gfenfia B s, 7o -

“(eh) ToReT Srerfore SEATH EIRT Ya9T 4o & &9 § TId%e & Tasl § Ta9T TEEAT &

ATV ek &l ST ATett J4T;”
(i) w2 (=) #,-

(@) 3T-HT (1V) &, « wreaffes sqw a9 geat F1 MR B Srom;

(@) 3T HE (1 V), ¥ weam, FReafrfea 37 a1 sia-eriua B s, aeT:-
“(v) TSR ST AT GIATSHed 6l ST ATed Sqid & A1eqw & et e
TEITT F17;

(1) TT=qF H, A5E, HICSF AT AL “TQATE (@) % AT T 62, FHITSF A AT “HE
@) Fsuag (1), (i) & (qii) » = it G s,

(T) T & T HEA T ied Toeqa I S :TATIq RAT STTus, 7T -
“Ferd o It T 72 (@) F 37 92 (V) § AET # ff arq uF 9o+ 9% a0 95t

g S R, —

(i) foemes o forar siv S==ae areafis @7 9% a1 99Fe =7 aF [T &
[TEIH ;AT

(i) Tl st =Tt T T F 0F G0 ¥ =7 § e ¥ arew
F T qATT 2 T B

(d) #H GCAT 77 F qHA, FIAH (3) FT &S §, 795 (1) F “q0F A A&l F T T
“HTT ZATL I | oTeal T TaeaTiod ohar ST, 1o -

(¥) FF GEAT 81 F AHA, AT (3) Hf TATS F T 9¥ AeAtertea gfaf® #r gioerfg fGFar
STTUATT, FAT:-
“fAeforfaa | g9 F SIfee & 7 § <7 A9 AT FAT0 -
(%) @, T a7 Hruer-d=e S| 9res a1 9o o arfee g;
(T) TwF g, ST qug @i afSre gfaaar, ST s@ede a7 #12 firer S &= qrear
T IET HHTIE & 9 3T1;
(37) AT YT ST TR
() dqreTEE;
gl STEd "8 (F), (@), () A7 (F) § TAT 9T qFHRIE AT TG H TAT F ATIHL FT
gfa®e 500 90 i =f<h & et T 8.

[(HoHo—fami—a= / Shogsdocio / fafder—21 /2017 (@e—1)—02(Rate)]
f[AER—TRUTA & S 9,
oI agadr,
g™ Ad |
25 GIFaNl 2018
Todflo 130, fasTid 25 SFaRY 2018 &1 UK # FHfRaT srgae ferR—ToauTd & TR 4
gA® gRT USRI BT ST & Sl R AfAd & ofeoa 348 @ W@US (3) & SMEfF ISl W #

SEEd Hllr‘:\/ldgd EICESLEIRSIRE!




6 foeR 961 (3FATUR0T) , 25 STAdT 2018

[(HoHo—f@mi—a= / Shogsdocio / fafde—21 /2017 (@s—1)—02(Rate)]
ARSI & 1S 9,

Jolrar agaal,
g AT |

The 25™ January 2018
Notification No. 2/2018-State Tax (Rate)

S.0. 130, dated the 25™ January 2018—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-
section (1) of section 11 of the Bihar Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 (12 of 2017), the
Governor of Bihar, on being satisfied that it is necessary in the public interest so to do, on the
recommendations of the Council, hereby makes the following further amendments in the
Commercial Taxes Department Notification No. 12/2017- State Tax (Rate), dated the 20ty une,
2017, published in Bihar Gazette, Extraordinary, vide number 555, dated the 29t June, 2017,
namely:-

In the said notification, in the Table, -

(a) against serial number 3, in the entry in column (3), after the words “a
Governmental Authority” the words “ or a Government Entity” shall be
inserted;

(b) after serial number 3 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial
number and entries shall be inserted, namely: -

(1) (2) 3) 4) 5)
“3A | Chapter | Composite supply of goods and services in which Nil Nil”;
99 the value of supply of goods constitutes not more

than 25 per cent. of the value of the said composite
supply provided to the Central Government, State
Government or Union territory or local authority
or a Governmental authority or a Government
Entity by way of any activity in relation to any
function entrusted to a Panchayat under article
243G of the Constitution or in relation to any
function entrusted to a Municipality under article
243W of the Constitution.

(c) against serial number 16,in the entry in column (3), for the words “one year”,
the words “three years” shall be substituted;

(d) after serial number 19 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial
number and entries shall be inserted, namely: -

) 2) 3) “) ®)
“19A | Heading | Services by way of transportation | Nil | Nothing contained in this
9965 of goods by an aircraft from serial number shall apply
customs station of clearance in after the 30"day of
India to a place outside India. September, 2018.




fIER a5ie (3rTYURTT), 25 STAALY 2018 7

19B Nil | Nothing contained in this
serial number shall apply
after the 30™day of

September, 2018.”;

Heading
9965

Services by way of transportation
of goods by a vessel from customs
station of clearance in India to a
place outside India.

(e) against serial number 22,in the entry in column (3), after item (b), the following
item shall be inserted, namely: -
“(c) motor vehicle for transport of students, faculty and staff, to a person providing
services of transportation of students, faculty and staff to an educational institution
providing services by way of pre-school education and education upto higher secondary
school or equivalent.”;
(f) after serial number 29 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial
number and entries shall be inserted, namely: -

(1) (2) 3) 4) )
“29A | Heading | Services of life insurance provided or agreed to be | Nil Nil”;
9971 or | provided by the Naval Group Insurance Fund to
Heading | the personnel of Coast Guard under the Group
9991 Insurance Schemes of the Central Government.
(g) against serial number 36,in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words
“fifty thousand”, the words “two lakhs” shall be substituted;
(h) after serial number 36 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial
number and entries shall be inserted, namely: -
(1) (2) 3) 4) )
“36A | Heading | Services by way of reinsurance of the insurance | Nil Nil”;
9971 or | schemes specified in serial number 35 or 36.
Heading
9991
(1) after serial number 39 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial
number and entries shall be inserted, namely: -
(1) (2) 3) “4) )
“39A | Heading | Services by an intermediary of financial services | Nil Nil”;
9971 located in a multi services SEZ with International

Financial Services Centre (IFSC) status to a
customer located outside India for international
financial services in currencies other than Indian
rupees (INR).

Explanation.- For the purposes of this entry, the
intermediary of financial services in IFSC is a
person,-

(1) who is permitted or recognised as such by the
Government of India or any Regulator appointed
for regulation of IFSC;or




foeR 961 (3FATUR0T) , 25 STAdT 2018

(i) who is treated as a person resident outside
India under the Foreign Exchange Management
(International ~ Financial =~ Services  Centre)
Regulations, 2015; or

(i11)) who is registered under the Insurance
Regulatory and Development Authority of India
(International Financial Service Centre)
Guidelines, 2015 as IFSC Insurance Office; or

(iv) who is permitted as such by Securities and
Exchange Board of India (SEBI)under the
Securities and Exchange Board of India

(International ~ Financial ~ Services  Centres)
Guidelines, 2015.

(1)

(ii)

(1i1)

(j) against serial number 45, in the entry in column (3),-
in item (a), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(ii1) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority,
Governmental Authority or Government Entity;”;
in item (b), after sub-item (iii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(@v) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority,
Governmental Authority or Government Entity;”;
in item (c), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(ii1) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority,
Governmental Authority or Government Entity.”;

(k) after serial number 53 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial

number and entries shall be inserted, namely: -

O]

2) 3) @ | O

“53A

Heading | Services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of | Nil Nil”;
9985 agricultural produce.

(1) against serial number 54,in the entry in column (3), after item (g), the following
item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(h) services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural produce.”;
(m) against serial number 60, in the entry in column (3), the words “the Ministry of
External Affairs,” shall be omitted;
(n) after serial number 65 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial
number and entries shall be inserted, namely: -

)

(2) 3) @ | 6

“65A

Heading | Services by way of providing information under the | Nil Nil”;
9991 Right to Information Act, 2005 (22 of 2005).

@

(o) against serial number 66, in the entry in column (3),-
after item (a), the following item shall be inserted, namely:-




IR sl (3rATURTT) , 25 STeAdLr 2018 9

“(aa) by an educational institution by way of conduct of entrance examination
against consideration in the form of entrance fee;”;
@i1) in item (b),-
(A)in sub-item (iv), the words “upto higher secondary” shall be omitted;
(B) after sub-item (iv), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(v) supply of online educational journals or periodicals:”;
(C) in the proviso, for the word, brackets and letter “entry (b)”, the words, brackets
and letters “sub-items (i), (ii) and (iii)of item (b)”’ shall be substituted;
(D) after the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-
“Provided further that nothing contained in sub-item (v) of item (b) shall apply
to an institution providing services by way of,-
(i) pre-school education and education up to higher secondary school or
equivalent; or
(i1) education as a part of an approved vocational education course.”;
(p) against serial number 77, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words
“five thousand”, the words “seven thousand five hundred” shall be substituted;
(q) against serial number 81, for the entry in column (3), the following entry shall
be substituted, namely: -
“Services by way of right to admission to-
(a) circus, dance, or theatrical performance including drama or ballet;
(b) award function, concert, pageant, musical performance or any sporting event
other than a recognised sporting event;
(c) recognised sporting event;
(d) planetarium,
where the consideration for right to admission to the events or places as referred to
in items (a), (b), (c) or (d) above is not more than Rs 500 per person.”.
[(File No. Bikri kar/GST/vividh-21/2017 (Part-1)—02(Rate)]

By the order of Governor of Bihar,
SUJATA CHATURVEDI,
Principal Secretary.

3refieteh, @G Hgumed,
feR, gear g1 uehrid Ta Fied|

IER el (TETYUROT) 69-571+10-310€I0WI0 |
Website: http://egazette.bih.nic.in




